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51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19001565MFSH Date: 7/3/2019
Our Ref: CSIFCI19004097/Ktd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO, SKN 4441E

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
6/3/2019 at the premises of M/s Accord Auto have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 4,025.88
Revised Estimate Amount . 5% 1.455.68
“Check™ Items Amount : 5% (.00
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage: rear

The vehicle sustained damages at the
n/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



1]
MS ‘ Firstca pita I M5 First Capital Insurance Limited comeq Mo 1350001060 CST Reg he 8200016759

G Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (656222 2311 Fax: (B5) 6222 3547

(Claims & Moter Undenwriting Depr: 36 Aobinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 062077
Tel: (G5) 6507 3848 Fax (656307 3849
wiane.mifirsicapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 04-03-2019 Our Ref No. D19001565MFSH
Accident Date 01-03-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA4386G Third Party Vehicle. SKMN4441E
Survey Location 10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 28 AMK AUTO POINT #03-11
Contact Person. JESSY SOE
Contact No. 64819517/ 97400299 Fax Mo. 64819518
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appointed

LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number, MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of elaim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

ACCORD AUTO
i Attention. MNIL
BRI SERVICES PTE LTD entio
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letler, no signature required.




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 1 April 2019 1:50 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuta)

Subject: Re: SKMN 4441E / TP/ FIRST CAPITAL

Dear Denise,

We confirmed acceptance COR at Lump Sum $1150.00 and 3 w/days.
Thank you.

Kind regards,
Jessy Soe

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile : (65) 9740 0999

Tel :(65) 6481 9517
Fax :(65) 6481 9316

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use
or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you,

On Mon, 1 Apr 2019 at 13:02, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jesse,

Please see enclosed finalize.

Lump sum 51150, 3days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler



Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 5:33 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments
Cc; '‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001565MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SKN 4441E.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKN 4441E

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 10:33 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001565MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-B434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Si408033)

From: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com 5g]

sent: Tuesday, 5 March, 2019 2:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001565MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

1



3az09 Transfer Fes Enguiry

» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Transfer Fee

Wehicle Mo, : SKM4441E

Vehicle Type P11- Passenger Station Wagon/Jeep/Land Rover
Vehicle Attachment 1: With Sun Roof

Vehicle S5cheme Mormal

Wehicle Make . WVOLKSWAGEM

Vehicle Model: SHARAM 2.0 TSIAT 7M14H3
Chassis Mo, : WVWZZZTNZEVD34185
Propellant : Petral

Engine No.: CCFr431574

Engine Capacity : 1984 cc

Maximum Power Output 147.0 kW (197 bhp)
maximum Laden Weight 2360 kg

Unladen Weight : 1790 kg

Year Of Manufacture 2014

Original Registration Date: 13 Jun 2014

Lifespan Expiry Date:
COE Category :
Quota Premium:

B - Car above 1600cc or $7kWwW (130bhp)
170,002.00

COE Expiry Date: 12 Jun 2024
Road Taw Expiry Date 12 Jun 2019
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date 12 Jun 2024
Inspection Due Date : 12 Jun 201%
Intended Transfer Date : 04 Mar 2019
CO2 Emission: 198.00 (g/km)

CEVAVES Rebate Utilised
Amount :

CO Emission :
HC Emission ;
MOx Emission :
PM Emission :

Late renewal feels] will be imposed if road tax / lay up has expired. Please use Enquire Road Tax Payable for feels) payable.
Road tax, including Over Payment {if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownershipIs being transferred.

Amount Before GST GS5T Amount Amount After GST

(55) 15%) (5%)

Transfer Fee: 25.00 - 2500
Total Amount Payable : 2500

You may print this page for reference.

OK
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ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#03-11 AMK Autopoint Singapore 568047
Tel: 6481 0518 / 6481 9517 Fax: 6481 9516 email: claims@ mycarworkshop.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Limited /' / /jv ‘? f /3 %‘ Date :

36, Robinson Road

N7 Ayz4 vy, o ESTIMATE

Vehicle No:

#16-01 City House /ﬂ f(./?h'7 /J‘ :ﬂlp /Z-‘ A7 Veh MakeMaodel

05/03/2019
SKN4441E
Volk, Sharan 2.0 (51

Singapore 068877 YOM : 2016
Atin: Motor Claims Department 3' 4”/&;{ Chassis No WVWZZLTNZEVD34185
< Date of Accident - 01/03/2019
No| Qty Description Amount §
List Items:-
1 1  |Front bumper 5 /T 151200] A
2 1 |Front bumper side retainer (LH} $ e, 3920 | e—
3 1 Front fender (LH) 5 ﬂ 75600 | —
4 1 Front bumper parking sensor (side) b3 L 26600 | X
Total - List ltem | % 2,573.20
Less 10% | § 25731
Total | % 2,315.88
Special Nett ltems:-
1 10 [Front bumper clip S e 6500 | X
2 10 Fromt fender splash shield clip (LH) & A /5,00 X
Total - SN Item | % 130.00
Labour Charges:-
1 Spray painting on all affected area. 8 600.00 '?j#"{
Labour remove/refix accident damages parts to knock. jack, cut weld and
- realign accident affected area. ik : ? 600 ; Qef.
3 To apply anti rust treatment. 3 80.00 | =t
4 To check wiring system & light. b 60.00 /‘?{f
5 To check & adjust front computer/wheel alignment. b v 12000 | X
f To remove and replace front parking sensor. 5 Aae 12000 | X
Total - L/C | § 1,580.00
Sub-Total| § 4,025.88
T% GST| § 181.81
Total| § 4.307.69

Page 1/1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4115

Reg, Mo; 198607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607156-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref CS/FCI19004097/Kid3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date - 02-04-2019 ” nmml“"m”lm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 43066 Veh. Inspected SKN 4441E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19001565MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 05/03/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN SHARAN (A} |c.c 1984
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WWWZZZTNZEVD34185 Colour METALLIC PEARL GREY
Odometer 77307 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RiM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 PIRELLI 4 mm
L/H Front Tyre [225/50 R17 PIRELLI 4 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 PIRELLI 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 225/50 R17 PIRELLI 5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/03/2019 |Inspection Date 06/03/2019
Survey held at ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK
2A AMK AUTO POINT #03-11
SINGAPORE 568047
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS,
CIYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i~ - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No; 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page No.1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKN 4441E

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 1,512.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER (LH) NECESSARY 38.20 38.20
1|FRONT FENDER (LH) BENT 756.00 756.00
1|FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR (SIDE) SERVICEABLE 266.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -257.32 -79.52
2,315 88 71568
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
10{FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY §5.00 2
10|FRONT FENDER SPLASH SHIELD CLIP (LH){SN} NOT NECESSARY 65.00
130.00 .
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING ON ALL AFFECTED AREA. 600.00 400.00
LABOUR REMOVE/REFIX ACCIDENT DAMAGES PARTS 600.00 300.00
TO KNOCK JACK,CUT WELD AND REALIGN ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREA INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
BUMPER
TO APPLY ANTI RUST TREATMENT. B0.00 30.00
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM & LIGHT. £0.00 10.00
TO CHECK & ADJUST FRONT COMPUTERAMHEEL NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
ALIGNMENT.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT PARKING SENSOR. |NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1,580.00 740.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,025.88 1,455.68
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,150.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004097/Kitd3n2

Y iva

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser




