Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 2:25 PM

To: '‘CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc: ‘Sithara’

Subject: RE: Our ref: D19001543MFSH , SLQ9887S accident involving with SHB3362E on
01-03-2019,

Dear Sir/Madam,

Survey report uploaded in CWS.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 11:24 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref: D19001543MFSH , SLQ9887S accident involving with SHB3362E on 01-03-2019,

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Veron,

Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CS/FCI19004074/Evd3e2

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@mesfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 9 May 2019 11:10 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Our ref: D19001543MFSH , SLQ9887S accident involving with SHB3362E on 01-03-2019,

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter,
Kindly let us know was there any re-survey done from your end.

If yes, please forward us the survey reports.

Thanks & Regards,
Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg
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