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GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP
NO 10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A

#02-03 AMK AUTOPOINT 568047

Tel No. { 64837111 Fax No. : 64837221

E-Mail : guanhinmotor@yahoo.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 06035200X

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET #05-00
IOB BUILDING SINGAPORE 048711

Attention - Motor Claim Department
Contact : 63476105 MEENA CHI Fax No. - 52244174

SN Quantity Particular

Estimate : ES000862

Date : 08/03/2018
Vehicle Num. - SGF 8684 J
Makea/Model - TOYOTA ALTIS-2008
Chassis/Eng# - MROS3ZC107118317/3Z24561824
Accident Date : 16/02/2019
Claim No.
Raferance
Folicy No. © (25/04/20086)

Unit Prica Amount S5

LIST ITEMS ;

1
List Total 5%
LABOUR ; a@?g/
REPAIR AND SPRAY PAINITNG ON FRONT LH DOOR .REAR LH
DOOR,REAR LH FENDER AND REAR BUMPER 1,000.00
Labour Total 5§ 1,000.00

T Aityprs
Fet,

e .

for GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP

E&OQE Total 5§ 1,000.00



Mariman e-Claims

418/2018
Print Received Message

This maill is associated with :

*SGFB6E4) (MCT19020766)
[SHA3TT2K]
TF
LOW AH WAH
Fab 26 2018 2:00PM

Guan Hin Motor Workshop

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 04/04/2019 15:18 PM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (55$0.00) - SGFBEB4J - Claim Handler: Sherinl Pillai

|Approved:0.00:Please proceed to reject TP claim.

hitps-//singapare merimen.com/claims/index cfm?fusebox=5YCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFI0=5153T8244CFTOKEN=108dd4a02721aa6c-CECE. ..

mn



Cecilia Chuna SI.H.K nutuz

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 3:20 PM

To: Guan Hin Motor Weorkshop

Cc: Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your ref: SGF B684) (Our Ref: CC4/11119004066/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA
3772K & SGF 8684) ON 26/02/2019 ***

Attachments: Ol AVF.MP4; sketch plan and statement. pdf

Your Ref: SGF 8684) without Prejudice

Qur Ref: CC4/1I19004044/Kg03

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3772K & SGF 8484) ON 24/02/201%
We refer 1o the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured car video footage and accldent statement for your easy reference. We
have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not liable for the accident, Our Insured is
driving at his own lane and your client cut into his lane. Your client is to be blamed for not checking before
changing lane.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client's
matter.

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings, No admibision of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subseguently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the Issues of
liability/damages, elther party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultanis Pie Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecllinChopg i lkkaute.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Y KK =

AlRiE ST g Ehe Earth Frint only when necessary
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Nivitha (LKK Auto

From: Motor Claim - |lI <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 5:14 Pm
To: Guan Hin Motor Workshop; ‘sur@lkkauto.com” admin-d@lkkauto.com
Cc: Sherini Pillai; Zuhaidah Samsuri
Subject: RE: SGF8ga4)
Dear Sir/ Mdm,
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SGFE634J and let us have your report urgently. ( T
(1]® o |
This claim will be handled by Ms Sherin. L
"Kindly upload this Survey request email to meriman
Thank You.
Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
., INDM
[} . iN‘I’I:'R.NATIDml

[nsurance

fiNadaroa i

“rutig (R e e ] RET
64 Cecll Street: 805 - 108 Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 245
From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop ImaiItn:guanhinmumr@vahnn.tuml
Sent: 04 March, 2019 2:45 PM
To: Motor Claim - 111 <motnrrlaim@iii.cam.sp
Subject: Re: SGF8684)
LKK
GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP,
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047
Tel: 64837111
Fax:64837221
LC NG
On Monday, 4 March 2019 1 36:37 pm SGT, Motor Claim - |I| <motorclaim@iii com.sg> wrote

Dear Sir / Mdm.



“ We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

= LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
+ Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Lid

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections
to the above list.

Bes! Regards,

Gabriel Wee

. fN DA
P [NTERNATIONAL
InsurancE

FiNGarang
Uprany te egenn sne AT

B4 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Guan Hin Motor Workshop [rnajl;u:guanhinmutgr@gahug.mm]
Sent: 04 March, 2019 12:27 PM
To: Motor Claim - 1] <motorclaim@iii.com sq>

Subject: SGF8584.

Please arrange to survey our vehicle SGFB684.
Traffic accident on 26/02/2018

Invalving vehicle SGFB684J and SHA3TT2K



* Please previous survey list

GUAN HIN MOTOR WORKSHOP
No 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#02-03 Singapore 568047

Tel 64837111

Fax 64837221

LC NG

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us. you are deemed lo have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and outside
Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance Associalion
of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes
Investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. f you do not agree to the same kindly let us know
immediately,

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information

If you are not the person for whom this e-malil was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please dalete it immediately and inform us of the errar and also be hereby

notified that any use. distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner Is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted. lost delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification

Print this email only if it Is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of enviranment,
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703702-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, vou are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

[F you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

wWe
(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING = — !
Case | Notified |Est Subimitted | Ad] Assigned Adj Rpt Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status |
| | 4 Mar 201% | Pending for Survey |
- |”5th::19 et nx:.un | mml || .
_Edn ey | | e ady e | —_BUMR . L. Cancel Case

Reference Claim Details

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - |[Created by adjuster]
Incared. | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co Reg. ho.: 19530382 1R

|LOW AM WAM, 1D 510850610

.

. “[26/02/2019 14:00 - 59
|SGFa584) Date of Loss: |1y ¢y Months and 1 Days From LTA Reg Data (Man r)]

: | TP / MCT19020766 PONCY/CEVET | mCOMOO1S

Palicy No.

(Clawmant): 5101868174

B B o | Excess: I

Guan Hin Motor Workshop (HQ) BLE 10 ANG MO KID TND PARK 24 ®£07-03 AMK AUTOPOINT, 568047 Ang Mo Kio - Tel 4837111

India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 83476100 , [Handied by Sherinl Pillai)

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Litd (HQ) - Tel:
LKK Aute Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 5255-3551 .. [Mandled by KENNETH KONG] __ | Final Rpt due 14/03/2019] |
/ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED -

|» 111_5G {04/04/2015): Alert - Adj Mandats Approved (580,00) - SGFB684J - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai
|« 111_SG (79/03/1019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SGFRBSA) - Claim Handler: Sherinl Pillai

view All_| _ Compose Case mai | |

view a8 | Search Tasts | Craste New Task | Compiste ||
Completed On Createsad On  Done?

https://singapore.mernimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp ... 23/4/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*SGFB684] (MCT19020766)
[SHA3772K]
T
LOW AH WAH
Feb 26 2019 2:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Guan Hin Motor Workshop

Video [1 per page E‘J—E
INg [ Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thiumbimall | Print
1 IW0I1915:31 | Videe - Accident - 0 ceamre
'Photos/Images Iperpage v M
Ho | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnail | Print
1 18/04/1% 11:44 | General View 0O eiws | B
7 1A/D4/19 11:44 | Ganeral View D | tcsdes | A
{3 |18/04/19 11:44 | Ganaral View 0 | Lossws | B2
e =
4 [18/04/19 11:44 | General View 0O | Lacwes | A
|5 |18/04/18 11148 | General View 0 | taces | A
T e — ——— — B
6 |18/04/19 11:44 | General View - D | acies | BA
7 |18/04/19 11:44 | General View O | wadws | &
L =
B 15/04/19 1144 | General View . 0 | s |
6 18/04/19 11:44 | General View D | eadic | M |
10 18/04/16 11:44 | General View 0  icsawc |
11 18/04/18 11:44 | General View 0 | teaws | B
11 1804719 1144 General View D teows |
(13 18/04/19 1144 General View 0 | toadws | B2
i}u 16/04/19 11:44 | General View © | Lacws | B4
|15 180419 11:44 | Genersl View O | aws |
st iperpage |~}
Mo | Aelabel/Reorder | LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1| 05/03/19 19:56 | EMAIL FROM 111 DD 04.03.201% B 0 | wosarroe |
2 15/03/19 1450 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED. - @ | Load pos
3 15/03/19 1450 | TP GIA REPORT 0 | loadpoe
A 18/04/19 1141 | REJECTION EMAIL TO TP B O | LosdPoF |
S 18/04/1% 1141 INSTRUCTION TO REJECTION O  cearor |
No | Finalized On :lnd.l-n International Insurance Pie Lid {HQ ) — Thumbnail | Print
1 |06/03/19 09:26 | Singapore Accident Statemant | Loaa FOF
Documents Checklist
;mcuutmmmr weset | Sawe | peen |

There are no document checklists configured.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 23/4/2019
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Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
histm: Awmacks arm DrVEtE ariess yeu dhae il B pther peries

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 23/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd . Rag Mo: 129507 104R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCA4/llI19004066/KGA302

Date: 23/04/2019
BREFERENCE
Handling Insurer. India Internalional Insurance Ple Ltd  Policy No: MCOMDO15
Ciaimant Vehicle ¢Gragaa) Insured Vehicle No: SHA3772K
Date of Loss: 26M02/2018 MNature of Claim TP Claim No: MCT12020766
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATI I
Heg No: SGFBEa4)
Make & Modal TOYOTA COROLLA, 1.6 (A) Engine No: 3224561824
Reqa. Date 25/04/2008 (Man, Year: 2008) Chassis No MROS3IZEC107118317
Colour: Metallic Gold Ddometer 2279802 km
Engine Capacily: 1598 cc
Market Value/MNew Car Price; NfA
Sum Insured (S§) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable), Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition.
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/T0 R14 Rear Tyre Size: 185/70 R14
Front Left Side: Falken & mm Rear Laft Side; Falken 5 mm
Front Right Side: Falken 6 mm Rear Right Side: Falken 5 mm
The sbove walues represant e mmamning tyre ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellanaous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.000.00 800.00 200.00 20.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 D.0o0
Towing 0,00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (S§) 1,000.00 800.00 200.00 20.00
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/03/2018
Date Inspected: 06/03/2018 Inspected At Guan Hin Motor Workshop (HQ)
BLK 10 ANG MO KIO IND PARK 2A #02-
03 AMK AUTOPOINT
Singapare 568047
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Chong Pui Lin

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 23/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This reporf represents our findings at the fime and place of inspection sialed herain. Such inspection has been carriad oul o the best of our
brpwhedge and ability bul any other Natlity under any oifer circumstances is hereby sxpressly sxcluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 23/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

'Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 22 Apr 2019)

Paris: 143 TOYOTA COROLLA 1.6 {A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SGFBE84J)

‘Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimale pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

I'-'urtl'lu_r Info: llems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

There are no new parts selected.
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. B

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 23/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
Thare are no new mincellansous lems sslecied.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab. Type Repairer's Amount
Labouyr ltems
1 REPAIR AND SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT LH DOOR ,REAR New 1,000.00 B0O0.0O

LH DOOR ,REAR LH FENDER AND REAR BUMPER

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,000.00 B00.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/idex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen ... 23/4/2019



