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Nivitha (LKK Auto)
m

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 9:35 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: SJS 3454 K /SLM 4217 E

2 16 aPtet (1 fl

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 9:32 AM

To: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE <chuanhoautoservice@gmail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 5J5 3454 K / SLM 4217 E

Without Prieudice

Dear Sir,

We pri. Pls provide all relevant information,
Dear LKK,

Pls pri.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
J Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079509

Co. Reg. Mo. 200208384E

DID: 83896171

Fax 62247175

Email. boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com

Viebsite: www sg.cntaiping.com

Disclgimer

This messoge is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Toiping insurgnce {Singapore) Pte. Ltd, except where provided
for in o written agreement between you and Ching Talping tnsurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid, Any unouthorized disclosure, use or dissemination.
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the mess oge, please notify the sender immediately.

From: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE [mailto:chuanhoautoservi mail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March, 2019 9:30 AM



To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Fwd: SJS 3454 K/ SLM 4217 E

Hi,.

I would like to arrange for survey.
Please let us know which survey firm you'll be appointing.
Thank vou.

Regards,

Sharin

CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE

160 SIN MING DRIVE, #07-09 SIN MING DRIVE (S) 575722
Hp: 9069 1985

—————————— Forwarded message ----—----

From: Irene Tay <irene.tav(@sg.cntaiping.com>

Date: Wed, Feb 20, 2019 at 10:53 AM

Subject: RE: SJS 3454 K /SLM 4217 E

To: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE <chuanhoautoservice@gmail.com>

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Liability is down on our insured.

We are prepared to do a direct settlement with you.

Thank you.

Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive

Claims Department (Motor Division)



China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079309

Direct (65) 6388 6192
Fax (65)6224747B/62247175

Email: claimsdept@sp_cntaiping.com

wiww 50 cntaiping. com

ANMNIVERSARY
Tu Singapore wnce 1938

Disclaimer

Thiv messape iv confidential; ity contents do nol constitiie a commiiment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. excepi
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid Any unauthaorized
disclosure, wse or dissemination, cither in whole or partial. is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notifv the sender immediately.

From: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE [mailto:chuanhoautoservice @gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 20 February, 2019 10:51 AM
To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Fwd: 5J5S 3454 K / SLM 4217 E

Hi Irene,

Please let us know liability for this case.

Thank you.

Fegards,

Sharin



. CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE
160 SIN MING DRIVE, #07-09 SIN MING DRIVE (8) 575722

Hp: 9069 1985

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE <chuanhoautoservice(@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Feb 18,2019 at 4:16 PM

Subject: Fwd: SIS 3454 K/SLM 4217 E

To: <claimsdept/@sg.cntaiping.com>, <irene.tay(@sg.cntaiping.com=

Hi Irene,

Any updates on this?
Please do keep us posted as it has been a few months to check Liability,

Thank you.

Regards,

Sharin

CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE

160 SIN MING DRIVE, #07-09 SIN MING DRIVE (8) 575722

Hp: 9069 1985

-weea-e--- Forwarded message =--------

From: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE <chuanhoautoservice(@gmail.com=
Date: Mon, Jan 28, 2019 at 1:00 PM

Subject: Fwd: SIS 3454 K/ SLM 4217 E

To: <irene.tay(@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: <claimsdept/@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Hi Irene,



Any updates on this case?

Thank you.

Regards,

Sharin

CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE

160 SIN MING DRIVE, #07-09 SIN MING DRIVE (8) 575722

Hp: 9069 1985

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE <chuanhoautoservice{@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, Jan 17,2019 at 2:21 PM

Subject: Fwd: SJS 3454 K/ SLM 4217 E

To: <irene.tav(@sg.cnlaiping.com=

Hi Irene,

Please refer to attached.

Thank you.

Regards,

Sharin

CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE

160 SIN MING DRIVE, #07-09 SIN MING DRIVE (8) 575722

Hp: 9069 1985

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE <chuanhoautoservice@gmail.com=

5



Date: Wed, Dec 19, 2018 at 9:49 AM
Subject: SIS 3454 K/ SLM 4217 E

To: <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

To : Officer In Charge,

Please refer to attached for New Claim.
We would like to propose Direct Settlement.
Please check for us the liability before we proceed with repair.

Thank you.

Regards,
Sharin
CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE

160 SIN MING DRIVE, #07-09 SIN MING DRIVE (8S) 575722

Hp: 9069 1985

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:/www.symanteccloud.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cwenier 102

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregictration Date:
Wehicke Make:

ehicle Madel:

Primary Cotour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Valee:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfar Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Ellgibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Pericd(Years):

QP Pald:

COE Rebate Amount:

Taotal Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Mar 2019

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Singapore NRIC
56790

5J53454K
Mo

12 Mar 201%
MITSUBISHI

LAMCER 1.6 CVT SPORTS GLX AIRBAG ZWD 4DR

White

2009

4G18KCTTR]
IMYSTCSIATUD0E03T
79.0 KW (105 bhpl
$13,982.00

12 Aug 2009

12 Aug 2009

a

$13,982.00

Yes
11 Aug 2019
$4,991.00

11 Aug 201%

A - Car | 1600ce & below)
10

$13,658.00

$565.00

37,556.00

OK

nupcs?wn.|ta.gav.sgma.wruac:tmr'lranqmraﬁeuamuwum|cu-amrauereg|npu:'rl- WML RJN_IU=FOsuauUe | |

1



CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE
SIN MING AUTO CITY

160 SIN MING DRIVE #07-09
SINGAPORE 575722

/1)9}7 /Zf'fé&f,rﬁ/
P /%y 8728
tonny A1 [lns

Cots,,

Wehicle & Document Information

ESTIMATE : $J5 3454 K Date: 19/12/2018
Vehicle No:  SJS 3454 K
Make/Model: MITSUBISHI LANCER
5/N Description Qty Repairer's Est Revised Est
1 FRONT BUMPER 6. co 1 S 980.00 $ % 980.00—
2 HEADIAMPRH  S#( 1 5 655.00 $ Gt 65500
3 FRONT GRILLE BASE 1 5 165.00 5 CI2F 165.00¢&
4 FRONT GRILLE NET RH 1 S 120.00 5 ‘F'-\ 120.00 x~
5 FRONT GRILLE NET LH 1 S 12000 $ 4~ 120.00 4
6 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET 1 S 80.00 $ 7T 80.00 x
7 FOG LAMP COVER LH 1 S 40.00 S /i~ 40.00X
8 FOG LAMP LH 1 5 B50.00 S fn g50.00 X
9  BONNET 1 $ 780.00 & 7T 780.00 A
10 FENDERRH ¢ 9¢. ce 1 $ 680.00 $ i 680.00 —
11 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 1 $ 88.00 $ I, 88.00
12 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE GARNISH RH 1 3 60.00 $ /N 60,00 £
13 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE GARNISH LH 1 3 6000 $ %~ 60.00 £
14 FRONT PANEL 1 S 780.00 $ 7T 780.00X
Parts Total : 5 5,258.00
2w (0] S HE5H60
Total s 4,206.40
1 ANTIRUST PROOFING, GALVANISING SPOT WIELD $ 72t 100.00
2 TO CHECK LIGHTING, WIRING & FUSES $ Zo/ 180.00
3 LABOUR TO DISMANTLE PARTS AND REPLACE 5 et 580.00
4 TO PUTTY, PRIMER AND RE-SPRAY AFFECTED PARTS $  Seey 800.00
Labour Total : $ 1,560.00
(34229
TOTAL: | § 5/,766.40
-20% | § 1,153.28
GRAND TOTAL:| § 4,613.12
LUMP SUM :| § 4,600.00

CHUAN HO AUTO SERVICE




Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregNo19s607158R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI19004057/KSD3NZ

Date: 19/03/2019
REFERENCE
Handlin i :
I.nsurer:g China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Policy No:
Claimant . ,
Vehicle No : SJS3454K Insured Vehicle No : SLM4217E
Date of Loss:  16/12/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: WN/A
CRIPT IF| F VEHI
Reg No: 5J53454K
Make & Model: MITSUBISHI LANCER, 1.6 CVT SPORTS GLX (A) Engine No: AG1BKCTTI
Reg. Date: 12/08/2000 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: JMYSTCS3A0U00B037
Colour: White Odometer: 159356 km
Engine Capacity: 1584 cc
Market Value/New Car
2 MiA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
ITION OF ATT
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
COMNDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/50R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/50R15
Front Left Side: Toyo 8 mm Rear Left Side: Toyo B mm
Front Right Side: Toyo 8 mm Rear Right Side: Toyo B mm
The ahave valuas represent the remaining fyre treads depih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 473220 1,729.80 3,002.40 63.45
Miscellaneous tems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,660.00 1,100.00 560.00 3373
Faintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 6,392.20 2,829.80 3,562.40 55.73
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,200.00
Nett Amount (S§) 6,392.20 2,200.00 4,192.20 65.58
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 14/03/2019
Date Inspected: 11/03/2019 Inspected At: Chuan He Auto Service (HQ)
Elk 11 # 01-85, Sector B Sin Ming Ind
Estate
Singapore 575655

Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Hiew May Fung

NQOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspechion stated harein, Such inspection has been camed ouf to the besf of our
krowledge and abiiity but any other iability under any other circumsiances is hereby exprassly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 19/3/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS -
Reference -
|Part Source: MEM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 18 Mar 2018

Parts: 143 MITSUBISHI LANCER 1.8 CVT SPORTS GLX (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SJ53454K)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page |
| numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last eslimate page

Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Bent 980.00FL “681.00FL
2 1 *HEADLAMP RH Cut B55.00FL *586.00FL
3 1 “FRONT GRILLE BASE Cracked 165.00FL *165.00FL
4 1 *FRONT GRILLE NET RH Serviceable 120,00 FL *-FL
5 1 *FRONT GRILLE NET LH Serviceable 120.00FL *-FL
6 1 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKET Repair B0.00FL *FL
7 1 *FOG LAMP COVER LH Serviceable 40.00 FL *FL
8 1 *FOG LAMP LH Serviceable 650.00 FL “-FL
9 1 “BONNET Repair 780.00 FL “-FL
10 1 *FENDER RH Buckled 680.00FL *490.00FL
11 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE Serviceable 88.00FL *-FL
12 9 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE GARNISH RH Serviceable 60.00FL *-FL
13 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE GARNISH LH Serviceable 60.00 FL *FL
14 1 *FRONT PANEL Repair 780.00 FL *-FL

F=Franchize parl. L=ListiemDusc.

Sub Total (S$) 5,258.00  1,922.00
- List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S$%) 525.80 182,20

Total Parts (S8) 4,732.20 1,729.80

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 19/ 3/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour tems

1 ANTIRUST PROOFING,GALVANISING SPOT WIELD MNew 100.00 30.00

2 TO CHECK LIGHTING,WIRING & FUSES New 180.00 20.00

3 LABEOUR TO DISMANTLE PARTS AND REPLACE Mew 580.00 450.00

4 TO PUTTY,PRIMER AND RE-SPRAY AFFECTED PARTS New B00.00 600.00
Gross Labour Cost (58) 1,660.00 1,100.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MT Radjuster&fuseaction=g... 19/3/2019



