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.Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e e ———————————————— e ——————————

From: Poh Kin [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 2.46 PM

To: OHMYCAR

Cc Admin A

Subject: RTA involving vehicle nos, SKWBOBOP and SLX 7821H on 02.03.2019 *** LKK REF:
CCR/AIGT19004042/Afa3

Attachments: DV SKW B0B0P.pdf

Importance: High

\/ITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CCB/AIG19004042/Afa3
‘our Ref: SKW BOBOP

Jear Zack,

Ve refer to the above matter and our tele conversation on even date.

Ve hereby confirmed settlement at global sum of $ 5,000.00 (all in) on this matter.

F'lease duly sign the DV attached and return with Authorization to ACT to us (LKK) for payment processing.
¢ the meantime, we appreciate if you could furnish us a copy of the after paint photo for our file record.

Your prompt action will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basls with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of llability/damages. either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
termsfsettiement.”

<t Regands,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
(1} 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933]
rF IFLF; =~

- N

mEmaR = sove the Earthe Print only when mecessary-

-rmall eanlain confidential and privileged materal, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an

ided recipient s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in arror, please do not
il ihis e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereod, and inform the
rider ihat you have deleled the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereol. Thank you.
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Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Final Repair Bill & Claim Loss Of Use (SKWB80B0P) *** LKK REF:
CCB/AIGT19004042/Afa3
Attachments: Final Repair Bill (SKW BO8B0OP Honda Vezel).odt

From: OHMYCAR <info@ohmyear sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 11:26 AM

To: Admin A <admin-af@kkauto.com>

Subjeet: Final Repair Bill & Claim Loss Of Use (SKW8080P)

Hi, this is Zack from FLYING HIGH SPRAY PAINTING.
We will be using this emall (Info@gohmycar.sg) for future inquiries, updates and paper works.

Attached is the Final Repalr Bill for vehicle SKWB080P.

We would like to request to claim for Loss Of Use.
Surveyar (Adrian) guoted us 5 days.

Mank you.

Best regards,

Zack

woww . ohimy car.sg
fo@ohmycar.sg

«65 92303750



S1UIHAVE L#01-25 PAYA URHINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (065) 62563561 FAX 1 (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CCO/AIGI9004042/A13

16 MAY 2019

BIS MOTORING PTE LTD

20 BENDEMEER ROAD

#03-13/14 BS BENDEMEER CENTRE
SINGAPORE 339914

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 7821H AND SKW B0BOP ALONGI/AT LORONG 27
GEYLANG TURNING RIGHT TO SIMS AVENUE ON 02/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or vour authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third-Party claim.
However, il your policy has an NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

I’ui\%ung

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT
hird v Claim

L &0\'\ C.“mﬂ HEE ith= third pm;é claimanty of ﬁu‘ 31&0
i GMPORE Syl
w Eﬁs‘ m‘ ﬁﬂl-u'l e (addressi, "}'.'L’n.gr of Eh"hw vehicle ne.l

bereby authorize _BOliNG WIGH SPRAY SAlnTmng ("the workshop™i to act for me

vith respect o my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loes of use (“claim” ) for my vehicle

no Stw to¥o® i was damaged pursuant 1o the sccident which cccurred on M‘?

rdate ) wene  LOROMG 3T GEYLANG MMS AVE ilocation: invalving vehicle nofs
SLx 182\ H 1"the accidem™)

| further autharize the workshop 1o setile my above mentioned claim & manner that they deem fit
and ihe workshop i further authorized W receive payment lurther to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any seitlemem the workshop may reach on my behalf is on 8 withow

prejudios and withour admission of lability basis insofar as the driverfowner/insurers of the other

vehicleis 15 concemed

Dated this __ & day) of Q 3 imonth) lﬂﬂ iyear)
" FLYING HIGH SPRAY PAINT.

BLK 1 KAKI BUKITAVE 8
#01-20 SINGAPORE 417883
BAY (@ KAKI BUKIT)
\ Vg7402997 FAX: 6744 2042
o I
Signed by “thdihird)party claimam™ Signed by “the wiishop”

iwith chop if applicable) (with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“Well, FLYING HS PAINTING (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
58500000 _(Global Sum) for vehicle no. SKW 8080P that was damaged pursuant to the sccident

which occurred on 02/03/2019 (date) along LORONG 27 GEYLANG (location) involving vehicle

no/s SLX 7821H. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 04/032019 (date) at “the
waorkshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner GOH CHOON HEE (“the third party
¢laimant™) of vehicle no. SKW 8080P make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority 1o settle the matter on his/her behall in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid for all damages,
lass and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
afier the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
sulfered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SKW
RDBOP (vehicle no,) as a vesult of the accident,

We/l confirm that the agreement reasched nbove is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party ¢laimant™ pursuant to the aceident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Duedthis_ 93 (day)of__0S (month) 20_11_ (yenr)
FLYING HIGH SPRAY PAINTING
BLK 1 KAKI BUKITAVE 8
; N #0120 SINGAPDRE 417883
) REEE
L | W TEL: BTAD 2507 Fa)X: 6744 2942
k_, — e

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)



Blk 1, Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-29 Singapore 417883 (AutoBay@HKaki Bukit)
Tel. 6749 2997 Fax: 6744 2942 Email: info@ohmycar.sg
Business Reg. No. 42523200

INVOICE

Vehicle no: SKW 8080 P
Model: HONDA VEZEL
Name: GOH CHOON HEE
Date of accident: 02/03/2019
Address: C/O No 1 kaki bukit ave 6

#01-29 AutoBay(@kaki bukit

S (417883)

FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR VEHICLE NO SKW 8080 P

QTY | ITEM AMOUNT

. , . — - |
1 LUMP SUM REPAIR COST $4,700.00 |

Total $4.700.00 |
Dollars | FOUR THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED ONLY |
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastianes

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING .
Case Natifed Est Submitted | Al Assigred A Apt h) Submitted Tres Auth'ed !5‘7.‘1—]’ |
|08 Mar 2019 08 bar 3019 |sge,700.00 |$$4,700.00 m for Survey.

; y
_Edtae | EanAgmpt | | St Eatmanes | | e mt | |_Cancel case |

Main Reference Claim Detalls

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - |[Created by adjuster]
Insured; BI5 MOTORING PTE LTD, Co. Aeg. No.: 20179350550

Main .
Claimant: GOH CHOOM HEE. 1D: S15871221

::T:h R%%. | ckWERODBOP Date of Loss: |D2/03/2019 20:00 - i59

Ciaim Type: | TP / 823754210956 PoNeYCO¥ET | 6999994322 (Comprehenaive)

Palicy Nao.
SLE7BI1H (Claimant}: GAIII94T

Excess:
Flying High Spray Painting (HQ) BLE 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-29 Auto Bay, 417883 Kak) Bukit - Tel; 67492557

AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (Express) - Tel: 65-841%-3000 ... [Mandled by Ler, Bernard-1Q]
Bermardlilian. LanSaig.com
Claimant's

Tnsurer: AXA Insurance Ple Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288
Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel! 62583561 ... [Handled by ADRIAM LING] ... [Final Rpt due 18/03/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED
There are no mail for thes case.

| ALL ASSOCTATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | complete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results.

view Al | Compose Case Mail |i

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_c... 6/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SKWBOBOP (82375421095G)
[SLXT7B21H]
™
GOH CHOON HEE
Mar 2 2019 8:00PM
[BIS MOTORING PTE LTD]
Flying High Spray Painting

Page 1 of 3

u“m! Upsimsd Fhotes | Compes New Letier | Upinad Vides I Uplasd Aurdle | View [view in Browse | ]
Letters/Correspondences T | & |
No | Finalired Dn LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnaill Print
1 |{Draft) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown 0 =
Photos/Images 3 per page Ell )
tio  Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 14/0519 18:35 | General View 0D | leadec | A
7 |14/D5/19 18:35 | General View 0 | oediic | &
3 |14/05/1918:35 | Genaral View D | tcadwc | B4
4 |14/05/1% 18:39 General View _.ﬂ Load 3G | B
5 14/05/19 18:39 | General View 0D | v | &
& 14/05/19 18:39 | General View D | wedws | A
7 14/05/19 18:35 | General View O | tsdwe | A
8 14/05/10 18:39 | Ganeral View O arc | 2
G 14/05/1% 18:3%  General View D | s | A
10 [34/05/19 18:35 | General View ﬁ Load PG | BA
11 14/05/19 18:39 | General View 0 | loadiec | A
12 |14/05/19 18:38 | General View 0 | losdiec | A
13 | 14/05/19 18:39 | Geners! View 0| dirs | A
14 |14/05/18 16:39 | Geners] View D | Lexdirc | [4
15 |14/05/19 16:39 | General View 0 | Loadire | A
16 |14/05/15 18:39 | Genaral View 0 | ez | A |
17 14/05/19 18:39 | General View 0O | woaars |
18 |14/05/19 18:39 | Genersl View 0D | edws |
I18 (14/05/19 18:39 | General View 0 | e |
|20 [14/05/19 18:33 | General View O | Lwodrws | H
21 14/05/19 18:39 | General View D  aswe | A
122 |14/05/1918:39 | General View © | Losdwc | A
21 | 14/05/19 18:39 | General View © | Lo o
24 |14/05/19 18:39 | General View 0| ars | A
(25 [14/05/19 18:39 | General View D | losdies | A
16 |14/05/19 18:39 | General View 0 | oaaws | A
37 | 14/05/19 18:79 | General View O | adws | M4
26 | 14/05/19 18:39 | General View D tcadws | A
29 [14/05/19 18:39 | General View D | leadec | A
30 |14/05/19 18:39 | General View 0D | Loasdirs
31 [14/05/19 18:39 | Geners] View O | oo | 4|
31| 14/05/10 18:30 | Genersl View 0 | teadrc | A |
13 14/05/19 18:35 | General View O | oawc | |
34 |14/0%/10 18:39 | General View O | oeaws ||

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 6/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 3

Letters /Correspondences \tperpage v} B/
no | Fnalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid [HQ) | Thumbnail| Print
| — |
35 |14/05/15 16:79 | General View 0 | wars | B
36 |14/05/19 18:39 General View S D | ecwc | A
37 |14/05/18 18:39 | General View 0| lwdes | A
36 14/05/10 18:33 | General View 0 irs | B
39 14/05/19 18:39 | General View © | wedws |
!i |14/05/19 16:40 | Replacement Part Photo 0 | Losdwc | B4
L¢_:_;1w5m 18:40 Replacement Part Phaoto 0O | leadies | A
42 | 14/05/1% 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo 0 | wdws |
43 14/05/19 18:40 | Repiacement Part Photo 0 | wuars || A
44 14/05/19 18:40 | Replacament Part Photo D | adic | A
45 14/05/1% 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo 0O wrc | M
46 14/05/15 18:40 Replacement Part Photo D | cadws | A
47 14/05/19 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo D | lcadwc | A
(4B | 14/05/15 18:40 | Replacement Part Phote D | leadwc | A
45 |14/05/1% 18:40 | Replacemant Part Photo D | ladc | A
{50 |14/05/19 18:40 Replacament Part Photo D | ocad G 51 ]
|51 |14/05/19 18:40 Replacement Part Photo D | loadiec | & |
182 |14/05/18 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo @ | Ladws | B |
53 [14/95/19 18:40 | Replacement Part Phote D | wedws | &
54 |14/05/13 15:40 | Replacement Part Photo B | toaawc | B |
55 |14/05/19 18:40 Replacement Part Photo D | oadwe | A |
S5 | 14/05/19 15:40 | Replacement Part Photo O | waaws | 4 |
7 |14/05/19 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo © | waws | B |
(58 |14/05/19 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo D | adwes | A
59 |14/05/19 18:40 Replacement Part Photo D | tcadiwc | B
60 |14/05/18 18140 Replacament Part Photo D | cadws | A
61 |14/05/1% 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo [ 1] mdmﬁjﬁ"
62 (14/05/16 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo D | leeac |
63 |14/05/15 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo D | s | 4
#4 14/05/19 1840 Replacement Part Photo 0D | oedis | M
65 |14/05/1% 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo D | tcedire |
|86 14/05/19 18:40  Replacement Part Photo 0 | Losdws | A
67 | 14/05/19 18:40  Replacement Part Photo 0 | e | 2
(68 | 14/05/19 18:40  Replacement Part Photo 0| teadivc | A
(68 14/05/1% 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo D | Lesdies | A
170 |14/05/19 18:40 | Rapiacament Part Photo O lrws | B
71 |14/05/19 18:40 Replacement Part Photo 0 | tadiee | A
T2 |14/05/19 18:40 Replacement Part Photo 0| toadies | A |
73 |14/08/1% 18:40 | Replacement Part Phota D | loadiea | [
74 |14/05/19 18:40  Replacement Part Photo 0O | losdies | A
75 |14/05/19 18:40 | Aeplacament Part Photo D | adirs | A
76 |14/05/19 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo 0 | 1oadire
77 |14/05/19 18:40 | Aeplacement Part Phota 0 | leadiec | A
TE | 14/05/1% 18:40 | Replacement Part Phato @ | loadic | B
79 |14/05/19 18:40 | Replacement Part Photo € | oadws | | |
80 |14/05/19 18:40 Replacement Part Photo € | lossws | [ |
|81 |23/05/18 16:00 Relnspection Photo-after paint photo Load 3G | [
82 |23/05/18 16:00 Reinspection Phato-after paint phote 0 | Load PG [ &
83 |23/05/19 16:09 Reinspoction Photo-after paint photo 0 | waaws |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 6/6/2019
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Page 3 of 3

Letters /Correspondences |1 par page Iw)| BA |

No_| Finalized On | LXK Auts Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) I | Thumbnail. Print

Documentation 1 per page ~] =

'No [Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmnail| Print

1 07/01/19 19:04 | TP GIA REPORT 0 | oadror |

3 |15/05/15 08:38 | TP ESTIMATE ) | Loadror |

3 |23/05/19 16104 |Letterto OF 0 | LoadroF

4 |DE/06/1910:17 | WORMSHOP INVOICE Load PDF

S 0A/06/16 10117 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

6 |06/06/1910:17 | Release Voucher 0 | LosdroF

No | Finsfaed On AlG Asia Pacific Insuranca Ple. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print

1 |08/03/16 11:41 | 01 GIA REPORT ©  Loadror
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST peset | Save | prm |
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|'ul'|h|=|n No: SLX7821H (Insd veh) Model: HONDA VEZEL 1.5 X CVT (A)
SKWB0BO0P (TP vah)
[Date of Accident: |02/03/2019
Global Sum Sattlemant | : r [X] Yes | [ 1 No
Repair Estimate -1 10,943.00
Final Repair Cost b 5,000.00
Loss of Use 5 5.00 days at 360.00 per day
Rantal (if any) 5 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 8
Others: s
'3
Final Setilement Sum (Global Sum) 5 5,000.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agraed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: s S ikt

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability o be filled only for chain collisions and for cases whare BOLA does nol apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Flying High Spray Painting 5 5,000.00
2) -
06 Jun
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd Data

Please attach all the supporting documents to tha form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Repart/ Bill (i any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg ne 13se07108m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sun@ikkauto com;assignments@ikkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCBIAIG19004042/AFA302

Date: 06/06/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 0999904322
Clalmant Vehicle skwsosop Insured Vehicle No: SLX7821H
Date of Loss: 02/03/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 823754210856
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKWB0BOP
Make & Model: HONDA VEZEL, 1.5 X CVT (A) Engine No: HIDDEN
Rag. Dals: (Man. Year: 1800) Chassis No: RU11103164
Calaur: White Odometer: B4B27 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 cc
Market Value/Mew Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
Ganeral Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable), Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60 R16
Front Left Side: Toyo 6 mm Rear Left Side; Toyo 6 mm
Front Right Side: Toyo 6 mm Rear Right Side: Toye & mm
The above values represant [ha remaining fhyrm froads depif
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 7,763.00 4,722 40 3,040.60 38,17
Miscallaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3.180.00 1.530.00 1.650.00 51.88
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 10,943.00 6,252.40 4,690.60 42.86
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 4,700.00
Nett Amount (55) 10,943.00 4,700.00 6,243.00 57.05
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x S$60.00/day) (S$) 300.00
Natt Liability (S5) 5,000.00
Global Sum Settlement (53) 5,000.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: D4/03/2019
Date Inspected: 04/03/2019 Inspected At: Flying High Spray Painting (HQ)
BLK 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-29 Aulo Bay
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE: This reporn represents our findinga-a! the fime and place of inspection siated herein. Such inspection has been carriad ouf o the best of our
knowiedge amd ability but oy other latility under any other circumatances is hereby expressly evcluded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Distorted BB0O.00F *880.00 FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 30.00F *30,00 FL
3 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER Necassary B400F *64 00 FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER SPOILER Distorted 1,200.00FS *000.00FS
5 2 *REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR Cracked J0200F *302.00FL
B 1 *REAR BUMPER TOP CHROME PLATE Bent 3B0.00FS *300.00FS
7 1 *REAR END PANEL Repair 580.00F “FL
8 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Deformed 105.00F *105.00FL
8 1 *REAR END PANEL SEALANT Nat Necessary 60.00FS *-FS
0 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 280.00FS *200.00FS
H A "TAILLAMP N/S Cul 820.00F *460.00 FL
12 1 *TAILLAMP LOWER GARNISH N/S Deformed 380.00F *185.00 FL
13 1 'TAILGATE Dented 1,100.00F *1,100.00 FL
14 1 ‘TAILGATE LOCK Damaged 182.00F *182.00FL
5 1 ‘TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIPE Not Necessary 165.00F “FL
B 1 ‘TAILGATE BUZZER Damaged 105.00F *105.00FL
7o *TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING Necessary 125.00F *125.00FL
1B 1 ‘TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT Necessary G0.00FS *60.00FS
9 1 *VEZEL EMBLEM Necessary B65.00F *685.00 FL
20 1 *SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER Mot Necassary 305.00F *-FL
21 1 *SPARE TYRE PANEL TOOLS SPONGE Deformed 215.00F *215.00FL
2 1 *TAILGATE SOUND INSULATOR Necessary 250 00F5 *200.00FS
F=Franchise parl S=SpcNett L=LiatemDisc
Sub Total {55) 7,763.00 5,488.00
- List tem Discount on L ltems 0.00/20.00%: (S$) 0.00 785.60
Total Parts (S5§) 7,763.00 4,722.40

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING New 1,200.00 B00.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING New 1,200.00 600.00

3 WIRING New 50.00 30.00

4 TO UNDERSEAL New 150.00 0.00

5 TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR New 100.00 £0.00

6 TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY New 150.00 50.00

[ TO TRANSFER TAILGATE FITTING Mew 150.00 B0.00

a TO REMOVE TAILGATE GLASS New 180.00 120.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 3,180.00 1,530.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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