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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 2:17 PM
To: Lee, Ming-Yao
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: TP / 0754154834SG [ACCIDENT BETWEEN JHG1816 & GBD917K  ON 

01/03/2019]
Attachments: VEP RECEIPT.pdf

TrackingTracking: Recipient Delivery

Lee, Ming-Yao

Admin A

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 11/7/2019 2:17 PM

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 11/7/2019 2:17 PM

shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 11/7/2019 2:17 PM

Your Ref: TP / 0754154834SG 
 
Dear George, 
 
We refer to the above matter and the telephone conversation between yourself and our Asher today. 
 
This is to confirm that the breakdown offer to Third party is as follows: 

1. COR                                                 : $ 6,099.00 
2. Loss of Use ($50 x 6days)             : $ 300.00 
3. VEP ($35 x 6 days)                         : $ 210.00 

TOTAL   : $ 6,609.00  
 
We will proceed to settle and close the matter with Third party accordingly. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 5:50 PM 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: TP / 0754154834SG [ACCIDENT BETWEEN JHG1816 & GBD917K ON 01/03/2019] 
 
Your Ref: TP / 0754154834SG 
 
Dear George, 
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We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
 
Kindly be informed that: 
 

 TPV entered SG on 26/2/2019 at 8.10PM and exited on 22/3/2019 at 6.07pm 
 Accident was on 01/03/2019 at 10.10 am 
 Date of Inspection was on 05/03/2019 
 Surveyor recommended days of repair is 6 days 

 
Kindly advice. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 5:38 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: TP / 0754154834SG [ACCIDENT BETWEEN JHG1816 & GBD917K ON 01/03/2019] 
 
Hi Khanchna, 
 
What is the repair time for TPV?  
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
MingYao.Lee@AIG.com | www.aig.sg 
  

 
 

Follow us: 

    
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the 
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any 
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer 
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system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG 
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 27 June 2019 17:32 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] YOUR REF: TP / 0754154834SG [ACCIDENT BETWEEN JHG1816 & GBD917K ON 01/03/2019] 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Your Ref: TP / 0754154834SG 
 
Dear  MingYao Lee, 
 
The above matter refers. 
 
Kindly be informed that the third party wants to also claim for VEP(as attached) for $ 649.90. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval on whether we can proceed to offer the same. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not 
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" 
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any 
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is 
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is 
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or 
damage arising in any way from its use. 


