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ComtortDelGro ineering Pte Lid
COMFORIDELGRO e S A
Maichne « 55 5383 428 Facurmes - £ 6000 073
ENGINEERING Wokshaes S
: ) S Mg e S STHTTT T Suom Pad Way Sngicam THS!
B i% Pumcgn Mioec Ginjdnon i IS 1 Yo e Pay L Segapors TSR
A member af CoMPRIDECGRD Date/Timg:" 0%.0372019 08:58 Page : 1
Team:  ARC Repair TP(CFSO0)1 JOB CARD  sales Order: JCNO- 305273870
MILEAGE
STOMER | REGN NO SaK
CITYCAB PTE LTD —— T
carsc 383 SIN MING DRIVE T ,N
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 1-40 03.03.2019 10:05
65551188 TARGET DATE
i " 9. 09. 2016
CHASSIS COMPLETION DATETIME
GRS "ﬁuanmmsa«lp
JO8 DESCRIPTION
Accident Date: 02.03.2019
NATURE: 3P 02.03.19 -
8/NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION
{ECKED & PASSED OUT BY,
SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATLURE
owlsdgemant Sip Exit Pass
("]
o Wahicie Mo
sie No. SHABS50K JU CHINA SHAB850K
i of Service Advisor SignatureDate Hame of Service Adwsor Date

& meturhnd o Service Reception upon callsction

To e kept by Security Guard




E .:’_:l’t,li

CITY CAB PTE LTD CHIM
REPAIR ESTIMATE*
VEWICLE NO : SHA 8850K DATE 4/3/2019 10:26 f‘ / /9
MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAIL 40
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Ty Unit Price Amount
Rear Bumper 'S il $  553.00
Rear Bumper Clip 10 pes X $ 22.00
Rear Bumper Bracket ! 3560 | § 71.20
Rear Bumper Sponge ! $ 10350
Rear Bumper Under Cover? §  228.00
SUB TOTAL 5 977.70
LESS 20% 5 195.54
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 782.16
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat 4 $ 50,00 |Nent
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo = 5 50.00 |Nett
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (LH/RH) e 100.00 | § 200,00 |Net
Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor \ 5 135.70 |Nett
§ 43570
Labour Clrnrge L
Panel| Beating 5 499’.1'ﬁ
Spray Painting Charge S 3t |2ee
Wiring Charge S 30T | e
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor 5 8004 pe
TOTAL LABOLR S 810,00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § 2.027.86
V r___'_—_ f—
L. ,é L ilely r P
| e
|
qé/f /’ 9 Hu’é. r
/7 |
|
M’ @‘” ) 4 —t____ ]
This 15 an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appomnted by the isurance company




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong. Tan@sg cntaiping coms

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2019 2:03 PM

To: Asher Sng [LKKAuUto) herSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: SNM19D202787-5FS4243T-TKL & Yr ref : CC3/CTI19004036/K1fa3 [SF5 4243 T) V5 SHA BBS0 K
D.0.A 02,0319

Without Prejudice

Dear Asher,

We refer to the above accident

Attached 15 our insured's GIA report for your necessary actions.
Thank you.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assislan! Execulive
Claims Departmant

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Lid.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 073909
DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sgentaiping.com | FB: www.lacebook comichinataipingsa

Disolmmer This e-mall and any fles fransmitted with it is mtanded ory for the mamed recipints and may contam confidential information. Any
unauthonzed oisclosure, use or dissaminabion of this message, oither in whale or parhisl, is prohiifod, If you are nol ihe niEN0eY MeCiDe, Hease
nedify the sender smmediately. Please delete the e-mall and any copues of f thereatiar

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Friday, August 30, 2019 5:57 AM

To: Tan Kah Leang <KahLeong. Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow chee@sg cntaiping. com>; willlamtan@cdge.com.sg; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Our Ref- SNM19D202787-SF54243T-TKL & Yr ref : CC3/CT119004036/K1fa3 (SF5 4243 T) VS SHA 8850 K
D.0.A.02.03.19

Dear Kah Leong,

Please assist 10 look into this matter and revert soonest possible.
Officer In Charge ~Tan Kah Leong- 6389 6193,

Regards

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Ple. Lid.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 0722309
Fax (65)6224 7175 /6224 7478

Email : clamsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Website:www 50 .cnlaiping.com




From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 17 lune 2019 2:20 PM

To: William Tan Thoo Seng <willlamtan@cdge. com.sg>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@|kkauto.com>, KKLau
<kklau@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com <alfred.t entalping.com>

Subject: RE: Yr ref : CC3/CT119004036/K1fa3 (SFS 4243 T) VS SHA 8850 K D.OA. 02.03.19

WITHOUT PREIUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi William,

We refer to the email below.

We are still pending our insured report from our principal.

Dur principal yet to revert to us till date, we are still following up the matter and shall revert to you soon.

Thank You.

dest Regond:

Asher Sng | Cose Hondied

LEE Auto Consultants Phe Lid

phone: 68414051 | emall gsbatsngBkkouto.com | ool 4741-4108
Bk &) Poyo Uty Indusiial Park. Ui Avanue |, #02-25 | 5{408%33)

From: William Tan Thoo Seng <williamtan@cdge.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 17 lune 2019 2:03 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; KKLau
<kklau@|kkauto.com>

Cc: alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
Subject: Re: Yrref : CC3/CT119004036/K1fa3 (SF5 4243 T) VS SHA B850 K D.O.A. 02.03.1%

Znd reminder

Without Prejudice.



Dear Poh Kin

The LOD was forwarded to you on 08.03.19,

Till to day, for almost two months, nothing heard from you. Kindly forward your driver's accident report and offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Willlam Tan
Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

Off : 62148737 | Fax: 62141843
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COMFORIDELCRO
ENGINEERING

Our Rel CC19030041/ SHABBSOK /WT{st)
Your Ref : ComforiDelGro Engineering Pl Ltd
Date 08-Mar-19 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept 205 Braidol Road Singapom STOT0Y
50 Loyang Drive 4th Fir Mabniine +65 5383 6280
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508969 Facaimilie +65 6280 9755
3 ANSON ROAD WS OO0 l:ftuln 80
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER w ”
SINGAPORE 079909 TR
. Braddall
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE Snonore 578701
Dear Sir Loyang
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHA8850K YOUR INSURED SFS4243T Sheos oot
AND OTHER ON 02.03.19 Sin Ming

We are the authorised repair workshop for Citycab Pie Lid, the owner of motor Vehicle No
SHABB50K which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle.

The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concernad have requested and authorized us to assist

them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising

from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving ©: SFS4243T
we are submilting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 69550

2 3 days Lossof Rental@ § 112.67 perday $ 33801

3 Survey Report Fees [Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5

4 LTA Search Fees s 7.49

5 GIA/Police Repart Fees $ -

6 Towing /! Medical / Transporation Fees 5 -
SubTotal: § 1.041.00

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 3 dayslossoflncome@ $ 80.00 perdays § 240,00

TotalClaims : $ 1,281.00

We enclose herawith the following documents to support the claims: -
a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 5

b) LTA search slip/s of : SFS4243T
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of : SHABB50K

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ X ) Pholocoples of Accidenl Scene Pholos { ) Certificate of Insurance
{ YPIR { » ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note thal it is a condition of any seitlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any parsonal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

William Tan
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : williamianf@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

A mimber ol

COMFORIDELGRO g

pCs.

383 Sin Ming Dnive
Singapore S757T17

Pandan
45 Pandan Road
Singapors 609286

Uk

220 Ubl Fosd 3
Singapore 408648
Senoko

=4 Sencho Loop
Sngapom T5R156

Sungel Kadul
T Sungei Kadut Way
Singapors 728751

Timhun

501 Yiihin Indugtriul Park A

Singapore TEETIR



SEUBLAVE 1, #01-23 PAYA LBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408938 TEL : (0631 62563561 FAX LS 6TA14108

Our Ref: CCYCTII9004036/K1ead

11 OCT 2019

ANG WAN MAY
61 DUCHESS AVENUE
SINGAPORE 269124

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFS 4243T AND SHA 8850K ON 02/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us il you have further queries.

Yours faithfully.

2

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6341 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @lkkaulo.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)



LG VARS. V. LetlorAuthorisanon

ACCIDENT INVOLVING
ALONG

1/ wa

and/or

Taxi Number

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(NAF | PAF]
i 40 SHABBS0K , SFS42437 ON 02-Mar-19 12:00
STEVEN RD > WHITLEY RD

LIM BOO TECK {Hirer] MRIC No,: S0136008F
POON KAH ONN (Ralief} NRIC No.; 55593841 '
SHABB50K

hersby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, |loss of rental,
madical fee and lagal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third pany (except personal jnjuries and medjcal dams).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our bahalf,

4, To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the ¢laim against third party and payment by chague
shall be forward directly to CDGE In accordance with CDGE's instruction and made (n favour of
"ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Ltd".

Date

Mama of Hirer
Hirer NRIC

AOdress

Contact No.

Name of Raljaf
Rellef NRIC

Address

Contact No.

http://cdgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG. V...

03-Mar-2019

LIM BOO TECK
S0136008F Signature : w ( I %M

543 BEDOK NORTH STREET 3 #06-1...
460543

84486611

POON KAH ONN
55593841 Signature :

e al

167 BEDOK SOUTH AVENUE 3 12-499
460167

-

81413732

Page | ot |

03/03/2019



Folicy We : DOHPCENI019521801 Clalm Mo : SHM19D2027B7
Claimant 3 CITY CAB PTE LTD
Amount : 551,100.00

DOLLARS OME THOUSAND OME HUNDRED ONLY.

[/We agree tao accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to me/us in full &
final asectlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by meSus through an accident invalving

TAN ENG KHOOM

Claimant Vehicle Ne. : SHA BESO0K

Insuced Vehicle No, : BFS 42417

Catze of Loss : DZ2/03/2018%8
Place of Accldent : STEVEWM RD > WHITLEY RD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementionsd sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID., I/We agree abasolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTID. and/or

Tnsured Name
Driver Nama

: AMG WAN MAY

: MARC SCOTT HARDY

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

{1) Global Sum 55 1,100.00
TOTAL + « & = o = & s s - u #'a s &« s 3% 1,100.00
Claimant Name : CITY CAB PTE LTD MRIC No :
Signature i Date H 35\“ t A
CLus Q&PIA - Ty
wONFORIDELGRD £ EbGuEs hJ.r,,]l
SOLCYANG DRive

MRGARSEE Shsge

The conens 0 16 ocumezd wT 10 Veficie dameges only Ploase forwara your chiegue mmmd payahlc
A peronel s and tanages aisng borson e ecidee  COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 11

e the antit and aoofication of s dooumen”



COMFOR'lDE]_GRO Cumfm'th:IGm Enginmarlng Ple Lid

(] Dol Ploast Bis

ENGINEERING e -t
A member of COMFORDELGRO - '. ::I II _It_' :
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 CUMPANY HEG. N0, : 1995000480
8010012
VEHULE WO MO/ DA
CHINA TATPING TNSURANCE 0O (SIPTE 11D SHABRSDK 4 30481 m 03.2M%9
SPRINGLEAF S0WHR { AR
o r e AKH 1ﬂI-I M.
1 ANSON ROAD #1600 HYIINDAT 7
HIRGAPORE 26 07949 AETHIN
L S LRIEN [y i
CONTACT NO: 62222366 =41 - PRI AT
HATE (¥ HEG BATE/TIME TN
29.09.2016 03.03.2019 10:05
) CHASSTS CODE
M Description : 3P 02.03.19 KMHT,R41[IMGI 093845
8/Ho  Part No. {ty Unit Price ®Dhisc Nat
PART REGUTSTTION
SUH-"ITYIATL : .00
JOR NATIURE
oonl PR PANEL BEATING 200,00 200.00
D02 &P SPRAYPAINYT (CHARGH Z00. 00 200, 00
ooG3 2005 HENEW AIVERTT SMENT 250,00 280100
STTCRER-
SUR="TOAL - fAf0. 00
=
omfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
member of COMFORIDXLCAQ ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ Ne
end Office; A,

15 Bruddell Road
ingapore 37970

indiy note that no receipt shall be issusd unless requastad,
USTOMER'S COPY




ComfortDelGro Engtmmrlng Ple Ltd
COMFOR-[DELGRO :rl,;" Geainod R il ‘;_-'luxr"
nEilite « 5 63 ¥ Facairila W0 BT
ENGINEERING . i .
383 S My Drres gt _.:'.-_'.l-.”."..l i
A membar of COMFORDELGRO e barg e ik oy e
(OMPANY REG. N0, : 19950604584
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Paga: 7
e VEHCILK NO TRV. NO/DATE
CHINA TAIPING TNSURARCE 0O (8)FTE TTD SHABRHBOK 91430481 07.03. 2019
BPRINGLEAF TOWK
SPRINGLEAF TOWKH MAKK 0K N0,
3 ARSON RODAD #1600 HYIINDA T ANK2T738T0
STRGAPORE 8G 079909
MOEL ONOMISTER KA NG
CONTACT ND: B2222356 i—40)
DATE _(OF KK DATR/TIME TN
29.09.2016 03.03.2019 10:05
(HASSTS (XK
— KMHI B4 LIMGIING 3845
items total /50,00
Add GET R T.000 % 45.50
Imvaics ameaint h95. Bl
[ssuad by : RATHERTNEV'AN 07.03.7019 16:01:51
Repair t CFSO/RT /AT
Ihy'rmnr %@flﬂl‘m /Cradit 30 dayn
s—

“omfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
L member of COMPORIDLLERD ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ N

dead Office:
105 Braddell Road
singapore 579701

<indly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requonated.
SUSTOMER'S COPY




OurRef. CC19030041 ‘S o (ﬂqfﬂb

Date: 07 March 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 02/03/2019 @ 1200 hrs
ALONG STEVEN RD > WHITLEY RD
INVOLVING SFS4243T

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that CityCab Pte Ltd is
the registered owner of the laxi bearing vehicle registration number SHABB50K (the
*Taxi"), The Taxi was hired to LIM BOO TECK IC NO S0136008F a registered hirer-
operator of CityCab Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident
at a rental rate $112.67 per day (inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was Insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a molor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

setilement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the sald
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainlina +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R

‘Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

Ref : CC3/CTI18004036/K 1ealq2

A

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079809 Pate 06112019
Code: CTI
1. _ Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SFS 42437 Veh. Inspected SHA 8B50K
Policy No. DMPCSN3019521801 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM19D202787 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 04/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGU093845 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 375837 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |208/80 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/80 R16 HANKOOK B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 02/03/22019 Inspection Date 04/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508989
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANGE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR

2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 166607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 8B50K
Description of Parts ‘Condition 7 e A (L djustect
& | i Workshop (8))| ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 553.00
LABCOUR
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP NOT NECESSARY 22.00
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKET @%35.60 SERVICEABLE 71.20 =
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 103.50
1|REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER SERVICEABLE 228.00 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -185.54
782.16
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBER MAT (SN} NOT NECESSARY 50.00
1|REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH/RH) NECESSARY 200,00 200,00
@$100,00 (SN)
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 135.70 -
435.70 250.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 400.00 200.00
BUMPER .
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 300.00 200.00
WIRING CHARGE. NOT MECESSARY 30.00 -
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
B10.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,027.86 650.00
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1 650,00
Report Ref No. CC3/CTI19004036/K1ea3qg2
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessar

CISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Heport is msos solaly 1o7 the use snd banefit of the Client named on 1he rent pegs of this Repon.




