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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March 2019 4:15 PM

To: 'CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter'

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SGR 9900R   - DOA : 25/02/2019      Our Ref: 

NSV1900113

Dear Chee Kiong, 

 

Confirm final figure at $7,011.40, 4days. 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March 2019 11:52 AM 

To: 'CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter' <pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com> 

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SGR 9900R - DOA : 25/02/2019 Our Ref: NSV1900113 

 

Dear Chee Kiong, 

 

I got my calculation is 

 

Parts $5,138.00 

+10% $5,651.80 

Labour: $1410 

S/N: 75 

Total $7,136.80 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter <pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 19 March 2019 3:13 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: OD survey assignment for SGR 9900R - DOA : 25/02/2019 Our Ref: NSV1900113 

 


