Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Tang, Ben <Ben.Tang@awac.com> on behalf of Motorsurvey
<Motorsurvey@awac.com>

Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 2:00 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Motorsurvey; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); assignments

Cc: SUR; 'CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter'

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SGR 9900R - DOA : 25/02/2019  Our Ref:
NSV1900113

Dear Denise

We refer to above matter.
Please proceed to finalized amount of $7,332.40 inclusive of check items.
Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0816

F: +65 6423 0864

E: ben.tang@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 March 2019 10:42 AM

To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter' <pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com>
Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for SGR 9900R - DOA : 25/02/2019 Our Ref: NSV1900113

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SGR 9900R

Please let us have your approval for confirm check item and supplemantary.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



