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S00N HOCK MOTOR PTE LTD 04/03/19

QUOTATION FOR VEHICLE SHF 1528 J

PARTS

FRONT DOOR (RH) p..(/.;,s" 1,318.38 £—

FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR (RH) $ 816.80 «—
SUB TOTAL § 213496
LESS 10% $ 213.50
DISCOUNTED SUB TOTAL § 102148

SINETT

FRONT DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO € 10000 Fota_
SUB TOTAL s 100.00

LABOUR

PANEL BEATING s 0000 £

SPRAYPAINTING CHARGES s 40000 2oy

WIRING CHARGES $ 30,00 2
SUB TOTAL $ 830.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 285146

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE ABOVE IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE

THEREFORE SHOULD THERE BE ANY ADDITIONAL PARTS

REQUIRE OR DISCOVER DAMAGE DURING OUR COURSE OF

REPAIRS. WE WOULD INFORM YOU ACCORDINGLY FOR THE

NECESSARY ACTIONS. PRICES OF PARTS QUOTED ARE

SUBJECT TO CHANGE WITHOUT NOTICE

AAer Aﬂ“mu



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 3:00 PM

To: olames@gmail com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH2440J AND SHF1529) AT CANADIAN INT SCHOOL
(LAKESIDE) DROP OFF POINT

Attachments: GlA-addendumform SLH3440) pdf

Importance: High

Dear Mr. Holmes Christopher Robert,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING ND I T OOL [(LAKESIDE) DROP OFF POI

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SHF1529) against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us
your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for
an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

If you have any evidence/information (e.g. video/photographs) to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 12/06/2019, after we shall proceed with negotiation with
Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by
you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount {NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim, However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Kindly also re-confirm the date of Accident as to whether it occurred on 02/03/2019 or 03/03/2019 and fill up the GIA
Addendum form.

Please call us if you have further queries.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Vic (LKKAuto) T —

From: Vie (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2019 9:35 AM

To: sponhockmotor@gmail com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKEKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref SHF 1529)_ ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLH 3440) AND SHF 1529)
ON 02/03/2019 LKK REF CC4/AIG19004025/Khb3

Attachments: SLH 3440) 020319.MP4; STATEMENT.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear William,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLH 3440) AND SHF 1529) ON 02/03/2019
We refer to the subject matter and to your LOD.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of this accident.

Our Insured had reported that he was stationary to unload passengers and the passenger door was already left open
for a while. However, your client, while also stationary did not take proper notice of the opened door and moved off
instead of waiting for the door to be closed. Please refer to the attached video footage that shows the entire
incident.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.
We will now close the matter in our end.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

1¥¥ == Save the Earth- Print only when necessery:

This &-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipiant. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah MdNoor@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 June, 2012 9:03 AM

To: OLAMES@GMAILCOM

Ce Vic [LKKAuto); Khanchna (LKE Auto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH3440) AND SHF1529) on 2.03.2019 AT CANADIAN INT

SCHOOL (LAKESIDE) DROP OFF POINT

Our Ref: 66687648445G (003)
Our Policy: 2100488188

Dear Sir,
We refer to our telephone conversation yesterday.

Kindly be advised that we revised your liability Not At Fault for this accident.
We have instructed our surveyor, M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to reject third party claim,

Hope the above clarifies.

Thank you

Kind regards
MNorsiah

Norsiah Md Noor

AIG

Compiax Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapora 075120

Tel «(A5) 8410-1806

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The informalbion in this amail (and any attachmants) is confidential If you are nol the infended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information, if you have received this email in ermor, please mmediately nolify me by “Reply™ command and permanently delete ihe arginal and any
popies of prinfouts thereal, Although this email and any attachments are belisved fo be free of any virus or other dedect thal might affect any
compiter systam into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient fo ensure that if is virus free and no responsibilify s
accepled by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from s use

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
vou must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other

1



defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International

Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way [rom its use.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 607 PM

To: Christopher Holmes

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH3440) AND SHF1529) AT CANADIAN INT SCHOOL

[LAKESIDE) DROP OFF POINT

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19004025/KFB3

Good Afternoon Mr. Holmes,
We have taken note of your e-mall below and will liaise accordingly with our principal, AIG.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Christopher Holmes <olames@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 5:20 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH3440) AND SHF1529) AT CANADIAN INT SCHOOL (LAKESIDE) DROP OFF POINT

Good afternoon,

Please note my car was stationary at the time it was stuck, and | have a video of the incident. Now would be the time to
inform the driver of SHF1529) that the incident was fully captured by the camera's at the Canadian School and If he is
claiming me, that is insurance fraud. AIG has been sent this video and my vehicle was repaired with no deductible being
paid as they would they pursue against the other party.

| will not accept any reduction in NCD as | am at no fault for this accident as per the video proof and accident report. |

will be contacting AIG to discuss this further.

On Thu, May 30, 2019 at 9:59 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mr. Holmes Christopher Robert,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH3440] [AIG] AND SHF1529) AT CANADIAN INT SCHOOL (LAKESIDE) DROP OFF POINT



Aq SOON HOCK MOTOR PTE LTD

r' Ty ke ¥
Our Rel: MTP/53063/19 \ |

Your Ref: SLH 3440 ]
Date: 15 Apr 2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
The Motor Claims Department
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Payva Ubi Ind Park
Singapore 408933

Dear Sir'/Madam
RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHF 1529 J & SLH 3440 J ALONG ACANADIAN
INTERNATIONAL SCHOOL ON 02 MAR 2019,

We are authorised by the owner of motor vehicletaxi, SHF 1529 J, which was involved
in the above-mentioned accident to claim damages against you.

The motor vehicle/taxi was surveyed by your appointed appraiser at the premises of M/s
Soon Hock Motor Pre Lid. The accident was caused by vour insured’s negligent driving
and/or management of his vehicle. Therefore, we are claiming property damages and
losses sustained by our client against vou in connection with the accident based on the
appraiser’s recommendation

Owur claim 1s as follows:

1) Cost of Repair S$ 2.000.00
2) Loss of Revenue 5% F50.00
1) LTA Search 5% 2.00

S§  2.752.00

We enclose herewith the following relevant supporting documents:

a) Authorisation Letter
b} Final Repair Bill

c) GIA Report

d) LTA Search

Any settlement is limited to the aforesaid claim only and does not prejudice our hirer’s
rights to any personal injury claims and/or losses in future should such a claim arises.

Yours faithfully,
> . t .
[ 09

i

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Industnial Park 2A. AMK AutoPomt #01-05/06. Singapore 368047, Tel: 165) 6483 6016 Fax: 165) 6483 6015
Company Registration No. © 199804869H



A-I SOON HOCK MOTOR PTE LTD

HDT SINGAPORE TAXI PTELTD
NO. 47 JALAN PEMIMPIN
HALCYON 2 #03-05
SINGAPORE 577200

VEHICLE NO
SHF 1529 J

DATE
12/04/2019

INVOICE NO
005007

ACC DATE/TIME
02.03.2019 @ 11:35 HRS

Cost of Repair

(SGD DOLLARS: TWO THOUSAND ONLY)

$ 2,000.00

TOTAL 3 2,000.00

Kindly arrange for payment as soon as possible.  All cheques must be crossed and made

payable to SOON HOCK MOTOR PTE LTD

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A, AMK AutoPoint #01-05/06, Singapore 568047, Tel: (65) 6483 6016 Fax: (65) 6483 6015
Company Registmation No,

199804865H



HDT

Hiki Diipaerry Timprrhas:
S
HDT SINGAPORE TAXI PTE LTD REGISTRATION NO 201609484H
Letter of Authority
To: Whom it may concern,
Accident invalving $ME x99 g £ W 3¥te T
alang P Fip  FrelaeTamAl  TTHooL on 0s/e3 /11

We, HDT Singapore Taxi Pte Ltd, Company Registration No.201609494H, located at 47, Jalan
Pemimpin #03-05 Singapore 577200, owner of mator vehicle registration No. _ fiFrr29 J

Insured by MS First Capital Insurance Ltd under Policy No. #=1Fuo 7 (t¥e~Zis/a¢ do hereby

authorize M/s Soon Hock Motor Pte Ltd as our authorized representative to write, negotiate
and settle claims on our behalf in our claim against the owner and/or motor vehicle

registration No. _SLH I¥4%e T in respect of the above-mentioned accident. We also

hereby authorize that the agreed settlement sum (cost of repair, loss of use, earnings &
rental, survey report fee, LTA fee and GIA report fee) be made in favour of our
representative, M/s Soon Hock Motor Pte Ltd and that the said payment be forwarded to

them as full and final discharge of our claim.

Signature:

Company stamp if applicable

Address: 47 Jalan Pemimpin Halcyon 2 203-08 Singapore 577200
Main Line: 67135 3760, Fax: 6258 0774
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lof2

GENERAL
INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

hitps:// www.gurme. org. s/ claims/ index. cim/ fusebox =M | Ksas&.

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Cuay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday o Friday 9am lo S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Ref No: GR-18-033578

Date of Request: 02/03/2019 Your Ref No Online Purchase

Soon Hock Motor Ple Lid

Bilk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A

#01-05/06 AMK Aulopoint

Singapore 568047

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 02/03/2019

Enquiry By Chris Lim Gan Koon

TP Vehicle Mo, SLH34404

Accident Date 02/03/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vahicle No Insurer Period of Insurance {Insurer Tal. No.
SLH3440. AlG Asia Pacific Insuranca Ple. L‘r.l:l 31/10/2018-30/10/2019 65-6419-3000
Thank You

The images provided (0 you are taken from the onginal repons forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the General Insuranca
Association of Singapore and wa taka no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss
or damage arising oul of or in connection with the reports or their images

This is a computer generated documant and requires no signature.

3272019, 1:37 PM



Invoice

«0

f2

GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Cur Ref No: GR-19-033578
Date of Requast: 02/03/2019

Soon Hock Motor Ple Ltd
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24

hitps://www.giarme org sg/claims/index.cim?tusebox=MTRsas& ..

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registralion No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No Online Purchase

#01-05/06 AMK Autopoint

Singapora 568047

Dear SinfMadam,

Enquiry Dats 02/03/2019

Enquiry By Chris Lim Gan Koon

TP Vehicle Na, SLH3440J

Accident Dale 02/03/2019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a compuler generated document and requires no signatura,

For GIARMC Official use:
Data:
[%] GIRO [ ] Cash [ | Cheque

3272019, 1:37 FM



MS First Capital insurance Limited (e teg Ne 1950000060 GA7 Amg so MEO00LETSS

MS @ FirstCapital s gy £23.00 Smgapor 43508

Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (BS) 6222 3547
Chairs & Motor Undwrwriting Deot 36 Robinson Aoad #16-01 City Houss Singapore 068877
Tal: (65) 6507 3B48 Fax: (B5) 6507 3648
wwwmstitstcapital.com g

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE ORIGINAL

Motor Viehicles [Third-Party Risks and Compensalion) Act (Chapter 188)
Wetor Vahicies [Third-Pary Risks and Compensation) Rulae, 1860
Road Transpor Act, 1887 (Malaysia)

Mator Yehicles (Third-Party Risks ) Rules, 1855 (Malaysia)

Type of Policy TAXIS - FLEET
Type of Cover, Comprehensive
Cenificate No. D-1B0S1840MFSHZE
Vehicle No / Chassis No SHF1529J f LCOCE4DB2G 1071065
I Name of Insured HOT SINGAPORE TAX| PTE.LTD
Period Of Insurance 15.08.2018 To 14.09.2018
insured Estimated Value Markel Value At Time Of Loss
Financial Institullon - NA
( Excess :

EGD3.000.00 ALL CLAIME EACH AND EVERY LOSS

Authorised Driver
ANY AUTHORISED DRIVERS

Persons of classes of persons entitled to drive®
a) Any licensed taxl driver driving on the Insured's order or with their permission.
b} Any person provided he s in tha Insured's employ and is driving on their order or with their permission

* Provided that the persan driving Is parmilted in sccordancs with (ha licensing o oihar laws or reguiations to drive Lhe Mator Yehide or has been
82 permitied and is mol disqualified by order of @ Courl of Law of by ressan of any enactmend o regulalion In that behall fram driving the Mator
Vishiche.

Limitations as to use®
Use as & taxl. Use for zocial, domestic and pleasurs purposes.

The Policy does not cover
{1} Uag for racing, pace-making, reliability trial or speed lesting
(2] Use whilst drawing & traller except the towing (other than for reward of any ona disabled mechanically propetied vehicle.

* Limitstions rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Molar Vehicles (Third-Farty Risks and Campensation) Act (Chapler 188) and Section
( 85 of the Road Transport Acl, 1687 (Malaysia), are not to be included under thess headings.

I'We HEREBY CERTIFY that the Policy 1o which this Certificate relates |s issued In accordance with the provisions of the Motor
Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapler 188) and Part IV of the Road Transpart Act, 1887 (Malaysia)

M5 First Capital Insurance Limitad
[Approved ingurers)

SUSANDODEIMEZL00A ﬂ’d—‘

Issued at Singapore on 09.10.2018 Authorised Signature

a e of [[EERERER) NSURANCE CROUP



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Ravoked / No aettlement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - -
Case | Notifieg Est Submitted Al Asmignen Ad) Rpe | Ady Submitted Ins Auth'ed | Status
a |05 Mar 2019 E';‘,:' 4019 £%2,000.00 £$1,000.00 i""‘""'. l for Survey
Edit Ry | Edit Ady Rpt I Edit Exomarm | | view #pr C Case |

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Insured: Holmes Christopher Robert, 1D: 58087210)

Main k
Clammant. | WOT SINGAPORE TAXI PTELTD, Co. Reg, No.: 201609454

Vehicle Reg. 02/03/2019 1100 - :59
ho.: 1 [25 Months and 11 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥rj]

{Claim Type: | TP / 666876484456 Policy/Cover |5, 50488188
. | Nate Na.:

\ehicle Reg
|No SLH3Ia40)

SHF1529) | Date of Loss!

'mwm_
| {Clairmant):
| Excegs;
Soon Hock Motor Pta Ltd {(HQ) Bik 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Fark 24, #01-05/06 AME Autopoint, S6B047 Ang Ma Kic - Tal:
GABIG0 16

AIG Azia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 .., [Handled by MdMoor, Norsiah] Norsiah MaNear@lalg. com

0-18091940MFSH/26

M5 First Capltal Insurance Ltd (HGQ) - Tel) £2222311
(Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) - Tel: 6256-3561 _ [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 14/03/2019]
|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case man |

ls LKK_MG (13/06/2019); Re: Conflicting DOA
| AIG_SG (06/01/2015); Conflicting DOA

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | complete |

Due Date Priority Typs  Task Group Subject  Handlar Assignad By Completed On Craated On Dona?
Na results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp _c... 1/7/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*5HF1529) (6668B7648445G)
[SI.I'I13_:4M]
HDT SINGAPORE TAXI PTE LTD
Mar 2 2019 11:00AM

[Holmes Christopher Robert]
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg ne 19ss07158m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, F'a‘yra Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email surf@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/AIG19004025/KHB302

Date: 01/07/2019
BREFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No: 21004868188
Claimant Vehicle siiF1520) Insured Vehicle No :  SLH3440J
Daie of Loss: 02/03/2019 Nature of Claim; TP Claim No: G668TE4B44SG
RESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SHF1529J
Make & Model: BYD E&H, (A) Engine No: HIDDEN
Reg Date: 18/01°2017 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis Na: LCOCE4DB2G1071065
Colour: Metallic Green Odometer: 208090 km
Engine Capacity: Oce
Market Value/New Car Price: NIA
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-acciden! Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fronl Tyre Size: 225/85 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/85 R17
Front Left Side: Pirelll 9@ mm Rear Left Side; Pirelli 9 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelll 9 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 9 mm
Tha above valuss represent (he remaining fyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Paris 202148 2,001 48 20.00 0.99
Miscallansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 830.00 530.00 300.00 36.14
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 2,851.46 2,531.46 320.00 11.22
Approved Total (Overridden) [55) 2,000.00
Nett Amount [S$) 2,851.46 2,000.00 85146  29.86
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/03/2019
Date Inspected: 08/03/2019 Inspected At Soon Hock Motor Pte Lid (HQ)
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24, #01-
05/068 AMK Autopoint
Singapare 588047
Estimated Period of Repair: 20 days
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: Thin repivt represents our findings al the lime and place of inapection sfpted hersin. Such inspection has been carmed ouf 1o the best of our
knowiedos and ability but any other labdity undor any olher circumatances is heraby expressly evcluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT DOOR (RH) Bent 1.318.36FL *1.31836FL
2 1 “FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR (RH) Dented / Cul 816.60FL “816.60FL
3 1 *FRONT DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO Necessary 100.00FS *BO.DDFS
F=Franchme pan. S=5Spchan. L=LntilemDisc
Sub Total (S5) 223496 2.214.96
= List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S$) 213.50 213.50
Total Parts (S§) 2,021.46 2,001.48

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

There are no now miscellansous llems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repalrer's Amount

Labour llems

1 PAMNEL BEATING Mew 400.00 250.00

2 SPRAYPAINTING CHARGES New 400.00 260.00

3 WIRING CHARGES Mew 30.00 20.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) B30.00 530.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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