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Hi Saw theng, there is no response from third party till date on the acceptance. In view we would like to
submit our report and temp close off the matter. Shall reopen the case if third party return. TQ Asher



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 February 2022 12:58
To: Thiam Heng Huat
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 2948R AND YP 7199J ON 26/02/2019
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir,

We refer to the email below.

Our principal maintain the previous offer as it was a merging lane.
Kindly advise your client to reconsider and let us have your acceptance.
Thank You.

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 5 I, Poyo Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1 #02 25 | 5(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 11:19

To: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176 @yahoo.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 2948R AND YP 7199J ON 26/02/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS




Hi Sir,

We refer to the email below.

Our principal maintain the previous offer as it was a merging lane.
Kindly advise your client to reconsider and let us have your acceptance.

Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176 @yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 11:04 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 2948R AND YP 7199J) ON 26/02/2019

Dear Asher,

Sorry for the late reply.

Our client has rejected the offer of $3,460. Attached is the police result for your attention. Please take
note that due to the fact that your principal's insured driver did not lodge any police report, police is
unable to investigate.

Please revert with a favorable reply.

Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Thursday, 27 May 2021, 10:49:33 am SGT, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <ashersng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS



Hi Sir,

We refer to the email dated on 04/05/21.

Please let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 12:05 PM

To: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 2948R AND YP 7199J ON 26/02/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.



On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, our principal propose the settlement at Global Sum
S$$3,460.00 (all-in).

Please kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108) did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 11:49 AM

To: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 2948R AND YP 7199J ON 26/02/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

We refer to the email below.



We are chasing our principal on the approval, shall revert to you once our principal revert.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 11:22 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 2948R AND YP 7199J ON 26/02/2019

Dear Asher,

We refer to our email dated 14 Jan 2021.

Would appreciate if you could give us a reply on this matter soon.

Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd



82636295

On Thursday, 14 January 2021, 04:08:32 pm SGT, Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Asher,

Dear Claims Team,
We refer to the above claim mentioned.

Attached is the repair invoice, LTA search receipt, letter of authorization and below are the items our
client wish to claim from AXA.

1. Repair costs $6,420.00

2. Loss of use for 8 days 1,200.00

(including weekend)

3. LTA search fee 7.45
$7,627.45

We look forward to an early settlement.

Warmest regards,
Steven
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295



On Thursday, 14 January 2021, 03:22:12 pm SGT, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <ashersng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 2948R AND YP 7199J ON 26/02/2019

Our surveyor have finalise COR at $6,000.00 (exclude gst) 7 days, finalize amount subject to our principal approval.

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108)| did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



