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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: N,4onday, 4 March 2019 5:11 PM

To: Vale Oh

Cc: CHOW Soon Hee Gene (gene.chowsh@axa.com.sg); KKLaU; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Bryan

, Ang (LKKAuto); HO Vincent; LKK Valuation
Subject: RE: Assistance required: Effect MV for SKL6448J

Dear Vale,

The market value of SKL 6448J is $120K-$125K (Estimated) as at March 2019

Best Regards,

Veron chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 I email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CHOW Soon Hee Gene <gene.chowsh @axa.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 t2:26 PM

To: bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; admin @a utoprobe.com.sg; nick@ lbs-a uto.com; jimmy.lee @ priorityservices.sg;

cynth ia.o ng @ p rio rityse rvices. sg; ricky@ rta.com.sg; elson@ rta.com.sg; co llin.wo ng @ a-pa c.sg; patrick.soo @a-pac.sg;
frankie@fta.com.sg; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivia lau @ lkka uto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

<bryana ng@lkkauto.com>; motorsurvey@fta.com.sB; HO Vincent <vincent. ho @axa.com.sg>; LKK Valuation
<va luation @ lkka uto.com>; OH Vale <vale.oh @axa.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Assistance required: Effect MV for SKL6448J

Dear Va lued Partners,

Kindly check MV and update Ms Vale

DOA: 1./3/19

Thanks and Regards,

Gene

---Disclaimer---
Th is message may contain confidentia I information intended solely for the use of the named add ressee. lf you a re not

the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content ofthis message. lf you have

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



PARF/COE Rebate EnquirY

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner lD Typei

Owner lD:

VehicleDetails 1

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

lntended Deregistration Datei

VehicleMake:

Vehicle Model:

PrimaryColour:

Manufacturing Year:

Entine No,i

ChassisNo-:

MaximumPower Output:

Open MarketValue:

Original Retistration Date:

First Registration Date;

Transfer Count:

ActualARFPaid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF ElicibiliW:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF RebateAmount:

lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Cate8ory:

COE Pdriod(Years):

QP Paid:

COE RebateAmount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The informatign contained herein is correct as at 02 Mar 2019

Singapore NRIC

4967H

SKLd{48J

Yes

o4Mar2ole f\ .{ - s }ZO.OOo
TOYOTA

IEXUS GS35O LUXURY AUTO
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Black

2013

2GR8824511

JTHBE18L3O5O29632

233.0kw {312 bhp)

$66,481.00

06 Dec2013

06 Dec 2013

0

$91,666.00

Yes

05Dec2O23 -//a
$64,166.m

05 Dec 2023

B -Car{1601cc & above)

10

$?6,607.00

$3.i,408.00

$100,574-oo
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