Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 171 December 2012 334 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto): Admin A

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D200450-GBH5927C-CBS - [MANDATE REQUEST] ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBH 5927C (OI) AND GZ 4530R (TP) ON 02/03/2019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Your Ref: Please advise
Our Ref: SNM19D200450C02/7(cbs)

Dear Asher
You may proceed to resolve claim at 55,752.00.

We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh{@sq.cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: XS Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with It Is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipiant,
please notify the sender immediately, Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) |[mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December, 2019 2:24 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.coms=; Alfred
Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 5o Chow <scchow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D200450-GBH5927C-CBS - [MANDATE REQUEST] ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 5927C (O}
AND GZ 4530R (TP} ON 02/03/2019

Hi Sir,

We refer to our email dated 10/10/20189.

Third party is chasing for settlement.



i}:lndh.r let us have your approval [ Instruction if any.

Thank You.

Best Regonds,
Asher Sng | Cose Hondies
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

pione: ABA |-A051 | emall! gthersng®@kkauta com | bax 4741-4108

Bk 51. Poya Ubi industriol Park, Ui Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

B

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 3:22 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg. cntaiping.com>; Alfred
Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D200450-GBH5927C-CBS - [MANDATE REQUEST] ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 5927C (Ol)
AND GZ 4530R (TP) ON 02/03/2019

Hi Sir,

We refer to our emall dated 10/10/2019.

Third party is chasing for settlement.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any,

Thank You.

Besl Eegornds,

Asher Sng | Casa Handles

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone; 4841-8051 | emall: geshersng@ikkoutp.oom | fox 4741-2108

Bl 51. Payd Ubl indusirial Podk. L Avenue 1. £02-25 | 5{408933)



From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.coms

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2019 4:58 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg cntalping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping. com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee®sg cntalping.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D200450-GBH5927C-CBS - [MANDATE REQUEST] ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 5827C (Ol) AND
GZ 4530R (TP) ON 02/03/2019

Dear Sir,
Officer in charge — Boon Sen

Dear Boon Sen,

fya

Regards,
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd,

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908
T (65) 63896116 | F: (B5) 62247175

W: www sgcntaiping com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsg/ | WeChat: L 13§ Taiping SG

Diisclamar, Ths e-mad and any fles transmitted with f s mfended anly for the named recipients and may contiin confidentiad information. Any
unauthonTed disclosue, use or dissemination of this message adher i whoke or partral (s probibited I you are nof the infanded recipian!. plaase nolify
fhe sender immedintely, Please delete the a-maid and any copes of if thenealier

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) |[mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 4;10 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg cntaiping. com>
Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg cntaiping. com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 5927C (O1) AND GZ 4530R (TP) ON 02/03/2019

Your ref TBA
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.
N NG GBH 5927C (O1) AND GZ 4530R ON 02/03/2019
The accident occurred when our insured roll forward and hit third party parked vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA
scenario 23 is applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured's favour.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
We seek your approval to offer repairer * FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at 55,752.00 (all-in}.

The summary |s as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
3



1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) $ 10,882.97 $ 5,350.00

2. Loss of Use (Sdays x $100) 5 500,00 S 400,00 (SDays x $80)
3, LTA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
Total $ 5,752.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please,

Thank You.

Bes! Ragardy,

Asher Sng | Case Hondle

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

prhore: 841-4081 | emnall gehenngSkkguto.com | lax 47414108
Bik 51. Pova Ut industial Pork. Ubi Avenue |, w02-25 | 5[408733)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hup: /www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteecloud.com




FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date 23.03.2019

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909

Aun: Motor Cluim Department
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES : GZ 4530R / GBH 5927C ON 02.03.2019

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicleno: GZ 4530R | which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no:  GBH 5927C . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his’her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accidenl was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1} Cost of Repair {inclusive of GST) 5 5,350.00
2) LossofUse 5 500.00
3} GIA Search Fee b 2.00

5 5,852.00
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:
a) Final Repair Invoice b} Car Rental Invoice / Agreement
c) GIA Search Result d) Letter of Authoerisation, etc...
e) GIA Repon f) IC & Driving Licence
g) Insurance Certificate h} Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the setilement of our customer's claims
as so0n as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank voir )
Yours faithfully,

Jason Tang (jason(d to.com.sg)
Faor Fastech Auto Pie Lid
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA LIBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CCO/CTI19003963/Ufa3

31 JULY 2019

M/S YOU SECURITY SERVICES
55 SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4
#01-01 89

SINGAPORE 555859

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 5927C AND GZ 4530R ALONG/AT KIM PONG
RD CARPARK ON 02/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Depr)



DATE : (N 03.2019

TO : fﬁhm Tﬂ.q}ma\ INSufance Hﬂlﬂﬂlﬂ] e Ud

RE * ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENo. __Z IS10R |/ 4RH 93¢

atoneg M i ﬂ"-fr'} Rad
ON__ [).01.2019

I'We, Xi e Li P ld B
® of RICNo/ROCNG)  JIRIITASYY

of 3 Mb Wbt bad | wes-1 Sgapore wisqz

owner of vehicle no. 67 450)R in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle (17 US20f, at my/our instraction and hereby

authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

mmmmmhbymmﬁnmymﬁmmhﬂmmmmmm

Mfmy,mdamymfmtb&mﬂuﬁmhmmmﬁlmﬂfmlmdm

mmmmwmﬁmwmmmmmufmuﬁwmm

all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely,

Waﬁnﬂﬁmnmﬂmdmmindnmﬂyﬁmagdmﬂwabwmmdaﬁnm

Signature of Owner :

Name of Owner :
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Policy Ho DMCVENLBZZ2T711800 Claim Mo : SNM180200450

L

Claimant : XI DE L1 PTE LTD

Amount $  5%5,75i.00
DOLLARS FIVE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED AND FIFTY TWO ONLY.

I/We agres ro accepc cthe above mentioned amount to be paid to me/us in foll &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us Chrough an accident Lnvolving

Claimant Vshicle Mo, : GI 4530R

Insured Vehlcle No. : GBH S927C
Date of Loas : 02/D03/201%
Place of Accident : KIM PONG ROAD

IM CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURARNCE (SINGAPORE) PIE. LTD., 1/We agres absolotely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/far

Inaured Name : YOU SECURITY SERVICES
Driver MHame i FOONG SONG CHUAM

from all clalms, present or future Lln respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising cut of the said accident.

1 acknowledge thst this payment [3 made without admission of llahility an the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Censral Damages £5
(2) Cost pof Nepalr/Bsas=ss L 5,350,00
(3} Loas of Use/Rental/Earning 58 400.00
(1) GIA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Sesarch Fees 5% 2.00
(%) Medical Reports/Expenses £s
(&) Survey Fees/Towlng Fee/Disbursement 5%
{7} Cost including Disbursemsnt 55
BUTAL v » o = & = & 3 & 31 & e s woy B 5,752.00

Claimant Yame : HRIC Mo : 200B14985W

1 fo2/2020

Signature 3




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice : 20936
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

3 Ansen Road Date :23.03.2019
#16-00 Springleaf Tower Vehicle No (GZ 4530R
Singapore 079909 Make'Model - MITSUBISHI L300
ChassisEng#
Attn 2 Motor Claim Department Accident Dute  :102.03.2019
Claim Mo
Relerence 0319 20936
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair S$ 5000.00
E.&O.E. Towl : S8 S000.00
GST @ 7% : S8 350.00
Amaunt Due = S8 535000
s=——"739——4—/¥7Z%Z72mm—j

r'.

]

for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
All Invoices are subjected to GST




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL
I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520 / 6746 5786

Co. Reg No: 52928467K

Invoice : DCR-2019-03-08

To: X1 DE LI PTE LTD
Daie : 06.03.2019
Agreement No : 20599
Payment Term : LOD
. DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : GBB 5697Y | 0319-20936 | 5 170.00
Rental Period from 04.03.2019 to 06.03.2019
E&O.E. Total s 170.00

LINA PANG
for Dynamic Car Rental




AL TERMS AND C

Dynamic Car Rental

! KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, lﬂidﬁﬂﬂrﬁﬂ' AUTOBAY. SINGAPORE 417885

TEL' (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 67465
Co. Reg. No. 52928487K

_No. 2‘9
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AMOUNT DUE | REFUND

| HAVE READ THE TEFIMS AND

ON BOTH SIDES

RENTER'S/DRIVER'S SIGNATURE
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
|NSUME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GSTR d
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE SErEirasion No: MIGNOTIF35

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Rel No GR-19-034241
Date of Request: 04/03/2019 Your Ref No: Cnline Purchase

Kim Chwee Aulo Ple Lid

1 Kaki Bukil Avenue & #01-48
AuloBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 4178683

Dear Sir/Madam,

!nnulrg.nI Date 04/03/2019
Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
TP Vehicla No. GBH5827C
Accidant Date 02/03/2018
Enquiry Result
TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GBH58927C China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 24/07/2018-23/07/2019 6389 6111
GBH5827C China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. 20/07/2018-19/07/2019  |6389 6111
Thank You.

wm provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the mambers of the General Insurance
iation of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any

loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This s a computer generated document and reqguires no signature,

hitps./isingapore. merimen comiclaims/index cfm ?usebox=MTRsasAluseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=2075121ACFID=4825T6164CFTOKEN=bZs.
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04/03720M4

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref Na: GR-19-034241

Date of Request; 04/03/2019 Your Ref Na:

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@HKaki Bukit

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
uﬂm RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSUWE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Dear SirlMadam,

enquiry Date 04/03/2019

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. GBH5827C

Accident Date 02/03/2019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a compuler generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

.\te:

[X] GIRD [] Cash [ | Cheque

https./fsingapore. menmen.com/claimsindex cim Husabox=MTRsasaluseaction=dsp_oaninvip&refid=20751214CFI0=192576 16&CFTOKEN=h2e. 2z



