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AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

176 Sin Ming Drive #05-12 Sm Mimg Autocare Singapore 375721 ———r
[FL A58 3637 FAX: 6456 16R6  Email adminaalmsmcom sg ( VVEVAD A
SURVE YOR.COPY

OST MONMG630-E ROB MO 064 THI00H

s

M/S: LIMCHIH YENG

23 LORONG ONG LYE Estimate No:  MCS1900042
Date: 26 Feb 2019
SINGAPORE 536386 Policy No: MT/00432519/01
TEL: 96354699 Veh Reg No:  SLI4970D
ATTN: MakeModel:  HONDA VEZEL HYBRID
g 15X A
Your Ref No: SLI4970D e7 AW/}HM
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  22/0272019 M"’V A 9‘4.- Ve ey
TP Veh Reg No: SHD7314H
Zota, .,
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLJ4970D PAGE:1/1
Description Quantity List Price Amount
55 55
SPARE PARTS V4
1 FRONT FENDER LH I PC s3p00 X
2 FRONT FENDER WHEEL ARCH I PC 197.00 7
T3L.00
Less 20%, 146.20 SR4.80
LAROLUR
I 7O ALIGN FRONT FENDER LH AND 10 ENOCK & REPAIR FRONT LH 1 PC A0 1M f-fﬁf
AFFECTED AREA AND REFIT LISTED PARTS BACK
4 TOSPRAY FRONT BUMPER. FRONT FENDER LH 1 PC A00.00 ?zﬁf
R0, 00) H00,00
T otal 55 1,384 80
Add GST @ M 9694
Total Amount Pavahle 55 148174

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR ONE THOLSAND FOUR HUNDRED EIGHTY ONE AND CENTS SEVENTY FOLUR ONLY

Please arrange this vehicle to be surveved soonest possible.
Fhank You

For AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

— — )

AUTHORISED JGNATURE



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Pag % of |
> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type; Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 12681
Vehicle Detalls
Vehicle No.: 5LJ4970D
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 22 Feb 201%
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Model; VEZELHYBRID 15X A
Primary Colour: Brown
Manufacturing Year: 2016
Engine No.: LEB5909873
Chassis No.: RU31209863
Maximum Power Output; 112.0 kW (150 bhp)
Open Market Value: $29,371.00
Original Registration Date: 13 Dec 2016
First Registration Date: 13 Dec 2014
Transfer Count: u)
Actual ARF Paid: $5.000.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 12 Dec 2026
PARF Rebate Amount: $3,750.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 12 Dec 2026
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $56,000.00
COE Rebate Amount: $43.705.00
Total Rebate Amount: $47,455.00

The information contained herein Is correct as at 22 Feb 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNC...  22-Feb-19



Jimn_rl‘ Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 9:53 AM

To: muihong@almsm.com.sg

Cc: meili@almsm.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Request for survey for our client - SLI4970D accident with India Insured -
SHD7314H on 22.02.2019

Attachments: Video - Accident TP 1.MP4; Video - Accident TP 2MP4

Dear Sir/Mdm
We refer to the above subject matter,

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of this accident.

Based on the attached video from your client, we can clearly see that there's no point of contact between the
vehicles.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.

‘We will now close the matter in our end.

Best Regards,
Jimmy Chen| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2028 | email: jimmychené@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Nivitha !LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 1109 AM

To: Kee Mui Hong - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming; ‘sur@Ikkauto.com’; admin-
d®@Ikkauto.com

Cc: Meili-5in Ming; Pooi Chin Han Daniel

Subject: RE: Request for survey for our client - SLJ4970D accident with India Insured -
SHD7314H on 22.02.2019

Attachments: 4970 - Direct.pdf; Est - SL4970D-03012019092811, pdf

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLJ49700 and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Danel,

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen

Thank You. s ) PP A :

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

) [nDIA
.. . IIHTERH.&“‘DNA.L
( [nsuraNCE
i I NG AFDEDN
Sarping Uia rughes oy | LT

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

From: Kee Mui Hong - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming [mailto:muihong @almsm.com.sg]

Sent: 04 March, 2019 11:04 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il «<motorclaim@iil.com.sg>

Cc: Meili-5in Ming <meili@almsm.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Request for survey for our client - SLI4970D accident with India Insured - SHD7314H on 22.02.2019

Dear Motor claim,

We choose LKK for the survey.

Pls do request surveyor to contact us.
Thanks

Best Regards,

Kee Mui Hong



Ah Lim Motor @ 5in Ming

Tel : 64563637 Fax : 64563686

From: Motor Claim - 111

Sent: 01 March, 2019 11:34 AM

To: mailto:muihong@almsm.com.sg

Subject: RE: Request for survey for our client - SLI4970D accident with India Insured - SHD7314H on 22.02.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your emall,
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o InDiA
|NTERNATIONAL

|NsurANCE
fFINGAFDRI
Lprany the Fagriin sy | WET

64 Cecil Street; #0S - 108 Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Kee Muil Hong - Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming [mailto:mulhong @almsm.com.sg]

Sent: 01 March, 2019 9:38 AM

To: Maotor Claim - il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Request for survey for our client - SLJ4970D accident with India Insured - SHD7314H on 22.02.2019

Dear claims,

Pls do assist to arrange for the survey of our client - SLJ4970D accident with India Insured - SHD7314H on
22.02.2019.

Car Is not in our Sin Ming workshop yet. Pls do request appointed surveyor to contact the workshop to
arrange for the survey appointment.

Pls also do assign OIC for the case and request OIC to let us know the liability status.
Pls do refer to the two dashcam video that we attached onto the Merimen report

Thank You



Best Regards,

Kee Mui Hong

Ah Lim Motor @ Sin Ming

Tel : 64563637 Fax : 64563686

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |
...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
we
'CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notified Est Submitted Ad) Assigned &dy Apt Ad) Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
|15 Mar 2019 edr $$470.00 $$470.00 Panding for Survay
| = g Reg | s Ay . | Ectit Estimates | | view mpt | Carcel Case |

Main

| CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg No.. 193303821R

Hain LIM CHIH YENG, [D: 578112681

|[Creatad by adjuster]

22/02/2019 09:00 - ;59
[28 Months and 9 Days From LTA Reg Date {(Man fr)]

MCOMODO15

SL14970D Date of Loss:

Palicy /Cover
Note No.:

Palicy Ne.
{Clalmant):

TP f MCT19020856

SHD7I14H MT/004a32519/01

Excess:
Ah Lim Motor Company (Sin Ming) 176 Sin Ming Drive #05-11, Sin Ming AutoCare, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: 84563637
India International Insurance Pie Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Pool Chin Han Danlel]

| Direct Asia Insurance [Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 65322888

| LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Te!: 8256-3561 ... [Handled by KENNETH XONG] ... [Final Rpt due 13/03/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All I Compase Case Mall i
« III_SG ((3/07/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved {550.00) - SLI48700 - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han ...

# II_SG (01/07/201%): Alert - Ad] Mandate Maintained - SL.349700 - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han Danlel
e 111 S5 [28/05/2019). Alert - Ad) Mandate Malhtained - SL149700 - Clalm Handler: Poal Chin Han Danlel

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=

Dus Date  Priority  Type
Ho results

Wiew All
Assigned By

Swarch Tasks | Crewte Now Twsk | Compiete |

Task Group Subject Handlar Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 18/7/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*S1L14970D (MCT19020856)
[SHD7314H]
TP

LIM CHIH YENG
Feb 32 2019 9:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Ah Lim Motor Company

Page | of |

ww} umn-m-| l:ommuuu-mm| View |View in Browser| v |
Video tperpage  (v]| & |
(Mo |Finalized On india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 |28/06/18 16:12 | Video - Accident TP 1 O | oaa e

2 28/06/19 16:12 | Video - Accident TP 2 € | Load MPd

o | Melabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 10719 09:04 | Genaral View 0 | wwrs |
|2 |12/07/19 09:04 General View D  wwurs | B
1 12/0771% 08:04 | Genersl View 0 | edwc | 4
4 112/07/1309:04 | General View 0 | caws | [
|5 12/09/13 05:04 | General View 0| wars | A
6 |12/07/19 08:04 | General View ) | tosd¥o
E: 12/07/19 09:04 | General View 0 | leadiec | A
|8 12/07/1809:04 | Chassis Mumber 0| ades | A
9 12/07/1909:04 | Ddomater Reading © | wrs | B
Documentation iperpage  |~] & |
o Relabel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) [Thumbnail| Print|
[t !p4/oa/1s 15:17 TP ESTIMATE [ BEP |
12 04/03/19 15:17 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 [D4/03/19 1517 | EMAIL FROM II1 DD 04.03.2019 3 Load POF
4 15/03/19 14:06 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
{§ | 32/07/19 09:00 Claim Rejection Email to W/S % Load POF
[Wo_|Finalwed On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbinall| Print
1 13/0315 1530 | Singapore Accident Statement © | Losdror

Documents Checklist

'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

neset | save | ernt |

There are no document checklists configured,

Our Checklist Remarks -

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
HotE Bamacis @ provals sniml you ihew B ES SERET DT

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 18/7/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg Ne 1598071288

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email surf@ikkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/1118003094B/KPA302
Date: 18/07/2019
REFEREMCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid ~ Palicy No: MCOMOD15
Claimant Vehicls ¢, o700 Insured Vehicle No :  SHD7314H
Data of Loss 2210220189 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18020856
CESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION QF |
Reg No: SLJ48T70D
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL, 1.5 HYBRID X (A) Engine No: LEBS209873
Reg. Date: 13/12/2016 (Man. Year. 2018) Chasais No RLU31208883
Colour; Metallic Bronze Odometer 41020 km
Engine Capacily: 1486 cc
Markel Valua/New Car Prica:  N/A
Sum Insured (S8): Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition; Sleering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable} Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fron! Tyre Size: 215/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60 R16
Fronl Left Sida: Dunlop 7 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 7 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop 7 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 7 mm
The above values represent he remaining fyre reads deplh
COST OF CLAIMS ) Repairer's Adjuster's Difference _ Diff %
Parts 584.80 0.00 58480 100.00
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 D.00
Labour B00.00 470.00 330.00 41.25
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 .00
Gross Total (S5) 1,3B4.80 470.00 914.80 66.06
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5%5) 95.94 3290 B4.04 £6.06
Nett Amount (S§) 1,481.74 502.90 978.84 66.06
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/03/2018
Date Inspected: 05/03/2019 Inspected At: Ah Lim Mator Company (Sin Ming)
176 Sin Ming Drive #05-12, Sin Ming
AutoCare
Singapore 575721
Estimated Period of Repair 2.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_...

18/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

NOTE: This rpor! regressnts our findings at the time and piace of mspection ataled horin. Such inspection has boen camied aul o the best of our
knowiedge and abiify but any other Babitty undar any olher circumstances is hemeby axpressly excluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

|Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 17 Jul 2019)

Parts: M1-SUvV HONDA VEZEL 1.5 HYBRID X (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Lahouir: Repairer's (Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLJ45700D)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: ltems/ivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk °.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT FENDER LH Repair 534.00 FL “FL
2 1 *FRONT FENDER WHEEL ARCH “Check 187.00FL *FL
FeFranchise pan. L=LstitemDise
Sub Total (5%) 731.00 0.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (SS§) 146.20 0.00
Total Parts (S5) 584.80 0.00

Report was unsubmitted duning this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuscaction=gen_... 18/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thars are no new miscellansous ltems solocted
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO ALIGN FRONT FENDER LH AND TO KNOCK & REPAIR New 400.00 150.00

FRONT LH AFFECTED AREA AND REFIT LISTED PARTS

BACK
2 TO SPRAY FRONT BUMPER ,FRONT FENDER LH New 400.00 320.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 800.00 470.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/7/2019



