Vic (LKKAuto)

From: 0OO], Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 April, 2020 11:05 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Letter of Demand SLG3225U - 3rd party claim against EQ Insured SGM1773U

(DOA: 22.02.2019) - LKK REFCC4/EQI19003862/Ghb3

Dear Jasper,

Thank you for your email.

Since you have rejected and maintained your offer at all-in $490.00 then we called it quits.
Please expedite full payment according to invoice. We will maintain this stand thereafter.

Please expedite LOD as soon as possible or we have no other alternative but take legal means to demand
back our payment .
Thank you in advance .

Truly
00T, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders

25, Defu Lane 9

Singapore 539266

Office: +65 6679 1146

Mobile: +65 9147 8545

Email: ben@allswellmotor.com.sg

On Wed, Apr 8, 2020 at 9:20 AM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Ben,

We will maintain our offer as at 490.00(all-in).

Thanks,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
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Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: OOI, Ben [mailto:ben@allswellmotor.com.sg]

Sent: April 7, 2020 3:07 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Letter of Demand SLG3225U - 3rd party claim against EQ Insured SGM1773U (DOA: 22.02.2019) - LKK
REFCC4/EQI19003862/Ghb3

Dear Jasper,

Thank you for your email..

As a formality sake, we agreed if you round up to a global sum at $500.00 ( all-in)

Thank you for your understanding.

Truly

OO01I, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapore 539266
Office: +65 6679 1146

Mobile: +65 9147 8545



Email: ben@allswellmotor.com.sg

On Mon, Apr 6, 2020 at 4:19 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $490.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Jasper Chua| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: OOI, Ben [mailto:ben@allswellmotor.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 March, 2020 12:14 PM




To: EQI PRS; Joel Goh
Cc: account5 leasing
Subject: Letter of Demand SLG3225U - 3rd party claim against EQ Insured SGM1773U (DOA: 22.02.2019)

Dear EQ Insurance ( claims Department )

(Without Prejudice)

Letter of Demand

We are pleased to write to you for demand payment of the repaired works of SLG3225U

Attached are the Rental, TP search and Invoice for your kind and immediate actions.

** Please acknowledge receipt of Letter of Demand within 02 weeks of this email **

Truly

OO01I, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapore 539266
Office: +65 6679 1146
Mobile: +65 9147 8545

Email: ben@allswellmotor.com.sg




Total Control Panel

To: joel.goh @eginsurance.com.sg

Login
From: ben @allswellmotor.com.sg

Remove this sender from my allow list

You received this message because the sender is on your allow list.



