Vic (LKKAuto)

From: 0OO], Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 March, 2020 12:14 PM

To: EQI PRS; Joel Goh

Cc: account5 leasing

Subject: Letter of Demand SLG3225U - 3rd party claim against EQ Insured SGM1773U (DOA:
22.02.2019)

Attachments: SLG3225U-Invoice.pdf

Dear EQ Insurance ( claims Department )

(Without Prejudice)

Letter of Demand

We are pleased to write to you for demand payment of the repaired works of SLG3225U

Attached are the Rental, TP search and Invoice for your kind and immediate actions.

** Please acknowledge receipt of Letter of Demand within 02 weeks of this email **

Truly
OO01I, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders

25, Defu Lane 9

Singapore 539266

Office: +65 6679 1146

Mobile: +65 9147 8545

Email: ben@allswellmotor.com.sg

Total Control Panel Login

To: joel.goh @eginsurance.com.sg Remove this sender from my allow list

From: ben@allswellmotor.com.sg

You received this message because the sender is on your allow list.



