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S1 UL AVE 1. #0225 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGA

Your Ref: D19001063MESH

Our Ref: CS/FCI19003846/Esd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir'fMadam,

Company Registration Mo, 193G0T13ER

PORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX @ (065} 62364315

Date: 07 March 2019

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLN 3063H .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 06/03/2019 at the premises of M/s Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check™ Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the front RH portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Chen Tsue Yee
Automotive Assessor

1 83

3.719.00

: 5%

2,615.00

- 5%

136.00

;5%

: 5%

: 8%




MS @ FirstCapital

§ Raffies Quay 421-00 Singapore (48580
Tet: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Clalms & Motor Undensriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore D85E77

Tel, (65) 6507 3848 Fax (R5) B507 3849
wiww mefirstcapital comsg

M5 First Capltal Insurance Limited co2eg Mo 1950000060 GST Reg Mo HZ-000LE76-9

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.
Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Mumber.

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

13-02-2019 Our Ref No.
11-02-2019 Claim Type.
SHC1677E Third Party Vehicle.
209 PANDAN GARDENS

TAY JIAN YE

65684501/ 0 Fax No.
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No.
MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18001063MFSH

Third Party

SLN3063H

65651240

68416315

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD Attondon.
A TP Solicitor Fax No.
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

MIL

MA

Kindly submit the survey report via CVWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) —

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 9:30 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: SLN3063H (MIT) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM

Dear Shirley,

As per your request.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, April 15, 2019 9:33 AM
To: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos
Subject: SLN3063H (MIT) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM

Dear Larry,

We confirm the finalize 53,283.00 (P/P, before GST). 3 days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos [mailto:laur n rriage.com.
Sent: Saturday, April 13, 2019 5:51 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo; Tay Jian Ye

Subject: SLN3063H (MIT) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM

Dear Steve,
Pls. refer to attached files and photos.

Kindly confirm finalized amount of $ 3,283.00 before Gst for SLN3063H.

Thank you so much.



Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service

@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 608339
T +65 6568 4658 + F: +65 6565 1240 » www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

$ A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



Shiriex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) < ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 4:14 PM

To: ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong'; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12001063MFSH/1
Attachments: SLN 3063H - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear loanne,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLN 3063H.

Thank you,

Bast Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 1 March 2019 2:41 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001063MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop , repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [maiItc::cwsmuturclaims@msﬁrstcapital.cum,sg]

Sent: Thursday, 28 February 2019 3:55 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; Joanne Yong Lai fong



<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001063MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS5 for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




> Back to OneMotoring

DADENTE Rahata Ermiing

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Chwiner 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis No:

Maximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility;

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Mar 2019

Business
So0aW

SLN30&3H

Mo

07 Mar 2019
MITSUBISHI
ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
Red

2017
IAF2UGB15%9
MIMBSTATIAHHODE028
57.0kW (76 bhp)
£13.174.00

28 Apr 2017

2B Apr 2017

0

$5,000.00

Yes
27 Apr 2027
$3,750.00

27 Apr 2027

A - Carup to 1600cc & 97kVV (130bhp)
10

$51,765.00

$42,130.00

$45,880.00

NHES ) vrn o, e v, @i o e 8 D I OV DUTLEL Y | s G D 1R L A N AT M
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' /NK INTERNATI

BLOCK 123 BUKIT MERAH
TEL:(65) 6467 8156

ONAL SERVICES

LANE 1, #03-82 SINGAPOIRE 1501 23

FAX:(65) 6467 4636

EMAIL : NKIS_INFO@PACIFIC.NET.SG
ROB: 52999430E GSsTREG NO. 52999430E

S P e E = e T e ——
S ) B s 0

INCIDENT REPORT F ORM
| Type |Fire Outbreak | Damages ' Disputes ]
__(#) | Theft Break-In | | Injuries | Others —
| Name of Person | Nric/ Other ID: ]
Making Report | I5GA™  CammDadon CERRA T
| Company or e beamte | Date of Report:
| Personal | wlen 2o\
Address | Time of Report: j
%3¢ Gmpm |
Checklist | Details of Incident:
Location of the I LI vty PUNST QuatT TR LgnramE
incident
Date & Time of wlon\am : ;
the incident |ox\aea eaze s
What hﬂppﬂ‘ﬂ_ﬂd Boes ity (L L. TP R T Q\M
Ml by N, N waes -:L hmu»,\&;.h-\_. L1 -.:--é. Q"t Ry
Pl we ?\‘!\“Q\- ﬁ"& Mg Sgeen M -L\q. Py .\ L Y
8 Aawsy  oeeN a o GaeNutdh ey crtadmel B
ISR RO TR Adrh WA SWE AL,
| [ T et Sl LB D A, ST WWC'F'\ P
| [ 96 Teomn vl @\ Az Gtea Am  codwe\ Aie
Avellve. "he  con® ok w erIvLR ONugeal 20 I
| T i*m\""'\' x |
How it happened | — |
Where ithappened | ®\¢xS®  R8WT Wt te oot
Who suffered Nowae
Who witness it NeNE L o R
LY/ _
INCIDENT REPORTED TO_ THE FOLLOWING'PERSON(S):
| 1) Property Management Yes (" ) | 3. Police 999 Yes ( )
2) Company Ops Mgr Yes ( ) | 4. SCDF 995 Yes ( )

Report Written by: €© "k tuasd




CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE COMMERCIAL AUTO PROTECTOR COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Nama of Policyholder  : 8TO8 Quick Bucks Vehicle No. : SLN3063H
Period of Insurance ! 28 Apr 2018 To 27 Apr 2018 Policy No. : 2100508785-01
Engine No. : 3AB2UGB1598 Endorsement No.  :
Chasslis No. : MMBSTA13AHHOOE028 Issued Date : 18 Apr 2018
Make/Model : MITSUBISHI Attrage 1.2 CVT
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1193 Tonnage Sum Insured ; Market Value First Year of Registration : 2017
Driver Rastriction : NA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COE/PARF : Yes

| Person or Classes of Parsons Entitled to Drive®
Ay parsan wha iy l}iwﬂﬁm'."lb Ptﬁt}hﬁll}dr: ander or wilh thelr parmission,
This Policy will ingemrify the Policyholdar or any authorised driver anly if he/she mests the specified age conditian.

¥auw have o pey an agdfional sum of §3,000 83 "Young andior inexperiencad Driver Excess™ (YIDR") i You are or Your Authonsad Driver (named of unnamed) i3 urder the age of 23 andicr has less
&1 2 paars’ dnving expenance

| Age Condition : All Age Condition

Limitation as to use®

Use for the carmaga of passangars o goods in connection with the Policyholder's business, Use for social, domastic, pleasure purposes end business purposes of ary person t whom the Vehcls is hired.
This Paliay doas not cover

11 usa far driving buiban, driving tash, racing, paca-makng. reliabdity insl or spesd-lasting Pr

2} use whilsl drawing & iraler except !e lowing (other (han for reward) of anyone dsabled using a mechanically propelled vahicle; and g |
&} U for the g8 ol p gare o hirg or -y 0SNG NG ETHC 8 R LB POr-BIY DUpES i SinReaten Wit Moter Trade, \

| '\\5-:

* Limaalions renderad inoparative by Section 8 of the Molor Vshicles (Third-Parly Risks and Compensation) Act {Csp. 189) and Sectian 85 of me Road Transpan At {587 (Malaysia), are not to be
nchidad urder these headings. -

EXCESS

Section 1
Fire - 30 Dwn Damage - $2000 Theét - 50 Flood Cover - $0

Section 2
Prapery Damage - 52000

Windscresen ; 5100

MNamed Driver and Exc2ss (where applicabls)
Dng Khisw Yong - §2000 (Own Damage) $2000 (Proparty Damage)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REPAIRS)

1.Cychs & Camiage Customer Senice Cantre (For windscrean claim only] Add: 330 Ubi Rd 3 Singapens 40BE50 67481000
2.Cycle & Cariage Bacy & Panl Canlre Add 208 Pandan Gardens Singapore 605339 25384501

Far other Approved Reperting Contrasial0 Aulhorised Repainens, plesse contact our 24:-hour accident emargency hotling at +85 5338 6200, Alemativaly, you may rafer 1o AIG webshe www.8ig.com.sg
or AIG 5G Mobie App, Simply search and download "ANE B0 from ITunes or Googhe Play,

IMPORTANT NOTES

if e vahicle & hired for the camiage of passenger for hing or reward, such driver mus! be named under Te Policy and registorad with e service cperator, Should you cecide 1o induds any alfer driver,
pleasa irdicata, (Company rasarves e nght 1o accaptirajss! the inclusion of any Mamed Drivars],

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan; Daimler Financial Services Africa & Asia Pacific Ltd

UAa hersby certify that he poficy to which this Certificate of Insurance relabes s (sswad in accordance with the provisions of the Motor Viehicles{Third Party Risks and Companastion) Act [Tap, 188), Part 1 of
ra Foad Transport A, 1867 (Malaysia) and Malor Vehicles {Third Party Risks) Rulea, 1856 (Meleyaia),

oE007207a3

A
CYCLE & CARRIAGE - SHERNI(MIT)
238 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159930 ANSP-MCTOR AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd.
Underwritten by AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

SEPHAN

Thah Wiy PO -1 60 A4S Dulding SOTAE20 | T B4 300 | F+N5 0415 1 v B L 0 B A0 A Padic Insrance e, Lt & B
1
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

@)

CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED.

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684555 Fax: 65691056

9
VA

MITSUBISHI
MOTORS

Co Reg Mo : 1977014694 ESTIMATE GST Reg No : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
Rag No/Reg Date SLN3O063H J 28/04/201
BLK 512 SERANGOON NORTH AVE 4 Date In/Mileage / 0
#06-414
Chassis No MMBSTAL3IAHHOOG0Z28
SINGAPORE 5
U513 Engine No JA9ZUGB1599
Contact Mo Mobile: 91373517 Make/Model MIT/17MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
Colour/Trim P57 WINE RED PEARL / BK BLACK
Account Mo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIF No
CSMo0041 Cash 11/02/2019/ 21:55 465 / Tay Jian Ye 36149
Description of Goods / Services Qty  Unit Price Disc% Amount
(1) E PNT88000 207 1100.00
/ TO RENEW FRT BUMPER :
1| E PNT98Q00 840.00
(4 PAINT WORK SPRAY FRT BUMPER
| A 54900099 30.00
' CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 200.00
[ TO CARRY OUT DIAGMOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
F USING HI-SCAM PRO TEST
/] M SUMDRY 20.00 [
; SUNDRIES ] .
/| M BRACKET,FR BUMPER,RH ,~ /K /NG D00 13.00 00.00 13.00
@‘ M FACE,FR BUMPER /. /) 1] .0e—) 696.00 00.00 696.00
& M CLIP,FR BUMPER < ALC 4 | \18.60— 3.00 00.00 30.00
“| M REINFORCEMENT,FR BUMPER 1.00 136.00 00.00 ¢ 136.00
[ M HEADLAMP ASSY,RH - ||' { 1.00 654.00 00.00 654.00
Eidd :I nln] B
: . A —
i SIGNATURE -
¢ g | fl#h
=i DATE : ——————— e
i REMARKS —_—
il
! a
f | PR - i — —_—
bt I I | -
LK Auto Consuitants hence nolify
heR I the follosdne:
i ﬁﬁﬂﬂ“ﬂf.l‘.“ﬂ".e following:
ED“TW:MD“"“WM 4259
*Fars e 5l o P,
® Third ;T‘fi.'.:ﬁ ':'\'J:':-',.ﬂ.;‘\f‘-.E ::I":I:T::::l;lfmm Nett 3 .?19 -00
# No legel modiicationis) s akmed. i 7% GST on 3719.00 260.33
* Suppbimentary dem ';. ]
s Siiec 10l aprovd o I Gy Total Payable 3,979.33
Aut ur.i,mw company stamp

vali t;rm estimate is 14 days from date of

any

ote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Estimatedegmsts quoted are excluding GST. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include
after repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. However, should this eccur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
depesit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
cheque, You must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of renewing
the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.

Page 1 of 1
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OYC" T &% CARRIAGE

VEHICLENO : SLMN 2062 H

MODEL : MIT/ ATTRAGE |22 CVT

WIP : 36149

Ly~
<eve Chen

Material $ |,292.00
Labour $ | $90.00
Sub-Total $ '3;‘?-?93. g0

Less 2% Disc  : $ e

Less Excess $ P

Total § 3729700

GST 7% 3 219.91
Grand Total + 8 212,91
Finalise By/Date : Uiy on /oy /19

[ZT REVERT BACK WITHIN 7 DAYS,
OTHERWISE WILL PROCEED WITH INVOICING

[ ] SURVEYOR'S REPORT REQUIRED

REPAIR TOOK B WORKING DAYS

¢ TP veliele no ! SHC 167TE
¢ cladm  lose c.r![ NeNTAL,



©

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

INSURANCE CO.:  FIRST CAPITAL

Supplementary For Registration No.: SLM 30683 H
Labou
1 Repair RH Front Fender
2 Spray Paint RH Front Fender
7% GST
Total
Thank You.

Yours faithfully
CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

o

-
e

=

LARRY SONGCUAN
CUSTOMER SERVICE
TEL 6568 4658

FAX 6567 5258

Cost ($)
250,00
420.00 ~

70.00
4G 80
716.90
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Co Reg Wo i 1977014636

% @ CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

o

MITSUBISHI

209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 608339 Tel: 85684555 Fax: 65691056

PRO-FORMA INVOICE

THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE GST Reg Mo :

MOTORS

MR-B500111-%

Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
Reg Mo/Reg Date SLN3DG3IH / 28/04/2017
BLK 512 SERANGOON NORTH AVE 4 Date In/Mileage 06/03/2019/ 129253
#06-414
S NCADORE  EEGE 1% Chassis/Packaga MMBSTAL3ZAHHOOGOZE SDCITRE
Engine Mo 3A92UGH1599
Contact Mo Mobile: 91373517 Make /Madel MIT/17MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
| 06,03/ Colour/Trim P57 WINE RED PEARL / BK BLACK
AccountMo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP Mo
CTPOOD4D Cash 13/04/2019/ 17:38  TLT 8BB4 [ Lauro Songcuan 36149
Description of Goods [ Services Qty  Unit Price Disc%  Amount
E PNTBROOD 550,00
RENEW FRONT BLUMPER
E PNTYB00D az20.00 ¢
SPRAY PAINT FRONT BUMPER
A 54000099 30.00 4
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 200.00 4"
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
M SUNDRY 20.00¢"
SUNDRIES
E PNTSH000 f /250,00 |
REPAIR RH FRONT FENDER =72 [Svpp s d |
E PNTS8000 /420,00 |ﬂ!~
SPRAY PAINT RH FRONT FENDER —= S@p. F
X BRACKET,FR BUMPER,RH -~ 1.00 13.00 00.00 1 .DI:I-::
% FACE,FR BUMPER . 1.00 696.00 00.00 696. 00 1
X CLIP,FR BUMPER - 10.00 3.00 00.00 30.00 1
£ HEADLAMP ASSY,RH - 1.00 654.00 00.00 654,001
Z TEXT
TP FIRST CAP - SHC1G67TE
BOA: 11.02.2019
SURVEYOR: STEVEN LKE 06/03/2018
03 DAYS
Cyele & Corrioge celebrotes 120 yeors.
Visit www.cyclecarrioge.com/120 for more info!
Parts 1,393.00 Nett 3,283.00
Labaur 1,870.00 7% GST on 3283.00 229,81
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 0.00 Total Payable 3.512.81
Diagnostics Job 0.00
Sundry/Others 20.00
Total{w/o G5T) 3,283.00

This is not an efficial tax invoice.

This 152 a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Page 1 of 1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3961 FAX: 62506 4315

Reg. Mo 190607108R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref . CS/FCI19003846/Esd3n2

316,01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 088877 Dy asnakesin M“M”llmumm
Code: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 1677E Veh. Inspected SLM 3063H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19001063MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  JOANNE YONG Assign Date 01/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI ATTRAGE c.c 1183
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. MMBSTA13AHHCOG0Z2E Colour RED
Odomaeter 129253 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/55 R15 FALKEN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/55 R15 FALKEN 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55 R15 FALKEMN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [195/55 R15 FALKEN 7 mim
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/02/2018 Inspection Date 08/03/2018
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
209 PANDAN GARDENS SINGAPORE 609339
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

= g ma 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 18-8607198-R Fage No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 3063H
i Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rhhnp?;}} ':5%'
IREPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BRACKET,FR BUMPER, RH (SN) BROKEN 13.00 13.00
1|FACE.FR BUMPER (SN} DENTED 696.00 696.00
10|CLIP,FR BUMPER (SN} MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REINFORCEMENT . FR BUMPER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 136.00 -
1|HEADLAMP ASSY,RH (SN) BROKEN 654.00 654.00
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1,549.00 1,413.00
LABOUR
TO RENEW FRT BUMPER 1,100.00 550.00
PAINT WORK SPRAY FRT BUMPER 840.00 420.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM 30.00 30.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN 200.00 200.00
PRO TEST USING HI-SCAN PRC TEST.
REPAIR RH FRONT FENDER (ADDITIOMNAL). 250.00 250.00
SPRAY PAINT RH FRONT FENDER (ADDITIOMAL). 420.00 420.00
2,840.00 1,870.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,389.00 3,283.00
! RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 3,283.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19003846/Esd3n2

]

CHEN TSUE YEE

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Clisnt namad on the front page of this Report.




