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N1917 PARFICOF Rehata Fanitiy

LY

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 7298D
WYY [ 1| [ s g e |
Vehicle No.: GBD3835T
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 12 Mar 2019
Vehicle Make: NISSAN
Vehicle Model: CABSTAR 3.0 5M/T ABS 2DR 2WD
EUROS
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2014
Engine No.: ZD30342098K
Chassis No.: JN1SC2F24Z0856515
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $25,386.00
Original Registration Date: 255Sep 2014
First Registration Date: 25Sep 2014
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $1,270.00
[Clivended PARFRebateDetallsi e o )
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Eiitended COF Rehate Dala R e e e e 7y
COE Expiry Date: 24 Sep 2024
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $54,009.00
COE Rebate Amount: $29,884.00
Total Rebate Amount: $29,884.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Mar 2019

OK

RTREVILIE.gov.sgita/vrllactiontenguireHebatetyFubbchstorelUeneginputl /F UNL | IUN_IU=FUSUaUUS T |



..-}

| N_iuitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.comsg>

Sent: Friday, 1 March 2019 9:27 AM

To: Chio Ziting; ‘sur@Ilkkauto.com’; admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Ce: Manivel Priyadarshini

Subject: RE: GBD3835T & SHAT7925K - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR
INSPECTION WITHIN 3 WORKING DAYS

Attachments: 28022019145649-0001.pdf; 3835.pdf IREVACR /3 |Lﬁ,

w1l
Dear Sir/ Mdm, 2 ;‘_-\N:)

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle GBD3835T and let us have your report urgently,
This claim will be handled by Ms Friya.

"Kindly upload this survey request amail to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

[nDIA
INTERNATIONAL
[NsuRANCE

S I NG ATFORDE
Lerutng 8 ragiue wce 30T

64 Cecll Streat; #05 - 10B Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

From: Chio Ziting [mailto:ziting@n51.com.sg]

Sent: 28 February, 2019 5:26 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: GBD3835T & SHA7925K - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 3
WORKING DAYS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We appoint your surveyor from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Please see attached.

Thank you.

On Thu, Feb 28, 2019 at 3:34 PM Motor Claim - [11 <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,



o 4

o ‘We acknowledge receipt of your emall.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

o LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
+ Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

64 Cecll Street; #05 - 108 Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

From: Chio Ziting [mailto:ziting@n51.com.sg|
Sent: 28 February, 2019 3:08 PM

To: Motor Claim - |l <motorclaim@iil.com.sg>
Subject: GBD3835T & SHA7925K - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 3 WORKING

DAYS

Dear Sir/Madam,



W
" A's per above subject,

Please refer attachment and:-
Kindly propose / provide your 10 surveyors
Thank vou.

Regards,

Zi Ting

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office: 6842 0051

Fax: 6741 0510

www.n51.com.sq

E“—“‘ BE‘:

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

i



g
" intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission
or any modification.
Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.
Registration No. 198703792-K

Regards,

Zi Ting

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office: 6842 0051

Fax: 6741 0510
www.n51.com.sq

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General [nsurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Iei2e Manmen e-Clams

View Received Message

Thes manl is associated with |

*§KI2543Y (260875190356)
[SMGED05T]
™

CHOW MAN Jur, GRACE
Feb 21 2019 C.O0AM
[MARIC & PARTNERS FTE LTD|
Velkswagen Centre Singapore

Reoly | Reply All I Mark as l.illlml-d-.l Fl‘il'll;illl; i Debete ;lﬂllﬂl_! Fu-_'wlrd ]

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_S5G), sent on 28/02/2019 11108 &AM,
Ta LKK_HOQ
cC NoarMariesa AbuKassimifiaig.com

Subject  NO OI GIA REPORT

Hi S '

Kindly be informed that OT has not reported yet. O detnils as below @
(Name . MARIC & PARTNERS FTE LTD
Addrees © 19 TAGORE LANE #03-04 9 @ TAGORE SINGAPORE 787472

Thanks
Mariesa

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY ' -
There are no documents

hitpa:ifsingapore marmen com/claima/index cfm?usabox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewhmode=1&linboxdd= 14421 85&I0omainid=11410bjId=64... /2



Print Received Message

This mail is associated with

*GBD3B35T (MCT1812079T)
ISHATS25K]
COMBI GALLERY PTELTD
Dec 28 2018 3:00PM

|COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Twincar Automotive Pte Lid

From
To
Subject

India intemational Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) (_SG), sent on 07/03/2019 14:13 PM.
LKK_HQ
Alert - Ad| Mandate Approved (5§0.00) - GBD3835T - Claim Handler: Priya

Approved:0.00.




Asher Sna !Mtﬂ!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent Tuesday, 2 April 2019 2:20 PM

Te: Sabnina { N-51)

Subject: Accident Involving GBD 3835T & SHA 7925K on 28/12/2018
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Your Ref: GBD 38357
Our Ref; CC4/11119003831/Geb3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident Involving GBD 3835T & SHA 7925K on 28/12/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
{subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost |s subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor,

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please farward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement,

Thank You.

Batt Regords.
Asher Sng | Cose Hondker
LEK Auto Conjulfaniy Pte Lid

phone: 4841-4051 | email gshersng@tkkouto.com | hox 4741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubl Indusiial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §{408%33)



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Shi Pel (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Friday, 1 November 2019 9:19 AM

To: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: LOD of GBD3835T - Accident Involving GBD3835T & SHA7925K on 28/12/2018
Attachments: GBD3B3ST pdf

Reassign case

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone 6366-0055 | emall: shupel@|kksuto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: Chin Hul Xin <huixin@n51.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 4:32 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: LOD of GBD3835T - Accident Invalving GBD38B35T & SHA7925K on 28/12/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above subject.
Attached LOD for your kind perusal.
The original documents will be mailed to your

Kindly revert to us once received the documents.

Thank you

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510
www.n51.com.sq
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MIZ242019 Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL ) B
M on Audit Reminiky Ay
1 'ﬂ_?;" 2015 £ym veh Model Changed (202897} NISSAN CABSTAR 2.0 (M), ;L'-;;
01 Mar 2019 Feg No; GBD3IBIST. Acct Date: 2018/12/28. Claim Type: TP, Insurer; India Intérnationa (Al ml
2 407 Cim Created | Insurance Pte Ligt (HQ). TP Insurer: ANA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Twincar A 0 o
) ulomative Pte Ltd (Kaki Bukit)
01 Mar 2019 , [A] Lau
3 14:07 Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ): Shu Pei
a B1MAr2015  puj Mext Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt Due Dite:2019/03/12 (Al th
01 Mar 2019 . ; |A] Lau
5 14:07 Ad) Mandate Set Approved!0.00. Reinsp: Ad) deckdes, £hu Pal|
p1 Mar 2019 X [A] Low |
e Label Added (30653): Direct Settiement. AT b
01 Mar 2019 Al Lo
Fiiar Adj Adjuster Assigned  [None| -> ADRIAN LING Ln{-m
g D5 Nar 201 cim oy Modified Insured NMame: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. [A] Lhu
g U6 Mar2018 o ot Modified Claimant's Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. [A] Loy
09:21 Shu Pel
(4]
10 37 9272019 ad) Mandate Request  Cureq:0.00:PODS: LIABILITY: 100% REMARK: B:NIL OID REVERSED HIT TP gy
Reng
11 J7MAT2015 agj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt-Final Apt.Due Date:2019/03/12 Pm'
07 Mar 2019 , m |
i3 Ad Mandate Set Approved!0.00. LA
13 Mar 2019 b {A] Lau
13 13:01 Adf Adjuster Assigned ADRIAN LING -> XING GUD QIANG Eh Pel|
[MHE'
20 Nov 2018 JOBNNE
1'% Adj Rpt Initiated LEE
109 KHANG
MIN
JﬂLﬂHE
15 190017 cim ot Modified Insured 10- -= -, LEE
' KHANG
MIN
JOE:.!HE:
1 20 NOV201S o o Modified 1P] Reg. Date: -> 2014/08/25. LEE |
12:09
KHANG
MIN
m.lﬂuﬁ
17 195574 cim petalls Notified LEE
: KHANG
MIN

Cur,Req: 2883.00:PODS Lisbility: 100% *Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: §2,354.00 + (bJLOU  [A]

1g 44 Nov 2019 Adj Mandate Request [(Sdays x §100,00); §500.00 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: §29.00 = Total: $2,883.00 *Vehi CHEW

0B:53 cle Model: Nissan Cabstar (2953cc] *4 recommandation repair days + 1PRS = Sdays *F HSIAD
e = === TONG
Date From 4|75 ¥ pateTo 4| 7H »| Audit Type nane v oo
ACTIVITY R
Mo record - =

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

| | | LKK Aute | LKK Auto
20 Nov 2019 | ODY/TP Case 7
2351152 12:00:32 (Adjuster) Motor Consuftants Consultants GBD3IB3ST SHATI2SK 11.

Pte ltd | Pte Ltd (HQ)

hitps://singapore. medmen, com/claims/index. ofmHusebox=MTRad|uster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhislory&cassid=T977034extid=2060954CFID=020... 12



11!3*9!20?9 Merimen e-Claiims
Print Received Message

This mail |5 associated with ;

*GBD3835T (MCT18120797)
[SHAT925K]
™
COMBI GALLERY PTE LTD
Dec 28 2018 3:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Twincar Automotive Pie Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd [HQ) (Il_SG), sen! on 22/11/2019 10:51 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$2883.00) - GBD3835T - Claim Handler: Priya

Approved:2883.00:Reguest TP W5 to issue Tax invoice for Repairs in III's favour

hitps iisingapore marimen com/claims/index cfimMusabox=5VCmall&fuseaction=dsp_Prim&CFID=633307458CFTOKEN=525{TTBETT40cc27-3F... 11



Hsiao TanE (LKKAuto)

From: Chin Hui Xin <huixin@n51.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 10:29 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD of GBD3B35T - Accident Involving GBD3835T & SHA7925K on 28/12/2018

/FLKK REF: CC4/11119003831/Gpb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Refer to the above subject
We agreed as per offer $2,783.00

Kindly proceed for payment.

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
TWINCAR Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510
www.n51.com.sg

T -

On Sat, Nov 30, 2019 at 9:17 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -



1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) §2,354.00
2. Loss of Use (S5days x S80.00) S 400,00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee s 29.00

Total | $ 2,783.00

Please confirm acceptance,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
Inferred from this negotiatlon of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subseguently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Hest Regards,

Hsino Tong. Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax; 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408913)

From: Chin Hui Xin <huixin@n51.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 4:32 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@|k >
Subject: LOD of GBD3835T - Accident Involving GBD3835T & SHA7925K on 28/12/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above subject.
Attached LOD for your kind perusal.
The original documents will be mailed to your

Kindly revert to us once received the documents.

Thank yau

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510

www.n51.com.sq

T —
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiament

.ﬁ.ll.ﬂl SUBFOLDER TRACHMING
[ Hotified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad| Rpt Ad| Submitted | Ins Auth'sd [ Status
tor
' |0 Mar 2019 g:._,;" ey 5$2,200.00 $$2,200.00 | m ey
Eannsg | | e ety e | Bt Estimates | | view Aot Cance Coow |

Clnim Details

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by ndjuster]
Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 1993038218

Main .
et COMBI GALLERY PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No. 2015272960

Wehiel _ | z8/12/2018 15:00 - 159

ho.© " |GBD3I8IST Date-of hows: i;n Months and 3 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

. Paficy/Cover |

| Claim Type: TP f MCT18120797 i HOOMOD1S
| Vehicle Reg

No SHAT925K ?’"’-"" e o |P1m17376

[Insurad}: Claimant]:

Exresy:

Repainer: Twincar Automotive Pie Ltd (Kakl Bukit) BLK 2 KAK] BUKIT, #01-17/18 KAK] BUKTT AUTOHUR, 417921 Kaki Sukit - Tl

HanGig | yndia tnternational Insurance Pte Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Mandied by Prival

E":I"::“ AXA Insurance Pta Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5880 4888

Adjuster; LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handled by XING GUO QIANG] ... [Final Rpt dus 12/03/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View M| |  Compase Case Mall |
» [MI_S5G (§2/11/2015): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$2883.00) - GRD3S3IST - Claim Handler: Priva
= [II_SG (07/03/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - GBD383ST - Claim Handler: Priya

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tusks | Croate New Task | Compiete |

Dug Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Crasted On Done?
N results.
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*GBD3835T (MCT18120797)

[SHA7925K]
™

COMBI GALLERY PTE LTD
Dec 28 2018 3:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Twincar Automotive Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

View [view in Srowser|

Photos/Images Spepege V]| W
Nt | Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbsall | Print
1 |16/08/1917:24 | General View @) | waewc | B
2 |18/08/19 17:24 Geoneral View O adwsc | 4
3 |15/09/12 17:24 | General View O wawrc | A
& |16/09/19 17:24 General View 0 leiws | A
5 |16/09/1917:24 | General View @ wurs |
& |16/09/1917:24 | General View @ | v | ¥
7 |16/08/18 17:24 | General View 0| s | A
B 1508019 17:24 | General View @ | oaaws | &
§ |16/Mm8/19 17124 Ganaral View 0| weews | A
10 |16/09/1917:24 | General View 0 | wews | B
11 [16/09/19 17:24 | General View g wad®s | B
12 |16/09/18 17:24 | Genersl View Q| adirc | A
13 |18/09/19 17:2¢ | General View Q| aews | A
14 |16/09/19 17:24 | General View 0| weers | A
15 |16/09/18 17:25 | Odometer Reading 0| warws | A
16 |18/09/16 17:35 | Chassis Number @ | waws | W
17 |18/09/19 17:28 Dismantied Paris 0| dec | M
18 |16/0%/19 17:28 Dismantled Parts 0| cadws | M
19 |16/09/1917:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| v | A
20 |10/05/19 1728 | Dismantied Parts 0| wears | B
21 | 16/09/19 17:28 Dismantied Parts g wae s | B
22 |16/06/19 17:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| weiws | A
21 |16/09/19 17:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| wovc | B
24 |16/09/1917:38 | Dismantied Parts 0| wiws | &
25 |16/09/19 1728 | Dismantied Parts O wars | B
26 |16/09/1917:28 | Dismantied Parts O | wews | B
7 |16/09/19 17:28 Dismantied Parts 0| i | A
28 |16/09/19 17:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| dwe | A
29 |16/09/19 17:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| mawc | A
130 |16/09719 17:28 Dismantied Parts D | wmaws | A
31 |16/09/1917:28 | Dismantied Parts @G| waws | A
17 |16/09/19 17:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| wdc | A
| 16/09/19 17:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| tosews | A
3 [16/09/19 1728 | Dismantied Parts 0| weawc | A
35 |16/09/1917:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| wews | A
36 |16/09/19 17:28 Dismantied Party 0| weaws | A
37 |16/09/19 17:38 | Dismantied Parts O | wawc | B
I8 |16/09/18 1728 | Dismantied Parts @ | tcesrc | A
39 |18/09/19 17:28 Dismantied Parts ! losd 30 | BA
40 |16/09/19 17:28 | Dismantied Parts 0| wedwc | A
41 |16/09/19 17:28 | Cismantied Parts ! loed G | B
42 |16/09/19 17:28 | Cismantied Parts 0| v | A
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Photos/Images Beerpme [] &
No | Relabel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ [ Thumbnall | Print
Dacumentation [iperpoge [~} M
No | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbrall | Print
1 |D1/03/19 14:07 | EMAIL FROM 111 DD 01032019 ) | iooaPof
2 |01/03/19 14:07 | NOTICE & GIA REPORT Laad PDF
3 11191628 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
& (2111710 16:29 | GIA SEARCH Load POF
5 |21711/19 16:29 LoD Load POF
B |D9/01/20 10:41 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
7 |09/01/20 10:41 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Lnad POF
B |09/01/20 10:41 | GIROFORM Load POF
No | Finalied On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |D4/03/1909.27 | Singapore Accident Statemant @ | tosaror
Documents Checklist
neset | Save | pont |

lnn-:ummm:nu.u-r
iTMulwnoimm checklists configured.

Our Checkiist Remarks - LK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: L] Handfing Insurer
P R aew priedie unesd yoa dhices 8 15 Bfhas partiee
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Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co regno1sseoriser
51 Ubl Ave 1#01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCA4/1118003831/GPA30Q2
Date; 08/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No MCOMOO015
Claimant i
Vehicle No : GBD3835T Insured Vehicle No : SHATB25K
Date of Loss: 281212018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18120797
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBD3835T
Make & Model: N sy STAR.AOSMITABS 2DRZWD  EngineNo:  ZD30342008K
Reg. Date: 25/08/2014 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: JN1SC2F24Z0B856515
Colour: Silver Odometer: 160827 km
Engine Capacity. 2953 cc
Markel Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S5): Market Valua/New Car Price
ITION OF VEHI AT THE TIME OF SUR
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake [Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 18570 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 165 R13
Front Lefi Side: Habilead 5 mm Rear Left Side: Falken 5 mm
Froni Right Side: Habilead 5 mm Rear Right Side: Falken 5 mm
The shove valbes represan he remaning tyre reads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS - Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 407985 1,897.08 2,182 59 53 50
Miscellansous llems 0.00 D.00 0.00
Labour 1,780.00 880.00 800.00 50.56
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 5,859.65 2,777.06 3,082.59 52.61
Approved Total (Overridden) (58) 2,200.00
(S%) 5,859.65 2,200.00 3,658 85 B2 45
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (55) 410.18 154.00 256.18 62 46
Nett Amount (55) 6,269.83 2,354.00 391583 62.46
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x $$80.00/day) (S$) 400.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5§) 20.00
Nett Liability (5§) 2,783.00
INSPECTION
Dale of Assignment: 01/03/2018
Date Inspected: 11/03/2018 Inspected Al: Twincar Automotive Ple Lid (Kaki

Bukit)

BLK 2 KAKI BUKIT, #01-17118 KAKI
BUKIT AUTOHUB

Singapore 417921

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 9/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair 4.0 days

Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This repor! reprasants our fngings af ihe ime and place of inspecton siaded herein, Such nspection has besn camad out fo (e best of our
knowiedge and ahility but any other Nabiity undar any other circumatances is hemby exprasaly sxciuded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ge... 9/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: {Last Synchronised: 21 Nov 2018)

Parts: MIA MNISSAN CABSTAR 3.0 5MIT ABS 2DR 2WD EURO 5 (A) (Model not available in
database)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard Lisl)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for GBD3835T)

i\uli:ﬁw: These estimates are valid only if they contain the pnnt code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
' numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimata page

[Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefived with an asterisk =

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Cut 945 10FL *94510FL
2 1 ‘FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER GARNISH Broken 7500FL *7S.00FL
3 1 ‘FRONT LH CORNER PANEL Buckled 389 80FL *38890FL
4 1 *FRONT LH DOOR Repair 1,396.50 FL "~ FL
5 1 *FRONT LH DOOR HINGE Mot Necessary 56.10FL *FL
(1] 1 *FRONT LH DOOR STEP GARNISH Mot Necassary 13640 FL *.FL
T 1 *FRONT LH HEADLAMP Cut 47340FL =473 40FL
8 1 *FRONT LH SIDE MIRROR Not Necassary 171.80FL *FL
9 1 *FRONT LH UPPER CORNER GARNISH Mot Necessary 111.30FL *.FL
0 1 *FRONT PANEL CABSTAX EMBLEM MNecessary 30.00FL *3D0OOFL
"1 1 *SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Mol Necessary 50.00FS *FS
2 1 *SET FRONT GRILLE CLIPS Mot Necessary 30.00FS *.FS
3 1 *FRONT LH DOOR ART STICKER MNacessary 300.00FS *100.00FS
14 1 *FRONT LH DOOR COMPANY DETAIL STICKER Necessary 40.00FS *25.00FS
15 1 *SET FRONT LH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS Not Necessary 50.00FS ~FS
18 1 *SET FRONT PANEL ART STICKER MNecessary 200.00FS *S50.00FS

F=Franchise part 5=SpcMeft. L=ListitamDisc
Sub Total {S§) 4,458.50 2,088.40
- List ltem Discount on L ftems 10.00M10.00% (S§) 378.85 191.34

Total Parts (S§) 4,079.65  1,897.06

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ge... 9/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no now miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE ,REINSTALL ELECTRICAL WIRING New §0.00 30.00
HARNESS ,CHECK LIGHTING (TO FR)
2  TOREMOVE,REINSTALL WINDOW GLASS (TO FR) New §0.00 0.00
3 TO TRANSFER DOOR GLASS ,REGULATOR New 100.00 0.00
GEAR ,MOTOR ,RAILING ,CHANAEL ,TRIM
BOARD ,MECHANISM LOCK AND HANDLE
4  TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE CHARGE New B00.00 450,00
BODYPARTS ,REPAIR PORTION AND WHERE
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT
5  TOPROVIDE LABOUR WORKMANSHIP TO CHARGE THE  New 700.00 400.00
ABOVE DAMAGED BODYPARTS ,REPAIR ,RE-
CONSTRUCT AND RE-ALIGN BODY STRUCTURE ,BODY
ALIGNMENTS AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT
6 TOAPPLY ANTI RUST CHEMICAL ON REPAIRED AND New 80.00 0.00
REPLACED PANEL
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,780.00 880.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 9/1/2020



