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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N
Email: mg3solutionia gmail.com

T0 . AIG DATE  : 26-Feb-13
ATTENTION . MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE ; T/P CLAIM
ESTIMATE REPORT
VEHICLE DETAILS
VEHICLE NO + SLK8200L ﬂé'ljawa?(ﬂ,
MODEL + TOYOTA ALPHA 2.5 : I H
CHASSIS NO
ACCIDENT DETAILS  DATE : 26-Feb-19
TIME : 21:35HRS
THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT JACK LI
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Poh Kin (LKKAuto) — s e ——=

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 11:26 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SLK8200L & SMH9283U on
26/02/2019

Attachments: 71199108 for SLKB200L (SMG198154) pdf

Vour Ref: CC6/AIG19003827/Afa3 (SMH9283U)
Our Ref: SLKB200L

Dear Poh Kin,

We refer to below, we are pleased to accept the offer at global sum of $7,010.00 and let us have your
payment soonest.

Please find attached TAX INVOICE for your kind onward action.

Provided always that this discharge of my claim for damages relating to the damage to my vehicle
SLK8200L shall not prejudice or affect my further claim for general and special damages for my personal
injuries sustained in the same accident on 26/02/2015.

Best Regards,

5u Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-038B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri. May 10, 2019 at 4:29 PM Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkinf@!lkkauto.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE ASTO COSTS

Our Ref: CCH/AIG1I9003827/Afa3

Your Ref: SLK B200L

Dear Su,



Poh Kin ELHI{Autn] =

From: Poh Kin [LKKAuUta)

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:30 PM

To: MG Solution

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident invelving Vehicle SLKB200L & SMH9283U on
26/02/2019

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Qur Ref: CC6/AIG19003827/Afa3

Your Ref: SLK 8200L
Dear Su,
We refer to the above matter,

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $7,010.00(all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence belng discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negatiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
P'oh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkinglkkayto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

¥ IR o5 e
SeSRSR mw Sove bhe Larthe Frint only when necessary”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
mintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. I you believe that you received this e-mall in error, pleasa do nol
wad this e-mail or any attached tems. Flease delele the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the

der thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:23 PM



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:23 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SLKB200L & SMH3283U on
26/02/2019

Categories: clear

Your Ref: CC6/AIG19003827/Afa3 (SMHI9283U)
Our Ref: SLK8200L

Dear Poh Kin,

We refer to below email, we would like to counter propose as per below:

Repair cost $5992.00 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed

LOU $1080.00 (9 days x 5120) - Request: our client's vehicle belongs 2500cc
LTA Search S 7.45 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed

Towing Fee S 60.00 - Agreed

Total $7139.45

Best Regards,

S5uWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

1#102-03B Singapore 415933
lel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, May 10, 2019 at 4:04 PM Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CCO/AIGI9003827/Ala3

Your Ref: SLK 8200L

Dear Sir/Madam,



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e ————————————

From: Poh Kin [LKKAUto)

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:05 PM

To: MG Solution

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SLKB200L & SMH9283U on
26/02/2019

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CCH/AIG19003827/Afa3
Your Ref: SLK B200L

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $6,850.00(all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole

intentian of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/inlluence on the issues of liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
I"'oh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone; 6841-2132 | email; pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

EEREE ST o the Larth- Frint only when mecessary:

Ihis e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Usa or distnbution by an
unintended recipient 1s prohibited, and may be a vialation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and Inform the
sander that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereol, Thank you,

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com)
Sent; Friday, 10 May 2019 1:52 PM



MG SOLUTION PTELTD

23 Kakl Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kakl Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415833
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 201427944N)

Dﬂ[l: | ﬂa’ﬂir’lﬁl ]

Your Rel : SMH9283U

To : AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
Altn : Motor Claims Department
Dear SirfMdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLK8200L & SMH9283U ON 26/02/2019
AT ALONG BUKIT TIMAH ROAD TOWARDS SUNGEI ROAD BEFORE CTE
(SLE) EXIT.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal:

1 Proforma Bill No. 198154 @ S$5,992.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
2) Loss of Use (2 §52,250,00 (9 Days x S$250)

3) LTA Search @ S87.45

4) Towing Fee @ S560.00

5) Authorisation to Act

B GIA Report

Hope the above is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.
Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

Shavon

Sharon Chia

HP: 9188 6931
E-mail: mg3solution@gmail.com



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Name : ALELLENGE EDUCATION SERVICES PTELTP
address - > PANGAN \h(WBY FFi6-308
CHEMPREA confT s(543627)

Contact No

to: Al -ASWA  PACLFIC  INSUBANTL PTE LTD

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING __SLK F200L AND  SmH 4283w on 26]03] 2014

aT/atong BUET T EoAD TowALDS SUNGE| E£24p BEFCOKEL
(TE (!‘LE} EXTT

MWe, __ AtelIpALL Hates Jemwr Be e , am/are the registered owner of

motor carno. __ LA F200L

Pleasa nots that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above said accident
19 M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

|/ We, haraby authorize you to relaase 21l compansation manies pertzining to the above-mentioned
accidentto M/fS MG SOLUTION PTELTD and forward your settlement cheque to M/$ MG SOLUTION
PTELTD whom | had zutherized to collact the sald compensation menies.

Thankyou
’__,._.

5 m:“%)}g\ /

"tb u}

i T

Signature of Claimant Witness By



S1 UBEAVE L. #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CCO6/AIGI9003827/Afa3

17 APRIL 2019

ACE FLEET MANAGEMENT PTE LTD
237 ALEXANDRA ROAD

#02-03, THE ALEXCIER

SINGAPORE 159929

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 9283U AND SLK 8200L ON 26/02/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie
Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

-

Poh Chong

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)
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Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: E243 1376
{GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

21 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Buklt Centre #02-03 Singapors 415833

TAX INVOICE

INVOICE No : TT 199108

Bill Te:

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
78 SHENTON WAY

#07-12 AlG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

PE No : 188154

Date : 13-May-2019

Vehicle Number : SLK 8200L

aTty DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation ] 5.600.00
(Lump Sum})
BEFORE GST 5,600.00
7% GST 382.00
TOTAL | § 5,892.00

Cheque should be made payable to MG Solution Pte Ltd

Co's stamFilhuturhad Signature
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» Back to OneMotoring

Ll | mns |’1X'~.'..-'!III.'

Land Transport Adthorty

10 S Ming Deive

Sngapore 5TET01

GET Registation Mo, - MA-0008529.2

Print Date/Time : 28 Fab 2018/ 17:10:05
Receipt Date/Time = 28 Feb 20187 17:10:08
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Recwigt No. | ITNET-00000-150228-003182
Previous Racegt No

SN Mtem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Referance Before Amount After GST
No, GST (5%) I55) (55)

Resull of Insurance Enquiry - SMH22830

A5 al 26 Feb 2019/21:35.00

Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE FTE. LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry « SMHEZEIU

Enquiry Fes 7.00 0.48 748
20160226170906825776
Sub-Total T.00 048 Ta8
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 748
Reunding Ditferance 004
Total Amount Payabie 745
Pasd By
20100228170819618 mm ‘"E;“ e 745
Total 745
Cash Changs 000
Tendared Amount 7.45
Excess Refundabis Amount 0,00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure that all paymaents to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider | financial Institution, Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late foa

may apply.
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fasilane
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Notified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned #d) Rpt Ad) Subrmitted Ins Auth’eq [ Sratus |
{01 Mar 2018  Pending for Survey l
| i 01 Mar 2019 |o0:00 545,600.00 ] 585,600.00 |l-purt
| oo | e Adj e | L |_Cancel case | |

| [Created by adjuster]

| ACE FLEET MANAGEMENT PTE LYD, Co. Reg. No.: 201710614N

ACCELLENCE EDUCATION SERVICES PTE. LTD., Co Reg. No.: I01501651Z

Vehicle Reg.
Mot

. | 26/02/2019 21:00 - :59
|SLKS200L Date of L0SS: | /35 Months and 20 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

Clabm Type:

TP / 627555508956 ’N:‘;'fﬁ‘“:“" (1999994511 (Comprehensive)

Vehicle Reg,
No.
(Insured):

Policy No.

[Clalmant): S086690972-020LASS5]IC

SMHEZEIU

Excess:

MG Solution Pte Ltd (HQ) 2] Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-038, VICOM Inspection Centre, 415533 Kako Bukit - Tel: 91886931

Hardling
Insurer:

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. [Express) - Tel: 65-641%-3000 ... [Handled by Les. Ming-Yao] MingYao.Lee@aig.com

Clalmant’s
Insurer:

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Al juster:

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Te: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 14/03/2019]

MHDMLm View All I Compose Case Mail I

|. AIG_5G [0

£/03/2019); ND TP GIA REPORT

Due Date
| Mo results

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ Wiew All | Search Tasks | Create Mew Task | cComplete |

Priority Type Tosk Group  Subject Handier  Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 17/5/2019



Menimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLKB200L (62755550895G)

[SMH9283U]
™

ACCELLENCE EDUCATION SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Feb 26 2019 9:00PM

[ACE FLEET MANAGEMENT PTE LTD]

MG Solution Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

View [View in Browser | v |

Wo | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 |(oram) Third Party Express Sattlement - Payment Breakdown [1] Edr |
Assessment Reports 1 per page E i} |
[No | Finakzes On I[m Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (5G) Thumbnall| Print
1 !IHWH 13:33 'ﬂ“ﬁﬁmr e O | woaarm |
!Il'_ho'mlﬂmlgu 3 per ~]l & 1
[Ho | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) - Thurmbeall Print
1 |09/04/19 23:00 | Genersl View O | edirc | A
!hz__@l_uww 13:00 | General View © | dws | M
|3 |09/04/19 23:00 | General View D | cdws | B
4 |09/04/19 23:00 | General View 0 | wasws | M
& 09/04/18 23:00 | General View O | waaiwrs | A
& |09/04/19 23:00 Goeneral View D | Loac ks Ed
7 09/04/1923:00 | Genaral View © | waaws | BB
B 09/04/16 2300 | General View © | aawc | 4
o [o9oy/18 2300 |Generat view O | weows | B
(10 |09/04/18 23:00 | General View 0O tows | &
11 DH/04/19 2300 | General View - D | tsaws | B
112 |09/04/1923:00 | Genaral View 0 iceiws | A
113 |09/04/18 23:00 | General View 0| oo | &
|14 |09/04/19 23:00 | General View 0 | weows | A
15 |09/04/19 23:00 | General View D | adies | A
{16 |09/04719 23:00 General View _g_ Load PG @_
17 09/04/15 23:00 | General View 0 | s A
18 |0%04/1923:00  Reinspection Photo 0| wewrs &
19 |09/04/19 22:00 Rainspection Photo @O | loadws | & |
20 |09/04/1923:00 | Relnspection Phato © | eews | 4|
21 |09/04/19 23:00 | Reinspection Phato O | wews | B
21 |09/04/1% 23:00 | Reinspection Photo 0 | waaws | A |
23 |09/04/19 23:00 | Relnspection Phato 0 | twaws | |
24 |09/04/19 23:00 | Relnspection Phota O | wwaws | &
25 |09/04/19 23:00 | Reinspection Phato O  weaws |
26 109/04/19 23:00 Reinspection Photo g Load 3G | A
27 |09/04/19 23:00 | Reinspection Phato | @) | oanes | B4 |
28 |09/04/19 23:00 | Reinspection Phato | @ | weaws | BB |
(20 |D9roa/19 23:00 ;:;lup-w-nm - B r-ﬁ Losa WG | B |
130 09/04/1923:00 | Reinspection Photo O | s | A |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 17/52019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

[t e e

'Letters/Correspondences 1perpage | v] B |
[Na_|Finaiizea Cn "LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail_Print
31 |0W04/18 23:00 | Reinspection Photo Load PG | A
132 09/04/19 23:00 | Reinspection Photo - e s | @A
33 0W/04/1923:00 | Reinspection Photo toad 06 | A
34 090419 23:00 | Relnspection Photo Lbsd G | BA
135 |09/04/1923:00 | Reinspection Photo Load G | M
36 09/04/19 23:00 | Reinspection Photo Load G | BA
137 |09/04/1823:00 | Reinspection Phote Load G | BA
38 (09/04/1923:00 | Meinspection Phote - Losd G | B
Documentation 1 +]| B

T T e T P T S
1 15/03/10 18:46 TP GIA REPORT - INCOMPLETE
2 04/05/19 10:45 | TP GIA REPORT _ -
3 04/05/19 10:45 | TP Estimate-Marked

|

Lbad POF

L | D4/D5/19 10145 LETTER TD O1 Load POF
5 17/05/19 10:10 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
& 17/05/19 10110 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF |
(7 17/05/19 10:10 | Release Voucher Lsad PDF
B 17/05/1910:10 | LTA SEARCH Load POF

'

|
eecooceee i eceoepole

B

3|3

'S |17/05/19 10:10 TOWING FEE Losd POF

Documents Checklist

| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | print ]
| There are no document checkiists configured.

Show Remarks To: [ Handiing Tnsurer
Sinem: AEmarks are privane crmes you ahow 010 ofher pErlies.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 17/5/2019



NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
['Unhlch No: SMH9283U (Insd veh) Model: OYOTA ALPHARD 255
SLKBZ0OL (TP veh) ABS D/IAIRBAG 2WD
| Date of Accident: |26/02/2019 R (A)
Global Sum Settlement | - | [X] Yes | I 1 No
Repair Estimate '$ 11,028.89
Final Repair Cosl '8 7.010.00
Loss of Use o ] 8.00 days at $120.00 per day
Rental (if any) - 1 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee -1
Others:Towing Fee ‘5
]
Final Setilement Sum (Global Sum) 1 7.010.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agread Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes!/ No  BOLA Scenario No.

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: {%) Assessed Liability (). (%)
* Assessed Liabillty to be filled only for chain colllsions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1} |MG Solution Pte Lid

2)
3)
4)

7,010.00

4 | 4 | O | 45

17 May
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 17/5/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico regno 1ssso71ssm)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCB/AIG19003827/AFA302
Date: 17/05/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No- 0969064511
mimant Vehicle 51 k200 Insured Vehicle No:  SMHg283U
Date of Loss: 26/02/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 62755550895G
RIPTION & | IFICATI
Reg No SLK8200L
Make & Model Eg;?;;ﬂ ALPHARD, 25 S CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD Engine No: 2ARH581738
Reg. Date: 06/12/2016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: AGH300026986
Colour: Black Ddomeler: 151008 km
Engine Capacity 2493 cc
Markel Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
AT THE TIME OF SURV
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceabla): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235/50 R18 Rear Tyre Size. 235/50 R18
Front Left Side Michelin 6 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 6 mm
Front Right Side Michelin 8 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin B mm
The alunve valuss represant (e remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS B  Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 6,855.50 5,045.97 1,808.53 26.40
Miscellaneous lams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,450.00 1,850.00 150000 4348
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 10,305.50 6.985.97 3.308.53 Iz
Approved Total (Overridden) [S§) 5,600.00
(SS) 10,305.50 5,600.00 4,705.50 45 BB
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 721,39 382.00 32039 4566
Nett Amount (S$) 11,026.89 5,992.00 5,034.89 45.66
+ Loss of Use (8.0 x $5120,00/day) (S$) 960.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.45
+ Other Costs (S§) 60.00
Nett Liability (S$) 7,019.45
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 7,010.00
INSPECTION
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 17/5/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Date of Assignment: 01/032018

Date Inspected: 01/03/2019 Inspected Al: MG Solution Pte Ltd (HQ)
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-038, VICOM
Inspection Centre
Singapore 415833

Estimated Period of Repair: 8.0 days

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Chaong Poh Kin

NOTE: This report reprasents our findings af the fme and place of mapection stuted herein. Such inspechon has been camed out fo the Dest of our
knowiedpe and ability bul any other iability under any other ciroumstences is hereby expressly oxcluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 17/5/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *TAILGATE Dented 210060FL *1.7T1B.00FL
2 1 *TAILGATE EMBLEM ALPHA Necessary 90.00FL *80.00FL
3 1 *TAILGATE LOCK Damaged 480,90 FL *4B80.B0FL
4 1 *TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP Not Necessary 33050 FL *FL
5 1 *TAILGATE ANTENINA Cracked 180.90 FL *180 80 FL
3] 1 *TAILGATE BUZZLE Damaged 130.00 FL *130.00 FL
7 1 *REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING Necessary 250,90 FL *250.80 FL
8 1 *TAILGATE INNER BOARD Cracked 880.50 FL *548 40 FL
8 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 1.880.50FL *1.57500FL
0 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Necessary S8.30 FL *88.30 FL
1"t *REAR END PANEL Dented B20.00 FL *B85.00 FL
12 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Deformad 244 90 FL *244 BOFL
13 2 *REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 908.00 FL *498.00 FL
14 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE Nol Necessary 50.00FS *-FS
15 1 *TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT Necessary 100.00 FS *40.00 FS
16 1 *TAILGATE WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL Necessary 120.00 FS *40,00 FS
17 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 20.00F5 *20.00F5S
18 1 “SET REAR END PANEL GARNISH CLIP Necessary 20.00Fs *10.00F5
19 1 *REAR END PANEL SEALANT Necessary 100.00 FS *60.00 FS
F=Franchise pan. S=Spaelett L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (S%) 9,004.00 6,671.30
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (5%) 2,148 50 1.625.33
Total Parts (53%) 6,855.50 5.045.97
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 17/5/2019



Adjuster Repont Paged of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thore are no new miscellaneous ltems selocted.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO PANEL BEAT REMOVE AND REPLACE PARTS New 1.200.00 800.00
2 TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA MNew 1,200.00 800.00
3 TO TRANSFER TAIL GATE MECHANISM New 250.00 B0.00
4 LABOUR TO REMOVE AND REFIT WINDSCREEN New 120.00 120.00
5  TUFF COAT New 180,00 60.00
6  TOCONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TEST New 250.00 0.00
7 WIRING CHECK New 150.00 30.00
8 REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR AND DISTANCE New 100,00 60.00
SETTING
Gross Labour Cost (55) 3.450.00 1.850.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuscaction=gen_... 17/5/2019



