Vic (LKKAuto)

e ———— e —

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September, 2019 11:20 AM

To: Vie (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE; OUR REF: SNM19D201003 - FW: <SEEK MANDATE> RE:

Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMG8762R and SHD1262M (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI19003766/K1ha3) on 27/02/2019

LKK REF-CC3/CTI19003766/K1ha3
CTPIS REF — SNVI19D201003C02/2(thp)

Dear Vic
We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $3,926.79.
We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A4 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender Immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 16 September, 2019 4:21 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Chee 50 Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201003 - FW: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident
Involving SMG8762R (O : CTI - TBA) and SHD1262M (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119003766/K1ha3) on 27/02/2019

Dear Irene,

We refer to our below email.
Please be informed that TP is now chasing for settlement.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
¥y ESES =

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Monday, 5 August, 2019 4:59 PM

To: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Vic [LKKAuto)
Subject: OUR REF; SNM19D201003 - FW: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMG8762R
(O1: CTI - TBA) and SHD1262M (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119003766/K1ha3) on 27/02/2019

Dear Irene,

Fya.

Regards,

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
T: (65) 638896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: #-F i Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmilted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Flease delete the e-mail and any coples of if thereafter.

From: Vic (LKKAuUto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 5 August, 2019 4:30 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh®@lkkauto.comz>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMG8762R (Ol : CT| - TBA) and SHD1262M (TP
: LKK REF - CC3/CT119003766/K1ha3) on 27/02/2019

CTI REF - TBA
LKK REF — CC3/CT119003766/K1ha3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SMG 8762R (Ol) AND SHD 1262M (TP) ON 27/02/2019

We refer to the above matter.



It was reported that Insured vehicle was making a right turn at the junction with Green light only when the collision
occurred. A copy of TP video footage is attached for your reference. The footage shows that the TP vehicle was
travelling straight across the junction.

A letter was sent out to the Insured to notify TP claim and no feedback received till date.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) s 7,392.30 S 3,317.00
Loss of Rental (5100.39 x 6 days) 5 602.34 5 602.34
LTA Search Fee 5 7.45 5 7.45
TOTAL $ 8,002.09 $ 3,926.79
Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 4 days
Weekends / Downtime 2 days

TOTAL 6 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

F EFEFS o
SuRRER o Sgve the Earth Frint only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March, 2019 11:49 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Catherine Thia; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMG8762R (01 : CTI - TBA) and SHD1262M (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT119003766/K1ea3) on 27/02/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"



SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHD 1262M at M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd - Changi on a WP basis
and TP repairer purposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GlA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
» Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www. symanteccloud. com




PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446671 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG: 200707743D GST REG: 200707743D

Our Ref: SHD1262M/SR
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

13 March 2019 {By Email Only)

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Dear SirMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD1262M AND SMG8762R ALONG SENJA ROAD //
SENJA WAY ON 27.02.2019

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd, the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHD1262M. to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: SMG8762R at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle. Mr. Chia Kok Chuan.

As a result of the accident caused by vour Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of vour insured’s Vehicle Number: SMG8762R. our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair (Incl. G5T) 2 3.317.00

(2) Loss of Rental — 6 Days (@3$100.39 per day 5 602.34
{Ine PRI, Weekend + 4 davs)

(3) LTA Search fee 5 7.45

§  3926.79

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

(1) GIA report & sketch plan of SHD1262M

(2) Driver’s I/C and Driving License

(3) Final repair bill

(4) Vehicle Registration card. Certificate of Insurance. Certification Letter
(5) Check In/Out Voucher

{6) LTA search

(7) Scene Video



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446671 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG: 200707743D GST REG: 200707743D

Our Ref: SHD1262M/SR

We would appreciate if vou could look into the subject matter and let us have vour
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us vour discharge voucher as for our client’s signature and
payment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd".

Please note that if we do not hear from vou within the stipulated 14 days. we will have no

alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalfto commence proceedings
against you without further notice to vou.

Yours faithfully,

Claims Department — Shafawati Md Rabu
Email: shafawati rabui@premiertaxi.com
NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no when replying

¢.c. Client — Premier Taxis Pte Ltd
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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (165) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI19003766/K1ha3

25/06/2019

LOH SEET WAH, JEREMIAH (LUO ZHIHUA, JEREMIAH)
BLK 347A YISHUN AVENUE 11

#11-503

SINGAPORE 761347

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG8762R AND SHD1262M ON 27/02/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.c. by 05/07/2019, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
% f

Jimmy

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2928

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: jimmychen(@]lkkauto.com

c.e.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/'We, PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of 23 CHANGI
SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 SINGAPORE 486443 (address), owner of SHD 1262M
{vehicle no.) hereby authorize PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

(*the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental
and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no, SHD 1262M that was damaged pursuant
to the accident which occurred on 27/02/2019 (date) along JUNCTION OF SENJA
ROAD AND SENJA WAY (location) involving vehicle no/s SMG 8763R (“the

accident™).

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to

settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of “the workshop™.

I/'We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is
on a without prejudice and without admussion of liability basis insofar as the

driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s 15 concerned,

Dated this (day) of _ X (month) 2019 {year).
SN
[.2Y *."l
el )8
0N, ~ )
..,-'._‘:‘"' r—":g"‘/
Signed by “thethird party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop”

{with chop if applicable) (with chop)



t:nis Seitiement excl
odily injur 181
\ 1r1es arie
o Iammg out of the
said accident and e
10 ... oty do-- T

w i E "
& [
="

udes any

HMOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Amsunt i 853,828,758
SINGAFPORE DOLLARZ THREE THOUSAND MNINE HUNDRED TWENTY 5IX
AND CENIS SEVENTY NINE ONLY

I/We @Egree to accept the sbove mentioned amount to be paid to me/us
final ‘settlemmnt of all claims; ¢o3ts & disbursements [or dimjuries
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ustained by mefus through an accident invelwving

Claimant Vehicle No. SHD 12E2M
Insured Vehicle No. & BME B7&ZR
Date =f Leoas ;2 1x0dw2dls
Place of Accident : JUNCTION OF SEWJA ROAD ANWD SENJA WAY

IN CONSIDERATION &f the payment made to me/us of the aforementicned sum by
CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAFCRE) FPIE. LID., I/We agree absclutely to
dissharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFPCRE) PTE. LTDR. andfor

Insured Name : LOR SEET WAR, JEREMIAH (LDO ZHTHUA, JEREMIAH)
Driver Name : LOH BEET WAE, JEREMIAH [LUD JEREMIAH)

om:- ALl claims, present or future in Tespect of &ll loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/u ri
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gcknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liasbility on the

I pifi s =
part of CHINA TAIFING INSURRNCE (SINGAFCRE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Gensral Damages 55
{2) Cost of Repair/Zxcess 35 3,317.00
{3) Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 55 a0Z. 34
{4) GIA/P&lice Reports/

Investigarticon Results/Search Fees 55 T7.45
{5) Medical Repcrts/Expenses 55
&) “8urvey Feea/F.T:i FTeess 55
(7) Cost incliuding Dishursement 85

TOTAL + o v o + v 4 o s s & u « « . 55 3,926.79

Claimant Name m?ﬁﬁwwﬁ TH'LLE"?FIE LITG NRIC Ho : JGD-]EU'Q :]""HI
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PREMIER

FREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
QFFICE: 23 Changi South Avenue 2 #01-02 5(488443)

TEL: 65436678 / 654365089 FAX 62141511

AUTDMDT.IVE SER'I‘,.-'ICES CO. REG NO.: 2007077430 GST. REG. NO.; 2007077430
TAX INVOICE
PREMIER TAXIS PTELTD DATE 13-Mar-2019
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 PAGE 1 OF 1
SINGAPORE 486443
ITEM Description aTy U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA - 3,100.00
REGN NO: SHD 1262 M
s,
TOTAL LUMPSUM REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR $ 3,100.00
GST@7%]| $ 217.00
GRAND TOTAL] % 3,317.00
ol

for Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




»PREMIER

TAXIS

07 March 2019

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir/Madam

CERTIFICATION LETTER

This letter serves to inform that Chia Kok Chuan of NRIC Number 569266938 is a

registered driver of SHD1262M. Chia Kok Chuan is paying daily rental rate of $100.39
{(Inclusive of GST).

Should you require further information, please contact us at 6214 8880.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely

Kellie Poh
Administration Manager

Prepared By: Hasnah

PREMIER TAXISPTE LTD

23 Changi South Avenue 2

#03-02

Sirgnpore d56443

Telephone: +65 6214 830 Fux: +65 6214 0330
www, premicrtaxi.con

Co. Rep. Mo, 200304975H



REPLACEMENT VEH GIVEN YES /NO

@PREMIER , oo

TAXIS .,
CHECK IN / OUT VOUCHER AFTELL

DANERSNAME 1 1A Kol < HUAN ¢ HiRgr) INDICATE AREA OF DAMAGE HERE:
NRIC, e 649 #9586 HANDPHONE ¢ ¢ 7 27 | 7 REAR

TAXI REGM NO. SHPDP I 2_ é J M MAKE / MODEL ]1: E‘L

DATEIN TIME IN DATEQUT TIME OUT

2Pe2)q o94c0 0463lqg |S5o05

KILOMETRES 18 FUEL IN KILOMETRES OUT FUEL OUT

36349 4 [efwe]refon]¢] & [1a] o] F |

TAXI METER DOWNLOADED

DATE / TIME TOWED IN 70 WORKSHOP

ok R BA M E FET & B Y, [ |

DATE / TIME CALL TO DRNER FOR VEHICLE COLLECTICR

(e W ¥R T R | HoHokE-RA

1 ACKNOWELDGE AND CONFIRM THAT | HAVE EXAMINED THE ABOVE SAID VEHICLE AND
THAT THE SAME IS [N GODD COMDITION AND TO MY SATISFACTION [N EVERY RESFECT
TOGETHER WITH THE ACCESSORIES / ITEMS LIST ABOVE. THIS VOUCHER |15 USED IN
CONJUNCTION WITH THE TERM RENTAL AGREEMENT,

YES NO

CHECK IN CHECK OUT
i Bl Cuan X | Chi Whphun X
DRIVER'S NAME BRIVER'S NAME
% %
J?lw/ j o321
WEﬂ's SIGNATURE / DATE / TIME EFts SIGNATURE | DATE / TIME
» /5 BODY MARKINGS
1 —Light Dent 5 - Damaged
CHECKED M 8Y CHECKED OUT BY i: Eag:uws;?m"; 'E : g::in
{PAEMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOF) (PREMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOP) 4 — Barious Scraich B - Pealing
SERVICE | REPAIRS DONE DRIVER'S REMARKS
@ SERVICING O OTHERS:
Q TrBELT
O AIBCON SYSTEM ,53/ BCCIDENT: DATE f TIME of ACCIDENT:
8 TURSG 28| ] o7ge

O BRAKE SYSTEM

0O CLUTCH BYSTEM

O BuULB ——

0O UNDER CARAIAGE {P ; u
o ceF

0 BATTERY




 Réceipt Page 1 of 1

> Back to OneMotoring

! .:auuETa';m};}mr&\ua horiry

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

&ST Registration Mo, : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 27 Feb 2019/ 10:25:39
Receipt Date/Time : 27 Feb 2019/ 10:25:39
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt Mo, : ITMET-00000-190227-000731

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Iterm Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (5%) {5%) (S%)
Result of Insurance Enguiry - SMGBTE2R
As al 27 Feb 2019/07.40:00

Insurance Co: CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SMGEYEZR

Enguiry Fee 7.00 0.45 749
20180227 102423242112
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.48 7.48
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
redit Card:
wonooooono 0416 Ehal':ﬂastercard 745
Total T.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANEK YOU AMD HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / finaneial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

hitps://vrl Ita.gov.sg/ltalvrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION_ID=F1301001TT 27/2/2019



