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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 January 2021 2:31 PM

To: Pauline Tham; assignments

Subject: RE: yref : SJX9966) - DOA 22/2/2019 - Oref : SNM19D200965

Dear Pauline,

Apologise for the late reply.

Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already private settled.
No survey was done for this vehicle.

We will close this file at our end.

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 June 2020 4:29 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: yref : SJX9966J - DOA 22/2/2019 - Oref : SNM19D200965

Dear LKK

Please upload your report and let us have your bill soon.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

Thanks.

Pauline Tham
Senior Executive



Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6541 | F:(65)6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AEJfi Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please natify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



Celine Fong_(LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 4:50 PM
To: '‘Chong Boon Sen'; assignments

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: PRS Notice for SJX 9966)

Dear Boon Sen,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 2:19 PM

To: Jerone <jerone@chiaarul.com>

Cc: 'Weng Kit' <wengkit@chiaarul.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PRS Notice for SJX 9966

Without Prejudice
Save as to costs

Dear Sir,
We pri.
Dear LKK,
Pls pri.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sa.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sq.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :



This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Jerone [mailto:jerone@chiaarul.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 February, 2019 1:47 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Weng Kit' <wengkit@chiaarul.com>
Subject: RE: PRS Notice for SJX 9966

O/Ref: SJX 99664 (Jr)
Y/Ref: TBA

Dear Sir,
We thank you for your email below.

Kindly be informed that our client is not agreeable to your list of surveyors and we hereby propose the
following:

Name of Surveyor Company
Mr Dave Sincere Appraisal
S. Kumanan SK Auto Consultants

Please feel free to contact us should you have any queries thereof.
Yours faithfully,

Mr. Jerone Lee (Paralegal)

M/s Chia S Arul LLC

151 Chin Swee Road

#03-09 Manhattan House

Singapore 169876

Tel: (65) 6733 4647 Fax: (65) 6733 8183

This e-mail is from M/s Chia S Arul LLC, a firm of Advocates and Solicitors in Singapore, and is intended solely for the
named addressee. It contains confidential and /or legally privileged information. If the e-mail has reached you in error,
please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error. You may contact us at info@chiaarul.com. Internet
communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, arrive late or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the
context of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission.

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 February, 2019 1:17 PM

To: Jerone <jerone@chiaarul.com>

Cc: 'Weng Kit' <wengkit@chiaarul.com>

Subject: RE: PRS Notice for SJX 9966)

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair
survey as a single joint expert.

[ ADRIAN LING I




Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO

CHUA WELIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried
out by the sin

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sa.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute @ commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Jerone [mailto:jerone@chiaarul.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February, 2019 12:13 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee
<lucas.lee @sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay
<irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Weng Kit' <wengkit@chiaarul.com>

Subject: RE: PRS Notice for SIX 9966)

Importance: High

O/Ref: SJX 9966J (Jr)
Y/Ref: TBA

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter and our PRS Notice dated 25 February 2019.

We have failed to receive your acknowledgement and/or list of proposed surveyors to conduct the Pre-
Repair Survey.



In the event that we do not receive any favourable response from your good office by 2 p.m. today
(27/2/2019), our client shall instruct the workshop to proceed with the dismantling and/or repair works
without further reference to you.

Yours faithfully,

Mr. Jerone Lee (Paralegal)

M/s Chia S Arul LLC

151 Chin Swee Road

#03-09 Manhattan House

Singapore 169876

Tel: (65) 6733 4647 Fax: (65) 6733 8183

This e-mail is from M/s Chia S Arul LLC, a firm of Advocates and Solicitors in Singapore, and is intended solely for the
named addressee. It contains confidential and /or legally privileged information. If the e-mail has reached you in error,
please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error. You may contact us at info @chiaarul.com. Internet
communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, arrive late or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the
context of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission.

From: Jerone [mailto:jerone@chiaarul.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February, 2019 2:24 PM

To: 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Angie Foo' <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>;
'Lucas Lee' <lucas.lee @sg.cntaiping.com>; 'boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com' <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>;
'Irene Tay' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Weng Kit' <wengkit@chiaarul.com>

Subject: FW: PRS Notice for SIX 9966)

O/Ref: SJX 9966J (Jr)
Y/Ref: TBA

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter and our email below.

Kindly let us have your favourable response soonest possible.
Please feel free to contact us should you have any queries thereof.
Yours faithfully,

Mr. Jerone Lee (Paralegal)

M/s Chia S Arul LLC

151 Chin Swee Road

#03-09 Manhattan House

Singapore 169876

Tel: (65) 6733 4647 Fax: (65) 6733 8183

This e-mail is from M/s Chia S Arul LLC, a firm of Advocates and Solicitors in Singapore, and is intended solely for the
named addressee. It contains confidential and /or legally privileged information. If the e-mail has reached you in error,
please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error. You may contact us at info@chiaarul.com. Internet
communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, arrive late or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the
context of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission.

From: Jerone [mailto:jerone@chiaarul.com]
Sent: Monday, 25 February, 2019 12:19 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>



Cc: 'wengkit@chiaarul.com' <wengkit@chiaarul.com>
Subject: PRS Notice for SJX 9966

O/Ref: SJX 9966J (Jr)
Y/Ref: TBA

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly find enclosed herewith the PRS Notice for your attention.
Please feel free to contact us should you have any queries thereof.
Yours faithfully,

Mr. Jerone Lee (Paralegal)

M/s Chia S Arul LLC

151 Chin Swee Road

#03-09 Manhattan House

Singapore 169876

Tel: (65) 6733 4647 Fax: (65) 6733 8183

This e-mail is from M/s Chia S Arul LLC, a firm of Advocates and Solicitors in Singapore, and is intended solely for the
named addressee. It contains confidential and /or legally privileged information. If the e-mail has reached you in error,
please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error. You may contact us at info @chiaarul.com. Internet
communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, arrive late or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the
context of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission.
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