Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 10:02 AM

To: assignments

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Simon Ho (LKKAuto); Admin A; SUR

Subject: [AIG]: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018 *** LKK REF:
CS1/A1G19003650/d3

Attachments: RE: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018 *** LKK REF:
CS1/A1G19003650/d3

LKK Ref: CS1/AIG19003650/d3

10 DAYS NOTICE
Hi Nivitha / Summer,
Have we acknowledge previously? Please acknowledge and expedite.

Best Regards,

i

Olivia Lau | Admin Manager

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: olivialau@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)
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From: Lee, Ming-Yao [mailto:MingYao.Lee@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 8:56 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>; Simon Ho
(LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018 *** LKK REF: CS1/AIG19003650/d3

Hi Assignment Team,
TP has issued us 10 days notice. Please expedite the matter.

Thanks,

Lee Ming Yao

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1769
MingYao.Lee@AIG.com | www.aig.sg




100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: 13 March 2019 10:43

To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@I|kkauto.com>; Simon Ho
(LKKAuto) <SimonHo@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018 *** LKK REF: CS1/AIG19003650/d3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Ming Yao,
Thank you for your email.
By copy to assignment team.

Please expedite.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March, 2019 6:44 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018

Hi Mei Kwan,
Please do update us if Rl report is ready.

Regards,

Lee Ming Yao

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd



AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1769
MingYao.Lee@AIG.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@|kkauto.com]

Sent: 20 February 2019 13:09

To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.
By copy to assignment team.

FYNA please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao

Sent: Wed, 20 Feb 2019 04:02:05 +0000

To: 'SUR', Admin A

Ce:

Subject: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018
Hi Team,

Subject matter refers.

Please refer to attached email from TP Lawyer with RI details. Please arrange for re-inspection on third party vehicle.

Also attached survey docs for your kind reference.



Appreciate if you could acknowledge receipt of this email and to liaise with third party directly for the arrangement.
Regards,

George Lee

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1769

Ming-Yao.Lee@aig.com | www.aig.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: florencekohef @yahoo.com.sg

To: MingYao.L.ee@aig.com

Subject: Our Ref : 8115249380SG-003 | Your Ref : CKK/ck/ACC/10426/18 | Accident Involving SKX2530S &
GBC2446U on 24/11/2018

Date: Tue, 19 Feb 2019 08:57:51 +0000

Dear George

We refer to your email dated 18th February 2019.

Kindly arrange for your surveyor to reinspect our client's vehicle on the following date and time:-
Date: 28th February 2019 (Thursday)

Time: 1.00pm

Place: Ann Joo Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #02-17 Sin Ming Autocare S575721
Kindly confirm the reinspection date and time urgently.
Regards

Florence

K K CHENG & CO

Tel: 6227 1272

Fax: 6227 5563

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 20 February, 2019 12:02 PM




To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: - Request for Re-inspection for TPV GBC2446U DOA 24/11/2018

AlG ) <Y

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

Este es un mensaje cifrado y seguro. Para leerlo, abra el archivo
adjunto.

Esta é uma mensagem criptografada segura. Para |é-lo, abra o
anexo.

Ceci est une sécurité, un message crypté. Pour le lire, ouvrez la
piece jointe.

NIEESEEIN-BEFA—ILTY, BEICEFETI7MI1L
ZRWVWTLESLY,

Click here by 2019-02-26 22:02 CST to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



