Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 12:00 PM

To: lionel.tan@fwd.com; assignments

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Pre-repair inspection! Accident involving JND6815 & SKM8966L on 16/02/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com [mailto:lionel.tan@fwd.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 10:17 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: AsherSng@lkkauto.com

Subject: FW: Pre-repair inspection! Accident involving JND6815 & SKM8966L on 16/02/2019

Hi

Please arrange survey & explore direct settlement with workshop.

Regards,
Lionel

From: Aunteng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, February 26, 2019 10:05 AM

To: Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Subject: Re: Pre-repair inspection! Accident involving JIND6815 & SKM8966L on 16/02/2019

Dear Lionel
Refer to your email on the even date.

We would select LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the pre-survey on our client's vehicle.
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Regards

Aun Teng

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com <lionel.tan@fwd.com>

Sent: 26 February 2019 09:51:43

To: Aunteng

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: Pre-repair inspection! Accident involving JND6815 & SKM8966L on 16/02/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please select one of our surveyors as follows: -

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE

AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD
APPRAISALS ASSOCIATES PTE LTD
VICOM LTD

SNk

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we would proceed to appoint a surveyor to conduct a pre repair survey &
post repair inspection within the timeline stipulated under the NIMA protocol.

We look forward to your reply.
Thank you.

Lionel

From: Aunteng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February, 2019 8:37 AM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Subject: Pre-repair inspection! Accident involving JND6815 & SKM8966L on 16/02/2019

Dear Officer-in-charge

Refer to the above matter.

Attached our client's Police Report for you to create a third party file.
Your insured's vehicle is SKM8966L.

A copy of estimate will be ready and made available to surveyor on site inspection at our workshop. Please
indicate whether you are sending your surveyor to our workshop.
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In the meantime, please forward us a list of surveyors of your choice of our selection.

Regards

Aun Teng

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
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