Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 10:32 AM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLU3318 & SLE372H DOA 23.02.2019
Tracking: Recipient Delivery

chan pick yuen

Admin A

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) Delivered: 31/5/2019 10:32 AM
Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 31/5/2019 10:32 AM
olivialau@Ikkauto.com Delivered: 31/5/2019 10:32 AM
shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 31/5/2019 10:32 AM

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

Claimed Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $13,910.00
2. Loss of Rental (15days x $160.00) $ 2,400.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee S 7.45
Total $ 16,317.45

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, May 10, 2019 10:57 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SLU3318 & SLE372H DOA 23.02.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Your refer : SLE372H -AlG

Enclosed is our client's GIA report , invoice , rental bill with agreement, LTA search invoice, video camera .
As request following :

1. RC $13,910.00( $13000 + 7% GST -as agreed )

2. LOR S$3200 ( $200 - Mercedes 350 -luxury car X 16 -12 Days recommend + 2 days waiting PRS - accident
date on 23.02.2019 ( Saturday ), survey only can do on 25.02.2019 ( Monday ) + 2 days weekend /
total 16 days .

3. LTAfee $7.45

@ 100 % ( direct from behind with video camera )
Total $ 17117.45 /-.

Please let us have your offer & reply in next 14 days . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
SM SPRAY PAINTING
HP:92712214



