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10 Anson Road #33-17 International Plaza Singa
GST Registration No: 53078555A Email: paul@soon
Quotation No. SB-GA-TCC18037

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

LEK Auto Consuitants hence nofify
frewrer of iha lollowing:
betTred At S50y PRy

» g ITUSCee CArY 4| DU FESUrYey
Hm%'m to confismation

Thirtd paarty SUriey in on s Wi Prajudoe”
* No .z-;.u%éhﬁﬁfﬁm
« Suppiementary iemis) mus! Do resurveyed gr
& jutgect 1= nd spproval rom imuerance Co,
T

& Shenton Way Cirie (K| b HL. j:’ "y /
#24.01 AXA Tower AR (A : J - Ackhowledged by Fecaire
Singapore 068811 F127 ¥11 PP Sy
Dute:
Dear Sir/Mdm, n}‘jj
f re__ ﬂ:,. 4 A
Estimated Cost of Repair Job for: : [ sG1053D

Accident on 16/02/2018, along ORCHARD RD 08037 - DPP MANDARIN ORCHARD invalving SG1053D and

SMF5362L
We are pleased to submit the below estimated gquotation for your consideration.
1) [Vehicie No : SG10530
Modsa| MERCEDES-BENZ CITARO O530-6.4 L AT TURBO ABS (A)
2) Natt Unit ]
Price: Sub Total:
List tem: Qty (S8) (S5)
Gﬁmdnﬁﬂnlplulpanﬂlf r{ 1 $75B 28 §7s829
Off side front blinker lamp - ' 1 $129.30 $125.30 ~
Off side front comer bumper - vl i’ 1 $132770| $1327.70/
Off side windscreen cover right « 1 $341.00 $341.00 -
Sealant and double side tape JL ¢ . 1 $380.00 $380.00 4
Paint Material (Green/ White/ Grey/ thinner/ lacguer) .~ /¢ 1 1 $480.00 $480.00
Parts Total Sum: $3,456.29
Labour :hargu to remove and replace off side front glass panel
Labour charges to remove and and raplace windscrean cover nght .
Labour charges to remove and replace off side front comer bumper and repair off side | $240000| /("
front comer bumper brackst holdar
Labeur charges to remove and replace off side blinker lamp .
Labour charges o check and recitfy wiring $i5000 | 9
Labour charges 1o re-spray and polishing affected area I $1.800.00 J*? =
Labour Total Sum: £4,150.00
Parts and Labour Total Cost: $7.606.29 —
GST (T%) : §532.44 fJ
Total ; $8,138.73
Repair Duration: &  Working Day

Regards,

\.

»

Appointed Sunruynf confirmation & agreed:

'ir*-'r ?'1
©172 ¥iI73 )
) S

Surveyor Name:

Surveyor Contact:

1st Signature /Date

2nd Signature / Date

3rd Signature / Date:

Pagelofl



21268/2018 Claim Ponal

«  Service Request Details

SYMOIETI

ko

None "

Februsry 16, 2019

Feb 26, 2019 10:40:00 AM

February 2& 2019

e

March 5 2019

LKEE AUTO CONSLLTANTS PTE LTD [TP]
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Pending verfication - Direct Settlemarit

Artions

Agrer (g perfonm corvice

Vehicle Information

SGI05I0D

TPVD MERCEDES BENZ

CITARD 0530 6.4L AT TURBOD
hitps:/fvp.smartciams ma com sy claim-partalhtmifindex-vendor-service-requasts htmif/service-requestsTserviceRequasiNumber=100835 13



2262010 Claim Ponal

Primary Contact/Insured
MS CARZ LEASING FTE LTD
255 LAVENDER STREET. 338791, Singapore

985200527
HAN@MSCARZLEASING.COM,5G

Claim Handler

LOH Cynthia

A548804842
cynihianniEaxn. com.ag
o Y 1] mvDioe= History o e Assoummierii Metrics Mates
Daciitnént Typo Document SubType
* L)
|
[ v |
NAME B Accident Statement
TYPE Reports & Statement
SUB-TYPE
ALTHOR Merimen
DATE UPLOADED
MAME B EMAIL TP PRI msg
TYPE Letters and Carrespondence
SUB-TYPFE Waorkshop
AUTHOR VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar
DATE UPLOADED February 26, 201%
MAME B GlA SG10530 TPPOF
TYPE Reports & Statement

hitps:ivp smanciims.axa com.sg/clalm-portal/htmifindex-vendor-service-raguests himl# service-requeste/?serviceRequestiumber=100835

23



226208 Claim Poral

DATE UPLOADED February 26, 2019

https:ivp.smarncisms.axa. com. g caim-poralhimifindex-vandor-sarvice-requasts himig/ sarvice-requestaTsenviceRequestNumber= 100835 ¥a



Ni\rﬁha !LI{I{ Autu!

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.coms>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 11:49 AM

To: assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: Motor Claim Dept - Accident Claim against SMF5362L
Attachments: LOA 5G1053D (Signed) pdf

|.5&1ﬂ"@f“‘£
s*s*SMARTCLAIM NEW CASE**** s rd)

W
SPOKEN WITH PAUL -ARRANGE 27/02/2019 @10AM-12PM ***AT 2 LOYANG WAY gL 6" 2312114

Except Kalvin

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| in

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 31, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Paul <Paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 7:43 AM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA 5GP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: Motor Claim Dept - Accident Claim against SMF5362L

Attention: Motor Claim Control Dept,

We are putting up & claim against your vehicle no: SMF5362L

We are acting on our client behalf, Go Ahead Singapore Pie Ltd, with respect of the accident claim on the repair costs for their
vehicle no. 3G10530 that was damaged due to the accident occurred on (Date:) 16/02/2018 at (Time:) 04:45 pm at (location |

ORCHARD RD 09037 - OPP MANDARIN ORCHARD involving your vehicle no. SMF5362L forthwith,

Attached is the letter of authorisation from our client.

We will like to inform that the vehicle is available for the Pre Repair Inspection (PRI} in the premises al Loyang depol (Address: 2
Loyang Way Singapare 5087 76)

Kindly expedita on the arrangement for the surveyor 1o proceed on PRI with us
Do feel free to call us on the number below if you need any further clarification

Thank you

Best Regards,
Paul Yew
+b65 9003 6715



2072018 PARFICOE Robate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
‘Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 1700C
Vehicle Details
Vehicle Na.: 5G1053D
Vehicle to be Exported; Ne
Intended Deregistration Date: 27Feb2019
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model: CITARO D530 6.4L AT TURBO ABS
Primary Colour: Multi-Colour
Manufacturing Year; 2015
Engine No; 02926C1105044
Chassis No.: WEB&2808323130307
Maximum Power Qutput; -
Open Market Value: $287 44500
Criginal Registration Date: 11 Mar 2014
First Registration Date: 11 Mar 2016
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $0.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Rebate Amount: $0.00
Total Rebate Amount: §0.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 27 Feb 2019

OK

PUTEEIS 1 i v s o 1 0 bl Y Pl 0 P WA | PP e LS P R Wl B R Ward



ANNEXURE

Part 1 - Particulars of loss and expanse

Cost of repair (With GST) $6.747.73
Loss of Use @ 04 days (S$275 per day) £1.100.00
Survey Report $0.00
GIA Report/LTA search E7 45
Loss of Use for PRS (1 days x S§275 per day) £275.00
TOTAL $ 8,130.18




Ti2412019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} = Menu

<« Re:TP MANDATE IA-S9MO1E7I

Type
© Question

Message
APPROVE

Heply

htqu:m.mmm“.mwmmmmmmmumhwmmmmmwmu.. 1



- . Consumanis
s BRA B P Ly

31 UBIAVE L, #01-25 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : 1065) 62563560 FAX £ (005) 62564315

|5 AFR 2019

MS CARZ LEASING PTE LTD
255 LAVENDER STREET
SINGAPORE 338791

Dear Sir/f Mdm

OUR REF 1 CCHASMIDNISTY EgbS

YOUR REF : SMF 5362L

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 53611 AND SG 1053D ALONG/AT ORCHARD ROAD ON
16/0272019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party claim against your policy,

We have received a claim from SOON BEE VEHICLE & BODYWORK MAINTENANCE acting
on behalf of the owner of SG 1053D against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in our
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim
against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the
rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek
to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at vour own cost and defence, please
reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us
and acknowledged by us,

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following 1o

cecilinchong@lkkauto.com within 10 davs from the date of this letter_if_not provided at our
reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status
(if any)

Driver's driving license ot foreign driving license (if any)

Driver's Work Permit

Employment Letter/ Authorisation letter from your company

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and’or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you
are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim



To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of
the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without
AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because
of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you
informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the maner(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6749 4274 or email us at
cecilinchong@Ilkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours :im:-ereiy
\.\ \.‘._ |
Ny

Case Handler

DID: 6740 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: cecilinchong@lkkauto.com

Ce AXA Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)




. Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June, 2019 11:52 AM

To: contact@mscarzleasing.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 53621 & SG 10530 ALONG ORCHARD RD ON
16/02/2019

Dear Sir,

OURREF  : SOMOIETI
YOUR REF : CC4/ASMI19003579/Ewb3

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 5362L & SG 1053D ALONG ORCHARD RD ON 16/02/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a third party claim(s) from SOON BEE VEHICLE & BODYWORK MAINTENANCE acting on
behalf of the owner of SG 1053D against your motor insurance policy.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.
We also wish to inform you that Section 11 of the Motor Insurance Policy is attached, and capped, with an excess of
$1.500.00 for third party claim settlements.

As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 davs from the date
of this letter. You intent must be formally expressed 1o AXA and acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following 10
Vivianlau@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The list
below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Copy of the letter of authorization

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Partv(s), vou are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

To protect your interesi(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If
you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident, please
forward it to us immediately. You may email it to esti@axa.com.sg or deliver it by hand to AXA Customer Care Centre,

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), we shall keep vou informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).



If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6841 8625 or Vivianlau@|kkauto.com. Please quote
_ our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Soon Bee Vehicle & Bodywork Maintenance

10 Anson Road #33-17 International Plaza Singapore 079803
Tel: 90036715 Email: Paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg

Our Ref: SBV-GAS/2019/5G1053D
Your Ref: SMF53862L

Date: 16/07/2018

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
8 Shenton Way
#24-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Afin: Motor Claim Control DepL
(Vehicle Mo, SMF 5362 L)

Dear Sirf Madam

Accident on 16/02/2019, along / at ORCHARD RD 08037 - OPP MANDARIN ORCHARD involving SG10530 and
SMF5382L

We ars acting on aur client behall. Go Ahead a-oﬂﬂ.ﬂﬁ Pue Ltd, the owner of the above said motor vahicle no
S5G 1053 D

We are instructed to claim damages agsins! youlyour dnver'your insured in connection with the above-captioned
accident imvolving our cliant wehicle regisiration number $G 10563 D and vehicle registration number SMF 5362 L
drivan by youlyour drivecyour insuned al the materlal time

We are instrucied that the accident was caused by youlyour driver's/your insured’s negligent driving and/or
management of motor-vehicle SMF 8362 L As a result, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client has been put
1o loss and expense. particulars of which are as stated in Part 1 of the annexure

We have on 28 February 2019 notified you of the accdent and a pre-repair survey of our client's vehicle was camed
out an 27 February 2018, Our client's claim for cost of repairs is based on the amount negotiated and agreed with
your surveyor, Steve Chen whom you have appointediagreed after the pre-repair survey was complatad

¥We herefore propose the claim as follow Part 1 of the annexure

Flease lat us have your reply the soonast

Thank you

+65 8003 6715



AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Yishite No: Insd weh] |

(TP veh) | Madel: (WERLEVES GenNg
Mate of Accident) Time: IE|%1 ‘Hﬁm

L0

Hepal Estimale

2. %1

Final Repair Cost

Loss of Uss

Rervtal (i anvy)

LTA / BA Search Fee

Othery:

““'ﬁlﬁ“v\%

ﬂﬂl Settiement Sum

Payoe Name : mmvwm:wmmte.nmu,
I Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? | ] YES

8.,000.00

[X1 NO (Kindly mdware balow)

a) For Non GIA Registerod Workshop: Agreed Uablity 100 )
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: POLA Applicabile’ Yool No  BOLA Scenarlo No:
BOLA, Linbilizy: il Assaased Liabdlity (*)__ 1%}
" Assessed Linbility fo be filled anly fov chain colisipns and for coses wheee B00A does not apply
[“l" marks
NOTE:

1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERVE YOUR CLIENT'S RIGHTS IF 50 REQUIRED IN THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT,

1. THIS SETTLEMENT IS ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF
LIABILITY DN AXA AND THEIR CLENT/TORTFEASOR IN ANY MANNER WHATSDEVER.

3. AXARESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERMS & CONDITIONS AS WELL AS THEIR RIGHTS IN LAW.

Qnly applicable to rental clam - All document are to be submitted with this settlement confumation. In the event, rental
agresmant [ invoices sre not received within 7 deys of this signed confirmation. we will sutomatically revert ta los of uge claim

per the NIMA rates.

We/l confirmed that this is a full and final settiement that we and or our client have/Mad/Mas agalnst you (AXa and Lheir
poficyheider/autharised driver ftorifeasor) for any and all losses [past/oresent/Tuture) arising from this accident.

wWe confipmed that we have the autharity ﬂw_ﬁ’qgwmin! and on their behalf in this aecident

A g

el iu'f

(hors. logs L

Lgnatura nl'w‘uhnpm m!w;ﬁﬁnp
mnim
Date: | & E/,.-'

Gt K
s.nlmrlnul.u

Mame of AXA'S surveyo
Date

ANA Inmurance Pte Lid (Company Reg. No 19990381200
& Shanton Way w24-01 AKA Towaer Singapore DSBE11

ARA Custorner Centre 801-20/72

Talmphona: «E8 680 4R - aup.Com ug

days at § per day
days at § por day

Signature of Witness FVorkshop stamp (il ipplnhll]

Hame of Witness Lh Lﬂfv‘
e 03-p¢ +;:f,’



Soon Bee Vehicle & Bodywork Maintenance
10 Anson Road #33-17 Intemational Plaza Singapore 078803 Company Registration No: 530765554

Tel: 8003 6715, Email: paul@soonbae-vbm.com.sg

GST Registration No: 530765554

TAX INVOICE Tax Invoice No: TCC18037
6{' m Tax Invoice Date:  16-Jul-18
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
B Shenton Way
#24-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 068811
No Description Cost Amount
(8%) I5%)
01. |Completed Accident Repair Of Bus No: SG1083D $5,308.29 §86,308.28
Accident on 16022018, along ORCHARD RD 09037 - OPP MANDARIN
ORCHARD involving SG 10530 and SMF5362L
Ta supply spara part and repair for the above mentioned accident
T% GST: §441.44
All cheques should be crossed and made payable to:
Soon Bee Vehicle & Bodywork Maintenance
GRAND TOTAL : $6,747.73
AMOUNT DUE : $6.747.73

COMPANY STAMP & AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE




Land Transport Authority
Land Transport Autharity

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. - M4-0006526-2

Receipl No. : ITNET-D0000-180225-004 108
Previous Receaipt No

8/N Item Description/
ﬂ Transaction Reference
0.
Aesull of Insurance Engquiry - SMF5362L
As at 16 Feb 20168/16:45.00
Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SMFE3E2L
Enquiry Fea
201802252154004B84608

Print Data/Time 25 Feb 2019/ 2158500
Ascalpt Data/Times - 25 Feb 2018/ 21:54.59
Tax Involca/Receipt
Amount GST Amount
T7.00 0.49 7489
Sub-Total 7.00 0.48 7489
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.48 7.48
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By

Credit Card: Visa
WOOOONOoO0NC1 TR2 ‘MasterCard 745
Total T.45
Cash Changa 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Relundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure thal all payments to the Authority are good and promplly settied by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



y L7y LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L . B -! 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX- 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 198607188R GST Reg MNo. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Fedoratlon Internationale Das Exparts En Automoblle

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CC4/ASM180035T9/Ewb3g2
A TOWERINGARORE G i |11
ATTN:CYNTHIA LOH Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SMF 53621 Veh. Inspected SG 10530
Policy No. CND22452 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SSMO1ETI Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 26/02/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ CITARD c.c 6400
0530
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. WEBG2808323130307 Colour GREEN
Odometer 202553 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |275/70 R22.5 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |275/70 R22.5 CONTINENTAL . 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |275/70R225 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |275/T0R22.5 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT /S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/02/2018 I Inspection Date 2710212018
Survey held at 2 LOYANG WAY
Repairer SOO0N BEE VEHICLE & BODYWORK MAINTENANCE
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




1 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bds BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 1806807198R GST Reg No. 18-8607188-R Page No.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SG 1053D

' Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =Stma GE%’} “J]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|OFF SIDE FRONT GLASS PANEL (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 798.29 768.29
1|OFF SIDE FRONT BLINKER LAMP (CONSISTENT) cuT 1290.20 129.30
1|OFF SIDE FRONT CORNER BUMPER (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 1,327.70 1.327.70
1|OFF SIDE WINDSCREEN COVER RIGHT (CONSISTENT) |BROKEN 341,00 341,00
1|SEALANT AND DOUBLE SIDE TAPE (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 380,00 380,00
1|PAINT MATERIAL NECESSARY 480.00 480.00
(GREENMHITE/GREY/THINNER/LACQUER)
(CONSISTENT)
345629 3.456.28
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE AND REPLACE OFF 2.400.00 1,600.00

SIDE FRONT GLASS PANEL.LABOUR CHARGES TO
REMOVE AND REPLACE WINDSCREEN COVER
RIGHT.LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE AND REPLACE
OFF SIDE FRONT CORNER BUMPER AND REPAIR OFF
SIDE FRONT CORNER BUMPER BRACKET
HOLDER.LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE AND REFPLACE

OFF SIDE BLINKER LAMP
LABOUR CHARGES TO CHECK AND RECITFY WIRING 150.00 50.00
LABOUR CHARGES TO RE-SPRAY AND POLISHING 1.600.00 1.200.00
AFFECTED AREA.

4 150.00 2.850.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.606.29 6,306.28
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | T e.306.29]

Report Ref Mo. CC4/ASM1900357%Ewb3q2

CHEN TSUE YEE HO LEONG CHUAN

Automolive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIANELITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Mopori s mods saiuky for v use and Banefit of the Clieni named on tha frant page of ihis Repart
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