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From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 26 February 201 9 1 1:1 0 AM

'Joel Goh'; SUR

RE: PREVAILING MARKETVALUE FOR FBNl9A (DM 19HO00272-J G) DOA 13/01/2019

Dear Joel,

The market value of FBN 19A is $25K (Estimated) as at Jan2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 I email ;sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue I, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 9:02 AM

To:'Joel Goh' <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

subject: FW: PREVAILING MARKETVALUE FOR FBN19A (DM19HOOO272-J Gl DOA:13lOL/?079

Dear Joel,.

Thank you for the email.

Dea r Veron,

Kind ly assist

c.Nivitha Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assimments@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-43r5

Blk s1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2 25 I S(4o8933)

From: Joel Goh Imailto:ioel.goh @eqinsu rance com.sgl

Sent: Tuesday,26 February 2019 8:57 AM

To: claims(aa iaxinspection.com; elgene(arta.com.sg; aasschee@sinFnet.com.sq; iimmv.lee @ prioritvservices.sq;

mi@a'rspl.com.se; Survev@ ipkniehts.com; admin <ad min (dlbs-a uto.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com; edward cho



<edwardchowl(avahoo.com>; lnformation aapl <info@aa plpro.com>; KAAS <kelvinteo(akaas.com'sg> <' .
Subfect: RE: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR FBN19A (DM19HO00272-JG) DOAt L3/OI/2O79

Dear All

Apotogies, the attachment in the previous email was corrupted.

I have reattached in this email.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive I Claims

at

eonsuronce
Tr l4-,- q:t-. i.4^&

EQ lnsurance CompanY Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6500 6772 I tel 65 6223 9433 ext772 1 fax 65 6223 4190

www.eqinsurance.com.sg

,[ o t'rn-u.. ot ci,yrr.,.

privileged/Confidential informotion moy be contoined in this messoge. lf you ore not the intended recipient, pleose notit'y the sr

Froml Joel Goh

Sent: Monday, February 25, 2019 5:36 PM

To:'claims@ijaxinspection.com';'elgene@fta,com.sg';'aasschee@singnet,com.sg'i'jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg';
'mt6aispl.com.sg,; 'iurvey@jpknighG.com'; 'admin'; iassignments@lkkauto.com'; 'edward cho'; 'Information aapl'; '11445'

Subject: PREVAIUNG MARKET VALUE FOR FBN19A (DM 19H000272-JG) DOA: 13/01/2019

Dear all,

Please advise the prevailing market value of FBN19A as at I3/O\/2OL9 asap'

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive I Claims

"eqnsuronce
t t'|-l- 6i*-, 1;ad'

EQ lnsurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17 00 Tower Blocl( MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6500 6772 I tel 65 6223 9433 ext772 1fax65 6223 4190

www.eqinsurance.com.sg



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Backto OneMotoring

Pase 1 of 1

F.n,q,ttifePA,Bl.l,cgERebateforResisteredVehicle nnvl $ )5,L
VehicleOwner Particulars
Owrrcr lDType: singapore NRIC

ownerlD: 3292G
Vehicle Details
VehicleNo.: FBN19A

Vehicle to be Exported:

. lntenqed Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make:

26 Feh2019

TRIUMPH

Vehicle Model:

PflmaryLolour:

STREETTRIPLE RS

M e nufactu ring Year:

EngineNo.:

Chassis No.:

. Maximum Power Output:

. Open MarketValue:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

$10,ss3.0o

5MTHDA464ZK905396

27 Jun2OIE

27 )un2078

TransferCount:

ActualARF Paid:
lh+en.l.rl PAPF PFh.i,

0

$3,SO3.OO

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Elieibility:

PARF ElieibiliW Expiry Datel

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
20 )un2028

D- Motorcycle

$7,001.00

$6,524.00

$6,524.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Feh2079

OK

https://vrl.lta. gov. s!llalwUaction/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_ID=F030... 26-Feb-19


