Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 %:49 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAUtO); Admin A

Cce: Chee So Chow: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: China Ref: SNM19D201104/C02/3/ock Your Ref: TBA -
Accident involving GBB8663A & SLME103L on 18.02.2019 along PIE before Balestier
exiit

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Asher

Proceed to offer Loss of USE at $60.00 x 9.5 days.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh .cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: XF¥i i Taiping SG

Disclaimer- This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the inten ded
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

sent: Tuesday, 17 December, 2019 9:30 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQU EST] RE: China Ref: SNM 19D201104/C02/3/ock Your Ref: TBA - Accident involving
GBB8663A & SLMA103L on 18.02.2019 along PIE before Balestier exiit

Hi Alfred,

We refer to the email below.

Third party disagreed with our offer and counter propose Loss of Rental {9.5 days x $75) 5712.50.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.



Thank You.

st Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
phone: 6841-4051 | emai: gshersng@lkkaute.com | fox &741-4108
Blk 51 Pava Ubi Indusirial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 S{408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 2:48 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauta.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: China Ref: SNM19D201104/C02/3/ock Your Ref: TBA - Accident involving
GBB8663A & SLM6103L on 18.02.2019 along PIE before Balestier exiit

Your Ref: Please advise
Our Ref: SNM1SD201104C02/ock/at

Dear Asher
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 53,964.55.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh .cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AF i Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it (s intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December, 2019 2:12 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 5o Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.coms>




Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQU EST] RE: China Ref: SNM19D201104/C02/3/ock Your Ref: TBA - Accident involving
GBB8663A & SLM6E103L on 18.02.2019 along PIE before Balestier exiit

Hi Sir,

We refer to our email dated 10/10/2015.

Third party is chasing for settlement.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any.

Thank You.

Best Regords

Asher Sng | Case Hondler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-4051 | emall: gshersng @lkkauto.com fax: 474 1-4 108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5 [408%33)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 3:21 FM
To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: China Ref: SNM190201104/C02/3/ock Your Ref: TBA - Accident involving
GBBS663A & SLM6103L on 18.02.2019 along PIE before Balestier exiit

Hi Sir,

We refer to our email dated 10/10/2019.

Third party is chasing for settlement.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any.



Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Auto Consultonts Ple Lid

phone: 4841-4051 | emai: ashesng@kkayto com | fox af41-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ui Incustriol Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[40B%33)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2019 2:44 PM

To: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: alfred.tohi@sg.cntaiping.com; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: China Ref: SNM 180201104/C02/3/ock Your Ref: TBA - Accident involving GRBBEEGE3A
& SLM6103L on 18.02.2019 along PIE before Balestier exiit

Your ref : SNM190201104/C02/3/ock

Dear 5Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 s
applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured’s favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at 53,964.59 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) 5 10,600.83 5 3,562.59
2. Loss of Use (10days x 580) 5 B00.00 S 400.00 (8days x 550)
3. LTA 5earch Fee 5 2.00 s 2.00
Total $11,402.83 % 3,964.59

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handlss

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 48414051 | email gihesng@kkauio.com | fox: &£741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ul Industial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S408733)



From: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Friday, 2 August 2019 4:04 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <hsherSng@lkkauto.com=

Subject: China Ref: SNM19D201104/C02/3/ock Your Ref: TBA - Accident involving GBBBGE63A & SLMB103L on
18.02.2019 along PIE before Balestier exiit

Dear Asher,
We refer to our conversation earlier on,
Please find attached LOD from Comfortdelgro & our insured’s GIA report.

Thank you.

Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 0799089
DID: (65) 6389 6174 | F: (65) 6224 7174 /6224 7478

W: www.sa.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K PWREE Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is infended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unautharized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intendad recipien!, plaase nofify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp:/www symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www svmanteccloud.com




[WITHOUT PREJUDICE and Save As To Costs

cknowledge receiving this letter of
PP?ISJ?&EIIIJHL}EMSDEIEJ‘DS-EL e i ndoe T )
28/05/2019 demand

W/s China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd o1 KRN ' ig ST Y
3 Bason Road §16-00 Jd U WAl £ ComfonDelGro Enginering
Springleaf Tower pore) Pte Lid

lChinn Taiping Insurance {Singq

Sinqaptrr& (79904 ST RN G e ering Pio Lid

Bttn: Moter Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE Corporate Office

205 Braddes Road Singapuse 579701

Idainkoe +65 BIART G280

Dear Sirs Facsimile +65 6280 975

: r, - Tty gt Hoo | Soo04my

ACCIDENT ON 18/02/2019 INVOLVING SLM6103L & GBBBGEIA SWIH '!qD 20[ 1 ‘Jq Car Cars Conlios
P.LCIHE FIE | Ill'il.-l

5 Braddad 3

SN ¥

We are the authorised repair workshop for the owner of vehicle, 5LM6103L, which was involved Tel G353 B1H

in the captioned accident with your insured's vehicle. The vehicle owner has requested and S e e

authorised us to assist him/her in presenting his claim against the party responsible for Siegapore 504559

the damage to the vehicle. LTl 5

Pamdan
(351

Bs the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured, GBB8GG3A, we are submitting
these claims for your consideration on behalf of the onner/driver/claimant.

1, Cost of Repairs 3,562.59 e A
2. Car Rental o Sin King
3, 10,0 days Loss of Use @ $80 800.00 383 Sin Ming Dive
b S e :
5. LIA Fee b Sunyged Kadul
6. TP/GIA Fee 2.00 7 Sungei Kadut Way
7. Wedical - ‘E--l|-!.I'IF_TE?:.:_EI::J:E:J:
B. Others = Wyl
T —— G20 Ui Road 3
(e60E)  4,364.59 gy
wirew SPARNcarcase. com
We enclose the following documents o support the claims: -
[ (fl' Repair/Excess Bill L~ Insurance Certificate
[ | Sueveyor Report [~ Power of Attorney
| 1 Coloured Photographs [ ] Car Rental Bill
|# | GIA/Police Report(s) { ] Medical Bill
L7} GIR/TP Search [ ] Witness Statement
| | Others:

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our client's claim
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without
prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/driver/claimant.

Yours faithfully

Cecilia Lee

COGE Claims Department

59 Loyang Drive ${508969)

DID; 6214 B354  EAX: 6214 1843 Email: cecilialeefsparkcarcare.con ", o MAY 2019

A member of Q | womna

D | oo,
COMFORIDELCRO iy |“'“m':=- |



U U Auto

- W W Consuttants
Bedid BA B Pa lid

51 UBREAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA U INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563361 FAN : 1065 H2564315

Our Ref: CCH/CTI19003476/Kpb3
15 MAY 2019

NTH CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
13 KAKI BUKIT RD 4

#03-13

BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE
SINGAPORE 417807

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB8663A AND SLM6103L ON 18/02/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

KHANCHNA

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: khanchna@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

A miernbar of CONFORT
L

POWER OF A‘?Tgnngg

ACCIDENT, INVOLVING (Owner's Venicie No.) 4 l__J_“f_f;?mi (Third Party'sVehicle No.)
a5 0011 on _f.g:'g‘._,}/{:_f% along _ )L fTA [FF "}'/'—ﬁ?; Tl
X !IE -’r}‘.l F\'._-l“ll.'ﬂl-f.-‘l 1| r".__.‘_"n e :_\_:_
AR S S— : g "
Policy Nos.____ T "
e - A 3 K_;r;."".;, i -j{f';
BY THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY, “I/\We, O Rl . 4 . __ *NRIC/Passpori

M. _ [Address)t

_acompany

incorporate in Singapore and having its regisiered office al (Address)” T = T
P i —_ owner af Vehicle Ragislerad ‘\iu:}_S_lm L){_Ug L

hereby irrevocably appoint ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd {CDGE). a

company incorporated in Singapore and having its registered office a1

its agents or any person authorized by CDGE to be "myfour Allomey and in “myfour name(s) and on “mylour behalf

to do all or any of the following:
1. To submit, resolve and make any claim(s) (including the commencement of legal proceedings) which “bwe may
have against the other *party/parties to the Accident and under the insurance “policy/policies taken up by such
*party/parties or altematively under Insurance Policy Mo. __taken up by "*mefus in respect
of the cost of repairs, loss of use and at all other costs and expenses, elc. suffered by "melfus ansing from the
Accident {loss and damage).

2 Forthe purpose of such daimis) as aforesaid, to appaoint sclcitcrs on “myiaur behalf a5 * myfaur Attomey shall in bis absolute
discretion, deem fit,

3. To collect payment{s) due in raspect of any such claim{s} for the loss and damage, such payment lo ba mace

by way of chegue in favor of ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid , CDGE and to give a valid receipt and discharge
tharafor.

4. For any of the purposes aforesaid. to execute, sign, seal and deliver all documents whatsoever in relation thereto.
2. Generally do all such acts as it shall deem nacessary for the purpose of settling such claim(s) and

6. To agree to any settlement at the absolute discretion of CDGE.

*IWe heraby daclare that all acts, instrumente and documents done by wirtue of this Power of Atlorney on “rmylour
behalf by the Attorney, its agents or any person authorized by COGE in that behalf shall be as good valid and effectual
to all intents and ﬂ;rpuses whaisoever as if the same had been done or exaculed by *mefus in ‘myfour own proper

person(s) and *IfWe hereby ratify and confirm, all acis, instruments and documents done or executed by virlue of
the authority and powers hereby conferred.

"liWe hereby further declare that the powers and authority hereby conferred shall remain irrevocable.

*IiWe further confirm thal the acceptance by CDGE of lhe setllement amount in respect of such constitute the full discharge
of mylour ciaim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

*IN WITMESS WHEREOF. *I/We have hereunto to set *mylour hand and seal this day- ‘} ’1/_ of the month of

—DW - eeTee Thomang 20k T)

Signed, Sealed & Deliverad By-

e s,
e ———— —— *_ —s ;
Customers Name: " J
NRIC No.: - ¥
Cao's rubber Stamp i

delete as appropriate.  Insurance



Policy HNo DMCYSNIA33071803 Claim Wo @ SHML9D201104/c02/3/ock
claimant - LCRE BTE LID

Amount + 554,100.00
CoLLARS FOUR THOUSAND AND OQNE HUNDRED ONLY.

I/We agree Lo accept the above ment igned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final =ettlement of all claims, cests & disbursements for injuries [ damages
sustained by me/fus through an accident invalving

claimant Vehicle Mo, : SLM 6103L
tnsured Vehicle We. ¢ GBE BG663A
Date of Loss : 1Bf02/2019
Place of Accldent . PIE (TOA PAYOH TOWARDS JURDHG) LANE 2

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made TO me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD., I/We agree abseolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) BPTE. LTD. and/er

Insured Hame : NTH CONSTRUCTIOW PTE LTD
Driver Name . RAVICHANDRAN JAYA MURUGAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accldent.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHIMA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD.

(1} Global Sum 5% 4,100.00
TOTEL o o s mowos @ o0 v m & ¥ % &/ E3 4,100.00
Claimant MName : LCRF PTE LTD NRIC No : 201624597K

= .I []
Signature : 7( i Date : hilh bedisn

Yilnie Iy

LOMFORTDNELGRO .'_i-‘l_.-lrur_u;inut!ﬁ'. FIE OD

el i ani




— e - —

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

=arporate Offes Cl.r I"ﬂu EEﬂITH
5 Brardet Anad It B

2 Tel- 63638110
W Ens
- Tel: 6553 D400
\Waye i r|'|p.1-| Tel 636G TGN
||:.‘:l'| e Al -I-:'I' TekoBdl 5721 L e :
h COMPANY REG. NO: 199506048W
TAX IN“O'CE GST REG. NO. Misg821817-3
oM VEHCLE HO INVOICE NO. /DATE
BIa0L2 SIM6103L 91443110 10.05.2019
0 g R o (B - 3010
- m; 'N i HONDA 305270273
3 ROA
: MODEL ODOMETER READTHG
STNGAPORE 3G 079909 i GRACE HYERID
DATE OF REG
CONTACT NO: 62222366 03.04.2017
CHASSIS CODE
GM41105449
Description : TP — AIG - CHINA TAIPING
3/Ho Part No, Oty Unit Price Net
Description
01 20-501 1 EAC 1,680.00 8GD 1.680.00
RENEW & KNOCK OUT DENT ON AFFECTED AREA,
02 1979 1PBC 750,00 SGD 750,00
REAR BIUMPER
03 1979 1 PC 11.12 6D o 11.12
REAR BUMPER RETAINEE EH
04 1979 - 10 PC 3.12 8GD 31.20
REAR BUMPER CLIPS
05 1979 1PC 200,00 SGD 200.00
REVERSE SENSOR SET (2 PC)
06 1979 1P®C 40.16 1
BOOTLID 5 SGD 540.16
o7 1979 PC 19, § 3.
BOOTLID BADGE LOGO t 18 R 19.76
na 1979 E PC 36,00  SGD 36.00

BOOTLID EMBLEM - GRACE

Chamus should ba crosssd and made pavable to "ComfortDelGro Endinearing Pte Led"

nfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

=inbiet o LOMICRIR LG ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.
d Office: S T A e

Braddell Road “eornoz i 3.562.59

C Ext | Level 2 . ; . ——

apore 579701 il o . : RS S SR B

i: Finance Department
lly nata that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.

S5TOMER'S COPY




ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

. Cor porate Office Car Carie Cantres

I' fraddel Aoad Singapore 579701 Tel GBI BT
Loyang Diive Singaporne S8 269 Tel: 5214 8300
110 I‘- Pandan Road Sin gapar e BIKIAG Tet 6338 6778
Factimile + G5 62809755 383 5in Ming Drive Singapore 375117 Tek 553 0400
s CdgEonnag ﬁ I|1r|- .:d;f'._;gfnntumr:u Iljbf i I[;::‘EL;::: ;?g?
e -sl.l' i ¥ -':Hl.ql-ﬁ?'\- i ANY omfortDelGro I.'=g"!_)ﬂ" |
COMP, s
q
TAX INVOICE Gfg‘; % MESEWG
8010012 VEHCLE RO INVOICE NO. /DATE
CHIN PT H R C $)PTE T SILM6103L 91443110 10.05, 2019
A TAIPING INSURAN 0 {
SPRINGLEAF TO MAKE JOB NO.
2y RTNFGN zﬂhﬂ 16-00 HONDA 305270273
3 BANS ] =
MODEL ODOMETER READIRG
SINGAPORE SG 079309 - GRACE HYBRID
DATE OF REG
03.04.2017
CHASSIS CODE
GM41105449
S/No Part No. oty Unit Price Nat
DE‘E(:I'I._'DtlDﬂ
09 1979 1PC 46,88 8GD 46,88
BOOTLID EMBLEM - HYBRID
10 1979 4 PC 3.60 8GD 14. 40
BOOTLID CHROME MOULDING CLIPS
Items total 3.329.52
Add GST ® T.000 % 233.07
Invoice amount 3.562.59
Issued by : SIEWHWA 10,05.2019 15:23:02
Repair tvpe CES0/H2/5T

Favment Tvne!Term {Credit 30 days

omfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
mamber of COMFORIDELGRQ ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

15 Braddell Road

Ik C Ext 1 Level 2

ngapore 579701

tn:; Fipance Department

ndly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested,

USTOMER'S COPY



Invoice 10:24:30 AM Page 1 of 2

A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
i GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

lNSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
" ASSOCIATION Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Mo: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-19-026286
Date of Request; 19/02/2019 Your Ref Mo Online Purchase

ComiortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 575701

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 19/02/2018

Enguiry By Kristy Tay Siew Hwa

TP Vehicle No. GEBIEE3IA

Accident Date 18/02/2019

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. MNo.
GEBEGE3A China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd. 01/10/201B8-30/08/2019 6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided o you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liahilily whatsoever for any
lass or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cim?fusebox=MTRsas &fuseaction=dsp_... 19/02/2019



Invoice 10;24:30 AM Page 2 of 2

- X GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

"GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Ll ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
T Regisiration No; M40D017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Regisaton Noi M

TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref No: GR-19-026286
Date of Request: 19/02/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
ComforiDelGro Engineering Ple Lid
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701
Dear SirfMadam,
Enguiry Date 19/02/2019
Enquiry By Kristy Tay Siew Hwa
TP Vehicle Mo. GBBBBE3A
Accident Date 18/02/2019
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (33)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
%] GIRO[] Cash[] Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/ claims/index.cfin?fusebox=MT Rsas&fuseaction=dsp_... 19/02/2019



