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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 2:16 PM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & |A/Buses)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING TIB1246) AND SLQ7149C ON 15/02/2019 ALONG

UPPER BT TIMAH RD *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19003395/Jka3

ol P aied

Without Prejudice . " \
(save os fo costs) - 0\ WA A fow -
Dear Sirs/Mdm ' ”r}. hlee H'Q{M‘Jr

We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement for § 1,470.00 on a 50% liability basis due to confiicting versions.

Please confirm occeplance.

“Kindly note that this negotintion between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matier amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liahility/damages, either party is not bound, thereafler, by the negotiation terms/setilement,”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaa'lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 9:25 AM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <ChanSiauChin/@smrt.com.sg>;
Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a(@lkkauto.com>; Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpehi@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING TIB1246] AND SLQ7149C ON 15/02/2019 ALONG UPPER
BT TIMAH RD *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19003395/Jka3

Without Prejudice
Dear Karen,
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Ms Khanchna and she will get back to you
for an update/ofter.



K}aanchna !LKK Al.ltn!

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc
Subject:

Tracking:

Withoul Prejudice
(save as to cosis)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Wednesday, 4 September 2019 4:29 PM

Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svos/Claims & |A/Claims & [A/Buses)

Admin A

RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING TIB1246) AND SLQ7149C ON 15/02/2019 ALONG
UPPER BT TIMAH RD *** LKK REF: CC3/A1G19003395/)kal

Recipient Delivery

Karen Chan Siau Chin (Aute Sves/Claims & 1A/Clains

& 1A/ /Buses)

Admin A

Mellewan@lkkauto.com Delivered. 4/8/2019 429 PM
olvialaw@lkkauto com Delivarad 4/9/2019 429 PM
chupei@lkkauto com Delivered: 4/9/2019 429 PM

We propose settlement as follows:

1, Cost of Repair $ 2.200.00
2. Loss of Use |3 days x $250) 3 750.00
A.LTA Search Fee 3§ 700
Total $2,957.00

Please confimm acceptance.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotistion between parties on this matter is purely on » without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings, No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from

this negotiation of terma/setilement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequenily produced by elther party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues of
linbility/damages, elther party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/setiement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna(@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Aulo)
Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 5:11 PM
To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |1A/Buses)
Cc Admin A
Subject: RE LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING TIB1246) AND SLQ7149C ON 15/02/2019 ALONG
UPPER BT TIMAH RD *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19003395/ ka3
Attachments: AIG DV pdf
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Karen Chan Slau Chin [Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims
& IA/Buses)
Admin A
MedcwanElkkauto.com Delivered: 5/97201% 5711 PM
shupei@lkkauto.com Deliversad: 5/9/2019 511 PM
olivialaw@kkauto com Delivered: 5/97201% 511 PM

Withoul Prejudice
{save as to cosis)

Dear Karan,

We refer o the above matter,

We confirm settliement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair $ 2.200.00
2. Loss of Use (3 days x $325) 3 975.00
3.LTA Search Fee i 700
Total $3,182.00

We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

Thank you,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of Hability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materinlly affect/influence on the issues of
liahility/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/'settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Eapresa

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case | Notfied :m Submitted adj Assgnad .[ Adj Byt [Ad)] Eubmitted | Lns Auth'sd Status -

u |21 FED 209 A an $52,200.00  §§2,200.00 Poniieg for-oreey
| s !I'H-d‘llnt] | 2= Il —ul I I:IMIIc—I

Main Refersnce Ciaim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Tnsured: DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE LTD, Co. Rep Mo 1998037782
Main [§

Cimsny |SMRTBUSESLYD, Co fng. No.: 1982032910

[Vemicle Reg. —T15/0272015 11:00 - 159

| No. TIB1246) Date of oS3 | 1139 Manths and 11 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr]]
Clam Type: | TP / 608348819656 Policy/Cover | 10074033 (Comprehensive)
Vahicls Reg.
No. 5LQT148C :'“u"':"' "“‘I‘], DIINZ759ZMFRP

‘[_l.n.mmd'.l: y

Exceas:

iepairer. | SWAT Automotive Servicas Pte Ltd (Woodiands) 60 Woodlands Industrial Park £4, 757705 Woodiands - Tel; 68662628
Mandliog | u1G sia Pacific Insurance Pta. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000

Clalmant's -

ki MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel- 622333311

Adjustar. LKN Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3501 ... [Handled by ONG HWEE 31€] ... [Final Rpt dus D5/03/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compese Case Mai | I
« AIG_SG [25/02/2019): Request To Upload TP GIA Report |

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS— View Al | Search Tasis | Creste fw Task | Comusets |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Asmigned By Completod On Created On Dona?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=d... 3/12/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*TIB1246) (608348819656G)
[ﬂ-q;:m:l
SMRT BUSES LTD
Feb 15 2019 11:00AM
[DATMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE LTD)
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Letters/Correspondences 1 1] |
Mo |Finalized On LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HG) Thumbnail | Print
1| (o) Third Party Express Settisment - Paymant Areakdown [1] Edit
Photos/Images ~]| &
He |Relsbel/Resrder | LKK Auto Consultsnts Pe Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |25/00/10 09:08 General View 0| wmawc | A
2 |25/02/19 09:05 General View D | wdirc | &
3 |25/03/1909:05 | General View @ eawc | &
4 |2502190905 | Genaral View B | ioad i
5 |25/00/1909:05 | General View @ | tosairs | B |
8 |25/02/10 09:05 General View @ | iosd PG %3]
7 |2502/1902:05 | General View 0| leadivc | B
#  |25/02/1909:05 | General View 0| wedivc | B4
9 |25/00/1909:05 | General View 0| wadws | 4
10 |25/02/19 09:05 | General View D | s | A
11 |25/02/19 09:05 | General View 0| lesdws | B
12 |25/02/19 09:05 General View D | cadiec | B
13 |25/02/19 09:05 Ganeral View D | adirc | A
19 |25/02/1909:05 | General View 0| wedawe | &
15 | 25/02/19 09:05 Ganeral View g Loed PG | A
16 |25/02/19 09:05 Ganaral View D | leadis | A
17 |25/02/19 09:065 | General View 0| aws | @A
18 |22/03/19 11:22 | Photo After Spray 0| weaws B
19 |22/00/19 11:22 | Photo After Spray 0| ware | A
20 |22/00/1911:22 | Photo After Spray | tadwc | A
21 |22/03/1911:22 | Photo After Spray 0| wedrwc | M
22 |22/03/1911:22 | Pheto After Spray 0| cssrc | A
73 |23/03/19 11:32 | Photo After Spray Q| waaws | A
24 |22/00/1911:22 | Photo After Spray 0| woawe | A
25 |22/00/19 11:22 Photo After Spray ﬁ oad G | B
Documantation 1 per page ﬁ ]
to | Relabel/Meorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |25/02/19 20:52 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED ) | lcad POF
2 |2%/02/1920:52 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 |17/04/1911:30 | LETTER TO O1 Lood POF
4 | I6/00/19 15:53 | CCTV SCREENSHOT FROM THIRD PARTY REPAIRER g Load PDF
1Is U3/12/19 10:55 | WORKSHOP TNVOICE Laad POF
|6 |03/12/19 10:55 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM % Load POF
17 |oa12/19 10:55 | Release Voucher Load POF
|B|03/12/1910:55  |LTA SEARCH Load POF
9 |o3/12/1910:55  |LOD Loag POF
(Mo | Firaiired On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnall | Print
't |25/02191048 | 01 GIA REPORT @ | Load PoF
https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 3/12/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Seve | ennt |

Thers are no docurnent checkiists configured

KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Ramarks To: ] Handling Insurer
Epote . Bpmaling e DUt e gisd shos B D ofter perfies

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 3/12/2019



Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

| Vehicle No: SLQ7149C (Insd veh) Model: RCEDES-BENZ 0405G
TIB1246J (TP veh) 200 (A)
| Date of Accident: | 15/02/2019

Global Sum Settiement | :| [ ] Yes | [X] Neo
Repair Eslimate - § 2,716.45
Final Repair Cost : § 2.200.00
Loss of Use 3| 975.00 3.00 days at $325.00 per day
Rental (if any) : Ei 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee s 7.00
Others: 5 0.00
1§
Final Settlement Sum 5 3,182.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Reqistered Workshop: Agread Liability 100

(%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled anly far chain collisfons and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payea's Breakdown
1) |SMRT Buses Lid E 3,182.00
2)

3) :Sl

03 Dec
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Blll; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill {if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=8VCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 3/12/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg o 1essor1ser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 62568-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@/kkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/AIG18003395/JHA3G2

Date: 031272018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer; AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid.  Policy No: 100874033
Claimant %
Vehicle No TiIB1246) Insured Vehicle No : SLOT7148C
Date of Loss 15/02/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 608348819656
IPT | TIF N
Reg Na: TIB1246J
Make & Model: MERCEDES-BENZ 0405G, 12.0 D (A) Engine No: 44797710077564
Reg. Date: 04/03/2004 (Man. Year. 2002) Chassis No: WEBB1232321008680
Colour: Multi-colour Odomeler: 320829 km
Engine Capacity: 11967 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/Mew Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 275/T0OR22.5 Rear Tyre Size: 275/70 R22.5
Front Left Side: Firenza 7 mm Rear Left Side: Firenza 7 mm
Front Right Side: Firenza 7 mm Rear Right Side: Firenza 7 mm

The above values represant the remammg Hre eeds deph

\COST OF CLAIMS o ~ Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 204 45 184.00 2045 10.00
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00 _
Labour 251200 2.077.00 435.00 17.32
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 2,716.45 2,261.00 455.45 16.77
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 2,200.00
Nett Amount (55) 2,716.45 2,200.00 516.45 19.01
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 55325.00/day) (S§) 975.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (53) 7.00
Nett Liability (S5) 3,182.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 21/022018
Date Inspected 21/02/2018 Inspected Al SMRT Aulomolive Services Ple Lid
(Woodlands)
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapare 757705
Estimated Period of Repair, 3.0 days
Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: VIC ALPEH

https:/sigapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuscaction=g... 3/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: Thia repor represents our findings sl e time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been camed ouf fo the bast of our
knowiedie and abilily but any other labilty under ary ohar circumsiances it heraby arpressly swcluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Gty Part No. Particulars Condition  Repairer's  Amount
' *FLAP,EXIT DOOR:LH,FOR MB 0405G HABIT Cracked 204.45F *204.45FL

F=Franchise pan. L=ListhemDeac

Sub Total (S8) 204.45 204,45
- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (5§} D.00 2045

Total Parts (S$) 20445  184.00

Repon was unsubmitted during this print-oul. I
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

Thers are no new miscallansous ltems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REPAIR LH PORTION CENTER TO REAR New 1,080.00 795.00

2 TOPUTTY & RESPRAY New 1.452.00 1,282.00
Gross Labour Cost [S5] 2.512.00 2,077.00

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES »
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