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The One Holdings Pte Ltd
Office: 8 Woodlands Industrial Park E3 (S757786)
Reg :2017040522
Phone: 67558810 Fax: 67558809

Our Ref: TP/PCT464T/0003
Date: 16/02/2019

QUOTATION
Dear Sir, it DOA : 12/02/2019
Cost of Repair to Vehicle PC7864T
With reference to the above-mentioned, we are pleased to quote as follows:-
No. | DESCRIPTION QTY U/PRICE (S§)] AMOUNT (S§)
I | Rear Engine Cover Assy  ¢ve X ! 2,800,00 2,800.00
2 | Rhs Rear Cap Panel Assy  SVC X I 1600.00 1600.00
3. | Rear Bumper Assy DEF P 1 1800.00 1800.00 |/S%
4| 60 KM Sticker NEe - ! 5.00 5.00 [/
> |RHSRearTaillamp  ¢ppy I 280.00 280.00 |/
6. | HIGER AirCon Assy Ve 1 2500.00 2500.00
7- | Aircon Fanbelt wT 7 | 225,00 225.00 | I{07
ot
B. | Spray Painting on the whole rear cap, rear ~\0]
engine cover, rear bumper with Anwork | 3000.00| (500 3 9 00
9. | Labour & Misc. Charges: To remove the
affected parts & all relevant attachment &
fittings to commence repairs; cut & weld the
necessary parts as listed above; panel beat & 16 400.00 My/ 00
reshapes the affected areas; replace the U0
damaged components, reinstall & realign all
necessary parts (16Mandays)
10. Loss of use 8 250.00 2000.00 -t’ gf
.
SUB-TOTAL | 5620,610.00
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il Bs = Pte Lid Company Registration Ho. 189607 198R

SIURIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65) 62563501 FAX : (Dh3) hlERdNE

Your ref: TBA
Our ref: CC3/EQIN19003079/Kpa3 Date: 25/02/2019

The Motor Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. PC 7464T

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 20/02/2019
at the premises of M/s The One Holdings Pre Ltd - Woodlands and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S8 20,610.00
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 5.210.00
"Check” Items Amount : S8 -
Toral (Including Check liems) : 58 5,210.00
Murket Value 1 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 -
Nett Value : 8§ =

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the e
Rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 5.0 days

Yours faithfully,

ONG HWEE JIE
Licensed Appraiser



Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Hilmi (TOH) <hilmi@theoneholdings.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 9:24 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKALto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7464T AND YP 4042Y ON 12/02/2019
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher

MNoted and accepted
Process accordingly
Thanks

Hilmi

Fram: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto,.com]

Sent: Friday, November 22, 2019 4:35 PM

To: Hilmi (TOH) <hilmi@theoneholdings.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7464T AND YP 4042Y ON 12/02/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $ 3,700.00
2. Loss of Use (5 days x $150) 5 750.00
TOTAL $4,450.00

Kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Beal Regards
Asher Sng | Coss Honclles
LEX Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phome: &841-4051 | emal; gshesnog@ikkouto.com | fox 474-4108

Bk 51, Poya Ui indusiial Pork. Ubl Avenue | #02-25 | S{408533)



From: Hilmi [TOH) <hilmi@theoneholdings.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 2:14 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7464T AND YP 4042Y ON 12/02/2019

Dear Asher
Kindly see attachment.Please highlight to me if there is anything amiss
| will amend it.if not,process accordingly

Thanks

Regards

Muhd.Hilmi Deres

The One Holdings Pte Ltd

Tel : +65 6755 8810

Fax ; +65 6755 8809

Mobile : +65 97480340

Email Add : hifmi@theoneholgings.com.sg
ROC no:2017040522

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuta) [mallto:AsherSngi kkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 21, 2019 10:29 AM

To: hilmi@thegneholdings.com.sg
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7464T AND YP 4042Y ON 12/02/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Hilmi,
We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7464T AND YP 4042Y ON 12/02/2019

Our surveyor have finalise COR at $3,700.00 (exclude gst) 5 days, finalize amount subject to our principal approval.



" In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

s Please do not send the LOD to our prinicpal for direct settlement.

Thank You.

Beyl Regaras

Asher Sng | Cawe Hondler

LKEK Auto Consullants Pie Lid

phons: 6841-4051 | emalk acshernng@kkauia.com | fox: &74]-2108
Bik 51, Paya Ubl Industiial Park, Ukl Avenue 1. #02-25 | S1408¥33)



— Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple, Lid

() SOMPO | lisss etibmpuis st s

Ca Neg kia  1GRGTAEGF | GET Reg Me  BEOODI 166

Certificate of Insurance

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER189)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1860
ROAD TRANSPORT ACT 1567 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1855 [MALAYSIA)

Cen NoPolicy No. DABMTSCEUODDTE
1. Registration No. PCT4E4T
2. Insured Namea DLAMOND COACH SINGAPORE FTE LTD
1 Commencemant Date 20 DECEMBER 2018 00.00
4. Expiry Date 19 DECEMBER 2016 2349
5. Coverage Markel value a1 me of loss - Comprehensive
6. Excens £3500 - Section |
£1000 - Section Il

7. Persons or Classes of Persons entifled 1o drve®
b) Any person pravided he is in the Insured’s employ and is driving on thelt order or with their permission

Provided thal the person driving ls permitled in accordance wilh the licensing or ather laws o regulations 1o
drrve the Motor Vehicle or has been so permetted and is nol disqualified by order of 8 Court of Law or by reason
ol any enactmenl or regulation in that bahall from diiving the Motor Vehice

And provided urther 1hat the Molor Vehicde & regislered under the Road Traflic Act and lis registralion under
the Road Traffic Acl has not been cancelled al the time of the accident loss or damage

E. Limitations as to use”
) Lise only for the cariage of passengers or goods in connection with the Insured's business.
b} Uise only in the Republic of Singapore

The Falicy does not cover

1) Use for racing, pacemaking, relinbility trial or spead-testing

!}mum“nlhlhrmﬂhmw (ethar than for reward) of any one disabled machancally
pr

8. ExcelDrive Workshops & Accden) Reporting
i ks & conditlon preceden to Hability thal the Policyholder shall together wath the Motor Vehicle,
cal a1 the Company's Acciden! Repaning Cénler and repor the accident within 24 hours of Ihe sccident o
by 1he nexl working day thereo!

It it compudsary to have the aocident repairs 1o the nsured vehicle camed oul at ExcelDrive Workshops,
otherwine claim ks nol payable

In an emergency and for directions 1o the Company's Accdent Reporting Centers. please comlact our Emergency
Holline - (565) 6226 3323

Wisil www sompe com sg fer list of ExcelDnve Workshiops sntl Accident Reparting Conters

iWs WEREBY CERTIFY fhat the palicy e wilih this ewffileatn relales b vusd 0 srenrdance wilh the prostalons of e Boter Yehilctes [l Pty Bishs s
Compemuatinn) Aot |Chaptes 109) and Part iV of e Rosd Trasapon Ll 1987 (Malaysia)

Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Ltd,
5{.44.5'-

Tamaupoa readeied Bonealive by SECY) § 9 e WGy Yeivowsd Thnot Paety Mo ang Campenaatonide (Chasie |89 s jechos 55 of B Sage T asgew Aei P8l Maiar ™
il e be InCEeD under (hese heacesgr .

Dt/ Time of lssue | 04 DECEMBER 2018 13 48

ARG ANT NOTICE
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 February, 2019 11:57 AM
To: 'EQI PRS'
Ce: ‘Janet Tan'; 'Joel Goh'; "Tan Wei Yin'; CS A Team; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Our ref: YPA042Y: GIA Report PC7464T -PRS
Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED pdf
Categories: HMEK
‘WITHOUT PREIUDICE"
SAVEASTO COSTS
EQI ref: TBA

LKK REF: CC4/EQI19003392/]pa3
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: PC 7464T
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair
¢ Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mel Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@ lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Tan Wei ¥Yin eweiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 14 February, 2019 2:25 PM

To: assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Jlanet Tan <japet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Our ref: YPAD42Y: GIA Report PC7464T -PRS

Dear All,

Insured had reported — see attached.

You may proceed with DS.

Thks.



We have decided to pick LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.
Recently we have one case and it's also from LKk,
Can we get the same personel Mr Hwee lie

Thanks and Regards

Hilmi

From: Janet Tan [mallto:ianet.tan insurance.com.s
Sent: Wednesday, February 13, 2019 3:57 PM

To: hilmi@theoneholdings.com.sg; Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg=>
Subject: Our ref: YPA042Y: GIA Report PCT464T -PRS

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Sir/Madam,

For pre repair survey request, please emall to egiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg

Our insured has yet to report.

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle,

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have

agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2] Automaobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808 Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155 Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 B748 Contact Person: Sharon

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax: 6741-4108

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

7] Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services B) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services




Regards

Muhd.Hilmi Deres

The One Holdings Pte Ltd
Tel : +65 6755 8810
Fax : +65 6755 8809
Mobile : +65 97480340

Email Add : hilmi@theoneholdings. com.sg
ROC no:2017040522



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL

6256 1561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 198607188R GST Reg. Mo, 19-960T188-R

Afflliated to Fedaratlon Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Raf CC4/EQIM8003382/Jealq2
S TowE B RN
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 16-12-2019
MMND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 4042Y Veh. Inspected PC 74847
Policy No. DMCPHQ18-D06105 Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. Excess () 0.00
Assign From JANET Assign Date 14/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HIGER c.C BEO2
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. LEKLR1GSJ4JAT25T04 Colour GREEN
Odometer 8718 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes JAMMED Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |11R225 TRE85 T mm
L/H Front Tyre |11 R225 TRE85 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |11R225(D) TRG85 T mm
L/H Rear Tyre 11 R225 (D) TRE85 7T mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 12/02/2018 Inspection Date 20/02/2019
Survey held at THE ONE HOLDINGS PTE LTD
8 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E3 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E
SINGAPORE 757786
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YDUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




_I | Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 62568 4315
Reg MNo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PC T464T
a - - ; r = T e
‘Descri i Conditio: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty ption of Parts ondition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR ENGINE COVER ASSY SERVICEABLE 2,800.00
1|RHS REAR CAP PANEL ASSY SERVICEABLE 1,600.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER ASSY DEFORMED 1.6800.00 1,500.00
1|60KM STICKER NECESSARY 5.00 5.00
1|RHS REAR TAIL LAMP CRACKED 280.00 280.00
1|HIGER AIR CON ASSY SERVICEABLE 2.500.00
1|AIRCON FANBELT cut 22500 180.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -186.50
6,210.00 1,768.50
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING ON THE WHOLE REAR CAP REAR 3,000.00 1,500.00
ENGINE COVER .REAR BUMPER WITH ARTWORK.
LABOUR & MISC,CHARGES : TO REMOVE THE 6,400.00 1.400.00
AFFECTED PARTS & ALL RELEVANT ATTACHMENT &
FITTINGS TO COMMENCE REPAIRS;CUT & WELD THE
NECESSARY PARTS AS LISTED ABOVE ,PANEL BEAT &
RESHAPES THE AFFECTED AREAS ‘REPLACE THE
DAMAGED COMPONENTS REINSTALL & REALIGN ALL
NECESSARY PARTS (1BMANDAYS).
9,400.00 2,800,00
GRAND TOTAL 18,610.00 4,668.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS Ol 1 S ﬂﬂ
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) | LSy T -_"g.

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI1 gnuazgmaasqz

ONG HWEE JIE HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor Automolive Assossor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repant |s made solsly for the uss snd baneil of the Clienl named on the front page of this Repon.




