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- Consulfanis
Boin R W Pwtd Campany Reglstration No. 199607136R

51 UBLAVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBLINDUSTHRIAL PARE. SINGAPORE JU89Y3 TEL: (0E) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: D19000860MESH

Our ref: CS/FCI190339/Evd3 Date : 26/3/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. YN 8888H
We thank you for your instruction on 214212019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
26/2/2019  at the premises of M/s DETAIL LAB
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5§%4,763.00

Revised Estimate Amount 1 §$700.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount . 5%

Market Value 85

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear ofs portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

STEVE CHEN
Automotive Assessor



H H M5 First Capital Insurance Limited [ofeq Mo 1550001060 G5T Reg ho. M2 00016769
MS.FII‘EtCaprH & Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tek {65) 6222 2311 Fax (65} 6222 3547

Clalms & Motor Undenwiiting Dept: 35 Robinson Road #1601 City House Sangapore 0EBETT
Tet {65) 6507 3848 Fax: [B5) 6507 3848
wvw msfirstcapitaloom,sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 04-02-2019 Our Ref No. D15000860MFSH
Accident Date 01-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHADG54Y Third Party Vehicle. YMNEBBEEH
Survey Location B KAKI BUKIT AVE 4#02-03/04 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
Contact Person. MR BENEDICT YAP
Contact No. 63855510/ 98448533 Fax No. 0
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:
Appointed

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop DETAIL LAB Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March 2019 416 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Ce: ‘Merina Chia San San’; SUR

Subject: RE- SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000860MFSH/, YN 8888H
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle YN 8888H
Date of survey: 26/2/2019
Number of days : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 3:23 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Merina Chia San San' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000860MFSH/1, YN 8888H

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle YN 8888H on 26/2/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 11:41 AM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <gssignments@|kkauto.com>




Cc: 'Merina Chia San San' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000860MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

G Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 6:22 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia San 5an
<MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000860MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: T WWW.AVE.COm



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 3:23 PM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims'

Cc: ‘Merina Chia San San’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000860MFSH/1, YN 8888H
Dear Sir'Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle YN 8888H on 26/2/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4083933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 11:41 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia San San' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000860MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408q33)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims® misfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 6:22 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia San San

1

F1



<MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
‘Subject: PRI SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000860MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; WWW.avg.com



2/26/2019 Used Mitsubishi Canter Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resour

Post an Advertisement
Sl It yoursell! Advertise it st just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling
[ Browse by Category v « Back (12 ) Next » [Sort by Date Posted ¥ || 20 results/page
26 vehicles Mitsubishi Canter | whtmoceeSanehi. (R
Mk Model Price Depradation Rt [ Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection Mitsubishi Canter By Any 014 Ay Ay Any Availabl
Mitsubishl Fuso Canter FEB21 439,800 57,260 fyr 21-Aug-2014 2,998 ac - Truck Availabl
Fuel Type: Diesal
1 Ownes! In Good Condition!Cheagest In Town, Refiable 14 Feet Lorry You Can Trust! Full Loan Availablel High Trade-In Price! Trusted Partner For o
Your Commercial Vehicle Needs! L FRERITI |

AEWIN Bus Pte Ltd

posted: d6Febagis 1085 30114 Mitsubishl Euso, 2014 mitsubishi fusa, Mitsublshi Fusa, mitsubishi fusa, Misubisti, Fusa, fuso,

Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB71 £48,800 $8,B60 fyr 25-Aug-2014 2,998 cc - Truck Availabl
Fuel Type: Diesel
We Provide Up Ta 100% In-house Loan And Low Insurance Cuotation, For More Enquiries Plaase Contact Us!
ABWIM [1994) Pre Ltd
Fosted: 26-Fab-2019

Tags: 2014 Mitsubishi Fuss, 2014 mitsubishi Firen, Mitsubishl Fuso, mitsubeshi fuso, Mitsutishi, Fuso, huso,
Used Mitsubighi

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEADL $39,800 §7,810 fyr 31-Mar-2014 2,998 cc 108,817 km Truck Availabl
Fuel Type: Diessl

Think Ore Automobile & Trading

Tags: 2014 Masspbishi Fuso, 2014 mitaibishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsutishi fuso, Mitsubishl, Fuso, fusg,
Used Mitsubishi

Postod; 25-Feb-2019

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEAQL %$38,800 £6,940 fyr A0-Sep-2004 2,958 cc = Truck Avallahl
Fuel Typa: Diesel
FEADL Auto Box 7.5 Feet For Sele, 1 Owner Only, Tip Top Condition, Mo Need Say So Much Come And See And You Will Know How Good 1s The Lormy.
Trade In High Loan Avallable, Door Step Viewing Can B2 Arra...

ABAWIN {1994) Pte Ltd

Pasted: 75-Fab-2019 Tags: 2014 Mitsubishi Fusa, 2014 mitsubishi fusa, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsubishi fuso, MILsuBishy, Fusn, fuse,

Used Mitsubishi

Ralliart Emblem
Chrome Colour Emblem.
Mare infa about this product

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 543,500 $8,170 fyr 23-Jun-2014 2,998 cc - Truck Availabl
Fuel Type: Diesal
In House Finance Available,

Tags: 2014 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2014 mitsLibish fuss, Mitsubishi Fuso, matsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fusa,

Posted: 25-Fed-2019 Lis=d Mitsubishi

Compare

hUJ:ISWWWW.SQGEM.EDWl..IS:Ed‘__carsﬂiStirI.g,php?MOD=‘Mi|,$ub|.3h|*l:al'lMF&PRC‘MDEP=HERGD=ZD 14EVEH=08AVL=2 14



21262018 PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type: Company
Owner 1D Q501W
Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo YMNEBBEH
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 26 Feb 2019
Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Madel: CANTER FEB21ER4SDEB (CBU)
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No.: 4P10B30164
Chassis No.: FEB21EAQ0954
Maximum Power Cutput: -

Open Market Value: £30,562.00
Original Registration Date: 0% Sep 2014
First Registration Date: 09 5ep 2014
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,529.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: £0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 08 Sep 2024
COE Categary: C - Goaods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $29,933.00
COE Rebate Amount: $16,569.00
Total Rebate Amount: $16,56%.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 26 Feb 2019

OK
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Weran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March 2019 4:09 PM
To: 'benedict yap'

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: YN 8888H-DOA: 1/2/2019
Dear Sir,

MNoted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,
veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: benedict yap <detail lab@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March 2019 3:49 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: YN 8888H-DOA: 1/2/2019

Hi Veron

| confirm the Offer Lump Sum at $700 @ 2 days COR.
Thanks

On Tue, Mar 26, 2019 at 3:26 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) eyeronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $700/- @ 2 days.

Please check and confirm.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Should you require further queries or clarifications, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Best Regards

Ben Yap

Detail Lab
Swissvax Singapore
mobile: 9844 8533



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: benedict yap <detail lab@gmail.com=>
Sent: Friday, 15 March 2019 5:23 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Workshop Estimate YNB888H
Attachments: YMNB888Hestimate PDF

Dear Steve

For your perusal - workshop estimate YN8888H

Should you require further queries or clarifications, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Best Regards

Ben Yap

Detail Lab
Swissvax Singapore
mobile: 9844 8533



'Y Vel 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
_'-_"" ;; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 1906071988 GST Reg. Mo, 19.0507198.R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI3003391/Evd3n2
i?fﬁﬁgff’? EC?L?;EDSINGAF‘GRE 068877 Dol eRnl Mll‘|‘|”|||“u|luml‘|
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 954Y Veh. Inspected ¥M 8B8EH
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19000860MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MERINA CHIA Assign Date 21/02/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI CANTER c.c 2908
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2014
Chassis No. FEBRZ1EADOOS4 Colour WHITE
Odometer 317N Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/85R15 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/85R15 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [195/85R15 YOKOHAMA, 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/85 R15 YOKOHAMA, 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR OJS PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5, General Information
Accident Date  01/022019 Inspection Date 26/02/2019
Survey held at DETAIL LAB
BLK 8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
#02-03/04 PREMIER @ KB
SINGAPORE 415875
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES COMSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' Vel V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
BB BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 19%6071986R GST Reg. No. 19-86071598-R Fage Mo 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YN 8888H
arl Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | = oiehop {g:l] [51}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|TAIL BOARD ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 1,350.00
LABOUR
1|RH TAIL BOARD HOOK ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 385.00 -
LABOUR
1|TAIL BOARD END STOPPER RH DENTED 58.00 58.00
1|SET RH TAIL LAMP ASSY NOT NECESSARY 385,00 -
1|RH TAIL BOARD STOPPER HINGE NOT NECESSARY 235,00 .
1|SET REAR REINFORCEMENT BEAM NOT NECESSARY 685.00
1{RH TAIL LAMP PANEL DENTED 185.00 185 00
3,283.00 243.00
LABOUR
PANEL REPAIR.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF TAIL 450,00 300.00
BOARD ASSY AND RH TAIL BOARD HOOK ASSY.
SPRAY PAINTING. 450,00 300.00
CHECK WIRING & ELECTRICAL SYSTEM. 80.00 30.00
REMOVE & INSTALL TAILBOARD, NOT NECESSARY 250.00 3
REMOVE & INSTALL REINFORCEMENT BEAM RR. NOT NECESSARY 250.00 :
1,480.00 630.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,763.00 873.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 700.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19003391/Evd3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

e

CHEN TSUE YEE
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

MECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor ks made sclely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repo.

popled 10 any third party wiho im repdy on the Beport wholly or in part. A

W leallity of responsibilily whalsoe o Eenlact of borl, i3
Report. in whobe or in pard, dois So 8k his of her oW risk.



