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Ll

Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 4:33 PM
To: assignments
Subject: FW: Yref: New case - Inspection on insured vehicle SME9645A; DOA: 16.2.2019; Our
Ref: M585367; To survey on 22.02.2019 G
Attachments: GIA - SME9645A .pdf . y
-l
7 v

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Eng Huey Ni <HueyNi_Eng@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 4:14 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Nor Azian Binte Noordin <NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com>; Chhia Nyuk Pui <NyukPui_Chhia@sg.msig-
asia.com>

Subject: Yref: New case - Inspection on insured vehicle SMES645A; DOA: 16.2.2019; Our Ref: M585367; To survey on
22.02.2019

Hi Shiau Chan,

As spoken, please arrange to survey the above insured vehicle at Indeco Engineers located at 37 Defu lane 12,

The insured reported the left tyre was flat and dropped out after the accident.

Please check if the tyre was in efficient conditions before the accident or the damages of the tyre was a result of the
accident. Please also check for any other possible breach. (please do not alert the insured on the purpose of the
inspection if possible)

If the insured pass you the OD estimate during the inspection, please conduct the OD survey as well.

Excess is $2000.

Thanks

Eng Huey Ni
Senior Executive, Claims Services
D: +65 6643 1314 | F: +65 6225 7402 | hueyni_eng@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o @ o

AMember of [WATFNNE INSURANCE GROUP



3 Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
QOwner ID Type:

Qwner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:_

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Mar 2019

Company
7259H

SMES645A

Yes

27 Mar 2019
BLUECAR
BLUECAR

WI_'lite

2018
VL4BCEB4RJT003362
50.0kW (67 bhp)
$33,595.00

24 Oct 2018

24 Oct 2018

0

$19,033.00

Yes
230ct 2028
$14,274.00

23 0ct 2028

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$30,284.00

$24,227.00

$38,501.00

OK



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

— e e e ————

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 4:57 PM

To: bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: SME 9645A OD (MSIG)

Attachments: ESTIMATE.pdf

Dear Chloe,

Enclosed estimate marked.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 4:53 PM

To: bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SME 9645A OD (MSIG)

Dear Chloe,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SME 9645A (Excess $ 2,000/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



4/16/2019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SME9645A (585367)
oD
Feb 16 2019 1:00PM
[BLUECAR EAST ASIA PTE LTD]
Indeco Engineers Pte Ltd

[Reply | | Reply All | | Mark as Unread | | Print Message | | Delete Message | _Forward |

From MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (MSIG_SG), sent on 16/04}201_9 08:47 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2931.20) - SME9645A - Claim Handler: Nor Azian Binte Noordin

Approved:2931,20,

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1467509&Domainld=11&i0bjld=7...  1/2




3/28/2019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SME9645A (585367)
oD
Feb 16 2019 1:00PM
[BLUECAR EAST ASIA PTE LTD]
Indeco Engineers Pte Ltd

| Reply l Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Messagﬂ Delete Message | Forwa_l

From MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (MSIG_SG), sent on 28/03/2019 15:58 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2130.00) - SME9645A - Claim Handler: Nor Azian Binte Noordin

Approved:2130,00:Approved mandate $2130.00 (subject to excess $2000). Check items of $243 to be verified and confirmed

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - -
There are no documents,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cim?fusebox=SVCmall&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1457698&IDomainld=11&i0bjld=7...  1/2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:1sss071e8R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933 _
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com
To: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
4 Shenton Way 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#21-01 SGX Centre 2 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 068807 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Nor Azian Binte Noordin Date: 11 Apr 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SME9645A Accident Date : 16/02/2019
Make : BLUECAR BLUECAR Policy No. : 29112616MCY
Assignment Date  : 20/03/2019 Excess : $$2,000.00
Date of Inspection  : 22/02/2019 Est. Duration of Repair  : 5 days
Inspection At : Indeco Engineers Pte Ltd (Defu)

No. 39 Defu Lane 12

Singapore 539315

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S$
Revised Amount :S$
Check Items (Estimated) :S$
Total :S$
Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S%
Pre-Accident Value :S$
COE / PARF Rebate :S§
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S$

Remarks

4,858.80 (INCLUSIVE SUPPLEMENTARY)

2,931.20 (INCLUSIVE SUPPLEMENTARY)
0.00

2,931.20

66,000.00
38,501.00

27,499.00

( X ) The vehicle is economical for repair. We have received supplementary from repairer. Our surveyor had
since checked and verified the supplementary parts and is of the view that the supplementary parts are
consistent to the nature of the accident and is economical to repair. Supplementary amount is $ 123.20.

( ) The above survey was conducted on a 'without prejudice’ basis.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:1s9807198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ilkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
4 Shenton Way 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#21-01 SGX Centre 2 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 068807 Singapore 408933

Aftn:  Nor Azian Binte Noordin Date: 27 Mar 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SME9645A Accident Date : 16/02/2019
Make : BLUECAR BLUECAR Policy No. :29112616MCY
Assignment Date  : 20/03/2019 Excess : $$2,000.00
Date of Inspection  : 22/02/2019 Est. Duration of Repair : 5 days
Inspection At : Indeco Engineers Pte Ltd (Defu)

No. 39 Defu Lane 12
Singapore 539315

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S§ 4,735.60
Revised Amount :S§ 2,130.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S% 243.00
Total :S% 2,373.00
Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S$
Pre-Accident Value :S$ 66,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S$ 38,501.00
Salvage Value 8%
Margin for Repair 5% 27,499.00

Remarks
( X ) The vehicle is economical for repair.

( ) The above survey was conducted on a ‘without prejudice’ basis.



MELU19022422 / BlueSG Pte Lid - HQ
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 18/02/2019 14:41
SUBMITTED BY: Neo Hul Qian

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation ar witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the Insurance companies
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the Insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report al the centre and to coples of the report being made avallable

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

18/02/2019 14:41
16/02/2019 13:00

72 JOO CHIAT PLACE
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SMES645A

BLUECAR EAST ASIAPTE LTD
201617259H
CLAIMS@BLUESG.COM.SG
(LOCAL) +65-97365541
OFFICE-31637900

BLUECAR
BLUECAR-(A)

PRIVATE CAR

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

YES

MSD/VPCP/18-000001

KOH HWEE LIN

57612300D

01/05/1976

INDOOR

31/03/1998

20 YEARS AND 10 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-80482477

HL_KOH@YAHOO.COM.SG

Page 1 of 26



Address BLK 166 HOUGANG AVE. 1 #13-1572
Postcode 530166

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - HIRER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own B
Vehicle B

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident FIRE, EXPLOSION OR LIGHTNING
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| hgv_e_ been approacl'}ed by upknownlperson[s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

Refer circumstance to sketch plan.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SBA113D
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour BMW

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver

NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 26



Sketch Plan #2
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Sketch Plan #3

Page 4 of 28



Y /74 ol @@ . 35060 0k 12, SINGAPORE 539139

VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT DIVISION  Tel: (65) 382 2736 FAX: {65) 6382 2817

ACCIDENT REPAIR ESTIMATES

Our Ref:
Type of Claim - oD Vehicle No. . SME9645A
Make & Model : BLUECAR
Year of Manufacture : 2018
Chassis No. VL4BCEB4RJT003362
Ins Company : MSIG Engine No. : 922403A18W122453489
Excess - §2,000.00 Policy No. ;
Date of Accident : 26/2/2018 Time of Accident © 13:00
Suggested Days of Repair
Repair Estimates
Parts (a) Cost/ List Price ltems $ 1,696.00
Plus/Less 10% $ 169.60
Total of Cost / List § _ 1,865.60 LKK Auto Consultants hence noltify
—_—— the Repa]re[ of the [:;.I!meg.
(b) Nett Price Items $ . » To resurvey before/afier spray painting
T— » To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
« Pants prices are subjec to confirmation )
s « Third party survey is on a“Without Prejudice” basis
« No ifiegal modification(s) is allowed
Total of Nett Item " Suoplementary () musi beresurveyed gnd
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company
(c) Special Nett ltems $ 70.00
Acknowledged by Repairer
Total Parts Cost (Appendix A) $§ 1,93560 Signature:
| Date:
Labour (Appendix B) $  2,800.00 |
/
Total Repair Cost $§  4,735.60 I\
E \ /)
2.30 Narp ™
The above totai will be subjected to 7% G.S.T. 44L %

Name of Surveyor : ;?\, (\éQA_ 0’:})5 :]'.}C'cl
Company : L tt M

Survey conducted on : DX l 32 , ?1){‘1 at 222 \h 4

Remarks By Surveyor
(a) The repair of this vehicle is authorized / ignot authorized Antil further notice.

(b) Recommended Days of Repair | ») day(s) (?é‘v"{' t ?4(+-

{c) Resurvey : @cl Required ?\qm 51{- 5?({3
(d) Excess $ /7 s ')r\’“ dcmc g'QCDL

PV

(e) Signature of surveyor : Date:

Z \

WACCIDENT REPAIR ESTIAATESIFY / )



fndeco

VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT DIVISION

No. 39 DEFU LANE 12, SINGAPORE 539139
Tel: (65) 382 2736 FAX: (65) 6382 2817

ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS

Vehicle No : SMES645A Case Owner 0
Make & Model : BLUE CAR Year Manufacture : 2018
Chassis No : VL4ABCEB4RJT003362 Engine No : 922403A18W122453489
Date & Time Supplier
Order By Type of Claim oD
S/No Part Description aty Cost Liet Nett SIN

Price Price Price
1_|Front fender LH D.ande A 1% 52000(s 52000 ~——
2_|Front fender protector LH V5% 1083 70.00 | $ 7000
3_|Front fender inne shield set LH _obe] gv\ma A 108 36.00 § 36.00| —
4 |Front fender inne shield clip L-.L‘_,' 718 2008 14.00 —
5 [tye S C0d Ao 7 A2@Vicnh N 1 |$  13000]s 130.00 | <& 1—9[.60] SN
6 |Tyre pressure sensor M| 5 118 56.00 | $ 56.00 A
7 |Steeliim W ¥ 11% 70.00 | § 70.00 —
8 |Rimcoverset Cw | WOF 1]s 50.00 | § 5000 —
9 |FrontlowerarmLH "2y kaa 118 18000 $ 160.00 |
10_|Front shock absorber setLH 2. Vot 1 s 10000 10000 &2
11 |Drive shaft LH 2 =wA 11$  18000] % 180.00| v—
12 |Antirolibartierod LH ~ MNu{ 1|3 20.00 | $ 20.00 X
13 |Frontknuckle arm LH 2% o4 SAVArA 1 /8 17000]s$ 17000 & ~“T
14 |Side skitLH  K[s\ 119 120.00 | $ 120.00 bl
15 |Door stickers sz e 1 » |s 7000|—
16 |0 0
17 Jo 0
18 {0 0
19 |o 0
20 |0 0
21 fo 0
22 |o 0
23 |o 1
24 o 0
25 fo 0 [3 D) [gy;-{-— SH
26 o 0 _ ) )
27 Jo 0 106 | , =~pn o[- St
28 o 0 b il
29 |0 0
30 |o 0
Note: If any of the quoted parts are recommended to be repaired, then an additional labour charge
will be charged accordingly under supplementary.

TOTAL $ 168400 $ 1,696.00 $ - § 70.00



fmndeco

VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT DIVISION

No . 39 DEFU LANE 12, SINGAPORE 539139
Tel: (65) 382 2736 FAX: (65) 6382 2817

Labour
Vehicle No.  : SME9645A Case Owner 0
Make & Model : BLUE CAR Year of Manufacture 2018
S/No Labour Description . I
Price Price
1 |TO REPAIR,REPLACE, ON FIRE WALL,LHF FENDER,WHEEL HOUSE, $1,00000 | 50D~
LHF FLOOR PANEL,FRT BUMPER AND AFFECTED AREA
2 |TO PUTTY AND RESRPAY ON FIRE WALL,LHF FENDER,WHEEL $1.00000° | 408| -
HOUSE,LHF FLOOR PANEL,FRT BUMPER AND AFFECTED AREA
3 |TO REMOVE AND REFIX LHF SEAT,CARPET,UPHOISTERY TO $400.00 N K|
ASSSIT WORK
4 |TO REMOVE AND REFIX LHF UNDERCARRIAGE 30000~ | 190|-~
5 |TO PERFORM 4 WHEEL ALIGHMENT 510800 | bo|~

-

TOTAL

$2,800.00

Note: The above estimate of repair is based on visual assessment of the extemal affected areas. Any
additicnal damages observed during the course of repair will be quote accordingly as a supplementary.




fndeco

VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT DIVISION

Supplementa

No . 39 DEFU LANE 12, SINGAPORE 539139

Tel: (65) 382 2736 FAX: (65) 6382 2817

Vehicle No SME9645A Case Owner 0
Make & Model . BLUE CAR Year Manufacture © 2018
Chassis No . VLABCEB4RJT003362 Engine No 922403A18W122453489
Sales Order 0 Supplier -0
Order By Type of Claim . OD
S/No Part Description QTyY Uljit Cgst Nett Disposition
Price Price ltem SIN By Surveyor
1 |Steering rack end %7 1 1% 10000| % 100.00 "
2 |Tierodend ¥ 1[$ 1200]|$ 1200 —
3 >
4
5 \elo 12329
B i
7
8 2
9 “F—V\LZA
10 < — [I
11
B Jlck Badp
13 il
14 —
15 7 7
16 L Z
17 /N
18 / )
19 ;
20 » .
21 A vtk D 2
22 ' B
23 N
24| PDyhZwib 3R “H5 n
25 | \ MoV ol A L
26
27
28
29
30

Note: If any of the quoted parts are recommended to be repaired, then an additional labour charge

will be charged accordingly under supplementary.




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notified Est Submitted Ad) Assigned Ad] Rpt Ad] Submitted Ins Auth'ed | Status
20 Mar 2019
vain |19 Feb 2019 e $$2,931.20  |$$2,931.20 :::::f:" Tos-Svey
Edit Adj Rpt | Edit Estimates | | _view Rpt | Cancel Case |

Reference Claim Details Show All

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Insured: BLUECAR EAST ASIA PTE LTD, Co, Reg. No.: 201617259H

| [Created by insurer]

Vehicle Reg. . |16/02/2019 13:00 - :59
No.: SME9645A Date of LosS: |13 vonths and 23 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
: Policy/Cover |29112616MCY (Comprehensive)
Claim Type: |OD / 585367 Note No.: Coverage: 01/01/2019 - 31/12/2019
Excess: $$2,000.00
Repairer: Indeco Engineers Pte Ltd (Defu) No. 39 Defu Lane 12, 539315 Defu Lane - Tel: 6382 2738

Handing | Ms1G Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7886 ... [Handled by Pang Xiu Shi - 6594 2586]

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by BRYAN TANI] ... [Final Rpt due 19/04/2019]

Driver/CUSKo | (OH HWEE LIN (42 / Female) ,  NRIC: 576123000, Tel: +6590492477 Email: hi_koh@yahoo.com.sg

Adj Asg.
Rermarka: Please revert and inform us if unable to attend. Car in. Tks.

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All | Compose Case Mail |

+ MSIG_SG (16/04/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$2931.20) - SME9645A - Claim Handler: Nor Azian B...
« MSIG_SG (28/03/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$2130.00) - SME9645A - Claim Handler: Nor Azian B...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sssor1ssr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Our File No:  CS/MSG19003385/DSD3E2
4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2
Singapore 068807 Date: 02/08/2019
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant: BLUECAR EAST ASIA PTE LTD Policy No: 29112616MCY
Date of Loss: 16/02/2019 Nature of Claim: 0D Claim No: 585367
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SME9645A
Make & Model: BLUECAR BLUECAR, (A) Engine No: HIDDEN
Reg. Date: 24/10/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: VL4BCEB4RJT003362
Colour: White Odometer: 0 km
Engine Capacity: Occ
Market Value/New Car Price: $$66,000.00
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:

CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size:

Front Left Side:

175/65 R15
Michelin 7 mm

Rear Tyre Size:
Rear Left Side:

175/65 R15
Michelin 7 mm

Front Right Side: Michelin 7 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 7 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS __ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %|
Parts 2,058.80 1,791.20 267.60 13.00
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,800.00 1,140.00 1,660.00 59.29
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 4,858.80 2,931.20 1,927.60 39.67
- Excess (S$§) 2,000.00 2,000.00 0.00 0.00
(S$) 2,858.80 931.20 1,927.60 67.43
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 200.12 65.18 134.94 67.43
Nett Amount (S§) 3,058.92 996.38 2,062.54 67.43
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 20/03/2019
Date Inspected: 22/02/2019 Inspected At: 37 DEFU LANE 12
Repairer : Indeco Engineers Pte Ltd (Defu)
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days
Adjuster: BRYAN TANI Manager: Hiew May Fung
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NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out fo the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 02 Aug 2019)

Parts: BLUECAR BLUECAR (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SME9645A)

;Valldlty: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page |

Recommended Parts

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
|Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT FENDER LH Dented 520.00F *520.00F
(WCP)
2 1 *FRONT FENDER PROTECTOR LH Bent 70.00F *70.00F
(WCP)
3 1 *SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD LH Deformed 36.00F *36.00F
(WCP)
B 7 *FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP Necessary 14.00F *14.00F
(WCP)
5 1 *TYRE PRESSURE SENSOR Not Necessary 56.00F *F
(WCP)
1 *STEEL RIM Bent 70.00F *70.00F
(WCP)
7 1 *SET RIM COVER Cut/ Bent 50.00F *50.00F
(WCP)
8 1 *FRONT LOWER ARM LH Broken 160.00F *160.00F
(WCP)
9 1 *SET FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER LH Bent 100.00F *100.00F
(WCP)
10 1 *DRIVE SHAFT LH Damaged 180.00F *180.00F
(WCP)
11 1 *ANTI ROLL BAR TIE ROD LH Not Necessary 20.00F *-F
(WCP)
12: 4 *FRONT KNUCKLE ARM LH Distorted 170.00F *170.00F
(wee)
13 1 *SIDE SKIRT LH Not Necessary 120.00F *-F
(WcP)
14 1 *TYRE Cut 143.00FS *91.00FS
(3130.00) (70%)
15 1 *DOOR STICKERS Necessary 70.00FS *70.00FS
16 1 *STEERING RACK END Bent 100.00F *100.00F
(WCP)
17 1 *TIE ROD END Bent 12.00F *12.00F
(WCP)
F=Franchise part. S=SpcNett
Sub Total (S$) 1,891.00 1,643.00
+ Margin on L,N Items 10.00/10.00% (S$) 167.80 148.20
Total Parts (S$) 2,058.80 1,791.20
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Iltems
1 TO REPAIR, REPLACE, ON FIRE WALL, LHF FENDER, WHEEL New 1,000.00 500.00
HOUSE, LHF FLOOR PANEL, FRT BUMPER AND AFFECTED
AREA
2 TOPUTTY AND RESPRAY ON FIRE WALL, LHF FENDER, New 1,000.00 400.00
WHEEL HOUSE, LHF FLOOR PANEL, FRT BUMPER AND
AFFECTED AREA
3 TO REMOVE AND REFIX LHF SEAT, CARPET, UPHOLSTERY New 400.00 0.00
TO ASSIST WORK
TO REMOVE AND REFIX LHF UNDERCARRIAGE New 300.00 180.00
5 TO PERFORM 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 100.00 60.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,800.00 1,140.00
I Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 2/8/2019



