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J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD

Block 5, Defu Lane 10, #01-578,

Defu Indlustrial Park C, Singapore 539186

Tel: 6343-0934 Fax:6343-0921
Emall : jmartauto@gmail.com
Registration No: 201400244D

GST Reg. No: 201400246D

20-Feb-19
.
Our ref : TP/4649/18 TOAIG NYRaII0%2 14 -'fS?W
Chin Kwok Wai ¥ico Tar
el
1pc bootlid Buc (L 5 e/ 13
1pc logo emblem - 48.00 ~
1pc Kompressor emblem # 106.00 *~
1pc cc emblem }_" 110,00
1pc E 200 emblem ; 76,00
1pc bootlid outer garnish " 577.00 =
lpc bootlid third brake light /& = 235.00
1 pe bootlid Iock : 180,00
1pc bootlid w/strip s — 185.00 ‘; .
A -
2 pes taillamp i e wAd 21 1,09000 lr 5
2 pes taillamp garnish rh th e - 00
& pes taillamp garnish clips /o= /7 A oo™ o
1pe rear bumper ¢4l 1,780.00 *~
2 pes rear bumper chrome rh Ih s Piré-—< 270.00 -~
1pc rear bumper centre chrome #*~ 185.00 =~
2 pes rear bumper pad thih 7 lds! ruAs il =&6
1pc rear bumper centre pad v—d aspoess 208
2 pes rear bumpe retainers »wl A~ 220,00 -~
1pe rear bumper reinforement B4 d 580.00 ~
4 pes rear bumper reverse sensor L pieeas e 8((3, #2000~ 34 ¢
1pc rear bumper tow hook cover M = 78004
2 pcs rear bumper holder rhlh =~ =~ 270.00 “
1pe rear bumper centre holder Sk FAr 7 58 15‘{) 225002
1pc end panel 'b‘.,*g_j . 745.00 ,
1pe end panel inner gamish B2 'L—-‘ 14200 L
1pc rear fender inner trimrh pld = 370.00 ~.
11875.00
less 10% 1187.50
10687.50
Panel beating. 100000 S Adoea Li
Spray painting. fb@ 100800 5w 31l 6L
Wiring. 30.00 "/ > 9
Rust proofing. ol 50
1279750 06 QV)-"'
Plus 7% GST B895.83
LEX Auta Consuliznts nence nofify 13693.33 ;

[sDeThirtadr thousand six hundred ninefy-three & cents thirty-three anly.
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Date
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Owner 10 Type Singapore NRIC

Owner |O F674Z

‘Vehicle No SKVE154R

Yehicle to be Exported Yes

Intended Deregistration Date 21 Feb 2019

Vehicle Male: MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model EZ00MNGT-PC
Primary Colour; Blue

Manufacturing Year: 2006

Engine No. 27194130744320
Chassis Mo WDB2110422A953784
Maximum Power Output: 1200 kW (1&0 bhp)
Open Market Value $57.479.00

Original Registration Date: 11 Aug 2008

First Registration Date 11 Aug 2004
Transfer Count 4

Actual ARF Paid-: $40,23400
PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

COE Expiry Date: 30 Jun 2021

COE Category E - Open Category
COE Perfod(Years) 5

POP Paid $24.22000

COE Rebate Amount $11.433.00

Total Rebate Amount $11,433.00

Please note that the S-year COE far this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches s statutory lifespan {if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 21Feb201%



~ Without Prejudice

(save as fo costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We rafer to the above matier.

We propose setflement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair {w/GST) % 5.885.00
2. Loss of Rental (Bdays x $120.00) (w/GS5T) $ 940.00
TOTAL | S 6,845.00

Please confirm acceptance

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinledilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 202-25 | S{408033)



We refer to the above maftter.

We propose setllemeant as follows: -

I. Cost of Repair $ 5.885.00
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $140.00) § 1.120.00
TOTAL | $7.005.00

Kindly confirm acceptance

Best Regards,
Carlor Chan | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5702 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-35 | S[408933)

From: jmart jmart [mailto:imartauto @gmail. com]

Sent: Friday, 19 April 2019 8:13 AM

To: lia Le (LKK Auta)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SKVB154R *Our Ref: CC6/AIG19003351/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA9430Z & SKV8154R

ON 20/02/2019]

1 would like to counter offer at LOR at $150 per day

On Thu, 18 Apr 2019, 11:29 Jia Le (LKK Auto). <JiaLe/a|lkkauto.com> wrote:



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: J-Mart <jmartauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 1142 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKV8154R *Our Ref: CC6/AIG19003357/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SMA9430Z & SKV8154R ON 20/02/2019]

ok

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:Jiale @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 9:40 AM

To: jmart jmart <jmartauto@gmail.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKVB154R *Our Ref: CC6/AIG19003351/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMAS430Z & SKVB154R
ON 20/02/2019]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and returmn to us [LKK) for our necessary action.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jigle@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408931)

From: jmart jmart [mailte:imartauto@gmall.com]
Sent: Monday, 22 April 2019 9:14 AM
To: Jia Le [LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SKV8154R *Our Ref: CC6/AIG19003351/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMAS430Z & SKV8154R
ON 20/02/2019]
Ok accept offer
On Mon, 22 Apr 2019, 08:49 Jia Le (LKK Auto), <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

(save as lo cosls)

Deaor Sirs/Mdm,



J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD

Block 5, Detu Lane 10, #01-578,
Defu Industial Park C, Singapare 539186
Tel: 6343-0934 Fax: 6343-092]
Emall : martauto@gmail.com
Registration No: 201400244D
GST Reg. No: 2014002446D

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SKV 8154R & SMA 9430Z ALONG Jurong West St 51 Slip Rd ON
20/2/2019

We understand that you are the insurer of SMA 94302 vehicle.

IfWe wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SKV B154R have been completed repairs to my/our
satisfaction by M/s J-MART MOTOR PFTE LTD. |/We therefore propose to claim from your as follows:

1. Cost of Repair Plus GST 555885.00

2. Loss of Rental (55180x BDays) $51440.00

3. LTA Search Fee/ GIA Reports 55 0.00
TOTAL 55 7325.00

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.
Thank you.

Yours faithfully

ZRE L
Y
i%;"




51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19003351/Apa3
29 MARCH 2019

NG KEAT LYE @ LIM KEAT LYE
BLK 47 TEBAN GARDENS ROAD
#03-220

SINGAPORE 600047

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA 9430Z & SKV 8154R ALONG/AT JURONG WEST TO
JALAN BOON LAY ON 20/022019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SKV 8154R against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour as it is head-to-rear collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable
settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settiement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG

Case Handler
DID: 6742 3197
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewhi@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
{Matar Claims Dept)




Ta Whom It May Concarm
| (nin | ¥ I (the third party ciaimant] of 233

A S5 HO5-34 ﬁtiéi&gem,nwnuuf SK V51541 vehicie no,) hereby

Bt Advk Casy

juthorise 1 - mAGr mutee PTE LTO (the workshop! w act for me with respecr (o
my claims for the repair cosis ans/or rental 2ndfor loss of use {claim) for my vehicla SV §'1 S

. 2014 [date) 2long
sNA Qa3

thal was damaged punua—ntmﬁ'&mw&nr which o=curred on ")_\! )1

lJont sx 5! Slip r!;f ;mﬂmnnﬂmﬂnguhidnnm’s
1

Jufu e

my above mantionsd cigim in a manner that they deem §

| further authorisa the workthop- ‘o sette
riher 1o the sattlement of my claims

and the workshop is further autharised receive payment fu
with paymant cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop

the warkshop may r2ach on my behaif 1z on 2 withoul

i funher acknowledgs that any spitlemant
hasis Insofar &t the driverfownerfinsurers of the ather

prejudice and without admission of liability
vahiclels is concemee.

Datec this )'ﬂi {gay} of _!,’{'r.:l [mosth) ]Jl"j[ fyear)

/&71;;/

Lignad by the Lhird pary claimam

Signed and witnessad by warkshop

with company stamg it applicat'a) ywith company stamp)



EASE VO
- Party Claim

“Well. -MART MOTOR FTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an

agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd LKK AUTO
QQEEMME_LQ (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S35,885.00 (Repair Cost), S81.120.00 (Loss of Hse/Rental), S§ - (Disbursememt) for vehicle no.
SKV 8154R that was damaged pursuant 10 the accident which oceurred on 200022019 (date) along

w 51 OAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SMA 9430Z. This
is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 210272019 (date) at “the workshop”™,

We/l confirm that we/l are/um authorized by the owner CHIN KWOK WAI (“the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no, SKV 8154R make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matier on histher behalf in a manner that we/| deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

Wel further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd for all demages,
loss andlor expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental snd/or loss of use pursuwimt o the
dumage 1o SKV 8154R (vehicle no. ) as a result of the sccident.

We/l confirm thar the agrecinent reached above is in full und final settlement of any elaim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant 1o the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and withour admission of linbility basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Duted this - {day) of ih:'-_ (m-tmrh}]ﬂ_i{ynqr}

Signed by sppointed surveyor Signed by “the




J - MART MOTOR PTELTD
Block 5 Defu Lane 10, #01-578

Defu Industrial Park C, (S)539186
Company Reg. No. 201400246D

GST Reg No. 2014002460 TAX INVOICE NO: TP15-0044
Email; jmartmotorpl@gmail.com DATE: 01-Apr-2019
Tel: 6343-0934 Fax: 6343-0921
Chin Kok Wai
PAYABLE BY AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
DESCRIPTION AMOUNTSS
VEHICLE NO: SKV 8154R
To Supply:
Lump sum for repair cost 5,500.00
Plus T% GST 385.00
5,885.00

J - MART MOTOR PTELTD

|
¥
i
|

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE
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A & T CAR RENTAL PTE. LTD. c. feg no 201s00008m

BLOCK 119 ALJUNIED AVENUE 2 #01-24 SINGAPORE 380119

HP: 9681 3079 VRANo.: /41 /7
VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT
HIRER'S PARTICULARS S . VehicleNo: S1LH £7735 | Repiace Veh No
Namg! (as in 1/C) (Ca ok Wa Mileage Dut Milzage Out:
NRIC / PASSPORT No: soNqLTaz Make & Model. N Adto / Manual
Address (Res): _ 233 B ek East Aves !J-fx-‘i:f'- Wi - Group
&8 S- 30 (_{:S'_]lj__;) OUT: Date =013 l'l|". Al S AR 1 e
Name & Address of Employer HIRE / PERIOD EXPIRY f
COLLISION DAMAGE WAIVER Excess 2. [LU YES / ND
Oceupation Driving Exp PERSONAL ACCIDENT INSURANGE YES / NO
Driving Licenoe Mo [WL Type: Local | Imeimationat CHARGES
lssue Date Data of Birth: Daily E’ s ".Qn‘j per day g 14404
Tel! (0] [1:1] HP @s S
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS Monthly @ § o
Name: (as in 1'C) Acrea Baohae! "
= LTS o5 per hour
NRIC | PASSPOAT No S8 1NESL D
Address (Res): By A o R
COW s per day | month
Mmm-wnr@m Lfcyl / Intermational | PAI @ s per day / month
e Date: DaeofBn: Delvery Serice
i i e 2 SUB TOTAL § lq“l-h £
VEHICLE CHECK LIST PETROL LEVEL
@ REAR o | E [Qp |me]aa] F
EE - n E [lys|vz|ae] F
Eg EXTENSION
r.:w:: Collection Service
- Misc
g TOTAL CHARGES S | | 444¢, -
E% @ Rentad Out By
oo | .
o= Al 7
F FRONT TOP Q%Q ’/‘f{_‘
ACREGRONES CHECK Hirer's Signature / \l\‘
[ Ashray (1 Cig Lighter ] s/yre
[__1 STD Toois [ ] Jnck [ Hub Caps
EE= Addition Driver's Signature
[ ] Radio/Cass [ 1cp [ ] Canridges

| had read and agreed 1o the torma and condlfions on both sides of this agreemeant. If | have presented a charge/creadil card for payment, | agreed
that all amounts payable under this agreement and for parking and traffic infingements may be billed 1o that account and my signature above will
be considerad o have been made on the charga/credit card vouchar. All informations | had given A & T CAR RENTAL PTE. LTD. in connection
with this agreement is true

* IMPORTANT

1. ONLY FERSONS ABOVE 23 YEARS OF AGE WITH MOHE THAN 2 YEARS DRIVING EXPERSENCE. AUTHOREED. LCENSED AND SIGNIND THEE AGREEMENT MAY DRIVE THE VEHICLE

2 ALL PIRRING AND TRAFFIC VIDUATIONS AFE THIE RESPONSIBLITY OF Tril SRER. AN ACWINSTRATIVE CHARGE WILL BE LEVEED ON AN TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS REDWECTED

1 THE MIRER SHALL BE LIADLE FOA ERCESS CHARGES FOR ANY LATE AETURM AT THE RATE SHOWN FES 0L 0F FEA DAY INCLLISVE OF COW ANDUDH ) WHERE APPLICAHILE

i wam‘l TMWMHFDHTTDMH_MMTEHITM 2 BOHLY (RJLURSER A FOLICE BEPCAT MUAT BE WADE WITHIN 2 #0URS

4 GEMICLE SRR SR (e, AM0 WAY NOT BE DRIVEN OUT OF SINGAPDRE WATHOUT FRIOR COMSENT OF THE COMPSNY A & T CAR RENTAL PTE LT

FETURN OF YERRCLE  THE HIRER | DRIVER 16 REDUSHED TO SION ™ THE COLLIMN “SIGMATURE OF HIFEM | DRIVER™ FAILING WHICH THE MY AND TIME INSERTED BELOW SHALL BE
DEEMED TO) BE THE DAY AND TIAE THE VEHICLE 15 RETURNED T0O A & T CAR RENTAL FTE LTD AND THE SAME TMAll BF ACCEFTED AR CONCLUSNE MNCE OF THE SAME LND
BHALL NOT BE CHALLENGED OR DUESTIDNED OMN ANY ACCOUNT WHATSDEVER

DATEIN | TIMEIN |MILEAGE| CHECKED BY REMARKS

Jh‘)lliﬁ W am




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fasiiane

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING B —
[ Case  |Wotfied | Eat Submitten ) Assigren Adt) Mpt Ad) Submittag iln: Auth'ed | Status
|71 FE0 2019 a2 Isssso000 sssse000 | immfﬂw
Edit Reg | sam A gt | Eun Estmates | | view mpt | | cancel case |

Reference Clalm Detalls

|CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
NG KEAT LYE SLIM MEAT LYE. ID: 502328250

CHIN KWOK WAL [0 501196742

. 1 20/02/2019 07:00 - :59

TP / 096924086456 Poly/Caver | 1800070217 (Comprehensive)

Palicy No.
{Claimant )

Excess:
J-mart Motor Pite Ltd [HQ) Blk 5 Defu Lane 10, #01-576, 539186 Defu Lane - Tel: 83430934

. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 55-6418-3000 ... [Handled by Fooa, Chit Yan] Chityan.Foo@aig.com

|MT/00506044

Clalmant’s | irect Asin Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 65322888

insurees .1—'

(Aduster | LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handied by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 05/03/2015

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | compose case mait |
o AIG_SG (25/02/2019); Request To Upload TP GIA Report

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Sesech Tasks | Crante New Task | Complete ||

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
No results.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 7/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*SKVB154R (09692408645G)
[SMAS430Z]
TP
CHIN KWOK WAI
Feb 20 2019 7:00AM
[NG KEAT LYE @LIM KEAT LYE]
J-mart Motor Pte Ltd

Letters/Correspondences a 1 per page = |
Nc | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnall | Print
1 |(oram) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown O e
|Phatos/ Images |3 per page vl ]
[No_|Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 [12/03/15 08:44 | General View O | tooows | B

3 12/03/1909:44 | Genersl View 0 | wedws | 4

3 [12/03/1909:44 | General View 0 | s | B
4 112/03/19 09:44 | General View O wows | @
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[whir.ln No: SMA9430Z (Insd veh) Model: ERCEDES-BENZ E200 NGT
SKVE154R (TP veh) B (A)
| Date of Accident: | 201022019
Global Sum Settlement || [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimale s 13,693.33
Final Repair Cost 5 5.885.00
Loss of Use ‘5 days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) ' 5 1,12000| 8 days
LTA / GiA Search Fee 5 0.00
Others 5 0.00
;8
Final Settlemnent Sum ] 7.005.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No.
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: b ¢

BOLA Liability (%e) Assessed Liability (*): (%)

* Assessed Liability fo be filled only for chain coliisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Paymaent Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |J-Mart Motor Ple Ltd 5 7,005.00
2) '8

a7 May
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg v 1sseor1asn)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel' 6256-3561 Fax: GB44-8805 Email sur@ikkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCB/AIG18003351/APA302

Date: 07/052018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid  Palicy No: 1800070217
ﬁ':'f"‘“‘ Vehicle oive154R Insured Vehicle No : SMAS4307
Date of Loss: 20022018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 086524088450G
RIPT] 1 IF 1 1
Reg No: SKVB154R
Make & Model: MERCEDES-BENZ E200 NGT, 1.8 (A) Engine No: 27194130746320
Reg. Dale 11/08/2006 (Man. Year: 20086) Chassis No WDB2110422A953784
Colour: Blus Odometer 280225 km
Engine Capacity: 1796 cc
Marked Valua/New Car Price: NA
Sum Insured (S§) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable), Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-acciden! Condifion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 245/40 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 24
Front Left Side: Dunlop & mm Rear Lefi Side: Dunlop 8 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop & mm Rear Right Side: Cunlop 8 mm
The above values represent the remaming tyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 10,687.50 7,587.90 3,089 60 29.00
Miscellanaous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.110.00 1,680.00 430.00 20.38
Palntwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S85) 12,797.50 9,267.90 3,529.60 27.58
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 5,500.00
(S8) 12,797.50 5,500.00 7.297 .50 57.02
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 885.83 385.00 510.83 57.02
Nett Amount [55) 13.683.33 5,885.00 7.808.33 57.02
+ Car Rental (8.0 x S§140.00/day) (S$) 1,120.00
Nett Liability (S§) 7,005.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 21/022018
Date Inspected: 21/0272018 Inspected At J-mart Motor Pte Ltd (HQ)
Blk 5 Defu Lane 10, #01-578
Singapore 539186
Estimated Period of Repair: 6.0 days
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Adjuster;: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

NOTE This report reprasents our findings af ihe fme and place of inspecron amared horein. Such inspechon has been camed ouf o e besr of our
knowledge and ability but any other kabilly under any altar ciroumatances i eraby srpressly axcluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
101 *BOOTLID Buckled 222500FL *192300FL
2 1 *LOGO EMBLEM Necessary 48.00 FL “48.00FL
3 1 *KOMPRESSOR EMBLEM Necessary 106.00FL *106.00FL
4 1 ‘CC EMBLEM MNecessary 1M0.00FL  “110.00FL
5 1 *E200 EMBLEM Necessary T6.00FL *TE.00FL
B 1 *BOOTLID OUTER GARNISH Deformed 677T00FL *577.00FL
T *BOOTLID THIRD BRAKE LIGHT Not Necessary 235.00FL *-FL
8 1 *BOOTLID LOCK Damaged 180.00FL  *180.00FL
9 1 *BOOTLID WISTRIP Nol Necessary 185.00 FL *FL
10 1 ‘TAILLAMP O/S Cracked 1,090.00FL *S4500FL
111 *TAILLAMP GARNISH RH LH OIS Deformed 70.00 FL *35.00FL
12 4 "TAILLAMP GARNISH CLIPS 0OJS Necessary 48 00FL *10.00FL
13 1 *REAR BUMPER Distorted 1,78000FL =1,780.00FL
14 2 “REAR BUMPER CHROME LH RH Distorted ZT0.00FL *270.00FL
15 1 "REAR BUMPER CENTRE CHROME MNecessary 185.00FL  *1B5.00FL
16 2 *REAR EUMPER PAD RH LH Distorted B10.00F. *2B6.00FL
17 1 *REAR BUMPER CENTRE PAD Distorted S530.00FL *203.00FL
1B 2 “REAR BUMPER RETAINERS Not Necessary 220.00 FL *FL
1?1 *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bent 580.00FL *580.00FL
20 4 *REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Damaged (2 PCS ONLY) T2000FL  *380.00FL
21 1 *REAR BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER Not Necessary 78.00FL “FL
2 2 *REAR BUMPER HOLDER RH LH Necessary 2T000FL *270.00FL
23 1 "REAR BUMPER CENTRE HOLDER Not Necessary 225.00FL *FL
24 1 "END PANEL Dented 7T4500FL  *7T45.00FL
25 1 "END PANEL INNER GARNISH Deformed 142.00FL  *142.00FL
28 1 *REAR FENDER INNER TRIM RH Not Necessary 370.00 FL *-FL

F=Franchise part L=ListiemDaes
Sub Total (S$) 11,875.00 B.431.00
- List ltem Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S5) 1.187.50 B43.10

Total Parts (58) 10,687.50 7,587.90

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous ltems selecied.

Recommended Labour

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING Mew 1,000.00 BOD.0O
2  SPRAY PAINTING Mew 1,000.00 B0O0.0O
3 WIRING Mew 30,00 30.00
4  RUST PROOFING New B0.00 50.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 2,110.00 1,680.00
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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