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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owneer 1D Type: Company
Owner D 2T52K
(ST T | e ¢ = e SRl i |
Virhicie No SKMBATBG
Vehicle to be Exported Yes
Intended Deregistration Date 21 Feb 201%
Vehicle Make B.MMW
Vehicle Madel 5251
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year 2006
Engina Na, Da626316NS2B25AF
Chassis No VWBANESZ050CKT2472
Maximum Power Output 1460.0 kW (214 bhp)
Open Market Value: £58,430.00
Original Registration Date 2% Nov 2004
First Registration Date: 2% Nav 2006
Transter Count; 2
Actual ARF Paid: £44 27300

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount:

Forfelted

$0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category
COE Period(Years):
POP Paid
COE Rebate Amount
Total Rebate Amount:
The infermation contained herein is correct as at 21 Feb 2019

28 Nov 2025

E - Open Category
10

$56.053.00
£43,550.00
$43.550,00

OK



- Asher Sna !LKKAutn!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 12:30 PM

To: 'Foo, Chityan'

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your ref : 375691282656, ACCIDENT ON 21/02/2019 INVOLVING

SKX 5938E (OI) & SKM 6678G (TP)
Your ref : 375691282656
Our ref : CC6/AIG19003350/Aea3
Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT ON 21/02/2019 INVOLVING SKX 5938E (Ol) & SKM 6678G (TP)
We refer to the above matter.
The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
We seek your approval to offer repairer " EUNOS MOTOR SERVICE" at § 8.900.00 (all-in),

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) S 13,666.76 5 8,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $80) S 900.00 S 900.00 (9days x 5100)
Total $14,566.79  $ 8,900.00

For your approval in merimen please.

Thank You,

Besl Regords.
Asher Sng | Cose Hondler
LKK Auta Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 88416051 | email: gshenng@ikkgulo.com | fox: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Poya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408913)



Print Received Message

This mall is associated with :
*SKMGG6TEG (IT569128265G)
|SKXS93BE]

™
FUDAQ PETROCHEMICALS GROUP PTE LTD
Feb 21 2019 6:00AM

[Chay Yu Ting]
Eunos Motor Sarvice

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sant on 26/04/2018 15:19 PM.

From
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (S$8900.00) - SKMEET8G - Claim Handler: Foo, Chit Yan

\Approved:8900,00.




Asher Sna !I.HKAutu!

From: Asher Sng (LEKAUto)

Sent: Maonday, 11 March 2019 3:23 PM

To: ‘RINKACHAN@HOTMAILCOM'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 593BE AND SKM 6678G ON 21/02/2018

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19003350/Aead

11 MAR 2019

CHOY YU TING / CHAN KA KIN

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 5938E AND SKM 6678G ON 21/02/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @ lkkauto.com

.. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
{Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(AIG Asia Pacific — EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

|, etele et Pt Cocei e L7 (%he third party claimant®)
of /8 bak, 3okt Pd 3 x5 o - = (address),
owner of 1 &€ 74 (vehicle no.) hereby authorize

(“the workshop") to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or

rental and/or loss of use (“claim") for my vehicleno. _ ' = that was

damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on ' (date) along
AT ey e s R (location)

involving vehicle no/s_— " ' E_3 e D 754 & (“the accldent”).

| further authorize the workshop to settle the above mentioned claim In a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment furtherto settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in
favour of the workshop. |

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of llability basis insofar
as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s Is concerned.

Date this . dayof /. “ (month)20__ 7 (year)

b

Signed by “tha third party claimant® Signed by "the workshop”®



paner

RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asla Paclfic = EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

“Well __— (L& ] 1 Sraad = (‘the workshop®) hareby confim that wa/l
heve resched sn agreement with the appoinied surveyor of AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid,
o e e 1 e (name of surveyor”) with respect to the mount claimed for
o A o L (repmir costs), 85___ | (loss of usarental) S$____~  (search foes)
for vehicls me, " "© ' that was desmeged pursuant to tha accident which ocourmed
on_. 1 (dete) along b & Ml W W (locstien) Invelving
vehicle nofs_> [ [ & F kx Y

This |s pursuant to the inspection conduated on 2 02 = (data) ot “the workshep".
© Wa/l confirm thet we/) mre/am authorizad by the cwner e 4w (*third party claimant™)
of vehicle no_ - o - to make the cisim as sat out In the above parsgraph mnd we/l have full

autharity to settis the matter on his/her bahalf In & manner that we/| desm fit. We/l enciosa harein the latter of
authanty given by the third party clalmant’,

We/l further confirm that we/i will Indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pts, Ltd for all damages, loss andior
expenae that they will ar have already Ineurred (n the svent that *the third party claimant® sfter the abave said
ugrpament iocges & furiher ciaim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining i cests of
rapgirs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damagete < = (vehicle nc.) as & result
of the sceldent.

Wae/l confirm that the Rgreemant reached above Is in full and final settiement of any claim of “the third party
“‘uhlm:nf:sumnntlnm-mluunt-ndmmm‘rmhutu-mntlu reeched on & without prejudice and withaut
ldm!i_llun of [labllity basls,

Thl:nqrumunthwb}mmm:ppnuhncfsmnnmhwmmnsmmmhm have exclusiva
Jurisdication ever any dispute srising out of the sama.

Dated this __ — day of (month) 20 (year)

Signed by AlG appointed surveyor Chopped & Signed by "the workshop®

ENCEMTLS ) Y
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INVOICE
Speciaisn n Motor Car Repains. Servicins. & 3% = X R M 12 N? 42413
Car Air-Conditioners, Car Spray Painting,
Knocking ot Musarss s Crsoses— EUNOS MOTOR SERVICE

N.8. Prepare for ROV Inspection. Tl KA O Ten § S04
Tel: 67472033, 67480107, 67473418
Fax 67415197
RAeg. No. J36791/00C
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.,

M/5
11th. March '19
Owner: Fudao Petrochemicals group pte ltd., Fu?’%j No: GAUZU00E
Rurchese Qrder Moo
SKM6678G BMW 5251
Vahicls No: Ref. Our D/O No.
ITEM Price Per AMOUNT
NO QUANTITY DESCRIPTION Unit $ ¢
Accident involving vehicle SKM6678G and
SKX5938BE at Sengkang East Road (slip Rd)
on 21.2.19 06:35
Cost of repair $8000}00
(S. Doltars: Eight Thousand Only TOTAL > $8000.00

for EUNOS MOTOR SERVICE

g Ak

S

E.&A0.E
Received By AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Chegues 1o be made payabie to Eunos Motor Servica and marked AJC payes.

MN.B. Exly Remmitance will be much sppreciated.
Na official recaipt will ba ssued for all chaque paymeant uniess requested.



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fautinne

rEI.A.IH SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Cane Notified Est Submitied Adj Asmgned ]ld]_ﬂ_gl = Adj Submitted Ins Auih'ed ;5“11::
32 Feb 2019 21 Feb 2019 | 558,000.00 Pending for Survey
e 00:00 | $98,000.00 View Bpt Report .

Aeference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Irured: Choy Yu Ting. 10: 53634B10F

Main
PETROCHEMICALS . oo Wk
Claimant: FuoDao GROUP PTELTD, Co. Rag, Ne.: 190203752K

_ |23/02/2019 06:00 - 159
SKM6678G Date 0f LOSS: |48 Months and 23 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)] |

Policy/Cover | 2100443504 (Comprehensive)
TP / 375691282656 Note Mo.: | Coverage: 21/12/7018 - 20/12/2019

Policy No |
SKXSSIHE {Claimant): I GADADDCSE

Excesy: i

Repairer: | Eunos Motor Service (HQ) 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-64 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, 417863 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 6747 2033
mﬂ:‘ AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-8419-3000 ... [Handled by Foa, Chit Yan] Chityan Foo@alg.com
CAmants | AXA Insurance Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tl 6338 7288

Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... |Final Rpt due 05/03/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Wiew Al ] Compose Case Mall |

o AIG_SG_EXPRESS (26/04/2015): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$8900.00) - SKMEG678G - Claim Handler: Foo, Chit Y.
* AIG_SG(25/02/20159): Request To Upload TP GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All_| Search Tasks | Create new Task | complete |

Due Date  Priority Type TaskGroup  Subject  Handler  Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
No results

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 10/5/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Upioad Documents | Upioad Photos | Compose Mew Letter | Upioad vides | Upioas sudie |

Claim Documents

*SKM6678G (37569128265G)
[SKX5938E]
™

FUDADO PETROCHEMICALS GROUP PTE LTD

Feb 21 2019 6:00AM

[Choy Yu Ting]
Eunos Motor Service

Page 1 of 3

Letters/Correspondences 1perpsge  |v] O
No_|Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1| (Draft) Third Party Express Sattiement - Payment Breakdown [ BT
Photos/Images - Drerpope =] &
No | Relabel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1100319 1842 | General View 0  esws | M
2 1103191842 | Genersl View © | weaws | B
3 |11/03/19 18:42 | General View 0 | loadwc | &
la 1110319 18:42 | Genersl View 0 | weaws | B
S 10X/19 18:42 | General View O | weows |
6 1/0N19 1842 General View o © | oows | B
7 [11/03/19 18:42 | General View D | oadws | A |
8 [11/01/19 1842 General View © | sews | 2|
9 1019 18:4  General View © | wwe | &
10 [11/03/19 18:42  General View O | weiws | |
11 |1/01/19 18:42 | General View O | asrs | B |
13 |11/03/1% 18:42 | Ganeral View O waowe | 4|
13 10319 18:47 | General View ©  aawc | o |
14 [11/03/19 18:427 | General View 0 | wadies |
18 [10/03/10 16:42 | General View 0| wrc | A
16 |[11/03/19 16:47 | General View D i | A
17 [1/03/1918:42 | General View O | wedws | A
18 [11/03/19 18:47 | General View 0O wurs | &
19 [11/03/12 18:42 | General View O | weaws | BB
20 [11/03/19 16:42 | General View 0 | waawec | BB
21 [11/03/18 18:42 | General View © | e | A
22 [13/03/19 18:427 | General View 0 | weaws | B4
23 [13/03/19 16:42 | General View [ TR
24 |11/03/19 16:42 | General View 0| weaaws &
25 [10/03/18 18:42 | General View O | wadwc | B |
26 1L/03/15 18:47 | General View O | oews | 2 |
27 140319 16:42 | General View O v | B2
(28 |11/03/19 18:42 General View D | oadirc | &
;n L/03/15 18:42 | General View D | eades | A
30 |11/00/1% 18:42 | Relnspection Photo D | caaws | &
|31 |11/03/19 18:42 Reinspection Photo D | weaws | A
[:lz 11/03/19 18:42 Reinspection Photo D | edwvc | A
(33 110319 18:42 | Reinspection Phote O | edrc | B
{34 (110018 1842 | Reinspection Photo 0 | lead s

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 10/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 3
Ll.m;mum 1 per page E M
{No |Finalzed On LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print;
! = A
135 11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0O | wecwe | A
136 11/03/15 18:42 | Reinspection Photo o 0 | twwc | &
137 11/03/19 18:42 | Relnspection Photo O | weorvc | A
38 [11/03/19 18:42 | Rainspection Photo ©O | wuaws | B

38 |11/03/18 18;47 | Reinspection Phato 0 | 1ceawc | B
40 |11/03/19 18:42 Rainspection Phato 0D | sears | A
41 |11/03/18 18:42 | Reinspection Phote N O | Lo s
47 (11/03/19 18:42 | Relnspection Photo © | weaws | BB |
43 (11/03/19 18:42 Reinspection Photo | sadawc | A
44 11/03/18 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0O ledwc | A
45 |11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo © | eaws | BB
46 |11/03719 18:42 Reinspection Photo 0| coaws | B
47 | 10/D3/19 18:42 Reinspection Phato D | st | B2
48 11/03/19 18:42 Relnspection Phato D | loadwec | (A
48 11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Phato O | wawe | &
50 |11/03/19 18:42 Reinspection Photo ﬁ Load PG | A
S | 11/00/19 18142 Relnspection Phato 0D | waaws A
52 11/03/19 15:47 | Reinspection Phate @O | eaws | BB
53 |11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0 wwaws | A
54 11/03/18 18:42 | Reinspection Photo O | wasws | &
55 |11/00/19 18:42 Relnspection Phate D | wwadws | A
56 |11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo B | aaws A
57 | 13/03/19 18147 | Reinspection Photo 0 | sawrs | A
56 | 11/03/19 18:42 Reinspection Photo D | wadws | A
59 11/03/19 18:42  Reinspection Photo ——— O | wwews | B
60 |1103/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo O waors | B
61 11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo D leadwc | &
|62 |11/01/18 18:42 | Reinapection Phote O | eaws | B
63 | 11/03/1% 18:42 Reinspection Photo D | aaws | 4
64 |11/03/19 18:42 Reinspection Photo D | wwws | A
65 |[11/03/19 18:432 Reinspection Photo 0D | twdaws | #A
66 |11/03/18 18:42 | Reinspection Photo @ | osawc | B2
67 |11/03/1% 18:47 | Reinspection Photo 0 | weows | B
68 (11/03/19 18/47 | Reinspection Photo 0 cwws | M
69 [11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo - [ BITES [~}
70 |11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0| wirs | W
71 [1U03/19 16:42 | Reinspection Photo O | ears | B
72 [11/03/19 18:42 | Ralnspection Photo O wiws | 2
73 |11/03/18 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0| e | A
74 [11/03/1% 18:42 | Relnspection Photo 0| ears | B
75 [11/03/1% 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0| weaws | A
76 |[11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo @ | Load w6
77 |11/03/19 16:47 | Reinspection Photo 0 | wadwc | A
78 |11/03/16 16:42 | Reinspection Photo © | oeaws | B
79 |11/03/19 16:47 | Reinspection Photo O | wesaws | A
50 11/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0| i | A
81 11/03/1% 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0| edws | A
82 |13/03/19 10:42 Reinspection Photo 0| cearc | &
B3 11/03/1% 18:42 | Reinspection Photo D | Ladrc M |
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Documentation

|Letters/ Correspondences 1
(Ma_|Finaksed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) = F:mug rEu
(84 [11/03/19 1847 |Reinspection Photo 0| ads | 7
‘85 111/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo ‘_ Load G | B |
85 |11/03/19 16:42 Reinspection Photo O | waws | &
87 11/03/1% 18:42 Reinspection Photo O | wedws | 4
{88 [11/03/19 18:42 | Relnspection Photo 0O  iwews | B
B9 | 11/03/1% 18:42 | Reinspection Phato 0  eaws | A
90 |13/03/19 18:42 | Reinspection Photo 0 waaws |
91 ]‘ummn 18:42 | Reinspection Phato 0 s | HA
92 |11/03/12 1842 | Reinspection Phote o 0 | lsaaws | A
B
Print

Ho | Relabel f Reorder

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

! 15/02/19 20:55 | TP GIA REPORT Load PDF
2 11/03/18 15:24 | LETTER TO O1 Load FOF
3 10/05/19 D9:50 WORKSHDP INVOICE Load POF ]
il 10/05719 09:50 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM g Lo POF
|5 10/05/19 09:50 | Releass Voucher Load POF
|6 | 10/05/1909:50 | LETTERTO O1 3 Load PDF
[Ne |Finaitzed On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Ltd. (5G) Thumtbmnail| Print
1 25/02/19 1128 | O GIA REPORT g“_l.g.um
2 12/04/19 09:327 | LKK seek mandate Load PDF

Documents Checklist

' DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

esot | seve | pom |

| There are no docurnent checklists configured.

Show Remarks To: [ Handiing Insurer
Mote: Rambrks e DRVALE USRS yOU SNOW I 1D SEREF partiet
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|\fll'l.ll:l=l No: SKX5938E (Insd veh) Modael: MW 5251 2.5 (A)
SKMEET8G (TP veh)

| Date of Accident: |21/02/2019

Global Sum Settiement || [ ] Yes | [X) No

Repair Estimate 4 | 13,666.78

Final Repair Cost '3 B.000.00

Loss of Use - 800.00 9.00 days at $100.00 per day
Rental (if any) 4 0.00 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee '3 0.00

Others: ‘8§ 0.00

4

Final Settlement Sum :§ B,900.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO {Kindly indicate
balow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: PR

BOLA Liability. (%) Assessed Liability () (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain colfisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payea's Breakdown

1) |Eunos Motor Service 1 8,800.00
2) '3
10 May
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultanis Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Repart/ Bill [if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Ca Reg Mo 199807 188R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No: CCE/AIG19003350VAEA3Q2
Date: 10/05/20189
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid Policy No 2100443504
Geaimant Vehicle skmes78c Insured Vehicle No: SKX5938E
Date of Loss: 2110212018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: 3758812826506
ESCRIFTION TIFICATION I
Reg No. SKMBETEG
Make & Model: BMW 5251, 2.5 (A) Engine No: 04B26318N52B25AF
Req. Date: 29/11/2006 (Man. Year: 2006) Chassis No. WBANES2D50CK 72492
Colour: Black Odomater: 213938 km
Engine Capacity 2497 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S%) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla) Yes Engine Modification Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 275/30 R19 Rear Tyre Size; 275/30 R19
Front Left Side Michelin & mm Rear Left Side: Michelin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 6 mm
The above values represent the remaining fyne reads Goptn
[:D'&T OF GL_AIHS °n ) R_l_g_gll:gl_"ﬂl_ ﬁ_tgl]_ushr’s Difference Diff ‘H|
Parts 9.746.76 7,687.90 205886 21.12
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,920.00 2.300.00 1,620.00 41,33
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 13,666.76 9,987.90 3,678.86 26.92
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 8,000.00
Nett Amount (S§) 13,666.76 8,000.00 5666.7T6 41.46
+ Loss of Use (9.0 x S$100.00/day) (S$) 900.00
Nett Liability (S$) 8,900.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 21/02/2019
Date Inspecied: 21/02/2019 Inspected Al Eunos Motor Service (HQ)
1 Kaki Bukit Ave B, #01-684 AutoBay @
Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair 7.0 days
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE This report represenats our findings af fhe ime and place of inspection stafad femin. Such inspachion has been cemed oul 1o the best of our
hnowledpe and shilly but any ather labiity under any cther circumstances is hereby axpressly sxciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BOOT LID Dented 2,242 15FL “2.24215FL
2 2 *REAR BOOT LID HINGE Mol Necessary 237 B0FL *FL
3 1 *REAR BOOT LID LOCK Damaged 134 50FL *134 50FL
4 1 *REAR BOOT LID RUBBER Cul 104 20FL *194 20FL
5 2 *REAR FENDER LAMP Cracked 1,018 40FL *1,018.40FL
& 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 1422.50FL *1422 50FL
7 1 :PP%F BUMPER SENSOR Damaged (3 PCS ONLY) 947 40FL *T10.55FL
B 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH COVER Deformed 3355FL "33.55FL
B 1 *REAR BUMPER INNER CENTRE RETAINER Deformed 151.20FL *151.20FL
10 1 *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Benl §572.10FL *57T2.10FL
11 1 *REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR N/S Cracked T1.40FL *35.70FL
12 2 *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT MOUNTING Bent 455 20FL *455.20FL
13 1 *REAR END PANEL Dented 800.95FL “BOOG5FL
14 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Deformed 111.00FL *111.00FL
15 1 *REAR EXHAUST Benl 1484 82FS “200.00FS

(LOCAL REPAIR)
16 2 *REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE Mol Necessary 244 10FL “FL
17 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE Nol Necessary 50.00 FL “-FL
F=Franchisse part S=SpcNett LelisthemDisc

Sub Total (S$) 10,181.07 8,082.00

- List Item Discount on L ltems 5.00/5.00% (S$) 434 31 394 10

Total Parts (S§) 9,746.76  7,687.90
[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. f
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscallanecus items selected.
Recommended Labour
Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repalrer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO SPRAYING PAINTING AFFECTED AREAS New 1,500.00 1,000.00
2 TO DISMANTLE EXHAUST PIPE New 150.00 80.00
3 TO KNOCK ,STRAIGHTEN ALL NECESSARY PARTS New 1,800.00 1,000.00
INCLUDING ,CHANGING & REPAIRING OF ALL DAMAGED
PARTS
4  TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REVERSE SENSOR New 120,00 60.00
5  TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY New 150.00 60.00
6 TOPERFORM DIAGNOSTIC TEST New 200.00 100.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 3,920.00 2,300.00
[ Report was unsubmifted during this print-out |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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