
LOT : P riority :.ticitr.JIF.L / i.JRGeF;i
Reierence ilo :

Frcm (Ferson) :

Dsie/Tinre:

v Claim N0.

oT mstc

l'l OPS : Yes / l.Jo DOA:

MV:$

'LIEW CAR FRICE:S

TiFE: I'l cai / r'r. c)cre / Bus / van / Lo-ry i raii / priine Mover / Truck / rrairer oi,
Vehicle lrlo : i S qu{eA D.a.A/AsAt klz
l',4alie & l,4oc e l:

t



Veron Chen (LK](Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Friday,22 February 2019 9:04 AM
'Nor Azian Binte Noordin'; SUR

RE: Urgent: t\4v for SKJ9448A (DOA: 19/02/2019)

Dear Azian,

The market value of SKJ 94484 is $80K-$83K(Estimated) as at Feb 2019

Best Regards,

veron Chen I case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Nor Azian Binte Noordin < NorAzian-Noord in@sg. msig-asia.com>

Sent: Thursday,2l February 2019 6:41 PM

Subject: Urgent: MV for SKJ9448A (DoA: t9/02/20L9)

Dear all,

Please let us have the market value for the above car. Details ofthe car make and model is as per below.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Nor Azian Binte Noordin
Executive, Ctaims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 I Direct fax +65 6275 7402 | NorAzian Noordin@sq. msiq"asia. com

M 5IG

MSlc lnsurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Rafftes Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Buitding, Singapore 048581 I T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +6562256371 | Co.Reg. No. 200412212c I msie.com.se O @ @ S
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle



Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

sKJ9448A
Vehicle to be Exported

No
I ntended Deregistration Date
25 Feb 2019
Vehicle Make
B.IV,W.

Vehicle Model
328I SEDAN AT D/AB DSC HID NAV

Primary Colour
White
Manufacturing Year

2013
Engine No.

A5450442N20820A
Chassis No.

wBA3456090NR04606
Maximum Power Output
180.0 kw (241 bhp)
Open Market Value

$43,s03.00
Original Reg istration Date

' 28 May 2013

First Registration Date

28 May 2013

Transfer Count
0

Actual ARF Paid

$47,90s.00
lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility
Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

27 May 2023
PARF Rebate Amount

$33,s33.00
lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date
27 May 2023
COE Category
E - Open Category
COE Period(Years)

10

QP Paid

$66,701.00
COE Rebate Amount
$28,383.00
Total Rebate Amount



$61.916.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 2'1 Feb 2019



From:
Sent:
Subject:

Nor Azian Binte Noordin < NorAzian-Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com >

Thursday, 21 February 2019 6:41 PM

Urgent: MV for SKJ9448A (DOA:, 19/02/2019)

Dear all,

Please let us have the market value for the above car. Details of the car make and model is as per below.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Nor Azian Binte Noordin
Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 I NorAzian Noordin@sq.msiq-asia.com

MSIG

Registered Vehicle

00. f) h

MSIG lnsurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Buitding, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 62256371 | Co.Reg. No. 200412212G I msiq.com.se O @ 6 O
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

SKJ944BA

Vehicle to be Exported

No
Intended Dereg istration Date

25 Feb 2019
Vehicle Make

B.M.W.

Vehicle Model
328I SEDAN AT D/AB DSC HID NAV
Primary Colour
White
N4anufacturing Year

2013

Engine No,

A5450442N20820A
Chassis No.



wBA3A56090N R04606

Maximum Power Output
180.0 kw (241 bhp)
Open Market Value

$43,s03.00
Original Registration Date
28 Mey.2013 I
First Registration Date
28 May 2013
Transfer Count
0

Actuat ARF paid f !1f f_
b4 /,905.UU

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility
Yes

PARF Elig ibility Expiry Date

27 May zo23 ?Ir1 \ Y
PARF Rebate Amount t

$33,s33.00
lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

27'WY,M
COE Category

' E-OpenCategory
COE Period(Years)

10

QP Paid

$66,701.00
COE Rebate Amount
$28,383.00
Total Rebate Amount
$61,916.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Feb 2019
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