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Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

QOffice 50 Bukit Batok S1 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapore 59578
Workshop: 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-08 Midview Building, Singapore 658578
Tet 6316 1131 HP: 9730 2017 Fax: 8318 7050
42, Sungel Kadut Ave, Singapore 729885 Tel . 83260523
[ Emall Adress . woonmeng @singnat.com.sg )
Co Reg No. 200603678M GST Reg No. 20-0603678M
Estimate
TP CLAIM
To AIG Asia Pacufic Insurance Pte Lid
Motor Claims Dept Date : 18 Mar 18
Dear Sirs - Fax : 64193727
: TE MER! B -Y
cCiD VING YP3534B B
[TEMS DESCRIPTION Qry PRICE
\  Rearsliding doornis.  / o o pc § 241718/
2 Rearsiiding door lower gamishnis. < (/T tpe § 378.98 /
3 Rearmudguardnis. ¥ F _ pc § 2160684 «
4  Rearmudguard lowergamnishnis ~ 7] e $ 238.01 ~
5 Rearlampnis. . (7] 1pc _§ 328.30 /
§ 55321
=} Rear lamp meal -~ ﬂ'ﬂ s 450,00 /
Sum Carried Forward § 598211
f
P - £ 44
e LKK Aylo Consultants hence nolify
T o 1 the Rapairer of the following:
. p « To resurvey balore/aNer sotay Denting
- 78§94 « To diapiny damaged oadis) dunng resurviy
e ) , « Parts prces e subect 1 confirmation
Iyt [ £d » The) party surviry @ 00 8 “Wifiout Projodcs” e
. » by gl mocSoailon( | M Blowed
i o 07 » Suppeementacy Bemie) st be resorveryed pad
Bl R -‘:.' 911 s subject 10 i aoprowsl from Insurance Company
- Sigratre
D

e rii
WYRE

)

7096 7



Sum Carried Forward
La r Cha & Misc

To remove, repair, replace & install
damaged parts,

To R & R wiring.
To paster logo { reflector )

To putty & spray painting

Total

All prices quotad are subjected lo 7% G5T

This is a computer generated document. No signature is required.

$§ 5098211

$ 150000 198 7
$ 8000 (0~

$ 1,800.00 [j007

5 1,200.00 {I_; #

$ 1056211 ([0~
o4



rI-I'enE Sew Sow

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday. 4 March 2019 8:21 AM

To: Heng Sew Sow

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: YP 3534B *Our Ref: CC6/AIG19003326/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC

4672U(AIG) AND YP 35348 ON 23/11/2018]

Your Ref: YP 35348 Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/AIG19003326/pa3

Dear Sis/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 45672U(AIG) AND YP 35348 ON 23/11/2018
we refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties. the liability is clear
and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client's vehicle.

The final repair cosl is subjected o the consistency of the doamages according to the nature of the
occident,

And the days of LOU/S LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor,

Flease note that all finalisation subject insurer’'s approval,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter is purely an a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settiemeant.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/Influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Stew (LKK)
Best Regards, gjyszHT

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Iﬁ'ﬁ“f/ﬁ’#@fkf% Com

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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> Back to OneMotoring

BARENTIE DOnhain Emewumy

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Calour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.;

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 14 Mar 2019

h“ﬂ““--hﬂ-wrw-wuﬂ-mw'lqu-m =2 SFh

OK

Company
B601N

Y¥P3534B

No

14 Mar 2019

MERCEDES BENZ

SPRINTER 516CDI 3665 HIGH ROOF A/T ABS
White

2014

65195533532535

WDB90646532P286997

$52,058.00
21 Jul 2016
21 Jul 2016
0
$2,603.00

No
$0.00

20 Jul 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

£48.002.00
$35.278.00
$35278.00

'ﬂ\r"."'-""‘lwl Th R W H-ll‘_ll.l'-'l A B

"



Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

#

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnetcomsg>
Sent: Wednesday, April 17, 2019 11:05 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Estimate of YP35348 ON 23.11.18

Dear Steve

Accept your offer S 4800.00

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow [Ms)

Waoon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

-—QOriginal Message-——

From: Steve Chen [LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lk com>
Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 10:53 AM

To: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Estimate of YP3534B ON 23.11.18
Dear Sir,

As per our communication the finalize $4800. 5 days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

—---0riginal Message-—

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:wo ingnet.com.s
Sent: Wednesday, April 17, 2019 10:46 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Estimate of YP35348 ON 23.11.18



Hsiao Tuna [I.I(KAutnz

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.comsg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 1:44 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto), Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto)

Ca Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: Accident involving YP35348 & GBC4672U ON 23.11.18 *** LKK REF:
CCB/AIG19003326/pa3 (LOD )

Attachments: 20190417131813,pdf, 20190417131802.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam

Attached LOD FOR YOUR REFERENCE.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)
Woon Meng Motor Pte Lid
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 11:28 AM

To: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng(@singnet.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving YP3534B & GBC4672U ON 23.11.18 *** LKK REF:
CCH/AIG19003326/pal

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that Ol has reported. Please refer to the below O1's sketch plan and statement.
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DESCRIBE CINCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
On FADAY FUF WG TME 5 300~ ] WAS Buri T BATeX BT 1)
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Please arrange for TP survey.

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742
3197,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiEwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(40849:33)

-—-Original Message--—-

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng/@ singnel.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 February, 2019 12:21 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a/@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident involving YP3534B & GBC4672U ON 23.11.18

Dear Sir'Madam
We refer to the above accident

Kindly be advised that we will be assisting our client, owner of vehicle no:
YP3534B, to submit a third party claim against your insured vehicle. We would like to proceed with direct
settlement.



Please arrange for your surveyor to liaise with us for an inspection on our client's Vehicle at your earliest
convenience.

Location : 50, Bukit Batok St 23 Midview Building # 01- 06 ( S ) 659578 Thank you.

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)
Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050



Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Address 50 Hukit Batok Street 23 801-06 Migview Bullding, Singapore 58578
Tal «BEBI16Y121 / +AEE3 1681161 FAX =BE8167050

WDUH ME"E Wemshop 42 Sunge Madu! Ave Smgupons T29666 Tel 8583628523

Email woonmang@liungsal com sg)

Co Reg No 20000358T8M GST Reg Na 20-D803STEM

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 17 Apr 2019
Chartis Building

78 Shenton Way

#07-16

Singapore 079120

Attn:  Motor Claim Dept
Dear Sirs
DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR REPAIR OF MERCEDES BENZ SPRINTER 2.2. YP3534B

RE = ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP3534B & GBC4872U
ALONG 153 BUKIT BATOK WEST BRANCH ON 23/11/2018

We have been given the full authority to act on behalf of AETOS Security Management Pte Lt
registered owner of motor vehicle no | YP3534B, which was involved and
damaged in the above accident,

We were told that the said accident was caused solely due to the negligence
of your insured driver. Therefore, we are compelled 1o claim against you

for the losses incurred as follows -

1) Cost of repairs. $ 5,138.00
2) Loss of use for 6days @250.00perday. $ 1,500.00
3) LTA search. $ 2.00

TOTAL AMOUNT:- $ _6638.00

We have told our client that this matter is sirictly on a DIRECT SETTLEMENT
basis. If you do not dispute liability, please arrange to let us have your payment
for the sum of S/D: SIX THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED AND THIRTY EIGHT ONLY
in full and final settlemeant for our client’s claim.

We enclose herewith the GIA report, Surveyor's report and the invoices for your
attention

We look forward to your early favourable reply

Chaong Hﬁn ¥



Hsiao Tunﬂ !LKIfAutu}

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 March 2019 12:44 PM

To: "AJMALGROUP@SINGNET.COM.SG'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 4672U(AIG) AND YP 3534B ALONG/ AT BLK 152 BUKIT

BATOK 5T 11 CAR PARK ON 23/11/2018

01 MARCH 201%

M/S AJMAL TRADE MART PTE LTD
Dear Sir/Madam,

Your Rel: GBC 4672V

ur Ref: CC4/AIG19003324/ ;.’-

=

We refer to the above subject matter. We write o inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party claim against your palicy.

We have received a claim from YP 35348 against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver's favour as your driver
reversed and hit onto third party vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable
setflerment with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to turther discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and setilement, please
contact us wilhin 10 days from the date of this letler,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due 1o this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-9108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, roz-25 | 5{(308033)
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING ){f’}be ¥ GCYf P21
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Owner of Motor Registration ND:%DW do hereby

Authorise M/S WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD as my agent

and representative to correspond in, negotiate and settle, on my
behalf, my claim against the parties involved in the above-mentioned
accident. In the event of final settlement, we agreed that payment be
make payable to M/S WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD.

Date & signature




RELEASE VOUCHER

a Pacific - Expre arty C
“We/l, WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have

reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$%$5,800.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no, YP 3534B that was damaged pursuant to the accident

which occurred on 23/11/2018 (date) along 153 BUKIT BATOK WEST BRANCH involving
vehicle no/s GBC 4672U.

Thus is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 14/03/2019 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authonized by the owner AETOS SECURITY MANAGEMENT
PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. YP 3534B make the claim as set out n the

above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalfl in a manner that
we/l deem fit. We/l enclose heremn the letter of suthority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damape 1o YP 3S34B (vehicle no.) as a result of the aceident

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute ansing out of the same.

Datedthis __ 0 (day)of [~/ (month) 20__|_(year)

Signed by appointed surveyor




m Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50 Bukst Satok Streel 23 #01-08 Mdview Buidng, Singapore B5B57TH
Tl «B5E1161121 ) «85631611581 Fax +B58316T050

mn" HEHE Workshop 42, Sungel Kadul Ave Singapone T2658 Tal 8583620527

Email woonmengDuingnal com sg)

Co Reg No 2008036 TEM GST Reg No  20-0603678M

TAX INVOICE NO: WM2018/C0427 1/apr/TP
Date : 17 Apr 2018

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

Chartis Building

78 Shanton Way

#07-18

Singapore 079120

Attn  Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs

RE : REPAIR COST FOR MERCEDES BENZ SPRINTER 2.2 - YP3534B
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP3534B & GBC4672U ON 23.11.2018

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE
1 Lump sum repair cost $ 4,800.00
'S  4,800.00
ADDGST7% 8 33600

S/D :Five Thousand One Hundred And Thirty Six Only.

Thisg is a computer-generated document. No signature is required
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday o Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MAMNAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-028037
Dale of Reguest: 21/02/2019 Your Rel Na: Online Purchasa
Woon Meng Molor Pta Lid
50 Bukit Balok Strest 23,
#01-06 Midview Building
Singapore 659578
Dear SifMadam,
Enguiry Data 21022019
Enquiry By Heng Sew Sow
TP Vehicla No. GBC46T2U
Acoidant Date 2311172018
Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Pariod of Insurance Insurar Tel, No.
GBC46T2ZU AIG Asia Paclfic Insurance Pte. Lid. 2307T2018-22/07/2018 65-6418-3000

Thank You.

Tha images provided to you are taken from the arginal reports forwarded to the centre by the meambars of the General Insursnce Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no lkability whatsoever for any loss or damage arnsing out of
or in connection with the repans or their images

This is a computer genarated document and requires no signature.

hitps:isingapore. menmen comiclaimsindes ofm Musebor=MTRsasdluseaction=0sp_geninvip&refid=20839118CF|D=48T244404CF TOKE M =341 11
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

E EI IEI u LI‘ & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
IHSUME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am lo S5pm

GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Raf No GR-18-028037
Date of Requast: 211022019 Your Ref No. Online Purchase
Woon Mang Motor Pta Lig
50 Bukit Batok Streel 23,
#01-06 Midview Bullding
Singapore 650578
Daar SirMadam.
Enqulry Data 210272019
Enquiry By Heng Sew Sow
TP Vehicle No. GBC4BT2U
Accident Date 231112018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You

This 15 a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO | | Cash [ | Chagus

hips Msingapors, metmen comiclaimeindes ofmMusebor=MTRsaslluseacton=dsp_ganinviplrafid=20683911 ACFID=487244404CFTOKEN=2aH

~
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiame

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
|  Case HNatified Est Submitted Ad] Assigred Ad) Ape Ad] Submittad Ins Auth'ed Status
|24 Nov 2018 ol el 5$4,800.00 | 5$4,800.00 Pending hor Burvey
__Hﬂm . Edit Ad) Mpt I | Edit Extsmaiss I_,.__m_“_ L Il:ﬂ_l

|cLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
|Insured AJMAL TRADE MART PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No. 200816753C

| Main
MANAGEMENT %
Clamant; | AETOS SECURITY PTELTD, Co. Reg. No.: 200208601N

|Vehicle Reg [23/41/2018 16:00 - :58

[ YP35348 ID"“ of LOSS! | 38 Manths and 2 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
\Cawm Type: | TP / 956660986356 PaicyCRvet 12100308079 (Comprenensive)

E'll'!hﬂl Heg.

Mg GBCABT2U
(Insured): |

Palicy No
{Claimant): D-1B0B8436MFTVI LS

- i S
Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd (Bukit Batok) 50 Bukit Batok Strest 23, #01-06 Midview Bulding, 659578 Bukot Batok - Tel: 6316
1131

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel! 65-6419-3000 . [Handied by Foo, Chit Yan] Chitvan Foo@aig.com

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222311

Repairer:

Handling
Insurer:

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Vigw A J Composs Case Mail [
There are no maill for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™~ view Al | Search Tasks | Create new Task | comptete |

Duse Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
| No results.
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Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: GBC4B72U (Insd veh) Model: ERCEDES-BENZ
YP3534B (TP veh) RINTER 516CDI 2.1 D 4325

| Date of Accident: |23/11/2018 L AT TURBO (A)

Global Sum Setttement | | [X] Yes [ [ 1 No

Repair Estimate $ 11,301.46

Final Repair Cosl . § 5,800.00

Loss of Use s 6.00 days at $120.00 per day

Rental (if any) 5 days

LTA | GIA Search Fee -

Olhers. 5

5
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) 5 5,800.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 ¥YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicale

balow)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No.
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: Aep s
BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (*) (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled anly for chaln colisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Woon Meng Motor Ple Lid 5 5,800.00
2) 5
3) ' §
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 14 May
2019
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Repart/ BIll (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoresne 1assor1esa;

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-BB05 Email: sur@lkkaulo. com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCB/AIG18003326/EPA3Q2

Date: 14/05/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd.  Palicy No: 2100308078
piaimant Vehicle yp3s348 Insured Vehicle No: GBC4672U
Date of Loss: 231172018 Nalure of Claim; TP Claim No. 95668098635G
IFl F
Reg No: YP3534B
MERCEDES-BENZ SPRINTER §16CDI. 2.1 D 4325 )
Make & Model EL AT TURBO (A) Engine No: B65195533532535
Reg. Date 211072016 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: WDBB086532P286557
Colour: White COdometer; 153544 km
Engine Capacity 2143 cc
Market ValueMew Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§5): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification; No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fronl Tyre Size: 1071108 Rear Tyre Size: 185/75 R16C
Fronl Lefl Side: Yokohama T mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 7 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama T mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 7 mm
The sbove valuss represant the remaining fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS B - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %]
Parts 5,982 11 347622 250580 41,89
Miscellanaous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4 580.00 2,530.00 2,050.00 44 78
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 10,562.11 6,006.22 4,555.89 43.13
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 4,B00.00
(S$) 10.662.11 4.800.00 5.762.11 54 .55
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 739.35 336.00 403.35 54 55
Nett Amount (S5) 11,301.46 5,136.00 6,165.45 54.55
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x 55120.00/day) (S5) 720.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5§) 200
Natt Liability (S§) 5,858.00
Global Sum Settlamant (S5§) 5,800.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 14/0372019

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/52019
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Date Inspected: 14/03/2018 Inspected At Woon Meng Motor Ple Lid (Bukit Batok)
50 Bukit Batok Street 23, #01-08 Midview
Building
Singapore 659578

Estimated Period of Repair 5.0 days

Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE Manager: CHEW HSIAO TONG

NOTE: This report represants our fingings &l the Sme and place of ingpection stated herein. Such inapochion has been camed ouf fo the bast of our
knowiedge and ability but any ather fadiily under gy ofher croumstances (s fereby expressly srcluded
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 “REAR SLIDING DOOR NIS Dented 24171BF  "241718FL
2 1 *REAR SLIDING DOOR LOWER GARNISH N/S Cut 378 9BF *378.98FL
3 1 *REAR MUDGUARD N/S Repair 216064 F “FL
4 1 *REAR MUDGUARD LOWER GARNISH NIS Cut 23801F *238.01FL
5 1 *REAR LAMP N/S Cut 328 30F *328 30 FL
68 1 *REAR LAMP MEAT Dented 450 00FS  *450.00FS
F=Franchisa part S=Spcheatl L=LintitemDisc
Sub Total (S§)  5,982.11 381247
- List Item Discount on L tems 0.00/10.00% (S$) 0.00 336.25
Total Parts (S§)  5,982.11 3,476.22
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 14/5/2019



Adjuster Repornt

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscallaneous [tems sslectad.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE ,REPAIR ,REPLACE & INSTALL DAMAGED New 1,500.00 T00.00
PARTS

2 TO RER WIRING New 80.00 30.00

3 TO PASTER LOGO (REFLECTOR) MNew 1,800.00 1,200.00

4 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING New 1.200.00 800.00

Gross Labour Cost (5%5) 4,580.00 2,530.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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