Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Saturday, 2 November 2019 10:18 AM

To: Jason

Cc: Lina Pang; Jenny Law

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKF 611A (OUR REF: CC6/11119003295/Ugb3q2) *** ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SHD 3793J & SKF 611A ON 19/02/22019 ***

Attachments: Ol SCENE PHOTO.pdf

Your Ref: SKF 611A Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11119003295/Ugb3g2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 3793J (1ll) & SKF 611A ON 19/02/2019
We refer to the above matter.

We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not liable for the accident. Though Our
Insured changed lane, his vehicle did not touch the your client’s vehicle. Your client’s vehicle also do not show
any clear damages. There is a clear gap between Our Insured’s vehicle & your client’s vehicle as per scene
photo.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client’s
matter.

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary

From: Jason [mailto:Jason@fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2019 11:09 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>; Jenny Law <jenny.law@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKF 611A (OUR REF: CC6/11119003295/Ugb3qg2) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 3793J & SKF
611A ON 19/02/22019 ***



Without Prejudice

Dear Cecilia,
That is the only video we had.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Tang Jun Zhong

Choo Motor Spray Painter

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-39 AutoBay

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 8443
ChooMotorClaim@gmail.com

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 22,2019 7:42 PM

To: Nancy Lam <nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: YOUR REF: SKF 611A (OUR REF: CC6/11119003295/Ugb3q2) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 3793J) & SKF 611A
ON 19/02/22019 ***

Dear Nancy,
Our principal would like to request for complete Video Footage to review the matter.
Kindly email us a copy.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



