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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 28 February 2019 9:10 AM

To: chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: SKD995C  LIMIT COST OF REPAIR

Dear Mr Chong, 

  

As per our communicate a moment. The above vehicle repair limit is $100k. 

  
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Thursday, February 28, 2019 8:50 AM 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) 

Subject: FW: SKD995C LIMIT COST OF REPAIR 
  

  

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chong Min Seng [mailto:chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 2:38 PM 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong <liu.chun.cheong@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong 

<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Simon Koh Eng Aun <simon.koh.engaun@simedarby.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SKD995C LIMIT COST OF REPAIR 

  

Dear Shirley, 

  

As we speak on the phone please let us know the limit cost to repair for SKD995C  thanks  

  

  

Warmest Regards 

  
Chong Min Seng  

Bodywork Customer Service Advisor 
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Vantage Automotive Limited 

305 Alexandra Road 

Vantage Automotive Centre 

Singapore 159942 

Regent Motors Limited (FORD)  

AutoFrance ( PEUGEOT )      

Email : chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg 

HPl   : 8383 3190 

  

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February, 2019 11:31 AM 

To: Chong Min Seng <chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SKD 995C OD (MSIG) DOA 10/01/2019 

  

Dear Min Seng, 

  

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKD 995C (Excess $ 1,000/-). 

  

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 

to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

  

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before 

completion of the repair. 

  

*Our client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

  

  

  

  

  

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


