Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 3:41 PM

To: ‘Jenny Toh'

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH YP275T & YOUR INSURED YK2212M ON
01/02/2019

Attachments: TP GIA REPORT.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle YP 275T at M/s Sng Ah Tee Motor & Panel Service Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP’s GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 2:43 PM

To: 'Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh@qgbe.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH YP275T & YOUR INSURED YK2212M ON 01/02/2019

Resend
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.



G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh@gbe.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 1:34 PM

To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH YP275T & YOUR INSURED YK2212M ON 01/02/2019
Importance: High

Our ref: VC012296
Dear Sir
Kindly survey the third party claim:-

Insured: YK2212M

TP vehicle : YP275T

Date of accident : 01/02/2019
Contact : as below

Kindly acknowledge receipt.

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 12:17 PM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH YP275T & YOUR INSURED YK2212M ON 01/02/2019
Importance: High

HiJenny,

Please arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey this vehicle.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin



SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAH

MOTOR & PANEL

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 11:50 AM

To: janice@sngahtee.com

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH YP275T & YOUR INSURED YK2212M ON 01/02/2019
Importance: High

Our ref : VC012296
Dear Janice
We refer to the above captioned matter.

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list:

COMPANY

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte
Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
Surveyors.

From: Joyce Foo

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 10:33 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH YP275T & YOUR INSURED YK2212M ON 01/02/2019
Importance: High

VC012296 - FYA



Thanks & Best Regards

Joyce Foo
Senior Assistant - Claims
QBE Asia Pacific — Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
Phone: +65 6477 1184

Email: joyce.foo@gbe.com
Visit us on the web at www.gbe.com.sq

Wecreate insurance solntions for

Blglneeﬂng & .
Cmslruction

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 9:56 AM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@gbe.com>; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@gbe.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH YP275T & YOUR INSURED YK2212M ON 01/02/2019
Importance: High

Hi All,

We refer to the above & wish to check liability for this case & arrange for survey this vehicle YP275T.
The vehicle CURRENTLY IN our workshop.

Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAH

MOTOR & PANEL

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-
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or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.
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