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Cearnsunllar ts

Pte Lid Company Registration No. 199807198R

SEUHEAVE 1, #0225 PAVA URIINDUSTHIAL PARK, SINCAPORE 208933 TEL (63 H25HASAH] FAX D (06S) HI5040]5

Your ref: To Be Advised Date: 200022019
Our ref: CC3/CTLI9003222/T1fb3

The Motor Claims Department
M/ CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (3) FTELTD

Dear SirMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHC7169R

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 15.02.2019
at the premises of M/s_ComfortDelGro Engineering Ple Ltd_and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 2,053.62
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,322.40
"Check” Items Amount 1 5% 561.22
Markel Value LS5 -
LTA Reimbursement Value 55 -
Nett Value + 5% -

Description of Damage: ————
The vehicle sustained damages at the C 1
Rear Portion o

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours [aithfully.

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE C hi_wa Tﬂli [‘H‘\:‘.]L P[P)

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER: 7010070
ADDRESS : CITYCABPTE LTD

383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717
65551 188

JOB | PARTS DESCRIPTION

PART

REEQUISITION

JOB NGO

REGN NO
MILEAGE

MAKE

MODEL

DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

Date: 15.02.2019

Time: 15:54:18 =
Page: I|:}, 1 ‘-’:}
—

305269089
SHCT169R
COO0000000
HYUNDAL

[-40

25.08.2016
15.02.2019 12:40
15.02.201%

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

0001 04-01-0103-0579-G  REAR BUMPER 1 553.00 20,00 44240 ﬂtﬂ"/
0002 04-01-0103-0738-G  REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER 1 22800 2000 182.40 A{Q -
0003 04-01-0103-0739-G  REAR BUMPER SPONGE 1 103.50 20,00 B2.80 H':: X

0004 04-01-0103-0740-G

0005 04-01-0101-0111-G

0006 09-01-9999-0068-A

REAR BUMPER BEAM
REAR BUMPER CLIPS

REVERSE SENSOR

JOB NATURE

T
| 42840 20,00 34272
10 2200 2000 17.60 AL
1 13570 288 13570 4 NN

SUB-TOTAL

20000 wip

(000 20-05 Rear Fender Adv Sticker RH/LH
D001 20-05 Rear Bumper Adv Sticker 50.00 ol
0002 PB PANEL BEATING 240,00 2/&.)“
0003 5P SPRAYPAINT CHARGE 240.00 IZJUW
0004 L R/1 REVERSE SENSOR 120,00 ]7,4,;
—
2
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LT}) Date: 15.02.2019
Time: 15:54:18 -"'g

REPAIR ESTIMATE (qumiﬂﬁpﬂ“ﬂ}w}l(y Page: 2 l 3 L_

|-

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JIOB NGO
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGN NO
ADDRESS : CITYCABPTE LTD MILEAGE
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL
H5551 188 DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN

JOB | PARTS DESCRIPTION

ACCIDENT DATE

305269089
SHCTI69R
0000000000
HYUNDAL

1-40

25.08.2016
15.02.2019 12:40
15.02.2019

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DIS5C% AMOUNT

L

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE :

SUB-TOTAL : 85000

TOTAL : 2,053.62

—

AUTHORISED : YES / NO
SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE :




ComiortDelGro Enginss=ring Ple Ltd

OMFORIDELCRO i
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Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: William Tan Thoo Seng <williamtan@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 12:04 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: RTA involving vehicle nos, GBH 9776U, SHC 7169R and other on 15.02.2019

Without Prejudice.

Dear Poh Kin

We are glad to accept your global offer.
Kindly forward your D.V. .

Thank you.

Best Regards

William Tan

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off : 62148737 | Fax: 62141843

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 11:32:41 AM

To: William Tan Thoo Seng

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RTA involving vehicle nos. GBH 9776U, SHC 7169R and other on 15.02.2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC3/CTI19003222/T1fb3
Your Ref: CCo020431/ SHC?].EQR{'WTI:SI:I

Dear William,
We refer to above matter.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $1,990.00(all in) on this matter.

kindly confirm acceptance.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 11:33 AM
To: William Tan Thoo Seng
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RTA involving vehicle nos. GBH 9776U, SHC 7169R and other on 15.02.2013
Importance: High
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE A5 TO COSTS
Dur Ref: CC3/CTI19003222/T1fb3

Your Ref: CC9020431/ SHCT169R/ WT(st)
Dear William,
We refer to above matter.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $1,990.00(all in) on this matter.

kindly confirm acceptance.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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SeERE% WETT Sope the Earthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
o 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Ne. 18-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref : CC3I/CTI19003222/T1fb3n2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 076909 Pate: 27:05:2019 M”H“MI'H'M'W
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBH 9776U Veh. Inspected SHC 7169R
Policy No. DMCVSN1835081800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D200820 Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 15/02/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KMHLE41UMGU093566 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 250452 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOoOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  15/02/2018 Inspection Date 15/02/2019
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 5089689
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo: 199607198R GST Reg, Mo, 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 71638R

Page Mo.:1 of 1

aty Description of Parts Sondifion;. | UMAle P | OUFAER Sted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 553.00 553.00
1|REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER DEFORMED 228.00 228.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 103.50 .
1|REAR BUMPER BEAM NOT NECESSARY 428.40 -
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 22.00 22.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -266.98 -160.60
1,067.92 542 40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 135.70 -
2|REAR FENDER ADV STICKER RH/LH (SN) NECESSARY 200.00 200.00
1{REAR BUMPER ADV STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
385.70 250.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING, 240.00 200.00
SPRAYPAINT CHARGE. 240.00 200.00
R/l REVERSE SENSOR. 120.00 30.00
600.00 430.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,053.62 1,322.40
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 1,322.40]
Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18003222/T1fb3n2
P (e
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor




