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Adn BE Pre Lid Campany Registratian No. 195607 158R

) U AVE L MZ-25 PAYA UIUINDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 2 1065) 625635610 FAX 7 omn#) 61364315

Yourrei:  To Be Advised Date: 22022019
Owr ref: CC4LPCI19003217/Ihh3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. YM7683T

We reler to the above malter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 21.02.2019

at the premises of M/s _Lee Kuan Hwa Motor Service and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 10,763.00

Revised Estimate Amount : 8% £,948.00

"Check" ltems Amount . 88 3R5.00

Market Value : 5§ -

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 855 -

Nent Value : 8§ -

Description of Damage: -
The vehicle sustained damages al the
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6 days

Yours faithfully,

HWEE JIE
Licensed Appraiser



LEE KUAN HWA MOTOR SERVICE
Mailing Add: 39, Westwood Ave Singapore 648719
Workshop: 24, Sungei Kadut Street 4 Singapore 729050
Tel: 6269 9192 Fox: 6269 2239 H/P: 9631 1712

Business Reg. No: 364635000

Ms: Lonpae Insurance Bhd
300, Beach Road

#17-04/07 The Concourse

Singupore 199555

Motor Claim Depi

Vehicle number :

Make/Muodel
Date of accident :
Claim Type

Accident involvin

YM 7683 T
MITSUBISHI FES3BEOSRDEA
14.02.2019

TP Claim

Re: Estimate
! 2 pes Rear door due - §
2 2 fpes Rear door hinges LH RH (e 1) 21 ~@5? *v 5
3. 2 pes Rear door lock LHRH  Sve = $
4 2 pes Rear lampLHRH _ ctap -~ 5
5 ) pes Rear lamp bracketCI)5ot 87 7 5
o 1 pe Rear box lower panel ~ Rapmie € 3
7. 1 pe Rear cross member PO - 5
8 I pe Rear number plate §EF - 5
9 I pc Rear number plate lamp ¢ 8 / s
10. ¢ Zpes Rear box side bar ( Big )N RH —Lapaee PUW g
I 1 pe Reur box side bar ( Small ) LHE BT .- $
12 | pe Rear bumper N¢F -~ 5
13 2 pes Rear bumper bracket LHRH 81 ~ $
14 8 pes Rear box U clip bracket LHRH B9/ $
5 I pe Rear box front cross member NN ¥ 5
16 1 pe Alr filter pipe RH Qs s
Sub-Totl $
t 4L #4401

LEE KUAN HWA MOTOR SERVICE -

30 Westwooo Avenug, Singapom 84871

TEL

£759 9182 FAX: 6368 2236 HIP; 0811 1

Pags 10of 2

Date 19:022019

1 60 O -
300,00 ==
400.00
360,00~
120.00-
300,060
450,00~

30.007
28.00
60,00 =00
280.00-
400,00+~
200,00+
400,00+
500.00
385.00

6,553.00



LEE KUAN HWA MOTOR SERVICE
Mailing Add: 39, Westwood Ave Singapore 648719
Workshop: 24, Sungei Kadut Street 4 Singapore 729050
Tel: 6269 9192 Fax: 6269 2239 H/P- 9631 1712
Business Reg. No: 364635008

Mi/s: Lonpae Insurance Bhd
300, Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse Date 19,022019
Singapore 199555
Motor Cluim Dept
Vehiele number : YMT7683T
Make/Model MITSUBISHI FES3BEOSRDEA
Date of accident : 14.02.2019
Claim Type = TP Claim
inv T GBA 440 J along Boon W ]
He: Estimate
To Wiring Services s ¥o 20000
To Remove & Refix Rear Box Labour Charges S ‘Yog 80000
To Change Rear Box Cross Member § RoaBOPUO -
To Repair & Replace Labour Charges Ine>$S |IM00-
To Logo Writing 5 260.00 .~
To Putty & Spray Painting SCun 85 ~
Tostal S 10,763.00
Yours Faithfully,

Hueg  Jia ~Llek

4L FA 4N o214
LEE KUAN HWA MOTOR SERVICE
19, Westwood Aveénue. Singopore S48T18
. = Lfs
TEL: E280 9102 FAX 8285 2206 HiF 983 ﬁ nolly ‘v‘lj'.r.
A1 the Repairer of the lollowing:

» T retstedy Catormafom 1priy plentng
« T gy Samaged parils) Qung ey L=

» Party prer are vateect i confirmahon
& Theaa pamy Borvmy 5 o @ “HiThous Pregdon” bk
» b g Pl e 1) ) oeed

 Sunpaprnrary iemi)| masl be resureryed g0d
o nutyect 1o e acgrowal o msurance Compary

Acinowsetged by Pagare
Sgrawry:
Dnie:

Page2aofl



Shu Pei (LI(I(Autnz

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 4:03 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAUtD)

Co MT_Claim_SG; Admin A, Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Qur Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021426 Acciden involving YM 7683 T & GBA 440 J along
Jalan Boon lay Way on 14.02.2012 _ [External Confidentiall

Attachments: GBA440) 140219.PDF

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Shu Pei

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
TEL_:_E&S} 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all C#w3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties anly,

From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto,com)

Sent: Friday, 22 February, 2019 3:49 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021426 Acciden involving YM 7683 T & GBA 440 ] along Jalan Boon lay Way on
14.02.2019 . [External Confidential]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle YM 7683T at M/s Lee Kuan Hwa Motor Service on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler In-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.



Thank yvou,

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LEK Auto Conaultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupelkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 10:43 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: "MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com»; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE; Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021426 Acciden involving YM 7683 T & GBA 440 ) along Jalan Boon lay Way an
14.02.2019 . [External Confidential]

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshaop, repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pssignments@lkkauto com | fox; 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408093%)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.cam]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 9:14 AM

To: Lee Kuan Hwa <kuanhwa@singnet.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments@ikkauto.com;
Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021426 Acciden Involving YM 7683 T & GBA 440 ) along Jalan Boon lay Way on
14.02.2019 . [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Without Prejudice

Dear Siew Chen

You may liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability.
2



Dear Catherine/Nivitha
FYA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext, 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

| —
—_—t

The all {%% ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Lee Kuan Hwa [mailto:kuanhwa@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February, 2019 9:09 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Acciden involving YM 7683 T & GBA 440 ] along Jalan Boon lay Way on 14.02.2019 .

Dear Gerald Poh,
Our vehicle; YM 7683 T
Attached the GIA report.

We refer to the above matter and please be informed that we are making T.P claim against your insured GBA
4401

Kindly create o T.P claim for this case
Please advise on the officer-In-Charge & Liability
Kindly arrange survey for this case

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Siew Chen

Lee Kuan Hwa Motor Service
39, Westwood Ave,
Singapore 729050,

Tel: 6269 9192 Fax: 6269 2239
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: B256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg Mo 189607188R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607T106-R

Affiliated to Federation Internafionala Des Experts En Automobile

300 BEACH ROAD

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Ref : CC4/LPC12003217/Jab3n2

r - 1
#17.04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 e 22102018

[MIREAT

Code : LPC2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBA 440J Veh. Inspected ¥M TEB3T
Policy No. 219V C05001635 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 1911919V C05/021426 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From ONG LI LI Assign Date 20/02/2018
r Vehicla Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI FEE3 c.c 2977
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. FEB3BEA10621 Colour WHITE
Odometer 422190 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |7.00-16 SWALLOW T mm
L/H Front Tyre |700-16 SWALLOW T mm
R/H Rear Tyre |7.00-16 SWALLOW 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |7.00-18 SWALLOW 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date 14/02/2019 Iln:pnr:ilan Date 21/0212019
Survey held at 24 SUNGEI KADUT ST. 4
Repairer LEE KUAN HWA MOTOR SERVICE
Sa. Remarks
A)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b, Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR

6 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uts Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ute Industnial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6258 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 190807108R GST Reg. No 19-0607108-R Page Mo 1ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YM TG83T
-
ay Descripin o Part Conditon | et B | O e
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
Z|REAR DOOR BUCKLED 1,600.00 1,600.00
6|REAR DOOR HINGE LH RH BENT (2 PCS OMLY) 300.00 100.00
2|REAR DDOR LOCK LH RH SERVICEABLE 400,00 -
Z|REAR LAMP LH RH CRACKED 360,00 360.00
1|REAR LAMP BRACKET LH BENT 120.00 120.00
1|REAR BOX LOWER PAMNEL TO REPAIR SEE 500,00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR CRDSS MEMBER DENTED 450,00 450.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE DEFORMED 30.00 30.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP CRACKED 28,00 2B.00
2|REAR BOX SIDE BAR (BIG) LH/IRH N/S DENTED 600.00 300.00
1|REAR BOX SIDE BAR (SMALL) LH BENT 280.00 280.00
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 400.00 400.00
2Z|REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH RH BENT 200,00 200.00
B|REAR BOX U CLIP BRACKET LH RH BENT 400,00 400.00
1|REAR BOX FRONT CROSS MEMBER NOT MECESSARY 500.00 -
1|AIR FILTER PIPE RH NOT NECESSARY 285,00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - 42680
6,5563.00 384120
LABOUR
TO WIRING SERVICES. 200.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR BOX LABOUR 800.00 400.00
CHARGES.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BOX
LOWER PANEL
TO CHARGE REAR BOX CROSS MEMBER 800,00 400.00
TO REPAIR & REPLACE LABOUR CHARGES 1,300.00 1.000.00
TO LOGO WRITING 260.00 280.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 850.00 600.00
4.210,00 2.740.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,763.00 £,581.20

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC19003217/Jeb3n2




' 7d 74

ot

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC19003217/Jeb3n2

Page No.2 of 2
5,250.00

&Y T~

ONG HWEE JIE HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

MECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THEID PARTIES - This Regar is msds soisly (or the ues snd benelit of the Client naened on the from pags of this Repart




