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Veron Chen !LHHAutn!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Woednesday, 23 October 2019 4:31 PM

To: jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg; Taufikh (LKKAuta); Admin A

Ce: eva kok@eurokars.com sg; janicesyn@porsche com.sg; rickteo@eurokars.com.sg;
SUR

Subject: RE: Finalization SKQ28B CT1 TP

Dear Jessica,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed COR: $23,706.12 before GST
09 repair days

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall ;suri@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | (408333}

From: jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg <jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 21 October 2019 11:25 AM

To: Taufikh [LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: eva. kok@eurokars.com.sg; janice.syn@porsche.com.sg; rickteo@eurokars.com.sg
Subject: RE: Finalization SKQ288 CTI TP

Dear Taufikh,
Hope this email finds you well. | am writing to you for follow up with the finalization.
| am hoping we could finalized this case.

Please let us have your confirmation,

Thanks & Regards,
Jessica

From: Jessica Harry Shastri

Sent: 17 October 2019 2:48 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@|kkauto com=; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>: Janice Syn <janice.syn@porsche.com.sg>; Rick Teo




<rickfeo@eurokars.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalization SKQ28B CTI TP

Dear Taufikh,
Please find our Ammended computation attached for your agreement.

COR: $23,706.12 before GST
09 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for liability/wait for
survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Appreciate your confirmation for this case.

Thank you very much.

Regards,

Jessica Shastri

Admin Executive — Insurance Claims

27A, Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

Dir: +65 6331 0691 Fax: +65 6331 0690 Email: jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg
Website: www.eurokarsgroup.com

Fram: Jessica Harry Shastri

Sent: 14 October 2019 2:45 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A’ <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Eva Kok <eva kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Janice Syn <janice syn@porsche com.sg>; Rick Teo

<rickteo@eurokars.com.sg>
Subject: Finalization SKQ28B CTI TP

Dear Taufikh,
Please find our computation attached for your agreement.

COR: §22,299.53 before GST
09 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for liability/wait for
survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Appreciate your confirmation for this case.

Thank you very much.

Regards,

Jessica Shastri

Admin Executive — Insurance Claims

27A, Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

Dir: +65 6331 0691 Fax: +65 6331 0690 Email: jessicahsaleurokars com.sg
Website: www.eurokarsgroup.com




STUTTGART AUTO PTELTD

27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 609042 .
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS

o Y | —— 1 —— s S | =——

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd NAME : Mr Lim Heck Leong WP : 4261
 Arvane A, #1600 Springoest Towsr ADDMTSS 9 Sannett Anad EXCESS :
hgapere 079909 Singapore 465TEA DATE: 13.00 7015
ATTN. : MAOTOR CLAMS TEL:
FAX -
VEHNO ; sKQ288 DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON WA | 63310883
CHASSIS NO - WPOZZZSTZGLO0ZI2T  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM "
MODIEL : Panamera Editon DATE REG.: DEOL 016 IPOLICY NO. :
SATURE OEWORKS
8/NO Parts Desucription
ary REVISED PRICES
1 |neas suMPER 1 PI0-505-951-03- dy .~ |s  amn
2 |REAR BUMPER | LOWER SPOILER | i PITD-S0%-811-01-1ED ‘W{ 7 1 1840
3 |vau PiEE GARNISH LK 1 P70-505-837-00- 160 e 143.30
s [T PIPE GARNISH RH 1 PS70-505-§38-00-1£0 s 14330
s |munp vEr s PE59-190-191-30 ak $ 22.00
¢ |nean poos 1 $S70.532.011.01.GAV bt~ |s  33eea0
7 |REAR DOOR SEAL KR 1 PA0-536-535-04 avi = |s 8230
& |REAR DOOR SEAL FAT 1 £970.536-531.03- - $ 2450
& |DOOR THIM UMIT BOLT [ PHES-07 352030 ouniell E .20
10 _|wasker s P999-025 12330 il s 18.20
11 |P970.536-531-01-/(570-536-53100) ADDITIO 1 PI-536-53102- REPEATID | S 84,50
12 |INSULATION DOOR 1 PYG7-537-551-00- [l ) 2240
13 |acTivATOR 1 POO0-O43-305-31- ?w—"\ 5 179 60
14 |DOOR WEATHER STRIP 1 PI70-536-275-01- e~ | g 28180
16 |STONEGUARD FILM LW i PETC-530-825-03 Al - $ 107.00
16 [une sont L POD-555-201-04-G2 Ky S 170830
17 _|RuBBER P 1 PS70-855-£01-01- 100 A | ¢ 1330
1E [SIDE SRt INSERT 10 PE55-507 911 40 il § 1200
19 |SPLASH SHIELD 1 P970.504 133.03- L 39770
10 |DISC WHEEL 1 P370-362-160-08 882 M |s  amew
21 _|BUND RIVET 3 $999-190-188-30- el s .00
TOTAL PARTS $ 127180
LESS 10% 5 L7318
TOTAL PARTS COST § 1145862
\abeur Description
L |70 REMOVE / SEPLACE LH REAR DOOR. SIDE SIORT & REAR BUMPER & TO REPAIR LW REAR FENDER v | s4Le |s 5.240.00
AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT. 1y be] A
B s i3 fen ’ +
3 |10 RESPRAY LH REA DOOR. SIDE SAIKT & REAR BUMPER & Li REAR FENDER VI HeENe s 280000
5 |10 CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. A 7 13 250 00
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= L= =
§ | BOARRALEISC TYRE 285/40 ZR1Y T o 3"}){ k 980 00
5 |10 MOUNT 1 PC SPORT RIM AND CONDUCT WHEEL BALANCING. I [ T 120,00
& |10 CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY & CONDUCT FULL WHEEL AUGNMENT. S 51 SR 680.00
7 |70 TRANSFER THE DOOR MECHANISM. A $ 780.00
& |70 CHECK FLECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. A [ R [ 200.00
8 |10 REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACTIDEN] KEPAIR WORKS. B NETT - |8 £00.00
10_|SUNDRIES. o w2 g sa.00
TOTAL LABOUR s $  14.700.00
TOTAL PARTS $ - |8 11asss2
ora. T, S€5- 3] s . s  sises2
LESS EXCESS 5 - |5 -
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS s
|GsT 7% 5 i -
|eraND TOTAL s - s 3
EiniiERY & , '
THIS 1S ONLY AN ESTIMATE FROM VISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD THERE ‘i*j:h Ak [ﬂ'L‘f 1N |
8 MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF ALPAIRING.YOU WILL )&\ I
BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING CARRIED OUT.

ol /(1 € [4e
TAXE NOTE THAT SHOULD YOLJ DECIDE NOT TO PROCEED WITH THE REPAIRS, &
QUOTATION FEE OF 540000 WILL BE AFPLY AS ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOURS INVOLVED

oo, paink
N SOURCING FOR PARTS PRICE AS WELL AS LABOUR CHARGES. ﬂ“""t‘) o f
8-

N G |headies
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STUTTGART AUTO PTE LTD

27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 609042 (1) ELROKARS |
— e e = e — = FINALIZATION COST OF REPAIRS
China Taiping Insurance (5) Pte Ltd !m: Mr Lim Hock Leong WP 42623
3 Anson Rd, W16-00 Springleal Tower ADDRESS : 9 Sennett Road EXCESS :
Singapare 072909 Singapore 456784 DATE: 13.02.3019
ATTN, : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL:
FAX
VEM NO ! SKQ28B DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : EVA 63310683
CHASSIS NO : WPOZZIST2GL002227 MILEAGE : [TYPE OF CLAIM : iF
MODEL : Panamera Editlon DATE REG.: 0R.01.2016 |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
S/ND Parts Description
ary REVISED PRICES
1 |REAR BUMPER 1 FO70-505-951-03- $ zamrro)s LITAT
2 |REAR BUMPER | LOWER SPOILER | 1 P970-506-611-01-1E0 s 92040 | 5 529,40
3 |TAIL PIFE GARNISH LH e | P970-505-837-00-1ED 5 14330 ) 5 14530
4 [TAL PIPE GARNISH AH 1 PG70-505-838-00-1£0) $ 14330 | '3 14330
5 |BLIND RIVET 4 POS9-190-191-30- $ 2200 % 2200
& |REAR DOOALH 1 PO70-532-011-01-GRV 5 3,396.40 | § 3.396.40
7 |REAR DOOR SEAL RR 1 PIT0-536-535-04- 5 20| 5 92 20
& |REAR DOQRSEALFAT | PIT0-536-531-02- 5 ga.s0| 5 84.50
9 |DODR TRIM UNIT BOLT 8 PE95-073-920-30- 5 7720 | 5 27.20
10 |WASHER 8 POOG.025-123-30. $ 19.20 | § 18.20
11 |Po70-536-531-01./(970-536-53100) ADDITIO 1 §70-536-53100 REPEATED | % B4.50
12 |INSULATION DOOR 1 PIR7-537-551-00- 5 2240 | 5 22.40
13 |ACTIVATOR 1 PO00-043-305-31- 5 - s 179.60
14 |DOCOR WEATHER STRIP 1 PE70-536-275-01- 5 ZELE0 | 5 18180
15 |STONEGUARD FILM LH | Po70-532-835-03- s 10700 | § 107.00
16 |SIDE SKIRT 1 P970-558-201-04-G2L H 1,708.30
17 |RUBBERLIP 1 PO70-555-601-01-1E0 5 730 S 7330
1B |SIDE SKIAT INSERT 10 POIG-507-911-30- 3ro0| s 32.00
19 |5PLASH SHIELD 1 P970-504-133-03- 5 197.70
20 |DISCWHEEL . PO70-362-160-08-882 § 2.700.00 | § 2,708.00
21 |BUND RIVET 3 ' P299-190-188-30- 5 £00 | § 6.00
TOTAL PARTS 1036170 (8 13 731 B0
LESS 10% 103617 | 5 1,273 18
TOTAL PARTS COST 932551 | § 11.458.62
Labour Dﬂ:ﬂ!“ﬂn
1 |TDREMOVE / REPLACE LH REAR DOOR. SIDE SKIAT & REAR BUMPER & TO REPAIR LH REAR FENDER 5 546000 | § £.240.00
AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.
2 |TORESPRAY LM REAR DOOR, SIDE SKIAT & REAR BUMPER & LM REAR FENDER, 5 405000 | § 4,800.00
3 |TD CARRY-QUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. 5 25000 | 5 25000

Fage 1of 2




70 AEFLACE 1 PC TYRE. 285/40 ZR19 5 784.00 | % 980.00
TO MOUNT 1 PC SPORT RIM AND CONDUCT WHEEL BALANCING. - 12000 | 5 12000
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY & CONDUCT FULL WHEEL ALIGNMENT 4 GEO.OD | 5 GRO.00
1O TRANSEER THE DOOR MECHANISM. 4 78000 | 5 TEO.00
10 CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING - 200.00 | 5 200.00
TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS. -] 60000 | 5§ &00.00
SUMDRIES. H 5000 |5 50.00
TOTAL LABOUR $  12974.00 | § 14,700.00
[TOTAL PARTS H 5,325.53 | § 11,458.62
TOTAL $§ 199518 16,158.62
LESS EXCESS ] - |5
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS 5 11,199.53
GST TH H 1,560.97 | § -
GRAND TOTAL $ 1386050 | 5 -

NUMBER OF DAYS: 9 WORKING DAYS(EXCLUDE WAITING FOR SURVEY AUTHORIZATION, PARTS, SAT,SUN & PH)

Pagezel?




STUTTGART AUTO PTELTD

27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 609042 (&) ELROKARS R
FINALIZATION COST OF REPAIRS
China Talping Insurance (5) Pte Ltd MNAME : Mr Lim Hock Leong WP 42623
3 Anson Ad, #16-00 Springleal Tower ADDRESS : 9 Sennett Road EXCESS :
Singapore 079903 Singapore 466784 DATE: 13.02.2019
ATTM. ¢ MOTOR CLAIMS TEL:
FAX :
VEH NO sKQ2s8 DATEIN ¢ CONTACT PERSON : EVA 6331068
CHASSIS MO ¢ WPROZZIZ9TIGLO02227 MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : TP
MODEL : Panamera Edition DATE REG.: 0#.01.2016  |POLICY NO. :
_NATURE OF WORKS,
5/NO Parts Description
any REVISED PRICES
1 |REAR BUMPER 1 P§70-505-951-03- ] .ITLTO | & 227210
2 |REAR BUMPER [ LOWER SPOILER | 1 P970-505-611-01-1E0 5 a4 | 5 829.40
3 |TAILPIPEGARNISHLH 1 P70-505-837-00-1€0 $ a0l 143.30
4 |TAIL PIPE GARNISH RH 1 P970-505-838-00-160 $ 14330 | § 143.30
5  |BLIND RIVET 4 P999-190-191-30 ] 200 5 2200
& |REARDOOR LH 1 Pa70-532-011-01-GRV 5 339640 | & 3.396.40
7 |REAR DOOR SEAL RR 1 PI70-535-535-D4- 5 92301 5 911
8 |REAR DDOR SEAL FRT 1 PG70-535-531-02- 5 BA50 | 5 #4.50
o |DOCR TRIM UNIT BOLT B F599-073-920-30 $ 2720 | % .20
10 |WASHER B PE949-025-123-30- 5 13.20 | 5 19.20
11 |Po70-536-531-01-/{970-536-53100) ADDITIO 1 970-536-53100 REPEATED 5 84.50
12 |INSULATION DOOR 1 PO57-537-551-00 H 2240 | 5 22.40
11 |ACTIVATOR 1 POOC-043-305-31- 5 - 17960
14 |DOOR WEATHER STRIP 1 P9 T0-536-275-01- 5 28180 | 5 I81.80
15 |STOMEGUARD FILM LH 1 PeT0-532-825-03- ] 107.00 | & 107.00
16 |SIDE SKIRT 1 PA70-559-201-04-GZL H 1.708.30
17 |RUBBER LIP 1 PE70-559-501-01-1E0 § 7330 | 5 73.30
18 |SIDE SKIAT INSERT 10 P999-507-911-30 32.00 | 5 32.00
19 |SPLASH SHIELD 1 PoT0-504.133-03- 5 3157.70
20 |DISC WHEEL 1 P970-362-160-08-887 2,700.00 | § 2,709.00
21 |BLIND RIVET ] | Pgog- 100-188-30- 600 | § .00
SLIPPLEMENTARY PARTS (e
1 |REAR DOOR PROTECTIVE FILM LH 1 P970-536-283-01 40.50 | 5 40,50
2 |DOOR INSULATION LOWER 1 PYT0-536-561-01 24.60 | & 44,50
TOTAL PARTS 1044630 | & 12 R16.90
LESS 10% 104468 | 5 128169
TOTAL PARTS COST 940212 | % 11,535.21
AiRgur Oescriptign
1 |TO REMOVE / REFLACE LH REAR DOGR, SIDE SKIAT & REAR BUMPER & TO REPAIR LH REAR FENDER g 546000 | 5 5,240.00
AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.
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2 . |TO RESPAAY LH REAR DOOR, SIDE SKIRT & REAR BUMPER & LH REAR FENDER. - 405000 | 5 4,800.00
3 |TOCARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION, 5 25000 | § 250.00
4 |TO REPLACE 1 PCTYRE. 285/40 ZR19 5 FEA.00 | 5 GRO.0D
5 |10 MOUNT 1 PC SPORT RIM AND CONDUCT WHEEL BALANCING. 5 12000 | § 120.00
B |TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY & CONDUCT FULL WHEEL ALIGNMENT, 5 G80.00 | 5 680.00
7 |TO TRANSFER THE DOOR MECHAMNISM 5 TRODO0 | & T80.00
B |TD CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. -3 200.00 | & 200.00
9 |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS, 5 00,00 | & B00.00
10 |SUNDRIES. 4 5000 |5 50.00
|SUPPLEMENTARY LABOUR
1 |TO REPAIR LH REAR ARCH PANEL AREA AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT H 78000 | & 780.00
2 |TO RESPRAY LH REAR FENDER ARCH PANEL H S50.00 | & £50.00
TOTAL LABOUR $ 14,304.00 | § 16,030.00
TOTAL PARTS % 9.402.12 | & 11,535.21
TOTAL § 23,706.12 )% 27,565.21
LESS ENCESS g ]
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS ] 23,706.12
GST 7% $ 1,659.43 | § .
GRAND TOTAL $ 25,365.55 | § -

NUMBER OF DAYS: 9 WORKING DAYS|EXCLUDE WAITING FOR SURVEY AUTHORIZATION, PARTS, SAT, SUN & PH)
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STUTTGART AUTO PTELTD
27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 609042

SUPPLEMENTARY
China Talping Insurance {S) Pte Ltd NAME : Mr Lim Hock Leong WP 42623
3 Araon Rd, #16-00 Springleal Tower ADDAESS 9 Sennett Road EXCESS :
Singapore 079909 Singapore 466784 DATE: 15.10.2018
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL:
FAX :
VEH NO : 5KQ288 DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : EVA | 63310683
CHASSIS NO : WPOZZZS72GLO02227  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : L
MODEL : Panamera Edition DATE REG.: 08.01.2016 |POUICY NO. ;
NATURE OF WORKS
5/NO Parts Deseription
ary REVISED PRICES
1 _|REAR DOOR PROTECTIVE FILM LH T P§70-536-283-01- rdar 40.50
2 |DOOR INSULATION LOWER 1 || PA70-536-561-01- e I 4460
L |
TOTAL PARTS % 85.10
LESS 10% 5 B.51
TOTAL PARTS COST $ 76,59
Labour Description
1 |TO REPAIR LH REAR ARCH PANEL i 5 780.00
AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.
2 |TO RESPRAY LM REAR FENDER ARCH PANEL v’ $ 550.00
TOTAL LABOUR £ - 5 1,330.00
TOTAL PARTS 5 - |3 76.59
TOTAL 5 = |3 1,406.5%
LESS EXCESS $ - |5 -
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS s -
GST 7% - - |5 =
GRAND TOTAL 3 - 1% -

1 THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE FROM VISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD THERE
BE MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF REPAIRING,YOU WILL
BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING CARRIED OUT.

2 TAKE NOTE THAT SHOULD YOU DECIDE NOT TO PROCEED WITH THE REPAIRS, A
QUOTATION FEE OF 5400.00 WILL BE APPLY AS ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOURS INVOLVED
IN SOURCING FOR PARTS PRICE AS WELL AS LABOUR CHARGES.

3 THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE BASED ON PARTS AVAILABILITIES AT CURRENT LOCAL SINGAPORE
WAREHOUSE, IF THERE IS A NEED TO INCLUDE AIRFREIGHT PARTS , WE WILL INFORM DULY,

Fm!q]'l




Adjuster Report

Page | of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno 1assoresn
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkaulo.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/CTIB003214/T1VD3N2
Date: 24/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling China Taiping Insurance .
Mt (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Policy No: DMPCSN1801021800
Claimant Insured
Vehicle No : o Vehlcle No : SLNG258T
. Nature of Claim
Date of Loss: 31/01/2018 Claim: ™ No: SNM18D200585C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKQz28B
Make & Model: PORSCHE PANAMERA V6, 3.6 PDK ES (A) Engine No: 0113m
Reg. Date: 08/01/2016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No:  WPOZZZO97ZGLO02227
Colour: Black Odometer: 12260 km
Engine Capacity: 3605 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (55): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 255M45R19 Rear Tyre Size: 285/40R19
Front Left Sida: Pirelll 6 mm Rear Left Side: Pirelll & mm
Front Right Side: Piredli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli & mm
The above values represeni the remgining fyre irsads depfh
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Ditt %
Parts 12,565.21 10,236.12 232908 18.54
Miscellansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 15,000.00 13.470.00 1.530.00 10.20
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (58) 27.565.21 23,T06.12 3,859.09 14.00
+GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 1,920.56 1,650.43 27013 14.00
Nett Amount (S$) 29,494.77 25365.55 4,129.22 14.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 21/02/2019
Date Inspected: 26/02/2019  Inspected At: Stuttgart Auto Pte Lid (HQ)
ZTA Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042
Estimated Period of Repair; 9.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE- This report represents aur findings at the fime and place of inspection stafed herein, Such inspection has been carmed cut fa e best of our
krowledge and ability but any ather izbily under any other crcumztances is hereby sxpressly excluded.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 24/10/2019



Adjuster Report
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REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

|P|rt Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 24 Oct 2019)

Parts: 144 PORSCHE PANAMERA V6 3.6 PDK E5 (A) (Calalogue:Merimen Singapore 1,0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no prini-code for SKQ288)

Validity: These estimates are valid only If they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: llems/values not in referance catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PariNo. Particulars Condition Repairer’s Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 227270FL *2,27270FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER (LOWER SPOILER) Cut 92940FL *92940FL
3 1 *TAIL PIPE GARNISH LH MNecessary 143.30FL  *143.30FL
4 1 “TAIL PIPE GARNISH RH Bent 143.30FL  *143.30FL
5 4 *BLIND RIVET Necessary 22.00FL *22 00FL
2} 1 *REAR DOOR LH Bent 339640FL *3,396.40FL
7 1 *REAR DOOR SEAL RR Necessary 92 20FL 92 20FL
8 1 *REAR DOOR SEAL FRT Necessary 84 50FL *B4 50 FL
9 a *DOOR TRIM UNIT BOLT MNecessary 27 20FL 2T.20FL
i0 A8 *‘WASHER Necessary 19.20FL *18.20FL
11 1 *P9T0-536-531-01-/(970-536-53100) ADDITIO Repealad 84.50FL -FL
12 1 *INSULATION DOOR Necessary 22.40FL *22.40FL
13 1 *ACTIVATOR Mot Necassary 179.60FL FL
14 1 *DOOR WEATHER STRIP Necessary 281 80FL "281.80FL
15 1 *STONE GUARD FILM LH Mecessary 107.00FL  *107.00FL
16 1 *SIDE SKIRT Repair 1,708 .30 FL *-FL
m o *RUBBER LIP MNecassary 7330FL *T330FL
18 10 *SIDE SKIRT INSERT MNecessary 32.00FL *32.00FL
1M 1 *SPLASH SHIELD Mot Necessary 397.70FL ““FL
20 1 *DISC WHEEL Dented 2,709.00FL *2,709.00 FL
21 B *BLIND RIVET Necessary 6.00 FL *6.00FL
22 1 "SUNDRIES Necessary 50.00 F5 *50.00FS
23 1 *TYRE 285/40 ZR19 (80%) Cut G80.00FS *7B4.00F5
24 1 *REAR DOOR PROTECTIVE FILM LH Necessary 4050 FL *40.50 FL
25 1 *DOOR INSULATION LOWER Necessary 44 BOFL 44 60 FL
F=Franchise parl. S=8pcNeil. L=LisilamDisc
Sub Total (S$) 13,846.90 11,280.80
- List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S$) 1,281.69 1,044 .68
Total Parts (S§) 12,56521  10,236.12
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Adjuster Repont

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour
Mo  Particulars

Labour ltems

1

10

TO REMOVE/REPLACE LH REAR DOOR,SIDE SKIRT &
REAR BUMPER & TO REPAIR LH REAR FENDER AREAS
AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT

TO RESPRAY LH REAR DOOR,SIDE SKIRT & REAR
BUMPER & LH REAR FENDER

TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION

TO MOUNT 1PC SPORT RIM AND CONDUCT WHEEL
BALANCING

TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY & CONDUCT FULL
WHEEL ALIGNMENT

TO TRANSFER THE DOOR MECHANISM

TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER
FUNCTIONING

TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR
WORKS

TO REPAIR LH REAR ARCH PANEL AREAS AFFECTED
BY THE ACCIDENT

TO RESPRAY LH REAR FENDER ARCH PANEL

Gross Labour Cost (S5)

Lab.Type

Mew

Mew

New
Mew

New

Mew
New

MNew

MNew

Mew

Page 3of 3

Repairer's Amount
6,240.00 5.460.00
4,800.00 4,050.00

250.00 250.00
120.00 120.00
680.00 680.00
780.00 780.00
200.00 200.00
600.00 600.00
780.00 780.00
550.00 550.00
15,000.00 13,470.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

l

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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