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51 UBIAYE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408233 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62504315

Your Ref: D19000993MFSH Date: 10 April 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19003209/Aqd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capi urance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SMD 6442T .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 22/02/2019 at the premises of M/s BW WORKSHOP. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 'S8 239625 .

Revised Estimate Amount :S% 1.217.50

“Check” Items Amount :S§ -

Market Value :S% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value ' 53 -

Description of Damage: e

The vehicle sustained damages =

at portion. i Fror

the rear n/s portion | ,JL'I

offace

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser



MS@FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg b 1950001060 GST Reg Mo M2 0001676-9
B Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapone D4B580

Tel: (B5) 6222 311 Fax (B5)622¢ 3547

Claima & Fater Usdersitiag Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 058877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax |65) 6507 3849

wwew.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.
Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

11-02-2019 Our Ref No. D19000283MFSH

06-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAS154E Third Party Vehicle. SMD5442T
30 UBI ROAD 4

JUSTIN EE

52898800/ 0 Fax No. 68582120

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

Kindly submit

BW WORKSHOP
ion. NI
SERVICES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MERINA CHIA SAN SAN
IMPORTANT NOTE

the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated |etter, no signature required.

or ot R RS UHARCE RO




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 10:41 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'Merina Chia San San’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000993MFSH/
Attachments: CSFCIT9003209Aqd3 pdf

Dear Merina,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SMD 6442T.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 2:43 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cec: 'Merina Chia 5an 5an' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000993MFSH/1

Dear Merina,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMD 6442T on 22,/02/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 10:52 AM

To: 'CWS5 Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: 'Merina Chia 5an San' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000993MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer arrange on 22/02/2019.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2013 2:43 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'Merina Chia San San'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000993MFSHA
Dear Merina,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMD 6442T on 22/02/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 10:52 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia San San' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000993MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Flease be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer arrange on 22/02/2019.

G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: CWS5S Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 5:27 PM
To: AﬁSIGNMENT'S@LKK.&UTD.CDM
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> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 10 Type: Singapore NRIC
Dwner 1D: 12500
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SMDG442T
Vehicle to be Exported: Y
Intended Deregistration Date: 18 Feh 2019
Vehicle Make; TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: MOAH HYBRID 18X CVT
Primary Colour; Black
Manufacturing Year: 2018
Engine No.: 2ZR0B5L1732
Chassis No.: ZWRBOD319228
Maximum Power Output: 100.0 kW {134 bhp)
Open Market Value: $33434.00
Original Registration Date; 29 Aug 2018
First Registration Date: 2% Aug 2018
Transfer Count: i
Artual ARF Paid: $20.091.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yog
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 28 Aug 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: 32181800
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 28 Aug 2028
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 971W (120bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $3242900
COE Rebate Amount: 52594300
Total Rebate Amount: $47 761.00
The infarmation cantained berein is correct as at 18 Feb 2019
OK
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BW WORKSHOP SERVICES PTE. LTD.

30 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408615

TEL: 5289 8800 FAX: 6858 2120
GST REG NO : 201504834E

o
T0 17 Cep "
oo Che Estimate
To : FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE DATE 18/2/2019
Attn ; Claims Officer
cc : 1499  VEHICLE NO SMD 6442 T
YEAR 2018 CHASSIS NO ZWRB00319228
MODEL TOYOTA NOAH HYBRID 1.8X PAGE 10F1
Please quote the following items listed. Third Party Claims
SINO ITEMS Qty Price
1 Rear bumper t—m=~= 1 $650.00
2 Rear bumper reflector - LH AL o 1 $75.00
3 Rear bumper side retainer - LH { Inner ) [8 1 $85.00
4 Rear bumper side retainer - LH { Qutier ) e 1 $145.00
5 Rear bootlid »’f-:_I 1 REPAIR
v $955.00
Discount 25% $238.75
TOTAL : §716.25
i 650

e



BW WORKSHOP SERVICES PTE. LTD.

30 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408615
TEL: 5289 8800 FAX. 6858 2120
GST REG NO : 201504834E

Estimate
To ; FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE DATE 2 18/2/2019
Attn : Claims Officer
cc : 1499 VEHICLENO  : SMD 6442 T
YEAR : 2018 CHASSIS NO : ZWRBE00319228
MODEL TOYOTA NOAH HYBRID 1.8X FAGE p 10F1
SINO LABOURS . AMOUNT
TO REMOVE, CUT OUT DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL BEATING, WELDING, ALIGN, REFIT AND TO RENEW B _
1 |AFFECTED PARTS. $300/ Per Days o 5 600.00 | < -
2 |TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ON AFFECTED PORTIONS. $280/ Per Panel $ 840.00 | L0000
DISCOMNNECT AND CHECHK ELECTRICAL WIRING, HARNESS, WIRE SOCKETS,.ETC. REMOVE AND &
3 REINSTALL DAMAGED PARTS, TEST AND RECTIFY FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. $ 120.00 { s
4  |REMOVE AND REPLAGE BUMPER SENSOR. 5 12000 | © ©
Working Days : 4 Days. o 1P
[
NOTE: ALL QUOTED FRICE IS SUBJECT TO 7% GST
TOTAL : $1,680.00
PARTS TOTAL $716.25
GRAND TOTAL $2,396.25
/ . [ '
f'!-ﬂf-“-. bim )

Flf 742 ;‘IIC‘J l.ll.'l. )

7

[r;:_l 5:-_[:_-... ." | :'-I ._r-. - P o . é:' 5 ¥ &-7 ] H

e ttal. 2050

esurveyed and

i S A e B ( D / f".a")

Acknowledged by Repaires

Sagnatune:
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave T #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-8607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCI18003208/Aqd3n2

Date .  11-04-2018

Code . FCIZ

IR

—
-

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SHA 9154E Veh. Inspected SMD 5442T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DAS000993MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MERIMA CHIA Assign Date 19/02/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA NOAHHYEBRID c.c 1797
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. ZWRB00319228 Colour BLACK
Odometer 10644 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[195/65R15 Y OROHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[195/85R15 YORKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195/65R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  0B6/02/2019 Inspection Date 220212019
Survey held at BWWORKSHOP SERVICES PTE LTD
30 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408615
5a, Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: B258 4315

Reg. No: 199607 198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607188-R Fage No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMD 6442T
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qi Pl Workshop 5)] _ (5)

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED §50.00 650.00
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR-LH NOT NECESSARY 75.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER-LH (INNER) NOT NECESSARY 85.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER-LH (OUTTER) NOT NECESSARY 145.00 -
1|REAR BOOTLID (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE . «

LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -238.75 -162.50
716.25 487 50

LABOUR

TO REMOVE,CUT OUT DAMAGED PARTS PANEL 600.00 250.00

BEATING WELDING,ALIGN,REFIT AND TO RENEW

AFFECTED PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR

BOOTLID.

TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ON AFFECTED PORTIONS. 840.00 400.00

DISCONNECT AND CHECK ELECTRICAL 120.00 30.00

WIRING HARNESS WIRE SOCKETS ETC REMOVE AND

REINSTALL DAMAGED PARTS TEST AND RECTIFY FOR

PROPER FUNCTIONING.

REMOVE AND REPLACE BUMPER SENSOR 120.00 50.00

1,680.00 730.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,396.25 1,217.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I 1,21?.50'

Report Ref Mo. CS/FCI19003208/Aqd3n2

% /8‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Raport is made solely Tor the use and benefil of the Client named on the front page of this Repo.




