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51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19001085MFSH Date: 8/3/2019
Our Ref* CS/FCI19003207/R1td3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO, SLB 980T
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

20/02/2019 at the premises of M/s Hitachi Capital have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 8% 6.533.75

Revised Estimate Amount ot ] 5.702.50

“Check” Items Amount 1 5% 0.00

Market Value : 58

LTA Reimbursement Value (5%

Nett Value :S$

Description of Damage: rear G
The vehicle sustained damages at the n/s portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Rasul
Automotive Assessor



I MS.FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg wo 1550000060 GAT Rem fo. M2 OD0LGTH-9

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: {B5) 6222 2311 Fax (65| 6222 3547

Clalws & Hotor Underwiting Dept: 36 Robinsan Road #LE-CL Oty House Singapore 0EBETT
Tek {65) 6507 3048 Fax: (65} E507 3840
wwi.msTirsicapialoom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
13-02-2019 Our Ref No. D19001085MFSH
12-02-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB2100B Third Party Vehicle. SLB98OT

JUN TAIYO SERVICE CENTRE NO 8 FOURTH LOK YANG ROAD
NG JIONG HOW

64663022/ 0 Fax No. 68866591

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

HITACHI CAPITAL ASIA
PACIFIC PTE. LTD.

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

HENRY KAC

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

B of REREEIN (NS RANCE GHIOLP




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent; Friday, 8 March 2019 11:27 AM

To: Admin-D [LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Cc: ‘Henry Kao Cai Jie'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001085MFSH/
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SLB 980T.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLB 980T

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 11:11 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai lie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001085MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 68B41-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S${408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 5:50 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKEAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai lie




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 11:47 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Vonn, LM Siow

Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim; SUR

Subject: RE: SLB9BOT / SHB21008 TP CLAIM FCIL DOA: 12/02/2019 LIABILITY
Hi Denise,

COR confirmed

Thank you

Regards

Ng Jiong How

Motor Claims Advisor
Auto Servicing
Total Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

t: 6833 6282

e jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg

w: www hitachi-capital.com.sg

HITACHI

Insgire the Mot

DISCLAIMER:

This email andior any files and/or attachments transmitted are PRIVATE & COMFIDENTIAL and may be LEGALLY PRIVILEGED.
This email is intended solely for the attention and use of the name addressee(s).

If you are not a named addressee, you must not use, disseminate, forward, print or copy this email and all its contents/attachments.
If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately by email and delete it from your system.

From: Denise Tay [LKKAuto) <denisetay @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 10, 2019 10:06 AM

To: JliongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>; Vonn, LM Siow <vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg>
Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLB980T / SHB2100B TP CLAIM FCIL DOA: 12/02/2019 LIABILITY

Dear Jiong How,

Any confirmation?

Best Regards,

Denlse Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
Jun Taiyo Service Centre

No. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705
Tel : 64663022 Fax : 68966591

Co. Reg.No. 199400398N  GST Reg.No. M2-011899-3

VEHICLE ESTIMATE

FCIL QUOTE NO
ACCIDENT DATE  12/02/2019@1255HRS
VRN . SLB8OT
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEFT MODEL . Toyota Vellfire
TP VRN : SHB2100B
Qty S$ Unit S$% Amt S5 Labor
PARTS REPLACEMENT
1. Bod air
1 Rear Door LH w/ 1 $ 250000 $ 250000
2 Rear Door Protector LH S¢€ 1§ 76500 §$  765.00
3 Rear Fender LH rqﬁr | 5 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00
4 Rear Bumper € ~ Fai 1, & 635.00 % 635.00
5 Rear Bumper Outer Bracke@f?d{f“"t | re l $ § 27000
6 Rear Bumper Clips  ps. 10 § 550 % 55.00
- Discount 25% $ (1,431.25)
TOTAL $ 429375
2, Labor Charges
1 Panel beat, cut, weld, re-align & replace damaged parts of affected area 70V g 1,080'.'{]@
2 Spray painting on rear portion of affected area 10 § 1,[)90?][!
3 Remove & reinstall 2 pieces bumper sensors $4e 12600
4 Remove & reinstall rear reverse camera AnS X 120.00
Sub Total § 2,240.00
?ﬁ‘uﬂ_ Grand Total : $ 6,533.75
H? Gevivoly Add7% GST : $  457.36
Nett Total : $ 68911

No. of repair days: 5 S- M

s

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE

HITACHI CAPTIAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD
(MANAGER)



Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
Jun Taiyo Service Centre

No. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

Tel : 64663022 Fax : 68966591
Co. Reg.No. 199400399N  GST Reg.No. M2-011899-2

SUPPLEMENTAR VEHICLE ESTIMATE

FCIL QUOTE NO '
ACCIDENT DATE  12/02/2019@1255HRS
VRN 3 SLB}OT
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MODEL : Toyota Vellfire
TP VRN . SHB2100B
Qty S$ Unit S$ Amt S$ Labor
PARTS REPLACEMENT
1. Body Repair
1 Rear Fender Protector LH J§ . |- 325.00 % 325.00
2 Rear Bumper Cover LH so~7" 1 $§ 32500 $ 32500
Discount 25% $ (162.50)
TOTAL $ 487 .50
2. Labor Charges
Sub Total : ;3
Grand Total : § 487.50
Add 7% GST : $ 3413
Nett Total =i 521.63
No. of repair days: 0
CUSTOMER SIGNATURE HITACHI CAPTIAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD

(MANAGER)
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Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
Jun Taiyo Service Centre
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No. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705
Tel : 64663022 Fax : 68966591
Co Reg.MNo. 199400399N  GST Reg.No. M2-011859-3

iq-l-:w pl VEHICLE ESTIMATE A \— %Shbg Ci
—_-—4/,—. T ) ,'_r,pr-'"r-f
FCIL QUOTE NO ——
ACCIDENT DATE  12/02/2019/1255HRS
VRN SLBBOT & R80T
ATTMN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MODEL Toyota Velifire
e TP VRN . §HB21008
Cffrt 29)2) 17
f J
ik . Qty  S$Unit S$ Amt S$ Labor
6 & N PARTS REPLACEMENT
1. Body Repair
/1RearDoorLH {4/ | § 250000 $ 250000,
/2 Rear Door Protector LH se 7~ 1 $ 76500 $  765.00.
3 Rear Fender LH u,fa-.Y 1 & 150000 § 1,500.00
_~ 4 Rear Bumper € < 5 1: % 63500 S 63500V
/5 Rear Bumper Outer Brncke@-"%“"’t j'liu. Z % 9 270.00 v
6 Rear Bumper Clips  Ass 10 % 560 S 55.00 v~
Discount 23% 5 (1,431.25)
TOTAL $ 429375
2. Labor Charges
1 Panel beat, cut, weld, re-align & replace damaged parts of affected area 700 g 1(990’_'{):]
2 Spray painting on rear portion of affected area 70§ ‘|p@ﬂ’,ﬁ[}
3 Remove & reinstall 2 pieces bumper sensors $ e 12600
4 Remave & reinstall rear reverse camera $ X 120.00
Sub Total 5 224000
Sl
@ Grand Total : § 6,533.75
Hp Seolenly Add 7% GST : §  457.36
Nett Total o % 6,991.11
No. of repair days: 5 g C&uf>
s —— —— }-o({]l"’/ﬁ @ /éw
| u}n:f
((ZM bq (’
_f.:uarciljmé__r'e SIGNATURE HITACHI CAPTIAL ASIA PACIEIC PTE LTD

IMANAGER



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCIM9003207/R1td3n2

36 ROBINSOMN ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Daes H0sdlied

[ITIRTRANAN

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHE 21008 Veh. Inspected SLB 980T
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D15001085MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAD Assign Date 19/02/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAVELLFIREZESA c.C 2454
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JTNGF3DH208004336 Colour BLACK
Odometer 365018 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
B Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |295/50 ZR18 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |295/50 ZR18 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |295/50 ZR18 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |295/50 ZR18 DUNLOF & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/02/2019 |iInspection Date 20/02/2019
Survey held at HITACHI CAPITAL (5) PTE LTD
JUN TAIYO SERVICE CENTRE
NO. 8 FOURTH LOK YANG ROAD
SINGAPORE 629705
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLE 980T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industral Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo: 190607108R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607188-R

Page Mo.:1 of 1

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | - Bikehon {gj} “j}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR LH BENT 2.500.00 2.6500.00
1|REAR DOOR PROTECTOR LH SCRATCHED 765,00 78500
1|REAR FENDER LH TO REPAIR SEE 1,500.00 -
LABCUR
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED B35.00 63500
2|REAR BUMPER OUTER BRACKET LH/RH @%135.00 M!S NECESSARY 270.00 135.00
10)|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @3%5.50 NECESSARY 55.00 55.00
1|REAR FENDER PROTECTOR LH (ADDITIONAL) SCRATCHED 325.00 325.00
1|REAR BUMPER COVER LH (ADDITIOMNAL) SCRATCHED 325.00 325.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,593.75 -1,185.00
4781.25 3.555.00
LABQUR
PAMEL BEAT,CUT WELD RE-ALIGN & REPLACE 1,000.00 T00.00
DAMAGED PARTS OF AFFECTED AREA INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF REAR FENDER LH.
SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR PORTION OF AFFECTED 1,000.00 750.00
AREA.
REMOVE & REINSTALL 2 PIECES BUMPER SENSORS 120.00 60.00
REMOVE & REINSTALL REAR REVERSE CAMERA. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
2,240.00 1,510.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,021.25 5,065.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 5,065.00)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19003207/R1td3n2

N

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

‘g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

MECLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ks made sclely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repor.

Ha Babdlity of responsikility whatsoever, in contact or tor pepted 19 any hird SRty Wit im ey onthe Bepori Wil orin part. Any inird parky acing or rep

Beport. in whede or in par, does so af his or her own risk,




