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S1 UBIAVE 1. #01-25 PAYA UBTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19003170/T1pb3
29 APRIL 2019

GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD
10 RAEBURN PARK

#02-01

SINGAPORE 088702

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD6345R & FBFT949L ALONG/AT ALONG YUNG HO
ROAD TOWARDS CORPORATION ROAD ON 29/01/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from FBF7949L against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

KHANCHNA
Case Handler
DID: 6841-2360
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

————————————————————————————————————

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 4:43 PM

To: mdsuhaimi@gbcr.comsg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD6345R & FBF7949L ALONG/AT ALONG YUNG HO ROAD
TOWARDS CORPORATION ROAD ON 29/01/2019 [YOUR DRIVER: SUGAWARA
HIROYUKI]

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19003170/T1pb3
Your Ref: SMDG&345R

GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD
Attn: Mr. Suhaimi
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMDB345R & FBF7949L ALONG/AT ALONG YUNG HO ROAD TOWARDS CORPORATION ROAD ON
29/01/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from FBF7949L against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour, We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Kindly also let us have your driver (Sugawara Hiroyuki) copy of passport with the entry passport stamp/chop to enter
Singapore.

Your prompt action is much appreciated.
Please call us if you have further queries.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



&

Y0>>2>>>>>>>>>>> %201 Y2W0LLSOYZNd 02900982481
DR2IOD235035233 2203 > > INNAOCHTH> >VHYMVONSNAL >d

- B
g AV 5 VRN WEX
- L . aﬂWWﬂtmﬁer

..t.._.__:wn:__u_ . ...L_

9261 AVH LL  NVdVP

WS T e R G W

"IXNAQHIH
w—

YHYAYONS
L BT

Ndr d  1HOdSSYd W

T T T

"
e W
L
L L
(R
. owow
R
e
L
Poaw
.
"
et
v e
e
L
¥ .
-
e PRRIBDUE ERimJAULD EEA UM
aaa
b ohow
s FEDIR pUN S&IIUNGD jjw 4B pTA B giodsmed wil
»ow
L] L
T
H

¥ W e



®
- =

3 kT o E
TN ;
e, o g

n»#w.:«ﬂlﬂ!.ﬂ....ﬂhf e

&

M 810z 9Ny 90
iy R

i




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:35 PM

To: Khanchna {LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: TP / 93928056355G (ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD6345R [AIG] & FBF7949L ON
29/01/2019 )

Hi Khanchna,

I have verified with insured that driver is an authorized driver.
As long as all documents, |.e. International Driving Permit, passport page are provided, | see no issue to proceed.
Thank you.

Regards,
Lee Ming Yao
AlG
Complex Claims Examiner
laims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

UG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel #(65) 6419 1769
MingYao. Lee@AIG.com | www aig.sq

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:
r
ﬁ m
FPORTANT NOTICE
iiormaton m this email (and any attechments) is confidential If you are not the mfended recipent. you must nof use or dissemmate (he

mafon. If you have recaived this emall in arrgr, please immadiately notily me by "Reply” command and permanently delele the onginal and any
opees ar panfouts thereol Although this email and any altachments are balieved o be free of any virus or gther defect that meght affect any compufer
yatarn ipto which iIf is recaived and opened, if i the responsibifity of the recipient fo ensure that if (s wus free and no respansibility s accepted by AIG
for any lnzs or damage ansing in any way from ity use

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@|kkauto.com)

Sent: 10 May 2019 16:31

To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Llee@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] TP / 93928056355G (ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMDB345R [AIG] & FBF7949L ON 29/01/2019 )

i« message is from an external sender: be cautious with links and attachments.

YOUR REF: TP f 9392B056355G
OUR REF: CC4/AIG19003170/T1pb3



Good Afternoon Ming Yao,
The above matter refers.

Kindly take note that the Insured driver is holding a foreign driving license and his passport stamp/immigration chop
shows
entry to Singapore on 6/8/2018 (less than 1 year from the date of accident (29/1/2019).

Kindly let us have your advice on whether there are any policy issues and confirm on whether we can proceed with D5.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

0ID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
#lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
tamage arising in any way from its use,



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:51 PM

To: Lee, Ming-Yao

Subject: RE: TP / 93928056355G (ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD6345R [AIG] & FBF7949L ON

29/01/2019)

Dear Ming Yao,
Noted with thanks.

Hest Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

D10 6841 2360| emall: Khanchna@Ilkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Ak 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:43 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP / 93928056355G (ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMDB345R [AIG] & FBF7949L ON 29/01/2019 )

Hello Khanchna,
Sorry if previous email was not clear,

If driver’s latest entry is within 1 year from date of accident and driver holds valid IDP, there is no issue on coverage
Also, driver was authorized as confirmed by insured.

Please ensure these documents are ready in Merimen while handling the claim,
Thank You.

Regards,

Lee Ming Yao
AIG
:omplex Claims Examiner

aims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore{(079120)
Tel +(65) 6418 1769
MingYao Lee@AIG.com | www.aig.sq

Celebrating 100 Years:
100

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:
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£] UBL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19003170/T1pb3
19 MARCH 2019

GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD
10 Raeburn Park #02-0]
Singapore 088702

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 6345R & FBF 7949L ALONG/AT YUNG HO ROAD
TOWARDS CORPORATION ROAD L/P NO:5 ON 29/01/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform vou that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against
vour policy,

We have received a claim from FBF 79491 against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
driver's favour. In addition, police investigation result shows that your driver was being charged
for Inconsiderate Driving. We will therefore proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable settlement with
the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20%
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy
has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed wtilized for this claim and your NCD will be
protected.

Please call us if you have further queries,

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAQ TONG
Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewht/@lkkauto.com

e AIG Asia Pacifie Insurance Pre Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)



RELEASE

Clmim Nee PIN2RO56355G Palicy No: 5100726122

U'We. FBF 7949L - SOUTHERN MOTOR, hereby agree 1o accepl the sum of [ SINGAPORE DOLLARS
ONE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED AND SEVENTY ONE ONLY) ($1471.00) to be pald 1o (SOUTHERN
MOTOR) in full and final scitlement af all claims, costs and disbursement arising from personal injury or loss of or
damage to property sustained by mefus as & reslt of an accident involving SMD 6345R on the 29 duy of JAN 2019
along VUAN CHING ROAD and 1/we agree thut the said sum 18 paid with a denial of liability on the part of AIG Asia
Pacific Insurance Pre Lid. being the insurer, insured and the driver of vehicle No SMD 6345R respectively, (or any
other person or persans) in respect of said loss and for damage whether now or hereafter (o become manifest, snd s
sccepted by me/us o the intent that the suid AIG Axis Pacific Insurance Pre. Lud. and all other persons be absolutely and
finally exoncrated and discharged from all clnims of every nature and kind whatsoever which [fwe now or hereafier may
have arising out of or connected wilh or traceable Lo the said necident. ['We further state thal Lhe foregoing release has
been carefully read by mefus or han been read 1o mefus and 1/we know the conients thereof and have signed the same ax
myloir own (ree and voluntary act and have not beon Influcnced in making this settlement by any representution of the
party ar parties released. /We also declare that | am/we are the personipersons entitled to receive the ahove
compensstion and hereby underike 1o indemnify AIG Agla Pacific lngurance Pie. Lid. againgt any claim made or which

may be made in respeci of this compensation.

“This Release does not bind the insured and insured driver of AIG Asta Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, and Is not to
be construed as an sdmission of liability on thelr part and shall not be used as evidence in any claims, sctions
which may be lodged by them.”

Dated this J - day of qu.h:—ﬁ’ {
w 55 f' CLAIMANT .
}l

Signature: AR SOUTHERN Mﬂ'l’ﬂl:
— - ori
Name &oitn eupy }r 2E MName L : ) u’lﬁ‘hﬂl I' 15?‘::1:4

Signature:

Addess LK Sa-d Gedan bendrietuidecss - BLK 1006 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2

=" O & - to 6
SINCAPORE [39762

f”":‘*‘:."';f‘*“ OO e ZIAI0L




SOUTHERN MOTOR
Blk 1006, Bukit Merah Lane 2 #01-10 Smgapore 159762
Tel 62730369 Fax 62746614 CO/GST Reg No:234 147001

TAX INVOICE NO : INV2B27T1

Invoice Date : 19th June 2010

Payment Terms : CASH

Vehicle No. ¢ FBFT7948L - YAMAHA FZ-16
Machanic . CASH

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD - AADDZ
76 SHENTON WAY #07-18 AIG BUILDING Singapore 079120

Tel 64193000 Fax: 64153727

S/No DESCRIPTION Qry U/PRICE Amount
1 7% GST ON COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIR 1 $91.00 $91.00
2 COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIR 1 $1,30000  $1,300.00
TOTAL : $1,391.00
BALANCE $1,381.00

Y T ep——— Caposs Fow Are Hul‘lllurm.ﬂu-mu.l-ll rn;uhnw;p:pm;mm_
Ilmrwsl Hatn of W pat mondh will be smposed on ceerdus Accounds. Thane you

Received by

Ubschi,_hirem 12 IO, B4 g . 1of1



SINGAPORE blivgreiigsan

10 Ul Avanue 3

POLICE FORCE f;,;;ﬁn;.m
Fax +B5 B54T 4500
waww police gov sg
Qur Ref : TRAPOS64T7/2018
Dats : 05 MAR 2019

UMAIR BIN AHZAMSHAH

BLK 140A CORPORATION DRIVE
#15-24

SINGAPORE 611140

Dear Sir,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES FBF7949L AND SMD6E345R ALONG JUNG
HO ROAD ON 29 JANUARY 2019 AT ABOUT 2045HRS.

| refer to the above accident.

2 We have completed Investigation into the case. Our investigation shows thal an offence of
Inconsiderate Driving under Sec 65(b) Road Traffic Act Cap 276 was disclosed against the
driver of motor car, SMD8345R. Action had been initiated against the driver for the said
offence.

3 i you require any clarification, please contact me &t Tel. 8547 6224 or emall at
Muhd_Farhan_Sairi@spf.gov.sg

Yours falthfully,

MUHD FARHAN BIN SAIRI, SGT(3) T09640
for HEAD INVESTIGATION

TRAFFIC INVESTIGATION BRANCH
SINGAPORE POLICE FORCE

A FORCE FOR THE NATION



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

++.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane
|CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING AR - B
Cape | Notifing Est Submitted  |Ao) Assigned  [Ad) Rpr | Adj Submitted Ins Auth’éd Etl‘l‘ul
19 Fab 2019 -t $$1,300.00 £31,100.00 wﬁ'm
| mll'ﬂ EHM‘HHJ Edlit Estamartes | Vlhtnl : F:’-]
d

Ml Referance

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

[tnsured: GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD, Co_ feg. Mo 2007108510
| Main

Fiimant. | SOUTHERN MOTOR,  Co. Reg. No. 234147001

Vehicle Reg _[29/01/2019 20/00 - ;59

ho.: FBF7949L |Pate of LOSS: | g Manths and 17 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr))
\Cmim Type: | TP / 939280563556 pouewEave! | 0999994300 (Comprehensive)

:ﬂm Reg. S
(Insured): _{\=emenl
\Hepairer | Southern Motor (WQ) BLK 1006 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2, #01-10, 159762 Bukit Merah - Tel: 62730368
i m AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Express) - Tei! 65-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Lee, Ming-Yao] Ming¥ac Lee@aig. com
| EI- man
flnmnﬁ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

(Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3581 _ [Handied by MOHD RASUL] . [Final Rpt due 01/03/2019]

(ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Ml | _compuse Case Masl ||

iThﬁn‘.'ﬂ ne mall for this case. |

SMDGI45R 5100726123

¥

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Create New Tase | compiete |

Due Date  Priocity Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dona?
| Mo resuits.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 17/7/2019



Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*FBF7949L (93928056355G)
[SMD6345R]
TP
SOUTHERN MOTOR
Jan 29 2019 8:00PM
[GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD]

Southern Motor

upioed Documants | Upload Protes | Compose tew Lotter | Upioad vises | Upioad Asdio | View [View m Sromssr >
|Letters/Correspondances [1oerpoge 1v]| B |
tic_|Finaliced On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 |(Dram) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown O e |
‘Photos/Images Gperpoge  v)| & |
o Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) = | Tmui{“ﬁhi]
1150315 12:05 | General View - © | losows | B
2 15/03/1512.05 | General View - O | sds | A
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
I"-“nhk:ln No: SMDGE345R (Insd veh) Model: YAMAHA FZ16 153CC (M)
FBF7949L (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: |29/01/2019
Global Sum Settiement | | | | Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 5 1,880.58
Final Repair Cost 5 1,281.00
Loss of Use -4 80.00 4.00 days at 520,00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 3 0.00
Others: $ 0.00
4
Final Seltlement Sum 5 1.471.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
balaw)

A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 [%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Asgzassad Liability (*) (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | Southem Maolor 8 1,471.00
2) -
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 17.dul
2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Pleass attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Repart/ Bill {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ice reg ne 199807108
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 8256-3561 Fax: BB44-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18003170/R1EB3G2

Dale: 17/07/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Paolicy Mo 0999994309
claimant Vehicle cgrraagL Insured Vehicle No:  SMDG345R
Date of Loss: 28/0172018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 839280583556
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBFT948L
Make & Model: YAMAHA FZ16, 153cc (M) Engine No: 21C7014781
Reg. Date 12/12/2011 (Man. Year, 2011) Chassis No: ME121C07AB2014730
Colour: Red Odometar. 0 km
Engine Capacity: 153 cc
Market Value/New Car Prica: N/A
Sum Insured (S5) Market Value/New Car Price
1 A RVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceabls) Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-acciden! Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
From Tyre Size: 1o70-17 Rear Tyre Size: 140/70-17
Front Left Side: Maxxis 4 mm Rear Left Side: Maxxis 4 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The sbove values represent ifve remaining hyre ready depth
COST OF CLAIMS B — Repairer's  Adjusters Difference  Diff %
Parts 1.536.80 1,478.40 5850 3.8
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 230.00 180.00 50.00 21.74
Paintwork Labour D.00 0.00 D.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total [S5) 1,766.90 1,658.40 108.50 6.14
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,300.00
(S$) 1,766.90 1,300.00 466.90 26.42
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 123.68 91.00 3268 26.42
Nett Amount (S3) 1,890.58 1,391.00 499.58 26.42
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x 5520.00/day) (S5) 80.00
Nett Liability (S5) 1.471.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 15/02/2018
Date Inspected 18/02/2019 Inspected At: Southem Motor (HQ)
BLK 1006 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2, #01-10
Singapore 1598782
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
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Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This rmepart represents aur findings af e ime and place af insgpection atated hersin. Stch inspection hes bean carmied oul 1o the best of owr
krowlaoges and abillly but any other Rability under any oifier circumstances is hereby srpressly eecluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *METER Scratched 350,00 FL *350.00FL
2 1 *TOP BRAKE PUMP Scralched 125.00 FL *125.00FL
i 1 *BRAKE LEVER Scratched 18.00FL *18.00FL
4 1 *HANDLE BAR Bemt 38.00FL *38.00 FL
5 1 "MIRROR Scratchead 35.00FL *A5.00FL
6 1 “HEAD LAMP Scratchad 180.00 FL *160.00 FL
7 1 *FRONT MUDGUARD Cracked 55.00FL *55.00FL
8 1 *FUEL TANK COVER Scratched 220.00FL *220.00FL
9 1 *FRONT HEAD LAMP BRACKET Serviceable B5.00 FL ~FL
10 1 *EXHAUST PIPE COVER Scratched 4500 FL *45 00FL
17 1 *FRONT FORK COMPLETE HBent 580.00 FL *580.00FL
12 1 *NO PLATE Scraiched 15.00FS *15.00FS
F=Franchise pan. B=5pcNen. L=LnfliemDec
Sub Total (S8) 1,706.00 1,641.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S%) 160.10 162.60
Total Paris (S5) 1,536.90 1,478.40

Repont was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous Hems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TRANSPORT Moy 30.00 30.00
2 LABOUR Naw 200.00 150.00

Gross Labour Cost (S§5) 230.00 180.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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