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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 1:47 PM

To: 'Woon Choo Kwok’; SUR

Subject: RE: OUR REF : M585443 VEH NO : SGS8694L DOA : 16.02.19
Dear Woon Choo,

The market value of SGS 8694L is $18K-$20K (Estimated) as at Feb 2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Woon Choo Kwok <WoonChoo_Kwok@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 10:56 AM

To: Admin @ VAuG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: OUR REF : M585443 VEH NO : SG58694L DOA : 16.02.19

OUR REF : M585443
VEH NO ; SGS8694L
DOA:16.02.19
Dear All,

Please advise market value.

Attach a copy of coe rebate and photos for your action.

Best Regards

Kwok Woon Choo
Senior Admin Officer, Claims Services
Tel : 6643 1330 Fax: 6225 7402 | woonchoo_kwok®sg.msig-asia.com

_LAIMS Insurer Claims
MSIG % AWARDS Team of the Year

2016

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Bu1ld1ng, Smgapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

L |
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg % %Lé



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
QOpen Market Value;

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount;

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Page 1 of 1

Dof ; (é'>llc(

Singapore NRIC (ms ‘G‘)
0283A

SGS8694L

Yes

20 Feb 2019

NISSAN

LATIO15LT

Silver

2007

HR15078746A
JN1BAAC11Z0004106
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
$14,652.00

27 Mar 2007

27 Mar 2007

1

$16,118.00

Forfeited

$0.00

26 Mar 2022

A - Car (1600cc & below)
5

$24,715.00

$15,320.00

$15,320.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COF expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Feb 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_ID=F03...

OK

§18 ~§20 K.

20/02/2019



