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Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

Tel : 6844 2475

\ N ’ 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
m Ork Paya Ubi Industrial Park

ra e E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H
et Lkk) wh i PreLtd  RoC number : 201015366H
96(3111 12-9% 3RD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd Vehicle number SMC1818G
78 Shenton Way P Make / Model TOYOTA ALPHARD
#08-16 ﬂﬂ ot ‘, A J’j Chassis number ~ JNTBAAC1120007196'
Singapore(079120) Accident date 25 January 2019
7 "l’w Reference 1902-17
Qty Particulars Unit Price - SGD §
PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS
1 |REAR BUMPER / 609.90/
1 |END PANEL - OUTER X 728.30 X
1 [END PANEL - INNER X AN ” 594,20 X
1 |REAR TAILLAMP PANEL X AN 364.80 X
2 |REAR BUMPER RETAINER ~ MEC #H < LH/ 70.40 /70.39
2 [REAR BUMPER BRACKET X AW 90.80 X
1 |END PANEL TOP GARNISH X M 173.10 X
1 |REAR TAILLAMP X MW (5059 519.30 X
1 |REAR PDC SENSOR WIRE M/ DAY 445.68 X
1 |REAR BUMPER SIDE COVER RH ¥ M/ <07 7 601.45 X
i ; E 4197.93
Less 25 % 1049.48
Subtotat 3148.45
Batance C/F 3148.45
PARTS REPLACEMENT - SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
Balance B/F 3148.45
1 SET|REAR BUMPER cLip ~ AT 19 7 40.00
1 SET|REAR REVERSE SENSOR | X Ml 400.00 ¥
Subtotat 440.00
Balance C/F 3588.45
LABOUR AND MISCELLANEQUS CHARGES
Balance B/F 3588.45
1 |CHECK REAR WIRING AND LIGHTING 60.00 §¢
2 _|REMOVE AND REFIT REAR LINING, TRIM AND GARNISH 200.00 57
4: |REMOVE'AND'REMBWAREAR REYERSE SENSOR 150.00 9
9°"|PANEL BEAYINGOM AFFECTEDJAREAS 1200.00 49
10 [SPRAY, RAINTIN ECTEQ AREAS 10307 1000.00 §94
11 |APPLY ANTI RUSTON AFFECTED AREAS 150.00 70
ot Frendios”besis Subtotal 2760.00
©oLst e resurveyed and
aladl. - frem insefanos Compaty Grand total 6348.45
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Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

/ 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
m Ork Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Tel : 6844 2475
rag e E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H
Pteltd  poc number : 201015366H
3RD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd Vehicle number SMC1818G
78 Shenton Way Make / Model TOYOTA ALPHARD
#08-16 Chassis number JN1BAACT11Z0007196'
Singapore(079120) Accident date 25 January 2019
Reference 1902-17
Qty Particulars Unit Price - SGD $§
PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS
1 [tancate < 0 VW46 19 2100.00 11577
1 [WINDSCREEN MOUDLING 7~ /¢ _ 985" 189.10/
(157 2289.10
Less 25 % 714.10
Subtotal 1575.00
LABOUR AND MISCELLANEQUS CHARGES
Balance B/F 1575.00
1 |REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN 200.00 /ﬂ///
Subtotal 200.00
Grand total 1775.00
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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: claims@teamworkgarage.com

Sent: Tuesday, September 10, 2019 11:07 AM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: '"TEAMWORK GARAGE CLAIMS'
Subject: RE: SMC1818G TOYOTA ALPHARD
Histeve ,

We confirm COR $3,279.79 & DOR @ 3 days.
Vhand you and bave 4 sice day! ©

Letitia

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore (408934)

Tel: 6844 2475 | Fax: 6844 2474

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2019 7:11 PM
To: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Subject: SMC1818G TOYOTA ALPHARD

Dear Darren,
Kindly refer our finalize $3,279.79 (P/P, before GST). 3 days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933)

From: Darren [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 09, 2019 6:36 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: SMC1818G TOYOTA ALPHARD

Hi Steve,

FYNA



