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T U A
TEO SPRAY PAINTING

[INCORPORATED IN THE FEPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE]
Heg. Address ELUGK 6, DEFU LANE 10, DEFU INDUSTRIAL PARK C, #01.558

SINGAFORE 533187 TEL: 6283 5474 (2 LINES) FAX: 8287 2012

REG MO J7e08s / OCx 7"”( 62.{.3353 /

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid,

AIG Building /4
78 Shenton Way #07-16 M
Singapore 079120 Csf
Tel: 64193000
Fax: 68357416 A gﬂdﬂ_‘)—
Dear SieMadam 14.02.2019 ’3 E )
RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIMS FOR FBD9SS0A AGAINST YOUR
INSURED SKM3810K, ACCIDENT ON 31.01.2019 AT ﬁ/”'
SLIP ROAD PIE (CHANGI) TOWARDS PTE (SLE) é"/a/‘/ % 7
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 TOP COVER Coan g 90,00
2 HEAD LIGHT SPt s 15000_—
3 STAY 15 52.50 &
a WINDSCREEN A4S 2250
5 FENDER eans 45.00 —
6 FRONT WHEEL MW /MA/S 18000 e—
7 FORK SET famf s 42000 A2 o5 A
& SIDE COWLING INNER LH €aq § 10500 B
9 SIDE COWLING INNER RH AA S 10500
10 SIDE COWLING OUTER LH Cm s 90.00 ——=
11 SIDE COWLING OUTER RH A-g 90.00
12 COWLING CENTER Cans 10500 ——
13 EXHAUST COVER FRONT Sves 2100 X
14 EXHAUST COVER REAR S s 1500 —
15 REAR FOOTREST LH %t $ 15.00 _—
16 FRONT SIGNAL LIGHT LH €uy s 12.00 —
17 FRONT SIGNAL LIGHT RH rar 1200
18 HANDLE LH Cals 30,00 —
19 LEVER CLUTCH LH Sel s 9.00—"
20 MIRROR LH Cul1s 3000 —
S 1,602.00 [000-X
Less 10% $  160.20
Sub Total S 1,441.80 foor 'r:':
— r ,]'[-' ‘[,
Nett lem }
1 FORK OIL (530X 2) L 5 60.00 "
2 LABOUR CHARGES S 280.00 2 $+2
3 FRONT NUMBER PLATE anm s 18.00 /o
4 TRANSPORT $ 60.00 3¢~
Sub Total s 418.00
Total m
THANKS

T5P



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner I1D: 2892D
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: FBD9550A
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 20Feb 2019
Vehicle Make: YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: YZF-R15
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2009
Engine No.: 20P1022889
Chassis No.: ME120P01192020400
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value: $2,989.00
Original Registration Date: 30 Sep 2009
First Registration Date: 30 Sep 2009
Transfer Count: 7
Actual ARF Paid: $449.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 29 Sep 2019
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $9200.00
COE Rebate Amount: $118.00
Total Rebate Amount: $118.00

Page 1 of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Feb 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 20-Feb-19



- Pra ropair inspection request - FBOS550A VS SKM3810K (O) DOA 31/01/2018

From:  Azlun. Syazsining

To admn-afffmita com, susignmeiliieio oom

[ <= Fang Andy-SY. Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassim, Moor Maresa, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosngh, Asswmenjestesur, Chan Yole Shi Keur Baljt. ot Yinnd
Samt:  TRR201G 11T.00 PM

Adtuchments: Y pipw per - Sx0u3N 0 AND FRDSSS0A DI ) imoRzIATIE

i, 28D ERT

Please refer 1o the enclosad request from TEOD SPRAY PAINTING. qu@ SQut

Claim ne 4769527877SGO03 whﬂh in ]'bl l‘\
Case Owner WAN NUR SALIHA BINTE SYED YUSOFF 30
anrd tniy O

if you have any querasiconcams, plaass et us know
Kindly assist to assign Marcus Chua as Single Joint Expert as requested,

Thanks and regards,
Syaza Irdina Azlan
AlG

Express Claims Adjuster |, Singapore FNOL. Ciama Dperabions = Auto
§G Clwms Operations | ANG Shared Services

Seacairding Aslandfiong com | www Big 89

From: Irene Suan [mailto: rened@teospraytrading. com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 12:35 PM

To: Azlan, Syazairdina

Subject: Re: FW: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKM3810K AND FBDSS50A ON 31/01/201%

Hi,
We will appoint Marcus Chua from LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid.

Thanks
Regards

[

On Tue, Feb 19, 2019 w8 11:57 AM Azlun, Syseairdine <Syazairdina Azlan®@aig com™ wrote:

Dear lrene,

| PRI lerter has been sent via fax. Kindly check and revert back whether vou agree 1o any of the appointment of the mator surveyars a1 o single
joint expert.

Thanks and regards,
| Byaza Irdinm Artan
MG

Express Claims Adjuster ||, Singapose FNDL. Clsirms Opefations - Auto
5G Clperns Operabons | AIG Shared Sarnces

Syazaleding Azian@aip.com | www B B

From: Irene Suan [maiko:isenednecsaraytrading com.sd]

Sant: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 11:54 AM

To: Azlan, Syazairding

Subject: Re: PW: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKM3B10K AND FBOO9SS504 ON 31/01/2019

Hi ALG,

I tried following the steps, but it did not lead me to crenle an one-time account. It only shows me to forgot password.
Thank you



rtwd!

On Tue, Feb 19, 2019 at 10:55% AM Azlan, Synzairding <Syazairdina Azlan@aig.com> wrole:
Dear SiefMAdm,

This emall contains a secure message attachment, please click on it and it will lead you 1o & page with the AG logo.

Continue with chcking “to read the message” and you will be asked to complete a one-time registration to create an account,
Upon completion of this reghtration, you will be able to read the email securely.

Kindly revert back if vou still unable to open the email. | will send the letter via fax

Thanks and regards,

Syaza lrdina Azian
AlG

Express Clama Aduster I, Sngapore FNOL, Claims Operatons = Autd
56 Clasms Oparations | AIG Shamwed Seryices

Syazaindi na A anEILCO | AN 5D 5T

From: Irene Suan [maillio:

Sent; Tuesday, February 19, 2019 10:49 AM

Tot Azlan, Syazalrdina

Subject: Re: FW. - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKM3810K AND FBDOS50A ON 31/01/2019
Hi,

We can't open the emall it needed login access 1o read it

Kindly assist.

i-l:p.rﬂ:

On Tue, Feb 19, 2019 at 10:28 AM Azlun, Syazairding <Syazairding Azlan@aig.com> wrote:
AIG <

This is a secure, encrypled message. To read i, open the
attachment.

EERSIEES, NEFRIAR, WS,

o rinearudaoadrdor e niadu oonahdwioa
Tniitfunusn

O|Z{2 ¢I{slD Y2obE AIXYUCE 2248 Had
T HS ORE Lo

Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk memboacanya,
membuka sitachment.

Click here by 2019-02-26 10:28 +08 to read vour message.
Afier that, open the anachment.

Mgrp inty

Paaildower Thils el and ss comiem) e comwlalaning mmd meended ssiely T e s of e
nilidrrsaes Plesse il the smiden of vy b ocin gl i eomsil o eme o gl Gl



Socured 1y Prowsfjsim Emcryuion, O ogwyrigle © 0000 T I'm:ﬁ\m: D A gl
(15 =g BT

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any aitachments) is confidentinl. IF you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If vou have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by “Reply” command and
permanenily delete the original and any copics ar printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are belicved (o be free
of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it s received and opened, it 15 the responsibility of
the reciplent to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidinries
or affilintes either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If vou are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. 1 you have received this emall in error, please immedintely notify me by "Reply” command and
permancatly delete the original and any copies or primtouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are belicved 1o be free
of any virus or other defect that might aflfect any computer system into which it s received and opened, it is the responsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is sccepted by American Intemnational Group, Ine, or its subsidiaries or
affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from ils usc.

IMPORTANT WOTICE

The infarmation in this emal (and any sftachments] is confiderdial if you are nol ihe intended reciplent, you must not use or disseminate the information. i you have

recaived this emaill in eror, please immedatsly me by "Reply” command and parmanenily delste e original and any copies or printouls thereol, Axhough this
ermal @nd mny atechmants are balisved 1o be free of any virus or cther detect thal might sffect any computer system inio which it is recerved and opened, i is the

reaponaisility of e recipsar 1o ensare 1hat i (8 virus free and no responsibillty is acoepled by Amarican intemalional Group. Inc. or Hs subsidiarien or affates aiher
jointly o severally, lor any loss or damage ansing in any way from is wse.



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

ta..mu SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cass Hatifiaed Est Submitted | Ad) Assignes Adi Bpt Adj Submitted | 1ns Auth'ed Status
‘ 06 Feb 2019 16 Fab 2019 $§1,000.00 $$1,000.00 w for Survey
Min 00:00
. Edit Rmg Echt Adf Bt 1 Edit Eatimates | vu-l:tl wm]

Claim Detaile

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insured: KDH WET FU, 10: SES14681E

pinr CHUA SOON HENG, 1D: S9222892D

Claimart:
Vehicle Reg. . |31/01/2019 07:00 - :59
No.: FBD9550A Date of LosS! |14 43 Manths and 1 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: TP / 47695278775G poscHcove | 1700093117 (Comprenensive)
Vihicle Reg.
Poiicy Na. .
No. . SKM3IB10K (Cluimant}: ED&TA2054 7-00
(Insurng):
Expess:

Rapairer: Teo Spray Painting (HQ) BLK 6 DEFU LANE 10, DEFU IND PARK C #01-558, 539187 Defu Lane - Teli
Handling AlG Asia Pacific Tnsurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ... [Handied by Syed-Yusoff, Saliha] Salina Syed-
Insurer: Yusoff@aig.com

F'mr:f" NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tal
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 _ [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 28/02/2015]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED “"'"_I- Compose Case Mail I

Thare are no mall for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSE view Al | Sewrcn Tasks | Create ew Task | compiete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Croated On Doana?
Mo results.

https://singapore. menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 18/12/2019




Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FBD9550A (476952787756G)

[SKM3B10K]
™

CHUA SOON HENG
Jan 31 2019 7:00AM

Page 1 of 3

[KOH WEI FU]
Teo Spray Painting

Upioad Documants | ugoad Prates |  Compose New ety | upioed vioes | upieas Ause | View [View i Srowsar| ]
Video I (]
Mo | Finalized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) Thumbnail | Print
N T e - A © | e
Letters/Correspondences [1perpage Tv]
o | Finalized On LEK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |(Dean) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Braakdown [i] Edit
Photos/Images ]@ 3
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |23/08/1911:37 | General View 0| weawc | &
2 |23/06/19 11:37 | Ganeral View @ | waws | ¥
3 |23/08/19 11:32 Ganeral View 0 | twaws | H |
3 |2081911:32 | General View 0| adws | A
5 |23/08/19 11:32 | Genersl View 0 | wawc | A
& |2woene 1132 Ganaral View | wadirs | @
7 |23/08/19 11:32 Ganeral View 0| wedirc | B4
B |21/08/1911:32 | General View 0| cdirc | A
9 |23/06/1911:32 | General View O oaws | B
10 |33068/19 11:32 | Genersl View 0| eavc | A
11 |2y/08/19 11:32 General View 0| tedirc | A
12 [23/08/19 11:32 | General View 0| earc | A
13 |23/08/19 11:32 General View i Load 3G | B
14 [23)08/19 11:32 General View D | adivc | A
15 |23/08/19 11:32 | General View 0| weds | A
16 | 23/08/19 11:32 Genaral View i toad G | B |
17 |23/08/19 11:32 General View _.- wad G | B4
18 |23/08/19 11:37 | Ganaral View 0 | wadws | BA
19 |23/08/19 11:32 | General View i Load G | A
20 [23/08/1911:32 | Genersl View O woorwc | B
21 [23/06/1911:32 | General View 0| aarws | @B
22 |23/08/1911:37 | General View Q| wars | B
21 |23/08/19 11:32 | General View | wadwc | A
24 |29/00/19 11:32 | General View 0| oacvs | A
25 [23/08/1911:32 | General View O worc | A
26 |23/08719 11:32 General View 0| wedivc | A
27 |23/08/19 11:32 Ganaral View ) | eedies | B
28 |23/00/19 11:32 | Ganeral View O eavc | A
20 |23/00/19 11:32 | General View | loodirs | FA
30 |23/08/1911:32 | General View @O | cadavc | B
31 |23/06/19 11232 | General View 0| cedc | BB
12 |2oens 1112 Genaral View 0| odirs | B4
33 |23/08/19 11:32 | General View 0| woows | F
34 |23/00/19 11:32 | General View ) | Load s
35 | 23/08/19 11:32 | General View i Load 0pG | A
36 |21/08/19 11:12 | General View O | eadirs

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp... 18/12/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 3

video [1perpage [v] B
[No_|Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) ""_mum-ulgt
37 |D/08/19 1132 | General View Q| aews | &2
I8 |ZVOE/19 11:32 | Geners] View 0| tdwc | M
19 |21/08/19 1132 | General View 0| wews | B
40 2000191132 | General View 0| wawc | M
41 |208/19 1132 | General View 0| wedws | 4
47 |23/0B/1911:32 | General View 0 lcedwc | &
43 |23/08/1911:37 | General View Q| teive &
a4 |20/08/1911:32 | General View 0 | wedwc | M |
a5 |7V08/19 1132 | General View 0| awc B
46 |20/08/19 11:32 | General View O | edwe | B
47 |7308/18 11:32 | General View 0| adws | A
4B |23/08/1911:37 | General View O wars M
40 [21/08/1911:32 | General View 0| eaws | A
S0 [23/08/19 1132 | Genersl View Q| woaws | M
50 |23/08/19 11:32 | General View 0| edies | A
52 |23/08/1911:32 | Genersl View 0| weaws | A
53 |23/08/19 11:32 | Ganeral View 0 | toadws |
54 |23/06/19 11:32 | General View 0| Leawrs
5t [23/08/1911:32 | General View 0| wdwe | &
55 |23/08/19 11:32 General View 0| losdirc | A
57 |33/08/1911:37 | General View 0 | losdrs | B
58 |Z3/08/19 11:32 General View D | toaaws | A
59 |23/08/19 11:32 Ganeral View D | weaws | B
60 |29/08/10 11:32 | General View 0| edis | B
61 |23/08/19 11:32 | General View 0| bedwc | A
61 |73/08/19 11:32 | Genernl View 0| wdws | &
631 |23/08/19 11:32 | General View 0| taaws | A
&4 |23/08/19 11:32 Ganeral View 0| weawc | A
65 |29/08/1811:32 | Ganeral View 0| wedvs | A
66 |Z3/08/19 11:32 General View 0| ocdvcg | A
67 |23/06/19 11:32 | Ganeral View 0| adc | A
B8 |23/08/19 1132 | General View 0| aars | B
69 |23/08/1911:32 | General View Q| wawe | B
0 |230019 11132 | Ganeral View D | weaws | |
71 |21/08/19 11:32 | General View 0| adivc | B
72 |23/08/19 1132 | After Repair Photo O | Lwws | B
73 |23/08/19 11:37 | After Repair Photo O | waws | B
74 |23/08/19 11532 | After Repalr Photo | oaws | A
75 |23/08/19 11:32 | After Repair Photo 0| eadiec | A
76 |21/08/1911:32 | After Repair Photo Q| s | B
77 |23/08/19 11:32 | After Repair Photo 0| codws | M
78 |23/08/19 11:32 After Repair Photo 0| v | A
79 |23/08/19 11:33 | After Repair Photo Q| o | B
BO |23/08/1911:33 | After Repair Photo 0| adirc | A
81 |23/08719 11:31 Afer Repalr Phato 0D | loadivc | A
B2 |23/08/19 11:33 After Repair Photo 0| cadrs | A
§3 |23/08/19 11:33 | After Repair Photo 0| waaws | A
B4 |23/08/19 11:33 After Repair Photo 0| wedws | &4
BS |23/08/1911:31 | After Repair Photo ) | Load WG [~}
86 |23/00/19 11:33 | Amer Repair Photo 0| aawa | A
87 |2308/19 11:33 | Afer Repair Photo 0 | eaws | A
BS [23/08/1911:33 | Afer Repair Photo 0| ceawc | B
B9 |23/08/1911:33 | After Repair Photo 0| wears | A
80 |23/08/19 11:331 | After Repair Phato 0| woawe | B
81 |21/08/19 1131 | After Repair Photo O | oetivs | B

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 18/12/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Page 3 of 3

[ [opme LI @
|na | Finalized On AlG Asia Pocific Insurance Pte. Lid. [SG) Thumbnail | Print
51 [23/08/1511:33  |AMer Repalr Phata B s | A
91 |73/08/1911:33 | After Repair Phato 0 osdirc | A
o4 | 708718 11:33 | After Repair Photo 0 wedirc | &
95 |23/08/19 11:33 | After Repair Photo 0 wers K
96 |21/08/1911:33 | Afer Repair Phote 0| weors W
97 |23/08/18 11:31 | Afer Repalr Phate 0| wedrc | A
98 |73/08/18 11:33 | Afar Repair Phato 0| edws | A
99 |23/08/19 11:33 | After Repair Photo @ wars | B
100 | Z3/08/1% 11:33 | After Repair Photo 0| wews | I |
Documentation [iperpage V]| &
fio | Relabel/Reorder | LEK Auto Consultants Pte Litd (HQ) Thismbnall | Print
t |19/02/19 20036 | ACKMOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD19.02.2019 ) | Load PoF
2 |19/02/18 20036 | EMAIL FROM AIG DO 19.02.2019 Load POF
3 |19/02/1920:36 | MOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP Lowd TIF
4 |19/02/19 20:36 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[‘U'-hlr.'li No: SKM3810K (Insd veh) Model: YAMAHA YZF-R15 150CC
FBDO550A (TP veh) (M)

| Date of Accident: |31/01/2019

Global Sum Settiement [ | [ ] Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimate 'S 1,859.80

Final Repair Cost - 1,000.00

Loss of Use - £0.00 3.00 days at $20.00 per day

Rental (if any) - 0.00 days

LTA / GIA Search Fea 1% 0.00

Others: | 9 0.00

g |

Final Settlement Sum e 1,060.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability ____ 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No;
B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): 100 (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be fillad only for chain coliisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |Teo Spray Painting - 1,060.00
2) .

18 Dec
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 20190
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report! Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg ne 1sssorissn

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408633
Tel: B256-3561 Fax; 6844-8805 Email: sur@|kkauto com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18003140/UEA3Q2

Date: 1811272019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. Policy No: 1700083117
Clalmant .
Vehicle No : FBDA550A Insured Vehicle No : SKM3310K
Date of Loss: 31012019 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: 478852787756
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBD9550A
Make & Model: YAMAHA YZF-R15, 150cc (M) Engine No: 20P1022888
Reg. Date: 30/08/2009 (Man. Year: 2009) Chassis No; ME120P01182020400
Colour Red/\White Odometer. 125823 km
Engine Capacity 150 cc
Markel Valus/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S5%5) Market Value/New Car Price
F T T F
General Condition; Steering (Serviceabla): ¥es Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) ¥es Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 80/70-17 Rear Tyre Size: 1107017
Front Left Side Maxxis 6 mm Rear Left Side: Maxxis 6 mm
Front Right Side: 0mm Rear Right Side: 0O mm
The sbove values represen] the remaining fyre reads gegth
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 1,510.80 1,050.45 469.35 30.88
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 340.00 285,00 55.00 16.18
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5§) 1,859.80 1,335.45 524.35 28.19
Approved Total (Qverridden) (S5) 1,000.00
Mett Amount (5§) 1,859.80 1,000.00 B859.80 46.23
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5520.00/day) (5$) 60.00
Mett Liability (S5) 1,060.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmant: 19/022018
Date Inspected: 20/02/2018 Inspected Al Teo Spray Painting (HQ)
BLK 6 DEFU LLANE 10, DEFU IND
PARK C #01-558
Singapore 539187
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi
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NOTE: This report represonts our findinga af the fime and place of inspection stuted harain, Such inapection hos been carried ow io the best of our
knowledge and abity but any offver labilify under any ofher circumstancas (s hemby expressiy exciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
11 *TOP COVER Cracked 90.00 FL *80.00 FL
2 1 *HEAD LIGHT Scratched 150.00 FL *150.00 FL
3 1 *STAY Repair 52 50FL “-FL
4 1 *WINDSCREEN Cracked 22 50FL *22. 50 FL
5 1 *FENDER Cracked 45 00FL *45.00FL
6 1 *FRONT WHEEL Dentad / Benl 180,00 FL *180.00 FL
7 1 *SET FORK (LOCAL REPAIR) Bent 37B.00FS *BO.00OFS
B 1 *SIDE COWLING INNER LH Cracked 105.00 FL *105.00 FL
8 1 *SIDE COWLING INNER RH Not Necessary 105,00 FL “-FL
0 1 *SIDE COWLING OUTER LH Cracked 90.00FL *80.00FL
11 1 *SIDE COWLING OUTER RH Cracked 80.00 FL *80.00FL
12 1 *COWLING CENTER Cracked 105.00 FL =105.00FL
13 1 *EXHAUST COVER FRONT Serviceable 24 DOFL *FL
14 1 *EXHAUST COVER REAR Scraiched 15.00FL *15.00FL
15 1 *REAR FOOTREST LH Bent 15.00 FL *15.00FL
16 1 ‘FRONT SIGNAL LIGHT LH Cut 12.00FL *12.00FL
17 1 *FRONT SIGNAL LIGHT RH Cut 12.00FL *12.00FL
iB 1 *HANDLE LH Bent 30.00FL “30.00 FL
B 1 *LEVER CLUTCH LH Scratched 9.00FL *8.00FL
20 1 *MIRROR LH Cut 30.00FL *30.00FL
21 2 *FORK OIL Necessary B0.00F5 *60.00FS
2 1 *FRONT NUMBER PLATE Necessary 1B.00FS *10.00FS
FeFranchise part S=SpcMatt. L=ListitemDisc.
Sub Total (SS) 1,638.00 1,150.50
- List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S$) 118.20 100.05
Total Parts (S$) 1,519.80 1,050.45
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems
There are na new miscallaneous [tems selecied.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
!  LABOUR CHARGES New 280.00 250.00
2  TRANSPORT New £0.00 3500

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 340.00 285.00
1 Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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