Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 12:22 PM

To: kelly@lamchee.com.sg

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO

UPPER BT TIMAH RD FROM LOR SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

Hi Kelly,

Re-send.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 June 2020 1:57 PM

To: kelly@lamchee.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD
FROM LOR SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

4t REMINDER

M/s TPE ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

OURREF  :CC4/ASM19003133/Apa3// SOSMO1ED1

YOUR REF : GBA1446L



ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD FROM LOR
SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from TORQUE 5 PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SJJ9036S against your motor
insurance policy.

We would like to request the following documents for our necessary action: -

e Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the driver is allow to drive the vehicle.
e Copy of ACRA letter for TPE Engineering Pte Ltd
e Copy of ACRA letter for D P Construction Pte Ltd

Appreciate an early reply.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 April 2020 2:59 PM

To: kelly@lamchee.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD
FROM LOR SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

3rd REMINDER



M/s TPE ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

OURREF  :CC4/ASM19003133/Apa3// SOSMO1ED1
YOUR REF : GBA1446L

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD FROM LOR
SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from TORQUE 5 PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SJJ9036S against your motor
insurance policy.

We would like to request the following documents for our necessary action: -

e Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the driver is allow to drive the vehicle.
e Copy of ACRA letter for TPE Engineering Pte Ltd
e Copy of ACRA letter for D P Construction Pte Ltd

Appreciate an early reply.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 9:50 AM

To: kelly@lamchee.com.sg <kelly@lamchee.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD
FROM LOR SESUAI ON 18/02/2019




2" REMINDER

M/s TPE ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM19003133/Apa3// SOMO1ED1
YOUR REF :GBA1446L

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD FROM LOR
SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from TORQUE 5 PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SJJ9036S against your motor
insurance policy.

We would like to request the following documents for our necessary action: -
e Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the driver is allow to drive the vehicle.
e Copy of ACRA letter for TPE Engineering Pte Ltd
e Copy of ACRA letter for D P Construction Pte Ltd

Appreciate an early reply.

Please call us if you have any queries.

‘Wishing you a Happy and Prosyerous New Year”

%
(

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2019 2:20 PM

To: kelly@lamchee.com.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD
FROM LOR SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

REMINDER
M/s TPE ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



OURREF  :CC4/ASM19003133/Apa3// SOSMO1ED1

YOUR REF : GBA1446L

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD FROM LOR
SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from TORQUE 5 PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SJJ9036S against your motor
insurance policy.

We would like to request the following documents for our necessary action: -
e Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the driver is allow to drive the vehicle.
e Copy of ACRA letter for TPE Engineering Pte Ltd
e Copy of ACRA letter for D P Construction Pte Ltd

Appreciate an early reply.

Please call us if you have any queries.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2019 12:23 PM

To: kelly@lamchee.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD FROM
LOR SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

08 Oct 2019

M/s TPE ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM19003133/Apa3// SOMO1ED1
YOUR REF :GBA1446L

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1446L(AXA) AND SJJ 9036S ALONG/AT SLIP RD TO UPPER BT TIMAH RD FROM LOR
SESUAI ON 18/02/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.



We have received a claim from TORQUE 5 PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SJJ9036S against your motor
insurance policy.

We would like to request the following documents for our necessary action: -
e Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the driver is allow to drive the vehicle.
e Copy of ACRA letter for TPE Engineering Pte Ltd
e Copy of ACRA letter for D P Construction Pte Ltd

Appreciate an early reply.

Please call us if you have any queries.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



