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LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) = Menu

I VILE AUULED>

31 JURONG PORT ROAD, , , 619115

Primary Contact/Insured

GLTC LOGISTICS PTE LTD
31 JURONG PORT ROAD, #08-13/14, 619115, Singapore
65674755

Claim Handler

ANG Yvonne
6568804461
yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
EXCESS $1000 TENDER REPAIR

Messages Invaices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

New Message




Service Request Details
Claim
SYM01BD1

Reference

None &*

Loss Date
January 21, 2019

Request Date
February 19, 2019

Due Date
February 26, 2019

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated workshop survey
Actions

Next Step
Agree to perform service

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (CD) =

Decline Wark

Accept Wark

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
YP275T

Make
MITSUBISHI

Menu



* RATAN BHOSALE Pragati

—
Iérom: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 9:27 AM
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey
Subject: SNG AH TEE - JANICE / P1704032 / DOA:21/01/2019 / OD : YP275T
Attachments: YP275T-A.PDF; S PASS,DL,CLtif
Importance: High
Categories: Pragati
Hi,

Please create claim & arrange for survey this vehicle.
This vehicle YP275T is CURRENTLY IN our workshop.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-



212212019

> Back to OneMotoring

o Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

" Vehicle _Oﬁner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Feb 2019

PARFI/COF Rahata Fnnniry

Company
6700D

YP275T

No

22 Feb 2019
MITSUBISHI
FUSO FM65FM2RDEB
Blue

2015
6M60207266
FM&65FMA20094
$58,511.00

23 Nov 2015

23 Nov 2015

0

$2,926.00

No

$0.00

22 Nov 2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$5,306.00

$3,581.00

$3,581.00

Nups:yvr.na.gov.sginavriyacuon/enquirexeopaiepyruniicoeiorgueraginpuisrUuNL | IUN_IUSFUIU4UUd | |

i



211q/2019 PARFIMOIF Rehate Frnnirg
T x
> Back to OneMotoring

' 'Ergquire‘PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner ID: 6700D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: YP275T

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 20Feb 2019
Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Model: FUSO FM45FM2RDEB
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: &M60207266
Chassis No.: FM&SFMA20094
Maximum Power Output: =

Open Market Value: $58,511.00
Original Registration Date: 23 Nov 2015
First Registration Date: 23 Nov 2015
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $2.926.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 22 Nov 2025
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $5,306.00

COE Rebate Amount: $3.584.00

Total Rebate Amount: $3,584.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Feb 2019

nups.Hvn.a.gov.sgiiia vriyacuon/enquireepalesyr UDIICoBIOTBUENEBgINPUL FUNG | IWIN_ILSTUIuauuy | |



R Shirl’ex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 3:48 PM

To: 'Janice Chang'

Ces SUR

Subject: RE: YP 275T OD (AXA)

Dear Janice,

As instructed by our client, please proceed at repair cost not exceeding $3,600.00 (inclusive
supplementary) to repair the insured vehicle
YP 275T (Excess § 1,000/-) on lump Sum basis.

[f there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Janice Chang [mailto:janice@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 2:36 PM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)' <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP 275T OD (AXA)

Hi Shirley,

Please find the attached document.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com




-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 1:48 PM
To: 'Janice Chang' <janice@sngahtee.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP 275T OD (AXA)

Hi Janice,

Kindly revert us the lump sum repair letter with owner signature.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Janice Chang [mailto:janice @sngahtee.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 1:18 PM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)’ <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP 275T OD (AXA)

Importance: High

Hi Shirley,

We accept your below offer.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com
L(.

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Frida'v, 22 February 2019 11:03 AM

o



To: janice@sngahtee.com
~ Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
" -Subject: RE: YP 275T OD (AXA)

Hi Janice,

As spoken, kindly check the repair cost limit whether you are able to repair the vehicle not exceeding $
3.600.00 on lump sum basis.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



2/27/2019 Claim Portal

« Re:RE: TENDER REPAIR

Type
© Question

Message
Please proceed to authorize, lump sum form received

}'

https:ﬂvp.smérlclaims.axa.com.sg!hlaim-pona I/htmi/index-vendor-service-requests.html#/service-requests/view-message/?serviceRequestNumbe... n



2/27/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (COD) = Men

« RE: TENDER REPAIR

Type
© Question

Message
Hi Yvonne, repairer able to repair the vehicle not exceeding $ 3,600.00 on lump sum basis. Kindly let us have
your authorize approval. Thanks. From : Shirley

'i

https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sq/claim-portal/ html/index-vendor-service-requests.htmi#/service-requests/view-message/?serviceRequestNumbe... 1/1



2/127/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) - Menu

« TENDER REPAIR

Type
© Question

Message
AS SPOKEN, PLEASE CHECK WHETHER THEY ARE ABLE UNDERTAKE LUMP SUM $3600

»?

s

1
https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/html/index-vendor-service-requests. htmi#/service-requests/view-message/?serviceRequestNumbe...  1/1



2/27/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) = Menu

« |A-YP275T

Type
© Question

Message
IA uploaded. Damages consistent, repair cost economical. We have not authorize repair. Kindly ley us have

your approval of authorization. Thanks. From : Shirley

i, i :
https://vp:s martclaims.adxa.com.s@/claim-portal/htmlfindex-vendor-se rvice-requests.htmi#/service-requests/view-m essage/?serviceRequestNumbe... 1/1



¥ IV e
SUUMIAVE I m2-25 PAYA LUHEINDUSTRIAL PAHK, SINGAPOREF J0891% TEL M B2EANEAL FAN C0nE) A2SsLNE
Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 22/02/2019
Survey Details:
Date of loss 21-Jan-19
Date of appointment 19-Feb-19
Date of survey 20-Feb-19

Location of survey

BLK 3, PIONEER ROAD
NORTH, #01-18 SINGAPORE
628457.

Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Own Damage
Vehicle number YP 275T
Make and Model MITSUBISHI FUSO
FMB5FM2RDEB

Date of registration 23-Nov-15
Excess $1,000
Market Value $86,000
Parf Rebate $3,581
Nett Loss $82,419

Repair details:
[Initial Estimate | 14,334.00

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts $9,669.00
Check items (estimate) $802.00
Labour $1,600.00
Total $12,071.00
Lump Sum(if applicable) S

INumber of days for repair |

7 DAYS




A
! ’d ( Coneutints
-

Pre Lid Company Registration Mo 190407 1988

£1 UKIAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFOKE JOR933 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FANX @ (06f) a230dbiS

Remarks:

DAMAGES CONSISTENT, REPAIR COST ECONOMICAL. WE
HAVE NOT AUTHORIZED REPAIR.

Mandate:

Liability(TP)

Proposed repair cost

Loss of use

Y n|R

no. of days

Loss of rental

no. of days

Loss of income

no. of days

LTA search fees

Others

s
$
$
s

Proposed Total #VALUE!




MSAT18008678-01 | Sng Ah Tee Motor & Panel Service Pte Lid - Plonaar
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 21/01/2019 13:52
SUBMITTED BY: Sharon Sng May Yuen

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies lo

repudiate policy liability

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and thal copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you heraby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of the report being made available

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

21/01/2019 13:52
21/01/2019 11:30
JOO KOON CIRCLE

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number YP275T
Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner GLTC LOGISTICS PTE LTD
Co Reg No 201006700D

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

Passport No/FIN

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

(LOCAL) +65-91501711
OFFICE-62667735

MITSUBISHI
FUSO-7.5 D FMB5FM2RDEB (M)

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

P1704032

MARUTHAMUTHU GAVASKAR
GB330107N

03/06/1985

OUTDOOR

07/03/2014

4 YEARS AND 10 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-81692456

NOEMAIL

Page 10of 15



Address NIL
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by N

0]
ambulance?
Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action
Was the accident reported to the police? NO

If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

ON 21/01/2019 @ ABT 1130HRS. | WAS DRIVING ALONG JOO KOON CIRCLE ON THE LEFT LANE. WHILE DRIVING,
SUDDENLY VEHICLE B (YP2962E) CUT INTO MY LANE [N FAST SPEED & KNOCKED ONTO MY VEHICLE AT FRON RIGHT
PORTION. AFTER THE COLLISION, THE SAID VEHICLE DID NOT STOP ON THE SPOT, | THEN CHASE AFTER HIM & ASK
HIM TO STOP. WE THEN EXCHANGE OUR PARTICULARS. NO ONE WAS INJURED. THAT'S ALL.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number YP2962E

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver QIAO GUANFENG
NRIC/Passport Number G3345440L

Contact Number 91492345

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 15



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

. Please report correctly the details of the sccident to speed up the claims process.

. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.
. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liabllity on the part of the insurance
companies.

. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer {collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

{i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

{if) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
{ili) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
“Purposes”)

{b) all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or mare of the above Purposes; and

{c) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or

agents(including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the zbove Purposes.

(d) my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(e) theinformation so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i) toall insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, contralling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(i) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

(
‘a ,6
& o
k?/. 7 rr‘ g’lo . 97:’._\

Y
et
Policyholder'sSiEnature Driver's Sign“uf? Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: (/f driver is nat the policyholder) Name:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

1AM AWARED THATMY INSURER MAY HAVE A 14 DAY S TMEFRAME FOR ME TO SUBM IT AN OWHN DR MAGE CLAIM UNDER MY CWH POLICY. | WILL

CHECK MY POLICY FOR MORE DETAILS.

Page 30of 15



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

Joo Koon Cirele

5
o

MY

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Jehn._\.z@ S ')':'IE’]'

verle @ Mp 286> €

On 9‘10\"}01« € At Nzowrs_

Re’P{r 4o Cirreumstamus ok acc dend

DECLARATION
I/Wed ‘5'\:5 24 8regoing particulars are true in every respect.
” c{.‘

. =
=
A 3 £ >

O Chaimewn pelicy
\JZ Claim third party
O Claim©OD / TP atother works hop
O Ferrseced purpsse
Felicy No. PIVY¥03a
Ins urer A CChH Veh.No. NP DQST

Frn

Policyholder &ifhature Drivek's Sllgiﬂne Reporting Centre Persannel’s Signature
Date & Time: {If driver is not' the policyholder} Name:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 15









FEBEZEIRIFFRNANFR T -

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

: . SNGAH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Website: wwwsngahteeoomUEST’,QUOTE NO. 50004610

RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: 20081044

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD DATE

8 Shenton Way #24-01
AXA Tower (S) 068811

ATTENTION :
CONTACT : -

ACCIDENT DATE
VEHICLE NO

CHASSIS/ENG.NO
VEHICLE MODEL :
: SOMOIBDI

CLAIM NO
FAX NO: 68804838 POLICY NO

REMARK

19/02/2019
21/01/2019

- YP275T

FM65FM2RDEB
MIT.FM65

P1704032

S/N. QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION

PRICE DISC % J)ISC/MARKUP TOTAL AMT

** LIST PRICE **

SUB-TOTAL: 0.00
*% SPECIAL NETT PRICE ** _

1 1 PC  FRTDOOR BLUETEC'LOGO M 4 S 1000 10.00 10.00

SUB-TOTAL 10.00
#% COST PLUS MARKUP **

1 1 PC FRT BUMPER # 7~ 1.300.00 7 -10.00 1.430.00 1.430.00 ~

2 1 PC FRT BUMPER SIDE(RH) Mt ¥ =~ 180.00 ~ -10.00 198.00 198.00 7~

3 1 PC FRT BUMPER FOGLAMP(RH) C&+ < 800.00~ -10.00 880.00 880.007

4 1 PC FRT HEADLAMP(RH) f#o ~ 700.00- -10.00 770.00 770.00 ~

7Xs54

5 1 PC FRT HEADLAMP HOLDER(RHW{DV & 160.00 -10.00 176.00 176.00

6 1 PC FRT DOOR(RH) B4 7 3.200.00- -10.00 3.520.00 3.520.00 ~

7 1 PC FRT DOOR HINGE(TOP) 7 yl-c 275.00 -10.00 302.50 302.50

8 1 PC FRT DOOR HINGE(BOTTOM) 'f)(’“' 285.00 -10.00 313.50 313.50

9 1 PC FRT DOOR LAMP(RH) F 40 ~ 75.00. -10.00 82.50 82.50

10 1 PC FRT DOOR WHEEL ARCH GARNISH(RH) C# £750.00- -10.00 825.00 825.007

11 1 PC FRT DOOR ROCKER GARNISH X $eC 210.00 -10.00 231.00 231.00

12 1 PC FRT DOOR RUN CHANNEL X §v & 200.00 -10.00 220.00 220.00

13 1 PC FRT DOOR MUDGUARD PROTECTOR M3/ 75,00 -10.00 82.50 82.50 ~

14 1 PC FRT STEP PANEL(RH) B&0 7 250.00. -10.00 275.00 275.00 7

15 1 PC FRT STEP ALLOY(TOP) bfe / 240.00. -10.00 264.00 264.007

JANICE PAGE: 1of2

ON BEHALF OF SNG AH TEE PANEL & SERVICEPTELTD E&oOE

Disclaimer clause:

The above estimate/quotation is meant for solely the intended party stated above and in any event, we are not liable to any other parties arising from
the circumstances of this or any action taken in reliance on such estimates or quotations.
Quotation is only valid for 14 days.
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SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

RCB Reg.| GST Reg. Ne: 20081044feS T/QUOTE NO. SQ004610

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD DATE 19/02/2019

ACCIDENT DATE 21/01/2019
8 Shenton Way #24-01 VEHICLE NO : YP275T
AXA Tower (S) 068811 CHASSIS/ENG.NO : FM65FM2RDEB
) VEHICLE MODEL : MIT.FM65
ATTENTION : CLAIM NO : SOMOIBDI
CONTACT : - FAX NO: 68804838 POLICY NO P1704032

REMARK

S/N. QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE DISC % )ISC/MARKUP TOTAL AMT

16 | PC  FRTSTEP ALLOY(LOWER) Bfe/” 240.00 < -10.00 264.00 264.00 -
17 | PC  FRTSTEP ALLOY HOLDERLOWER)M/”  400.00/ -10.00 440.00 440.00 ~
18 I PC  FRTSTEP ALLOY BRACKET(LOWER)Bf#”  180.00. -10.00 198.00 198.00~
19 1 PC  FRT STEP PANEL REFLECTOR MIs./ 85.00 - -10.00 93.50 93.50 ~
20 I PC  FRT SIDE MIRROR ARM ot/ 275.00, -10.00 G [/ 30250 302.50 ~
21 | PC  FRTSIDEMIRROR BRACKET 4L~ 40.00, -10.00 - 44.00 44.00 ~
22 I PC  FRT CORNER PANEL(RH) feper 850.00 -10.00 935.00 935.00
23 | PC  FRT SIDE MIRROR(RH) Y A N\ 70.00 -10.00 77.00 77.00
SUB-TOTAL 11,924.00
** WORK LABOUR ** Al o
L
TO KNOCK, WELD, REMOVE & FIX ABOVE PARTS oy — 1100.00 SOV W
TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA uf’ rHs 1300.00 80O 1,30070
7 Q SUB-TOTAL 2.400.00
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¢

ON BEHALF OF SNG AH TEE PANEL & SERVICE PTE LTD

Disclaimer clause:

ADD 7% GST. S§ 1.003.38
GRAND TOTAL : S§ 15.337.38

E&OE

The above estimate/quotation is meant for solely the intended party stated above and in any event, we are not liable to any other parties arising from
the circumstances of this or any action taken in reliance on such estimates or quotations.
Quotation is only valid for 14 days.



