Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February, 2019 6:35 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; CS A Team; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP050/21420 Accident involving SJA 2696 E & SGG 6776 K
Along T-JUNCT OF SIMEI AVE & SIMEI STREET 3 On 12/02/2019. [External
Confidential]

Categories: HMK

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

LPC ref: 18/19/19/VP050,/21420
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19003117 /ha3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 3:23 PM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; '‘assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com>;
'justin_ee@bw.com.sg'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP050/21420 Accident involving SJA 2696 E & SGG 6776 K Along T-JUNCT OF SIMEI
AVE & SIMEI STREET 3 On 12/02/2019. [External Confidential]

Dear Ms Ong,

Thank you for the assignment.

Shiau Chan on behalf of G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 12:15 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'justin_ee@bw.com.sg'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP050/21420 Accident involving SIA 2696 E & SGG 6776 K Along T-JUNCT OF SIMEI
AVE & SIMEI STREET 3 On 12/02/2019. [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Without Prejudice

Dear Justin

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability.
Dear Catherine/Nivitha

FYA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ©Hew" lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: CHEW BENG KEE

Sent: Monday, 18 February, 2019 11:28 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG; 'justin_ee@bw.com.sg'

Subject: FW: Accident involving SJA 2696 E & SGG 6776 K Along T-JUNCT OF SIMEI AVE & SIMEI STREET 3 On
12/02/2019. [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Gerald/Li Li, pls attend to this case. TQ.

Best Regards

Chew Beng Kee

Head of Claims | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 246 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Justin Ee [mailto:justin ee@bw.com.sq]

Sent: Saturday, February 16, 2019 2:05 PM

To: CHEW BENG KEE

Cc: Derek Low; Nur Syafirah

Subject: Accident involving SJA 2696 E & SGG 6776 K Along T-JUNCT OF SIMEI AVE & SIMEI STREET 3 On
12/02/2019.

Dear All,

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for the above mentioned case.
We herein attached the GIA Report and Estimate for direct settlement for your perusal.

Please kindly arrange for survey, vehicle is in our workshop.

Thank you

Best regards,

Justin Ee

BW Workshop Services Pte Ltd

30 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408615

Main: 6289 8800 / Direct Line : 6692 0139 /
Fax: 6858 2120 Email justin ee@bw.com.sg
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